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010026 BINDING COMBS $0.11
0.00
$.075
No Bid
No Bid
$.056
$6.35/Box
No Bid

$.056

1/2”, BlackSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples

GBC4000068Brand>

010124 CLIP, BUTTERFLY $1.07
$.87
$.76
No Bid
No Bid
$2.68
$1.86
No Bid

$.76

LargeSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Hughes

Acco #72610Brand>

010141 CLIPBOARD No Bid
$1.65
$.95
No Bid
No Bid
$.88
$2.09
$.80

$.80

LetterSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Business
Stationer

OIC #83500Brand>

010210 MARKER, DRY ERASE KIT $17.92
$16.55
$14.94
$21.71
$12.57
$15.04
$20.61
No Bid

$12.57

12 Marker KitSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Pyramid

Sanford #83054Brand>

010224 ENVELOPE, CLASP $21.14
No Bid
$13.85
No Bid
No Bid
$12.08
No Bid
No Bid

$12.08

5”x7.5”Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples
Advantage

QP #37835Brand>
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010236 ENVELOPE (REGULAR) No Bid
$8.25(*)
$7.96(*)
No Bid
No Bid
$13.26
$16.58
No Bid

$13.26

Regular #10Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples
Advantage

Staples #321554Brand>

010242 ERASER, ARROWHEAD PENCIL
CAP

$.57
$.35
$.36
No Bid
No Bid
$.25
$2.12
$.38

$.25

RedSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples
Advantage

Faber Arrowhead #70569Brand>

010267 FOLDERS, PORTFOLIOS $9.88
$5.37
$17.00
No Bid
No Bid
$5.57
$17.63
No Bid

$5.37

Asst. ColorsSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Elgin School

Smead #SMD486ABrand>

010361 GLUE STIC $1.64
$.66
$1.06
No Bid
$.79
$.52
$.78
$.31

$.31(Alt)

.75 oz.Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Business
Stationer

Dixon #026052 & Dennison #00-196 (1Brand>

010382 LAMINATING FILM No Bid
No Bid
$12.19
No Bid
$19.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$12.19(Alt)

22"x200' glossSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Hughes

Highsmith #WK0G2221Brand>
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010388 LAMINATING SHEETS (9”X12”) $18.75
$17.60
$12.79
No Bid
No Bid
$3.95(*)
No Bid
No Bid

$12.79

9”x12”Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Hughes

C-Line #65001Brand>

010445 MARKER, DRY ERASE (LOW
ODOR)

$3.77
$2.52
$2.79
$2.77
$2.65
$.95(*)
$3.74
$1.93(*)

$2.52

4 color setSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Elgin School

Ave #24-409Brand>

010446 MARKER, PERMANENT
(SHARPIE©)

$8.12
$6.37
$6.98
$5.94
$6.00
$7.07
$8.28
$4.86(*)

$5.94

BlackSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

National Art &
School Supplies

Sanford #30001DZBrand>

010455 PEN, ROLLER BALL $8.83
$4.12
$7.68
No Bid
$6.60
$6.47
No Bid
No Bid

$4.12/Alt

Black .2mmSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Elgin

Pentel #R204ABrand>

010458 MARKER, WASHABLE (MR.
SKETCH)

$6.52
$4.87
$5.62
$4.86
$4.72
$5.70
$6.94
No Bid

$4.72

12/color/seSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Pyramid

Sanford #19072Brand>
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010490 PENCIL, WRITING No Bid
$1.69
$1.25(**)
No Bid
No Bid
$2.56
No Bid
No Bid

$1.69

#3 Firm LeadSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Elgin

Elgin Royal Master #720Brand>

010504 POST-IT NOTES No Bid
No Bid
$7.07
No Bid
No Bid
$5.52
$7.38
No Bid

$5.52

2”x2”, Assorted ColorsSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples

3M #2051-3PKBrand>

010527 POST-IT NOTES (MEMO CUBES)
(Cont.)

No Bid
No Bid
$6.12
No Bid
No Bid
$4.07
No Bid
No Bid

$4.07

3”x3”/NeonSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples

3M #2027RCRBrand>

010603 RULER, YARD STICK No Bid
$1.99
$4.29
No Bid
No Bid
$1.95
$1.01
No Bid

$1.01(Alt)

36”Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

School Specialty

Acme #R-610Brand>

010610 SCISSORS, FISKARS $2.33
$1.37
$2.25
$1.26
No Bid
No Bid
$1.59
$.74(*)

$1.26

5”  (Kids)Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

National Art &
School Supplies

Fiskar #9416Brand>
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010616 SHARPENER, ELECTRIC (DELUXE) $43.48
$37.81
$34.25
$50.62
$33.79
$32.10
No Bid
No Bid

$32.10

BlackSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples

HUN1645Brand>

010631 STAPLER, DESK $15.88
$11.37
$10.17
$8.76
$19.95
$9.51
$15.46
$7.56(*)

$8.76

BlackSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

National Art &
School Supplies

Swingline #74701Brand>

010632 STAPLER, DESK (DELUXE) $25.68
$19.17
$21.50
$24.96
$29.95
$18.90
No Bid
No Bid

$18.90

Size/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

Staples
Advanatage

Paperpro #1110Brand>

010677 POST-IT TAPE FLAGS No Bid
$1.92
$2.77
$1.68
No Bid
$1.84
No Bid
$1.93

$1.68

1”/OrangeSize/Clr>

Beemuns
Elgin School
Hughes
National Art
Pyramid School
Staples Advantage
School Specialty
Business Stationer

National Art &
School Supplies

3M #680-4Brand>
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