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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #100-14

Due Date:  7-31-13

01 2” X 4” X 8’ STUDS, HEM
FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

3.88
2.99

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

2.99

02 2” X 4” X 8’ STUDS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

3.88
3.60

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

3.60

03 2” X 4” X 92-5/8” STUDS,
HEM FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

4.14
3.15

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

3.15

04 2” X 4” X 10’  HEM FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

4.85
4.50

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

4.50

05 2” X 4” X 12’ HEM FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

5.83
4.80

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

4.80

06 2” X 4” X 12’ DOUG FIR
          PREMIUM 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

5.83
7.50

Builder’s Choice 5.83

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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07 2” X 4” X 16’ HEM FIR

Lowe’s #6866

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

7.77
6.75

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

6.75

08 2” X 4” X 8’ PRESSURE
TREATED

Lowe’s #18294

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

6.39
5.72

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

5.72

09 2” X 6” X 8’  HEM FIR

Lowe’s #5089

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

6.00
4.50

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

4.50

10 2” X 6” X 7’-3/4”  PREMIUM
WHITEWOOD

Home Depot #845-728

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
6.30

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

6.30

11 2” X 6” X 10”
DIMENSIONAL LUMBER

CANFOR
(Home Depot #161-721)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

7.50
6.61

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

6.61

12 2” X 6” X 10’ HEM FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

7.50
5.75

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

5.75

13 2” X 6” X 12’ HEM FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

9.00
7.14

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

7.14
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       RECAP
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14 2” X 6” X 16’  HEM FIR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

11.99
9.96

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

9.96

15 2” X 6” X 12’ PRESSURE-
TREATED WOOD 
        HEM/FIR 
BrownSize -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

14.35
12.60

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

12.60

16 2” X 6” X 16’ PRESSURE-
TREATED WOOD
        HEM/FIR
BrownSize -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

19.56
16.80

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

16.80

17 2” X 8” X 16’ ALL
WEATHER WOOD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

26.20
22.75

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

22.75

18 2” X 10” X 10’ HEM OR
DOUG FIR
     DRIED

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

12.89
10.43

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

10.43

19 4” X 4” X 12’ PRESSURE
TREATED WOOD 

Lowe’s #30100

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

23.17
12.90

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

12.90

20 6” X 6” X 10’ PRESSURE
TREATED WOOD 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
40.61

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

40.61
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21 6” X 6” X 20’ PRESSURE
TREATED WOOD 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
81.22

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

81.22

22 1”  x  4”  x  12’ CEDAR
TITEKNOT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

6.81
5.59

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

5.59

23 1”  x  6”  x  12’ CEDAR 
TITEKNOT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

10.70
8.71

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

8.71

24 RED OAK
   1” X 4”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
8.10

No Award

25 CHERRY

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
7.90

No Award

26 CDX PLYWOOD

3/8” X 4’ X 8’Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

17.83
14.99

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

14.99

27 CDX PLYWOOD

3/4”  x  4’  x  8’Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

58.58
48.50

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

48.50

29 PLYWOOD, CDX

4’  X  8’  X  5/8”Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

27.07
23.50

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

23.50



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 5  of 9

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #100-14

Due Date:  7-31-13

29 3/4” X 4’ X 8’
UNDERLAYMENT
PLYWOOD
           TONGUE AND
GROOVE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

37.48
32.00

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

32.00

30 SMART SIDING, OSB

4’  X  8’  X  7/16”Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

38.83
38.50

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

38.50

31 COMPOSITE SIDING

4’  W  x   96”  H

LP SMARTSIDE
(Home Depot #25848)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

38.83
35.00

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

35.00

32 HOUSE WRAP

150’  x  9’

PACTIV
(Lowe’s  #LW1490)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

150.00
185.00

Builder’s Choice 150.00

33 SHINGLES

Brown

IKO Marathon Ultra;
CERTAINTEED

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

32.57
No Bid

Builder’s Choice 32.57

34 SHINGLE
           HIP AND RIDGE
Onyx Black

OWENS CORNING “DECO
RIDGE” DE01
(Lowe’s #DE01)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

35 SHINGLE, STARTER
BUNDLE
     ASPHALT FIBERGLASS
Black

OWENS CORNING  #SS10
(Lowe’s #SS10)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

44.37
46.49

Spenard
Builders - Kenai

46.49
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36 ROOFING PANEL

26” X 8’

PALRUF  #100423
(Home Depot #283495)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
14.75

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

14.75

37 CLOSURE STRIPS
   ROOFING
24”

PALRUF  #92771
(Home Depot #250639)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
5.59

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

5.59

38 RIDGE CAP

4’

SUNTOP
(Home Depot #109285)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

39 DRIP EDGE

AMERIMAX #5770400120
(Lowe’s #3810)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

4.57
No Bid

Builder’s Choice 4.57

40 STORM DOOR

36 inch

EMCO 100 SERIES #E1SS
-36WH
(Home Depot #818771)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

41 T HINGE

6”

NATIONAL MFG CO #N129
-171

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
4.92

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

4.92

42 DOOR PULL

6-3/4”

NATIONAL MFG CO #N100
-313

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
3.22

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

3.22

43 HASP, SWIVEL

4-1/2”

NATIONAL MFG CO #V32

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
10.11

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

10.11
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       RECAP
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44 BARREL BOLT

4”

NATIONAL MFG CO #N151
-654

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
3.22

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

3.22

45 JOIST HANGER

4.8” x 3.1” x 2.7”

SIMPSON STRONG-TIE
LUS26Z
(SBS #SIMH25AZ)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

1.36
1.10

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

1.10

46 HURRICANE ANCHOR

SIMPSON H.25AZ “Z-MAX”
(SBS #SIMH25AZ) 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

.59

.63
Builder’s Choice .59

47 ROOFING NAIL

1-1/4”

GRIP-RITE #114EGRFG5
(Lowe’s #107798)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

8.52
2.83

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

2.83

48 DRYWALL SCREW

#8 x 3”

GRIP-RITE #3DWS5
(Lowe’s #111760)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
18.57

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

18.57

49 DRYWALL SCREW

#8 x 2-1/2”

GRIP-RITE #212DWS5
(Lowe’s #111741)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
18.33

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

18.33

50 DRYWALL SCREW

#6 x 2”

GRIP-RITE #2CDWS5
(Lowe’s #112611)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
16.96

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

16.96

51 DRYWALL SCREW

#8 x 1-1/4”

GRIP-RITE #114CDWS5
(Lowe’s #112611)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
14.85

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

14.85
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52 ELECTRICAL WIRE

250 feet

ROMEX #28827469
(Lowe’s #70123)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
57.79

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

57.79

53 ELECTRICAL OUTLET
     DUPLEX
White

COOPER WIRING DEVICES
#TWRBR20W-SPL
(Lowe’s #315350)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

54 ELECTRICAL BOX
        SINGLE
Blue

CARLON NEW WORK
#B118A
(Lowe’s #70972)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
.42

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

.42

55 ELECTRICAL BOX
        CEILING

STEEL CITY #54151CFBBHL
-10L
(Lowe’s #73273)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

56 LIGHT SWITCH

White

COOPER WIRING DEVICES
#1301-7W-L
(Lowe’s #73112)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
.76/ea

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

.76

57 RECEPTACLE WALL
PLATE
White

COOPER WIRING DEVICES
#5134W-SP-L
(Lowe’s #72996)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

58 RECEPTACLE WALL
PLATE
White

COOPER WIRING DEVICES
#5132W-SP-L
(Lowe’s #72993)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid
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59 CEILING SOCKET

White

COOPER WIRING DEVICES
#659-SP-L
(Lowe’s #71100)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

60 WIRE CONNECTORS

IDEAL #30-5152JR
(Lowe’s #114567)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
No Bid

61 CONSTRUCTION
ADHESIVE

LIQUID NAILS #LNP-901
(lOWE’S #44906)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

No Bid
3.39

Spenard
Builders -Kenai

3.39

62 DELIVERY FEE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Builder’s Choice
Spenard Builders -Kenai

See bid
See bid


