
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Solid Waste Collection and Disposal #110-14

Re-Cap                                Award in Bold

Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

BID PRICING BASED ON A MONTHLY PERIOD, WITH SERVICE EVERY OTHER

WEEK EXCEPT DURING HOLIDAYS; CHRISTMAS VACATION, SPRING BREAK:

SITE AREA "A"

Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 28.90$    No Bid 50.00$        

Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster 21.00$    No Bid 30.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 45.13$    No Bid 67.00$        

Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 30.19$    No Bid 36.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 57.90$    No Bid 81.00$        

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 49.88$    No Bid 46.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 57.90$    No Bid 100.00$      

Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster 49.88$    No Bid 54.00$        

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 30-yard 257.39$  No Bid 650.00$      

Rental Fee, 30-yard Roll-off Box 105.00$  No Bid 165.00$      

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 257.39$  No Bid 650.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 75.00$        

b.       4-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 85.00$        

c.        6-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 95.00$        

d.       30-yard Roll-off Box 5.25$       No Bid 350.00$      

e.      40-yard Roll-off Box 5.25$       No Bid 350.00$      

SITE AREA "B"

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 377.12$  No Bid 300.00$      

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 46.88$    No Bid 46.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 543.16$  No Bid 380.00$      

Rental Fee, Pick-up, 8-yard Dumpster 46.88$    No Bid 54.00$        

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      

b.       6-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      

c.        8-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

SITE AREA "C"

Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 20.06$    13.63$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster 18.80$    16.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 29.05$    27.89$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 27.03$    32.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 40.50$    42.09$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 44.65$    48.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 51.99$    55.78$     No Bid

 

Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster 94.00$    -$         No Bid

 

Dumpster Pick-up, 12-yard 81.00$    -$         No Bid

Rental Fee, 12-yard Dumpster 94.00$    -$         No Bid

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 206.98$  229.94$  1,300.00$  



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

 

b.       4-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

c.        6-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

d.       30-yard Roll-off Box 4.70$       -$         No Bid

e.      12-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

f.      40-yard Roll-off Box 4.70$       -$         650.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling
BID PRICING BASED ON A MONTHLY PERIOD, WITH SERVICE ONCE PER

WEEK EXCEPT DURING HOLIDAYS; CHRISTMAS VACATION, SPRING BREAK:

SITE AREA "A"

Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 59.71$    No Bid 100.00$      

Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster 21.00$    No Bid 30.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 93.25$    No Bid 134.00$      

Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 30.19$    No Bid 36.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 119.67$  No Bid 162.00$      

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 49.88$    No Bid 46.00$        

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 30-yard 257.39$  No Bid 1,300.00$  

Rental Fee, 30-yard Roll-off Box 105.00$  No Bid 165.00$      

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 257.39$  No Bid 1,300.00$  

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 75.00$        

b.       4-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 85.00$        

c.        6-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 95.00$        

d.       30-yard Roll-off Box 5.25$       No Bid 350.00$      

e.      40-yard Roll-off Box 5.25$       No Bid 350.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

SITE AREA "B"

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 502.12$  No Bid 600.00$      

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 46.88$    No Bid 46.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 693.46$  No Bid 760.00$      

Rental Fee, Pick-up, 8-yard Dumpster 46.88$    No Bid 54.00$        

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      

b.       6-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      

c.        8-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

SITE AREA "C"

Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 23.37$    27.26$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster 18.80$    16.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 46.84$    55.78$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 35.25$    32.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 70.21$    84.18$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 44.65$    48.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 93.67$    111.56$  No Bid

Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster 94.00$    -$         No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 12-yard 162.00$  -$         No Bid

Rental Fee, 12-yard Dumpster 94.00$    -$         No Bid

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 206.98$  459.88$  2,600.00$  



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

b.       4-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

c.        6-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

d.       8-yard Roll-off Box 4.70$       -$         No Bid

e.      12-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

f.      40-yard Roll-off Box 4.70$       -$         650.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling
BID PRICING BASED ON A MONTHLY PERIOD, WITH SERVICE TWICE PER

WEEK EXCEPT DURING HOLIDAYS; CHRISTMAS VACATION, SPRING BREAK:

SITE AREA "A"

Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 119.43$  No Bid 200.00$      

Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster 21.00$    No Bid 30.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 186.50$  No Bid 268.00$      

Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 30.19$    No Bid 36.00$        

 

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 239.33$  No Bid 324.00$      

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 49.88$    No Bid 46.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 239.33$  No Bid 400.00$      

Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster 49.88$    No Bid 54.00$        

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 30-yard 257.39$  No Bid 2,600.00$  

Rental Fee, 30-yard Roll-off Box 105.00$  No Bid 165.00$      

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 237.39$  No Bid 2,600.00$  



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)  

a.       2-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 75.00$        

b.       4-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 85.00$        

c.        6-yard Dumpster 5.25$       No Bid 95.00$        

d.       30-yard Roll-off Box 5.25$       No Bid 350.00$      

e.      40-yard Roll-off Box 5.25$       No Bid 350.00$      

SITE AREA "B"

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 752.12$  No Bid 1,200.00$  

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 46.88$    No Bid 46.00$        

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 993.46$  No Bid 1,520.00$  

Rental Fee, Pick-up, 8-yard Dumpster 46.88$    No Bid 54.00$        

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      

b.       6-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      

c.        8-yard Dumpster 79.06$    No Bid 200.00$      



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

SITE AREA "C"

Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 46.74$    54.52$     No Bid

Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster 18.80$    16.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 93.68$    111.56$  No Bid

Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 35.25$    32.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 140.42$  168.36$  No Bid

Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 44.65$    48.00$     No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 187.34$  223.12$  No Bid

Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster 94.00$    -$         No Bid

Dumpster Pick-up, 12-yard 243.00$  -$         No Bid

Rental Fee, 12-yard Dumpster 94.00$    -$         No Bid

Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 206.98$  919.76$  5,200.00$  



Alaska Waste Moore & Moore Triangle Recycling

Sanitize Containers (price per cleaning)

a.       2-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

b.       4-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

c.        6-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

d.       8-yard Roll-off Box 4.70$       -$         No Bid

e.      12-yard Dumpster 4.70$       -$         No Bid

f.      40-yard Roll-off Box 4.70$       -$         650.00$      

Price to replace broken dumpster lids, upon request:

1.       2-yard Dumpster 157.50$  -$         No Bid

2.       4-yard Dumpster 183.75$  -$         No Bid

3.        6-yard Dumpster 194.25$  -$         No Bid

4.        8-yard Dumpster 262.50$  -$         No Bid

5.        12-yard Dumpster 262.50$  -$         No Bid

6.       30-yard Roll-off Box 892.50$  -$         No Bid

f.      40-yard Roll-off Box 892.50$  -$         No Bid


