KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

kphbs
where kids come first

(907) 714-8876

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

FAX (907) 262-7165

Page 1 of 9
RECAP
BID 116-14
Due date 12-13-13

(Item #

Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }

# 01 IAIRMOVER Action Time USA, Inc. $360.09 Alt. WCP $183.71
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $199.00 Alt.
Oreck Flor Care Center $218.00 Alt
Size - $219.00 Alt
$215.00 Alt
Brand ProTeam ProBlitz XP Unisource $220.00
Bid - Waxie $199.68
WCP $183.71
# 02 ’APPLICATOR SYSTEM, Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid Waxie $443.73
FLOOR FINISH AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center No Bid
Size - Unisource No Bid
Waxie $443.73
Brand ’Applicator Technology K100 wcCP $470.56
Bid. [EZWay
# 03 ’APPLICATOR SYSTEM, Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid Waxie $8.33
REPLACEMENT PAD AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center No Bid
Size -24" - 1 1b. Unisource No Bid
Waxie $8.33
Brand iﬁpplicator Technology #G- WCP $23.75
. TKV2400
Bid -
# 04 |BATTERY, DEEP CYCLE Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid No Bid
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center No Bid
Size -127 Ibs. Unisource No Bid
Waxie No Bid
Duracell Procell WCP No Bid
gir:r_‘d lasu12v215s

* Does Not Meet Specifications
*** Not FOB: Soldotna

** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*»***Draw *****No Award-bid as all or none >>All or None
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# 05  |BRUSHES, CYLINDRICAL Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid WCP $146.73
SCRUB AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $192.31
Oreck Flor Care Center No Bid
Size -80 grit Umspurce No Bid
Waxie $188.10
Brand |advance #56314393 WCP $146.73
Bid -
# 06 BURNISHER, HIGH Action Time USA, Inc. $1499.99 WCP $1367.30
SPEED DUST CONTROL AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $1316.67 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $1499.00 Alt
Size -31.5'L x 22.5"W x 47°H - 92 Unisource $950.00 Alt
Waxie $1076.10 Alt
Ib. WCP $1367.30
Nobles BR-2000-DC '
Brand
Bid -
# 07 CARPET CLEANER Action Time USA, Inc. $1381.45 Alt Frontier Paper $973.75
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $973.75 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $1349.00 Alt
Size -25.5 x 22 x 11.5 inches - 54 Umspurce $675.00 Alt
Ibs Waxie $1275.00 Alt
' WCP 1242.08 Alt
Brand Rug Doctor 95730 MP-C2D $
Bid - Mighty Pro
# 08 CARPET CLEANER, Action Time USA, Inc. $2832.99 WCP $2678.22
COMPACT AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $1541.25 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $1899.00 Alt
Size -30°L x 19'W x 28"H - 117 Jnisource $1895.00 Alt
Ibs Waxie $1599.00 Alt
' ) WCP $2678.22
Brand Tennant R3 Cord-Electric
Bid - Readyspace #9004192
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# 09 CARPET CLEANER, Action Time USA, Inc. $9783.083 WCP $7599.44
DUAL TECHNOLOGY AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $8500.00 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $4875.00 Alt
Size -60"L x 28"W x 42"H - 590 Unisource ig%:gg 2::
Ibs w/batteries 340 lbs w/o ) '
Waxie $8838.13 Alt
Brand Tennant 1610 WCP $7599.44
Bid -
# 10  |CART, CLEANING Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid Waxie $221.41
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center No Bid
Size -48-3/4°L x 21-3/4"'W x 38 rsouree $295.00
3/8'H-50.6 Ibx. - Black L 2xie $221.41
) WCP $264.01
Brand Llfubbermald 9T72
. FG9T7200 BLA
Bid -
# 11 |EXTRACTOR, CARPET Action Time USA, Inc. $1725.99 Frontier Paper $1541.25
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $1541.25 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $2349.00 Alt
Size -39"L x 16"W x 34"H - 86 Ibs. ) $2999.00 Alt
Unisource $1895.00 Alt
Brand Eennant EX-SC-716 Waxie $1795.00 Alt
Bid - 9007484 WCP $1628.85
# 12 |EXTRACTOR, CARPET Action Time USA, Inc. $1200.95 Alt Action Time USA $1200.95
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $1541.00
Oreck Flor Care Center $1599.00 Alt
Size -36"H x 34.5"L x 13"W - 68 . $1699.00 Alt
Ibs. Unisource $1695.00 Alt
Waxie $1599.00
Brand ‘?dvance AquaClean 12ST WCP $1659.99 Alt
Bid - 56265300
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# 13 |EXTRACTOR, CARPET Action Time USA, Inc. $2051.50 Alt Frontier Paper $2302.00
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $2302.00
Oreck Flor Care Center $1899.00 Alt
Size -100 Ibs. $2349.00 Alt
Unisource $1895.00 Alt
Brand ‘?dvance AquaClean 16XP Waxie $2405.82
Biq. [#56265000 WCP $1628.85 Alt
# 14 |EXTRACTOR, CARPET Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid Waxie $1275.00
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $973.75 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $1349.00 Alt
Size -25.75"H x 11.5" W x 22" D - Unisource No Bid
39 Ibs. Waxie $1275.00 Alt
. WCP No Bid
Brand Rug Doctor Mighty Pro X3
. (Costco #667156)
Bid -
# 15 [EXTRACTOR, PORTABLE Action Time USA, Inc. $531.80 Action Time USA $531.80
SPOT AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $475.00 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $499.00 Alt
Size -21" Lx7.75"Wx 175" H; ~ Jnisource $675.00 Alt
18 Ibs. Waxie $495.00 Alt
WCP $596.17
Nobles EX-SPOT-2
Brand
Bid -
# 16 FLOOR MACHINE, DUAL Action Time USA, Inc. $1135.00 Froniter Paper $915.97
SPEED AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $915.97 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $1099.00 Alt
Size -48’H x 23.5'L x 20"W - 97 Jnisource $945.00 Alt
b, Waxie $775.10 Alt
WCP $997.20
Nobles #FM-20-DS
Brand

Bid -
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# 17  |SCRUBBER, RIDER Action Time USA, Inc. $12,674.99 WCP $10603.92
(BATTERY POWERED) AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $12550.00 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $12355.00 Alt
Size -585 Ibs. 31.5"W x 50"H x $11382.00 Alt
60°L $12999.00 Alt
. } Unisource $9350.00 Alt
Brand ;e””asnt Tgt')\’“cro'R'der Waxie $12338.00 Alt
Bid - oor scrubber WCP $10603.92
# 18  |SCRUBBER, WALK Action Time USA, Inc. $5200.00 Alt Unisource $5295.00
BEHIND (COMPACT) AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $6476.25 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $4999.00 Alt
Size -51” x 29" x 42" $6899.00 Alt
$4500.00 Alt
Brand Clarke Focus Il BOOST L20 $5300.00 Alt
Bid - Unisource $5295.00
Waxie $4335.00 Alt
WCP $5493.66
# 19 SCRUBBER, WALK- Action Time USA, Inc. $9030.00 Alt Unisource $5995.00
BEHIND AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $8107.75 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $6999.00 Alt
Size - 364 Ibs. w/o batteries $7599.00 Alt
_ $8999.00 Alt
Brand IXdesor Saber Cutter Unisource $7995.00
Big. [79-840-160.0 $5995.00 Alt
Waxie $7791.42
WCP $7429.48 Alt
# 20  |SCRUBBER, WALK- Action Time USA, Inc. $4390.99 WCP $4043.78
BEHIND AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $3997.50 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $3595.00 Alt
Size -48"L x 30°W x 43"H - 319 . $3999.00 Alt
Ibs Unisource $3695.00 Alt
’ ) Waxie $3924.05 Alt
Brand Tennant T3 Walk-Behind WCP $4043.78

Bid -
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# 21 ACUUM / BLOWER, Action Time USA, Inc. No Bid NO AWARD
BACKPACK AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center $329.00 Alt
Size - 13"W x 19-1/2"H - White Unisource $318.00 Alt
Waxie $299.95 Alt
Brand Pullman-Holt P7 #B200642  \wcCP No Bid
Bid - (Global #WGB286940)
# 22 ACUUM, UPRIGHT Action Time USA, Inc. $306.67 Alt Action Time USA $306.67
(BAGLESS) AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center $319.00 Alt
) Unisource $475.00
Size -
WCP $312.04
Brand Eanitaire #H-2665 (Uline
Rid. [MEUK-SC58458)
# 23 |VACUUM, BACKPACK Action Time USA, Inc. $481.34 Alt Waxie $299.95
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $351.76
Oreck Flor Care Center $332.00 Alt
Size - Unisource $370.00
$318.00 Alt
Brand Pro Team Super CgachVac Waxie $299.95
Bid - HEPA #107119 / Kit 107100 wcCP $340.81
# 24 |VACUUM, BACKPACK Action Time USA, Inc. $481.34 Alt Waxie $299.95
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $334.12
Oreck Flor Care Center $374.00 Alt
Size - Unisource $340.00
$318.00 Alt
Brand Lljroteam CogchVac Waxie $299.95 Alt.
Bid - 107124 / Kit B #107098 WCP $331.89
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# 25 |\/ACUUM, BACKPACK Action Time USA, Inc. $451.00 Alt Waxie $299.95
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $351.76
Oreck Flor Care Center $371.00 Alt
Size - Unisource $370.00
$318.00 Alt
Brand Pro Team Super QuarterVac \axie $299.95
Bid - HEPA #107118 / Kit 107100 wcCpP $340.81
# 26 |\/ACUUM, BACKPACK Action Time USA, Inc. $451.00 Alt Waxie $299.95
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $351.76
Oreck Flor Care Center $371.00 Alt
Size - Unisource $370.00
$318.00 Alt
Brand ProTeam Super Quartervac  \Waxie $299.95 Alt
Bid - HEPA #107108 / Kit WCP $340.81
107098
# 27 |VACUUM, BACKPACK Action Time USA, Inc. $481.34 Alt WCP $340.81
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $351.76
Oreck Flor Care Center $374.00 Alt
Size - Unisource $370.00
$318.00 Alt
Brand Proteam Super CogchVac Waxie $299.95 Alt
Bid - HEPA #107109 / Kit B WCP $340.81
107098
# 28 |VACUUM, BACKPACK Action Time USA, Inc. $451.00 Alt Frontier Paper $351.76
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $351.76
Oreck Flor Care Center $371.00 Alt
Size - Unisource $370.00
$318.00 Alt
Brand Proteam Super QuarterVac  \Waxie $299.95 Alt
Bid - HEPA Kit #101336 WCP $340.81 Alt
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# 29 |VACUUM, LARGE AREA Action Time USA, Inc. $1829.00 Alt Waxie $1903.37
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $1259.15 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $2629.00 Alt
Size -41"L x 29.5"W x 38" - 111 . $1699.00 Alt
Ibs. Unisource $2150.00 Alt
dvance CarpeTriever 28 Waxie $1903.37
B WCP 1764.89 Al
rand 'z56330020 $1764.89 Alt
Bid -
# 30 |VACUUM, UPRIGHT Action Time USA, Inc. $267.88 Alt Waxie $299.95
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $366.44
Oreck Flor Care Center $599.00 Alt
Size - . $419.00 Alt
Unisource $360.00
Brand ProTeam Proforce 1500XP $325.00 Alt
Bid - HEPA #107252 (Waxie Waxie $299.95
573222) WCP $323.19
# 31 |VACUUM, UPRIGHT Action Time USA, Inc. $430.20 Alt Unisource $495.00
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper No Bid
Oreck Flor Care Center $599.00 Alt
Size -18" - 19 Ibs. . $649.00 Alt
_ Unisource $575.00
Brand r/vlndsor Sensor XP . $495.00 Alt
Bid - SRXP18 #1.012-030.0 Waxie $604.98
WCP No Bid
# 32 ACUUM, UPRIGHT Action Time USA, Inc. $699.99 Alt NO AWARD
(DUAL MOTOR) AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $366.44 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $399.00 Alt
Size -14.5"L x 14"W x 47"H - 21 $629.00 Al
Ibs $409.00 Alt
' Unisource $450.00 Alt
Brand |1€nnant #3220 Waxie $263.00 Alt*
Bid - WCP $595.42 Alt
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# 33 r/ACUUM, UPRIGHT Action Time USA, Inc. $699.99 WCP $595.42
(DUAL MOTOR) AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $366.44 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $419.00 Alt
Size -14.5"L x 14"W x 47'H - 21 . $629.00 Alt
Ibs. Umspurce $450.00 Alt
i Waxie $299.95 Alt
Brand Eennant Heavy Duty Upright WCP $595.42
. V-HDU-14
Bid -
# 34 |VACUUM, WET/DRY Action Time USA, Inc. $526.63 Alt Waxie $398.68
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $727.50 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $969.00 Alt
Size - . $449.00 Alt
Unisource $435.00 Alt
Brand kj/axie 17 Gallon Wet/Dry Waxie $398.68
Biq. |vac#572302 wcpP $450.05 Alt
#35  |VACUUM, WET/DRY Action Time USA, Inc. $614.00 WCP $450.05
AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $727.50 Alt
Oreck Flor Care Center $399.00 Alt
Size -37.5"H x 29" L x 15.5" W - . $499.00 Alt
44 Ibs. Unlspurce $435.00 Alt
Waxie $398.68 Alt
Brand Tennant V-WD-15 #9007469 WCP $450.05
Bid -
# 36 ACUUM, WET/DRY Action Time USA, Inc. $1376.99 Frontier Paper $727.50
(WITH SQUEEGEE) AlH No Bid
Frontier Paper $727.50 Alt.
Oreck Flor Care Center $559.00 Alt
i Unisource $495.00 Alt
Size - .
Waxie $569.00 Alt
Brand Tennant V-WD-16P Vacuum \wcCpP $1218.92

& Tennant #190108

Bid -
Saueeaee




