KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Page 1 of 5

Purchasing Department RECAP
N 139 E. Park Avenue BID 124-14
g Soldotna, Alaska 99669 Due date 2-4-14
w

here kids come first (907) 714-8876 FAX (907) 262-7165

(Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }
# 01 FIXTURES, LED Full Compass $1695.00 Stagecraft Ind. $1644.78
SOURCE FOUR Stagecraft Industries $1644.78
B&H Photo $2145.00
Size -Black
Brand [ETC Source Four LED Lustr
+ (Full Compass #S4LEDLS
-0B)
# 02 FIXTURES, ETC Full Compass $290.00 Stagecraft Ind. $257.67
SOURCE FOUR JR. Stagecraft Industries $257.67
B&H Photo $275.00
Size -Black
Brand |[ETC Source Four Jr Zoom
(Full Compass #S4JR
-25/50-B)
# 03 FIXTURE, Full Compass $240.00 ** Stagecraft Ind. $217.71
SOURCE FOUR PARNEL  Stagecraft Industries $217.71
B&H Photo $255.00
Size -Black
Brand [ETC Source Four PARNel
(Full Compass #PARNEL-B)
# 04 LAMPS, TUNGSTEN Full Compass $23.00 Stagecraft Ind. $12.49
HALOGEN Stagecraft Industries $12.49
B&H Photo $12.00 *
Size -

Brand |Ushio HPL575/115V

* Does Not Meet Specifications  ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB: Soldotna ****Draw *****No Award-bid as all or none >>All or None
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# 05 LAMPS, TUNGSTEN Full Compass $23.00 Stagecraft Ind. $12.49
HALOGEN Stagecraft Industries $12.49
B&H Photo $13.00 *
Size -
Brand |Ushio HPL750/115X
# 06 CONTROLS, THEATRE Full Compass $7.00 Stagecraft Ind. $5.03
PATTERN HOLDER Stagecraft Industries $5.03
B&H Photo $7.00
Size -M Size
Brand |ETC Theatre Controls
400PH-M
# 07  |CABLES, SAFETY Full Compass $9.50 B&H Photo $9.00
Stagecraft Industries $2.72 Alt **
B&H Photo $9.00
Size -30" - Black
Brand [ETC 400SC Source Four
Safety Cable
# 08 CONTROLS, THEATRE Full Compass $15.00 Stagecraft Ind. $14.84
C-CLAMP Stagecraft Industries $14.84
B&H Photo $15.00
Size - Black
Brand |ETC 400CC C-Clamp
# 09 |CABLE, LIGHTING Full Compass $29.95 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $21.98
Stagecraft Industries $21.98 Alt
B&H Photo $37.00 Alt

Size -5 - Black
Brand |Norcostco #F780
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# 10 |CABLE, LIGHTING Full Compass $39.00 alt Stagecraft Ind. $30.77
Stagecraft Industries $30.77 Alt
B&H Photo $40.00 Alt

Size -10’ - Black
Brand |Norcostco #F782

# 11 |CABLE, LIGHTING Full Compass $59.55 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $51.46
Stagecraft Industries $51.46 Alt
B&H Photo $52.00 Alt

Size -25’ - Black
Brand |N0rcostco #F784

#12  |CABLES, LIGHTING Full Compass $95.00 Alt B & H Photo $77.00
Stagecraft Industries $83.87 Alt
B&H Photo $77.00 Alt

Size -50’ - Black
Brand |Norcostco #F786

# 13 |STAGE PIN TWO-FER Full Compass $49.00 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $40.11
Stagecraft Industries $40.11 Alt
B&H Photo No Bid
Size - Black

Brand |N0rcostco #F175

# 14 |LED STRIP, QUAD COLOR  Full Compass $737.00 Stagecraft Ind. $728.00
Stagecraft Industries $728.60
B&H Photo No Bid

Size -40.25” (L) x 8.5” (W) x 9" (H)
-21 Ibs.
Brand |[Elation Pro Lighting ELED-
QW-STRIP
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# 15 |LIGHT, BLACK Full Compass $279.95 B&H Photo $185.00
Stagecraft Industries $206.40
B&H Photo $185.00
Size -15"H x 13.75"W x 14.25"D -
26.7 Ibs.
Brand IAmerican DJ UV-Cannon
# 16 CABLES, CONTROL Full Compass $22.25 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $16.25
3 PIN DMX Stagecraft Industries $16.25 Alt
B&H Photo No Bid
Size -5’ L
Brand |N0rcostco #F292
# 17 CABLES, CONTROL Full Compass $29.00 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $18.13
3 PIN DMX Stagecraft Industries $18.13 Alt
B&H Photo No Bid
Size -10' L
Brand |Norcostco #F293
# 18 CABLES, CONTROL Full Compass $44.00 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $25.82
3 PIN DMX Stagecraft Industries $25.82 Alt
B&H Photo No Bid
Size -25' L
Brand |N0rcostco #F295
# 19 CABLES, CONTROL Full Compass $55.00 Alt Stagecraft Ind. $35.71
3 PIN DMX Stagecraft Industries $35.71 Alt
B&H Photo No Bid
Size -50' L
Brand |Norcostco #F296
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# 20 |STROBE LIGHT, LED Full Compass $149.00 Full Compass $149.00
Stagecraft Industries $175.46
B&H Photo No Bid

Size -12.59"L x 5.51"W x 3.54"H -

3.52 Ibs.
Brand [Blizzard Lighting
SNOWBLIND
# 21 FADER WING, Full Compass $977.00 Stagecraft Ind. $843.96
UNIVERSAL Stagecraft Industries $843.96
B&H Photo $1015.00
Size-2x 10
Brand |[ETC FADW-2 x 10
# 22 |PLATINUM SPOT Full Compass $2652.00 Full Compass $2652.00
Stagecraft Industries $2729.67
B&H Photo No Bid
Size -14.6"L x 14.5W" x 18.4"H -
42 |bs.
Brand |Elation Pro Lighting
Platinum Spot 5R Pro
# 23 |CONTROL CONSOLE, Full Compass $9950.00 Stagecraft Ind. $5560.44
LIGHTING Stagecraft Industries $5560.44
B&H Photo $7132.00
Size -
Brand |[ETC ION-1000
# 24 |RADIO FOCUS REMOTE Full Compass $1895.00 Stagecraft Ind. $1739.01
Stagecraft Industries $1739.01
B&H Photo $885.00 *

Size -

Brand [ETC Radio Focus Remote
(RFR) #Net3-RFR




