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       RECAP
   Bid #115-14

Due Date:  12-20-2013

01 CLIMBING WALL
     DIMENSIONAL ROCK
20’ W  x  8’ H

Gopher “ULTRAVERSE” #87
-418

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
2899.00
No Bid
4778.28
No Bid
No Bid
3255.00*

Gopher Sport 2899.00

02 ADDITIONAL CLIMBING
WALL PANEL
     DIMENSIONAL ROCK
4’ W  x  8’ H

Gopher “ULTRAVERSE” #87
-417

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
579.00
No Bid
741.52
No Bid
No Bid
680.00

Gopher Sport 579.00

03 DISCUS CAGE

GILL ATHLETICS Z5003
#8021

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

4275.00
4368.00***
No Bid
3895.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
6734.90

MFAC LLC 3895.00

04 DISCUS CAGE
        PORTABLE

GILL ATHLETICS #732220

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

8345.00
6885.00***
No Bid
7595.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
9430.40

MFAC LLC 7595.00

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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05 BASKETBALL GOAL

FIRST TEAM
“POWERMOUNT
ADVANTAGE”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1178.75 Alt
3163.40 Alt

No Award

06 BASKETBALL GOAL

FIRST TEAM
“WALLMONSTER ARENA”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
4077.60 Alt

No Award

07 PING PONG TABLE
            OUTDOOR
9’  x  5’  (International Size)

KETTLER “STOCKHOLM”
GT TTT #7162-490

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
868.98
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
596.61
975.90

School
Specialty

596.61

08 VOLLEYBALL NET
SYSTEM
Net Color:  Yellow

ATS Competitive System

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
576.15 Alt

US Games 576.15

09 VOLLEYBALL NET
SYSTEM
           CONTINUED (#8)

ATS Competitive System

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games
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10 ACTIVITY CART

39" H x 36" W x 18" D

Kaplan Learning”Mobile
Gross Motor” #70162

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
176.65 Alt
No Bid
231.14
466.70

Nasco 176.95

11 BALL CART

39" H x 36" W x 18" D

TITAN “ALL-TERRAIN”
(Gopher #89-709)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
449.00
No Bid
534.64
No Bid
359.47 Alt*
369.20 Alt*

Gopher 449.00

12 PE CART

46-1/4" H x 32" W x 45” L

Gopher UltraCart
MountainGoat #89-611

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
399.00
No Bid
499.63
No Bid
238.14 Alt
317.20

Gopher Sport 399.00

13 BALL RACK
     SINGLE, WALL MOUNT
22" W x 12" D x 66” H

TITAN (Gopher #89-619)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
NoBid
109.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
126.10

Gopher Sport 109.00

14 JUMP ROPE / HOOP
PACKAGE

BSN Sports #1275079

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
506.60

US Games 506.60



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669 

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 4  of 9

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #115-14

Due Date:  12-20-2013

15 SOCCER GOAL

White

SKLZ Quickster Kickster

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
135.00
No Bid
No Bid
123.08
No Bid
406.73 Alt
206.35

Nasco 123.08

16 REPLACEMENT NET,
CLUB
       BADMINTON

Gopher #56-503

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
46.25
23.58
No Bid
17.46
No Bid
14.93 **
27.95

Nasco 17.46

17 STOPWATCH
     SOLAR-POWERED
Black

ULTRAK 350
(Gopher #91-570)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

24.00
21.50***
17.98
45.00
15.78
No Bid
14.80
19.40 alt

School
Specialty

14.80

17 STOPWATCH

Black

ROBIC SC-505W
(Gopher #91-144)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

21.00
161.00/6***
24.48
No Bid
19.51
No Bid
18.96
25.65

School
Specialty

18.96

18 FOLDING PANEL MAT

6’  x  12’  x  2”

AK Athletic Equipment, Inc
#USAM-6122

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
470.00***
645.00
No Bid
489.57
No Bid
134.98 Alt
728.05 Alt

No Award
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19 WALL PAD
      WOOD BACKED
2’  x  6’  x  2”

AK Athletic Equipment, Inc

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
70.00***
248.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
236.45 *

No Award

20 YARNBALLS
     EASY CATCH
3 inch

Sportime #1272708

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
9.69
No Bid
9.57
45.60/4

School
Specialty

9.57

21 BEACH BALL

24 inch

SCHOOL SMART
(Sportime  #1268774)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1.20
No Bid
5.99
3.60

Nasco 1.20

22 JUGGLING SCARVES

16 inch square

JUGGLETIME
(Sportime  #1004604)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
14.38
No Bid
12.33
No Bid
13.13
10.20

US Games 10.20

23 BEAN BAGS
    PRINTED
2 inch square;  4 ounce

School Specialty #004622

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
8.66
12.60

School
Specialty

8.66
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24 BASEBALL GLOVE
     INTERMEDIATE
12 inch

Sportime Yeller #087976

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
24.61
No Bid
25.20
21.50 Alt

US Games 21.50

25 BASEBALL GLOVE
     INTERMEDIATE
12 inch

Sportime Yeller #087978

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
24.61
No Bid
30.46
21.50 Alt

US Games 21.50

26 FRISBEE

140 grams

FRISBEE WHAM-O WORLD
CLASS ULTIMATE
(School Specialty #025116)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
9.78
7.80

US Games 7.80

27 BOOTA FOOTBAG

HACKEY-SACK
(School Specialty #022141)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
19.37
25.20

School
Specialty

19.37

28 SCOOTER BOARD
      WITH HANDLE
16 inch

CRAMER “COSOM
DELUXE”
(School Specialty #1284902)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
34.48
No Bid
16.02
No Bid
33.84
55.20 Alt

Nasco 16.02



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669 

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 7  of 9

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #115-14

Due Date:  12-20-2013

29 DODGEBALL

6 inch

CHAMPION
(School Specialty #1445381)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
70.52
No Bid
50.83
48.60 Alt

US Games 48.60

30 RELAY BATONS

1-1/4” D  x  14” L

Gopher “Rainbow” #12-521

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3.40 ea ***
18.68
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
19.58
18.60  Alt

Gopher Sports 18.68

31 PLAY TUNNEL
     COLOSSAL
12’ L x 36’ D

US Games “Prism Pack”
#1316667

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
102.00
97.20

US Games 97.20

32 CATCH NET
      ADJUSTABLE

US Games “Prism Pack”
#1275063

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
86.12 Alt
99.60

School
Specialty

86.12

33 TRACKERS
      JUMBO
20” L x 8-3/4” W

US Games “Color My Class”
#1008609

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
93.03 Alt
140.40

School
Specialty

93.03
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34 BEAN BAG TOSS GAME

BAGGO
(US Games #1269000)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
106.28
No Bid
89.96
No Bid
102.99
163.50

Nasco 89.96

35 BEAN BAG TOSS

US Games #1297119

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
47.77
51.80

School
Specialty

47.77

36 STORAGE BENCH
        POOL
27.25” H  x  96” W  x  27.25”

Lincoln Commercial Pool
Equipment #51-175

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

37 KICKBOARD

18” L  x  11-1/2” W

CHAMPION
(Lincoln Commercial Pool
Equipment #54-002)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty 
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
15.45 Alt

US Games 15.45
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38 SWIM FIN

TYR CROSSBLADE
#LFCROSS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco

Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
22.53,17.21
23.76,19.13
21.46 *
No Bid
No Bid
31.70 Alt *

No Award

39 LIFE VEST
  GENERAL PURPOSE
Universal (Adult)

STEARNS Model #2001

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
20.70 Alt

US Games 20.70

40 BOATING VEST

Youth (50-90 lbs)

STEARNS Model #3007

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Aluminum Athletic Equip Co
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Riddell
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
19.90 Alt

US Games 19.90


