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Bid #126-14
Due Date: 2-14-2014

[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
001  |RECEPTION DESK Arctic Office Products 1949.00  School 1889.00
Size - |72,,W « 84"D x 42" H Capital Offlc_e 2209_.81 Alt Specialty
Brand |pMI Furntiture Pimlico School Outfitters No Bid
Bid-  |collection School Specialty 1889_.00
S Staples No Bid
002 [RECEPTION DESK Arctic Office Products 1949.00 School 1889.00
Size - |72,,W « 84"D x 42" H Capital Offlge 2209:81 Alt Specialty
Brand |oMI Furntiture Pimlico School Outfitters No Bid
Bid-  |Collection School Specialty 1889:00
S Staples No Bid
003 L-STATION DESK Arctic Office Products 985.00 Arctic Office 985.00
RIGHT HAND Capital Office 1130.94
Size - [72" x 84" Footprint School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HON 10700 Series School Specialty 1063.45
Bid - H107LR7284J Staples 1051.68
004 TEACHER DESK Arctic Office Products 519.00 Alt  Arctic Office 519.00
DOUBLE PEDESTAL Capital Office 544.00
Size- [29" high X 59-1/4" wide X  School Outfitters 375.00*
Brand [NORWOOD COMMERCIAL School Specialty 569.73
Bid - IFURNITURE Staples No Bid
005 [KEYBOARD PLATFORM Arctic Office Products 76.00 Arctic Office 76.00
size- [10Dx 1.17H x 11"L Capital Office 84.58
Brand |HON SLIDE.AWAY #4022] School Outfitters No Bid
Bid - ) School Specialty 111.86
Staples 99.68
006 DESK Arctic Office Products 679.00 School 697.01
DOUBLE PEDESTAL Capital Office 713.26 Specialty
Size - [29-1/2" high X 60" wide X  School Oultfitters No Bid
Brand |HON 38000 Series School Specialty 697.01
Bid - H38155NS Staples 740.88

* Does Not Meet Specifications

** No Specificiations Provided
****DraW

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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007 FLUSH RETURN Arctic Office Products 449.00 School 430.93
RIGHT Capital Office 444.34 Specialty
Size - [29-1/2" high X 24" wide X  School Oultfitters No Bid
Brand |HON 38000 Series School Specialty 430.93
Bid - 1438215RCL Staples 462.73
oos  |DESK SHELL Arctic Office Products 465.00 Arctic Office  465.00
Size- |29-1/2 high X 72" wide x ~ C@pital Office 536.72
Brand |HON VALIDO Series H11594 School Outflt.ters No Bid
Bid - School Specialty 485.92
Staples 463.68
009 |DESK BRIDGE RETURN Arctic Office Products 275.00 Arctic Office 275.00
RIGHT Capital Office 313.14
Size - |42” School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HON VALIDO Series H11561 School Specialty 296.57
Bid - Staples 311.36
010 BOX /BOX/ FILE Arctic Office Products 298.00 Arctic Office 298.00
PE%EggﬁbVER Capital Office 338.70
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - |Mahogany / Crescent School Specialty 322.27
gr:nd |HON VALIDO Series H11502  Staples 351.12
id -
011 |FILE PEDESTAL Arctic Office Products 295.00 Arctic Office 295.00
2 DRAWER Capital Office 334.98
size - [Mahogany / Crescent School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HON VALIDO Series H11504 School Specialty 319.13
Bid - Staples 351.12
012 IpESK Arctic Office Products 879.00 Arctic Office 879.00
Size- [71"W x 89'D x 295" H Capital Offige 1242:12 Alt
_ _ _ School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |National Business Furniture . .
Bid - [signature Series #15779 School Specialty No B!d
Staples No Bid
013 DESK Arctic Office Products 689.00 Arctic Office 689.00
DOUBLE PEDESTAL  Capital Office 811.77 Alt
Size - [66"W x 30"D x 29" H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [OFFICE SOURCE PL Series School Specialty No Bid
Bid- 4P 350 Staples No Bid
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014 |KEYBOARD Arctic Office Products 275.00 School 245.04
CORNER Capital Office 246.93 Specialty
size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |FELLOWES School Specialty 245.04
Bid - IPROFESSIONAL Staples No Bid
015 DESK Arctic Office Products 748.00 Arctic Office 748.00
BOW FRONT Capital Office 946.30 Alt
Size - |29-1/2” Hx 42"D x 71"W  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |National Business Furniture ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid - ISignature Series Staples No Bid
016 IpESK Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital Office  760.18
Size- |60"W x 22'D x 42" H Capital Offige 760.1.8
_ _ _ School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |National Business Furniture . .
Bid - [signature Series Statesman School Specialty No B!d
S Staples No Bid
017 DESK Arctic Office Products 935.00 Arctic Office 935.00
DOUBLE PEDESTAL Capital Office 1252.40
Size- [60"W x 32"D x 29" H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [MARTIN FURNITURE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - [contemporary Collection Staples No Bid
018 DESK Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital Office  2468.27
nggéPE WITH LEFT Capital Office 2468.27
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - |71.75"W x 93.813"D x School Specialty No Bid
B_rand National Business Furniture Staples No Bid
Bid - [Clever Collection #15151
019 |cREDENZA Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital Office  1332.38
size- [71.75"W x 22063’ D x  Capital Office 1332.38
_ _ _ School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |National Business Furniture . .
Bid - |Clever Collection #15167 School Specialty No B!d
Staples No Bid
020 CREDENZA Arctic Office Products 1569.00 School 942.35
KNEESPACE Capital Office 1204.50  Specialty
Size - [72"W x 24"D x 30" H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |OFFICE STAR Mendocino  School Specialty 942.35
Bid - |Collection Staples No Bid
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021 DESK Arctic Office Products 2117.00 School 1257.14
EXECUTIVE Capital Office 1599.42  Specialty
Size - |72"W x 36"D x 30" H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |OFFICE STAR Mendocino  School Specialty 1257.14
Bid - |Collection Staples No Bid
022 [BoOKCASE Arctic Office Products 867.00 School 547.86
Size - |36,,W « 16"D x 79" H Capital Offlge 669.57 Specialty
Brand |OFFICE STAR Mendocino School Outfitters No Bid
Bid- |coflection School Specialty 547.36
S Staples No Bid
023 [BookcAsE Arctic Office Products 854.00 School 408.05
Size - |36,,W « 16" D x 49" H Capital Offlge 496.§4 Specialty
Brand |OFEICE STAR Mendoci School Outfitters No Bid
Bid-  |Collecti enaoein® school Specialty 408.05
ollection .
S Staples No Bid
024 FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products 868.00 School 512.41
LATERAL Capital Office 657.72 Specialty
Size- [36"W x 24"D x 30" H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [OFFICE STAR Mendocino School Specialty 512.41
Bid - [collection Staples No Bid
025 FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital Office  761.54
LATERAL Capital Office 761.54 Alt
size- [37.375"W x 23"D x 29.25" School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |National Business Furniture ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid - [Clever Collection #30397 Staples No Bid
026 [BooKCASE Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital Office  863.01
Size- [37.719°W x 147D x Capital Offlge 863.91 Alt
_ _ _ School Oultfitters No Bid
Brand |National Business Furniture School S ialt No Bid
Bid - |Clever Collection #32603 chool speciafty 0Bl
Staples No Bid
027 FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products 189.00 School 174.60
VERTICAL Capital Office 184.44 Specialty
. School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [Black School Specialty 174.60
Brand |HON #512P-P Staples 182.56

Bid -
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028 LATERAL FILE Arctic Office Products 489.00 Arctic Office 489.00
2 DRAWER Capital Office 538.47
Size - |29-5/8"H x 20"D x 36"W  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HON 10700 Series School Specialty 509.84
Bid - #HON10762J Staples 534.24
029 FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products 489.00 Arctic Office 489.00
LATERAL Capital Office 536.61
Size - |40 7/8"D x 19 1/4"H x 42" School Oulffitters No Bid
Brand |HON 600 Series #683L-P  School Specialty 507.92
Bid - Staples 530.88
030 |FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products 289.00 School 250.11
LATERAL Capital Office 342.10 Specialty
Size - |Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HON 510 Series #514P-P  School Specialty 250.11
Bid - Staples 254.84
031  [STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products 998.00 School 991.88
Size - |2 2D x 66-5/8" H x 36" W Capital Offic_e 1049_.02 Specialty
Brand |HON 10500 Series H105299 School Outflt_t ers No Bid
Bid - School Specialty 991.88
Staples 1027.60
032 |FILE CABINET, FIRE Arctic Office Products 3689.00 Arctic Office 3689.00
LATERAL Capital Office 4204.36
Size - |20-4” D x 53.6"H x42.8"W School Ouffitters 4600.00
Brand |SENTRY SAFE #414310B School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 3898.20
033 FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products 569.00 School 550.32
LATERAL Capital Office 579.94 Specialty
Size - J0-7/8"H x 19-1/4"D x 36" School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HON BRIGADE 700 Series  School Specialty 550.32
Bid - t783LS Staples 586.88
034 FILE CABINET Arctic Office Products 618.00 Alt  Staples 400.00
LATERAL Capital Office 542.74 Alt
Size - |18-3/4"D x 52-1/2"H x 30" School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |OFFICE MAX 10000 Series ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid - lcommercial #OM05840 Staples 400.00 Alt
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035 PEDESTAL Arctic Office Products 358.00 Arctic Office 358.00
FIEENC'L DRAWER, BOX,  Capital Office 504.79
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - |15-1/4"W x 18-7/8'D x 26 gehggl Specialty No Bid
Brand |VIRCO PLATEAU SERIES  Staples No Bid
Bid - #PDM1519PBFS
036 [FILE CREDENZA Arctic Office Products 1629.00 Arctic Office 1629.00
Size- |62'W x 18-7/8°D x 200w Capital Office 2211.44
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand VIRCO PLATEAU SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  4PTCF2062FCFL pecially .
Staples No Bid
037 DESK Arctic Office Products 607.00 Alt Capital Office  544.00
CREDENZA Capital Office 544.00
_ _ School Outfitters 400.00*
Size - |29-1/2" high X 60" wide X School Sp@Clalty 589.00
Brand |SANDUSKY LEE 500 Series ~ Staples No Bid
Bid - #30082-BW
038 TEACHER DESK Arctic Office Products 547.00 Alt  Arctic Office 547.00
STEEL Capital Office 881.11
Size - [29-1/2" high X 60" wide X  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [OFFICE SOURCE #LBA098- School Specialty No Bid
Bid - IDQ6030 Staples No Bid
039  [TEACHER DESK Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital Office ~ 1214.77
Size- 29" high X 60" wide X 26+ Capital Office 1214.77
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [EMPOWERED Il #6026A School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |(Hertz Furniture #EMP chool speclalty 0Bl
: Staples No Bid
os0  |DESK Arctic Office Products 839.00 Staples 813.34
Size- [29-7/8" high X 86-1/2" wide Capital Office 871.32
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |BUSH CUBIX Model School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  |RPLOOLHC chool Specialty o Bi
Staples 813.34
041 DESK Arctic Office Products 225.00 Arctic Office 225.00
COMPUTER Capital Office 240.68
Size - [29.75" high X 47.5"wide X  School Oultfitters No Bid
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialty No Bid
Bid - 1A #WC-90448A Staples 269.50
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[ Iltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
042 DESK Arctic Office Products 299.00 Arctic Office 299.00
CORNER Capital Office 312.69
Size - [29-3/4" high X 47-1/8” wide School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |BUSH FURNITURE SERIES ~School Specialty No Bid
Bid - 1A #WC-90466A Staples 337.60
043 DESK Arctic Office Products 207.00 Arctic Office 207.00
COMPUTER Capital Office 217.57
Size - [29.75” high X 35.63” wide X School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |BUSH FURNITURE SERIES ~School Specialty No Bid
Bid- | #WC-90436A Staples 248.52
044 |F|LE CABINET Arctic Office Products 243.00 Staples 199.86
size- [27.88 high X 15.75" wide x Capital Office 266.80
School Outfitters 395.00
Brand |BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  |a #WC-94453 chool Specialty 0 Bi
Staples 199.86
045 [FILE cABINET Arctic Office Products 239.00 Staples 199.86
size- [27.88" high X 15.75"wide x Capital Office 249.26
School Outfitters 325.00
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |a #WC-94452 P y
Staples 199.86
046 |LIBRARIAN DESK Arctic Office Products No Bid
size- [72’W x 30"D x 29" H Capital Office No Bid
Brand |TEXWOOD 48315290 School Outfitters No Bid
Bid - School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
047 SINGLE LD WITH Arctic Office Products No Bid Capital 469.03
WORKSURFACE + Capital Office 469.03
Size - School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |ERGOTRON WORKFIT-A School Specialty No Bid
Bid - 424-317-026 Staples No Bid
048 CONFERENCE TABLE Arctic Office Products 828.00 Capital Office  797.00
BOAT-SHAPED Capital Office 797.00
Size - [29-1/2"high X 72"long X  School Ouftfitters 1060.00
Brand |MAYLINE GROUP CORSICA School Specialty No Bid
Bid-  ISERIES #CTC72 Staples No Bid
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049 |cONFERENCE TABLE Arctic Office Products 391.00 Arctic Office 391.00
Size- |29-7/8" high X 81-5/8"long CaPital Office 412.28
School Outfitters No Bid
prand [BUSH WESTFIELD School Specialt No Bid
Bid - ICOLLECTION ¢ P y
Staples 414.12
050 |CONFERENCE TABLE Arctic Office Products 4124.00  Arctic Office 4124.00
Size- |06 long X 42 deep Capital Offige 793.§0 Alt *
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [MAGNA DESIGN : :
Bid- FRACETRACK" Model School Specialty No B!d
Staples No Bid
051 CONFERENCE TABLE Arctic Office Products 867.00 School 522.40
ROUND Capital Office 708.30 Specialty
Size - 48" diameter School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |OFFICE STAR Mendocino ~ School Specialty 522.40
Bid - [collection Staples No Bid
052 CONFERENCE CHAIR Arctic Office Products 105.00 Arctic Office 105.00
WITH CASTERS Capital Office 177.70
Size- [30"H x 24"W x 25" D School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |FLASH FURNITURE Model ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid-  #BZ100BLK Staples 125.00
053 CONFERENCE CHAIR Arctic Office Products 276.00 School 223.43
ARMLESS Capital Office 311.76 Specialty
Size- [81.5"H x 225"W x 25"D  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [LESRO LENOX School Specialty 223.43
Bid- |COLLECTION L1102G5D  Staples No Bid
054 GUEST CHAIR Arctic Office Products 171.00 Arctic Office 171.00
WITH ARMS Capital Office 336.47
Size- [23"W x 23'D x 32"H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [National Business Furniture ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Signature Series “Fairbanks ~ Staples No Bid
054 GUEST CHAIR Arctic Office Products 127.00 Arctic Office 127.00
WITH ARMS Capital Office No Bid
size - [BLue School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [BOSS #95650BLUE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples No Bid
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[ Item# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
055 |TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 195.00 Alt  Arctic Office 195.00
MID-BACK Capital Office 351.11 Alt
Size - [43-3/4"H x 39-1/2’W x  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |QUANTUM REALSPACE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - IPRO #510830 Staples 107.75 Alt
056  |OFFICE CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - Capital Office No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [HERMAN MILLER “AERON” School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  #AE123AWB Cchool speciatly o=l
Staples No Bid
057 WORK sTOOL Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - |Size B Capital Offlc_e No B!d
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [HERMAN MILLER “AERON” School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  AE713AWBG1/AINNBBBK4 o100 SPecially ° =l
Staples No Bid
058 TASK STOOL Arctic Office Products 155.00 Arctic Office 155.00
" G\SJUSTABLE WITH Capital Office 168.93
_ School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [Black School Specialty 161.63
Brand |HON VOLT Series 5705gal0 Staples 222.88
Bid -
059  |OFFICE CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size- J2-45"H x 205" w x 15  Capital Office No Bid
Brand |HERMAN MILLER School Outfitters No Bid
Bid- FEMBODY” School Specialty No B!d
Staples No Bid
060 [rASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 90.00 Arctic Office 90.00
Size - [Black Capital Offlge 113.36
_ School Outfitters 130.00
Brand |VIRCO METAPHOR Series School Specialt No Bid
Bid - NITASK18BLKO1BLKO1 P y :
Staples No Bid
061 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 348.00 Alt  No Award
MESH Capital Office 376.00 Alt
Size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |[KARE PRODUCTS School Specialty No Bid
Bid - %706SSMMESH Staples No Bid
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062 [TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 388.00 Alt Capital Office  211.17
Size - |Navy (640-637) Capital Offic_e 211.17
Brand |0EM ING 500 Series Model School Outfitters 350.00
Bid- |g40 School Specialty 258.15
Staples No Bid
063 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 298.00 Capital Office  282.28
MID BACK Capital Office 282.28
Size - [Blue School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |SAFCO UBER BIG AND School Specialty No Bid
Bid-  [TALL #3941BU Staples 353.27
064 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 198.00 Alt ~ Staples 107.75
MID BACK Capital Office 209.04 Alt
Size- [26-3/4"W x 25-5/8"D x 38 School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [ACADIA Model 21517D School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |(Staples #570621) Staples 107.75
065 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 208.00 School 197.27
MESH Capital Office 197.33 Specialty
Size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |SAFCO VUE EXTENDED-  School Specialty 197.27
Bid - IHEIGHT #3395BL Staples 241.68
066 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 249.00 Capital Office  241.96
MESH Capital Office 241.96
Size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [SAFCO VUE INTENSIVE School Specialty 342.84
Bid-  |USE #3397BL Staples 402.49
067 MANAGER CHAIR Arctic Office Products 429.00 Alt  Staples 216.81
WITH FIXED ARMS Capital Office 235.12 Alt
Size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |Staples Denville Bonded School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |Leather Big & Tall Model Staples 216.81
068 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid Staples 118.44
WITH FIXED ARMS Capital Office No Bid
Size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [Staples Avero Mesh / Luxura School Specialty No Bid
Bid - [Model 20497-CC (Staples  Staples 118.44 Alt
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069 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid Staples 118.44
AR\KAV'STH ADJUSTABLE Capital Office 198.61 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [Black School Specialty No Bid
B.rand Staples Covair Luxura Model Staples 118.44
Bid - 123097
070 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 169.00 Alt  School 195.28
WITH ARMS Capital Office 299.28 Alt  Specialty
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [Black School Specialty 195.28
Brand |GLOBAL INDUSTRIES Staples 215.20 Alt
Bid-  IMESH HIGH BACK
071 |OFFICE CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid
size - | Capital Office No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand TRUE INNOVATIONS #9636 o\ oo No Bid
Bid-  |(Office Depot #301437) chool specialty .
Staples No Bid
072 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid
WITH ARMS Capital Office No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [Black School Specialty No Bid
Brand [BATTISTA Il #OM03978 Staples No Bid
Bid - [(OfficeMax #22317501)
073 TASK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 146.00 Alt  School 383.57
WITH ARMS Capital Office 324.57 Alt  Specialty
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [Black fabric and base School Specialty 383.57
Brand JANTHRO TECHNOLOGY Staples No Bid
Bid-  [FURNITURE BASIC CHAIR
074 CHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid
HIGH BACK Capital Office No Bid
Size - [Black School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |BOSS SEATING BURKE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - [collection Staples No Bid
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075 |CHAIR Arctic Office Products 199.00 Alt* Capital Office  246.00
EXECUTIVE Capital Office 246.00
size - |Gray seat and back School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [OFM #125-DK-801 With School Specialty 288.83
Bid - IDRAFTING KIT Staples No Bid
076 |CHAIR Arctic Office Products 108.00 Alt  Staples 99.69
EXECUTIVE Capital Office No Bid
Size - [22-3/4"W x 23-3/4"D x 35 School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |FLASH FURNITURE Model ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid-  |H8020-GG Staples 99.69
077 |KNEELING CHAIR Arctic Office Products 136.00 School 78.37
Size . |B|ack Capital Offige 115.1.9 Specialty
Brand |OEFICE STAR WORK School Outfitters No Bid
Bid- |SMART KC247-3 School Specialty 78.3?
Staples No Bid
o7s  [BALLCHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size- [22"W x 31"H x 22"D Capital Office No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |GAIAM CLASSIC BALANCE School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  |495-1004 chool Specialty o Bi
Staples No Bid
079 STOOL Arctic Office Products No Bid
BACKLESS Capital Office No Bid
size- [25"W x 20D x 225"~ School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [ERGOCRAFT School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples No Bid
080 |LITERATURE ORGANIZER  Arctic Office Products 170.00 Capital Office  165.12
32 Compartment Capital Office 165.12
size - [25.27high X 39.2"wide X  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |SAFECO #9494MO School Specialty 201.60
Bid - Staples 168.19
081 |LITERATURE ORGANIZER  Arctic Office Products 292.00 Arctic Office 292.00
21 Compartment Capital Office 484.00
size - [33"high X 30-5/8”wide X  School Outfitters No Bid
Brand [TENNSCO 4075 03 School Specialty No Bid

Bid - Staples No Bid
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082 ORKSURFACE (DESK  Arctic Office Products 263.00 Arctic Office 263.00
1) CORNER Capital Office 289.80 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Size- |47 D x 48" W Staples 263.20
Br:nd IALLSTEEL #834824RA
Bid -
083 IWORKSURFACE (DESK #1) Arctic Office Products 97.00 Arctic Office 97.00
PRIMARY Capital Office 97.53 Alt
Size - |24" D x 24"W School Outfitters No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #832424A School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 97.44
084 I\NORKSURFACE (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 308.00 Arctic Office 308.00
CORNER COVE Capital Office 467.23 Alt
size- [72" x 36-24L/30L School Outfitters No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #83232EL School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 308.00
085 IWORKSURFACE (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 189.00 Arctic Office 189.00
PRIMARY Capital Office 191.32 Alt
Size - |30" D x 60" W School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #833060A School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 187.04
086 IWORKSURFACE (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 139.00 Arctic Office 139.00
STRAIGHT Capital Office 232.68 Alt
Size- [15"D x 60" W School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #851560 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 135.52
087 IWORKSURFACE (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 114.00 Arctic Office 114.00
STRAIGHT Capital Office 178.82 Alt
Size - |15” D x 36"W School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #851536 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 114.24
088 SUPPORT, END PANEL Arctic Office Products 85.00 Arctic Office 85.00
(DESK ?Ii)EESTANDING Capital Office 224.96 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size- [24"D x 29-1/2"H School Specialty No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #CEP2429F Staples 85.12

Bid -
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089 SUPPORT, END PANEL Arctic Office Products 73.00 Arctic Office 73.00
(DESK ?Ii)EESTANDING Capital Office 11.67 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size- [24"D x 29-1/2"H School Specialty No Bid
Ef:nd IALLSTEEL #CSL2429F Staples 73.36
id -
090 MODESTY PANEL (DESK  Arctic Office Products 76.00 Arctic Office 76.00
1) UL HEIGHT Capital Office 99.64 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size- 24" W x 20-1/2" H School Specialty No Bid
:r;md IALLSTEEL #CS249 Staples 76.16
id -
091 MODESTY PANEL (DESK  Arctic Office Products 84.00 Arctic Office 84.00
1) UL HEIGHT Capital Office 125.21 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size- [48"W x 29-1/2°H School Specialty No Bid
Brand JALLSTEEL #CS489 Staples 84.00
id -
092 |LEG (DESK #1) Arctic Office Products 68.00 Arctic Office 68.00
CORNER Capital Office 71.16 Alt
size- [29-1/2" H School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #CDL29 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 68.32
093 MODESTY PANEL (DESK  Arctic Office Products 84.00 Arctic Office 84.00
1) STAND-ALONE Capital Office 116.12 Alt
CORNER School Outfit.ters No Bid
Sive. |48,, W x 29-1/2" H School Specialty No Bid
Staples 84.00
Eir:nd IALLSTEEL #CSCMP4829
094 PANEL CONNECTOR Arctic Office Products 36.00 Arctic Office 36.00
(DESE fé?MGHT Capital Office No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
_ ., School Specialty No Bid
size- 3" Staples 36.40

Brand IALLSTEEL #802043P
Bid -
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PANEL (DESK #2)

Arctic Office Products

174.00 Arctic Office 174.00

095
NON-TACKABLE Capital Office 192.58 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
size- 43" H x 24'W School Specialty No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #904324P Staples 174.72

Bid -

PANEL (DESK #2)

Arctic Office Products

195.00 Arctic Office 195.00

096
NON-TACKABLE Capital Office 202.94 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size- [43'H x 30"W School Specialty No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #904330P Staples 194.88

Bid -

097 |PANEL (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 296.00 Arctic Office 296.00
NON-TACKABLE Capital Office 299.06 Alt
Size - |43" H x 60" W School Outfitters No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #904360P School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 296.24
098 |PANEL (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 218.00 Arctic Office 218.00
NON-TACKABLE Capital Office 222.08 Alt
Size - |43" H x 36"W School Outfitters No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #904336P School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 218.40
099 ELL PANEL CONNECTOR  Arctic Office Products 54.00 Arctic Office 54.00
(DESK #2) Capital Office 40.97 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
size - [43"H School Specialty No Bid
E_r:nd IALLSTEEL #802143P Staples 54.32
id -
100 PANEL CONNECTOR Arctic Office Products 36.00 Arctic Office 36.00
(DESgN#;Z)COVER Capital Office 24.29 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
_ ., School Specialty No Bid
size- 3" Staples 36.40

Brand IALLSTEEL #801843P
Bid -
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101 BRACKET (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 32.00 Arctic Office 32.00
PA’\\I/\SRKSURFACE-TO- Capital Office 17.37 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
sie- |pa"D School Specialty No Bid
Staples 32.48
Brand IALLSTEEL #831324
Bid -
102 BRACKET (DESK #4) Arctic Office Products 33.00 Arctic Office 33.00
PANV\éCERKSURFACE TO  Capital Office 47.28 Alt
School Outfitters No Bid
Size - [30° D School Specialty No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #831330 Staples 32.48
id -
103 |BRACKET (DESK #2) Arctic Office Products 37.00 Arctic Office  37.00
Capital Office No Bid
size - [Driftwood (PO1) School Outfitters No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #851500 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 19.60
104 |SUPPORT LEG (DESK #2)  Avrctic Office Products 92.00 Arctic Office  92.00
Capital Office 229.70 Alt
Size - |30" D x 29-1/2"h School Outfitters No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #CSL3029P School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 91.84
105 [FILE CABINET, MOBILE Arctic Office Products 312.00 Arctic Office 312.00
Size- |8 H x 19-7/8" D Capital Offige 325.37 Alt
Brand IALLSTEEL SPM187.203B School Outfitters No Bid
Bid - School Specialty No Bid
Staples 311.92
106 |cCENTER DRAWER Arctic Office Products 83.00 Arctic Office 83.00
Size- |3"H x 14-34'D x 19" W Capital Offic_e 37.44 Alt
Brand IALLSTEEL 4CSDCLY School Outflt.ters No B!d
Bid - School Specialty No Bid
Staples 82.88
107 |KEYBOARD TRAY WITH Arctic Office Products 275.00 Staples 209.00
CLIP MOUSE Capital Office 180.34 Alt
Size - School Outfitters No Bid
Brand |HUMANSCALE #6G 900 90  School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 209.00
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108 ILL\JSTALLATION FOR Arctic Office Products 375.00 Arctic Office 375.00

LLSTEEL DESKUNITS  capital Office 440.00
Size - School Outfitters No Bid
Brand School Specialty No Bid

Bid - Staples 1400.00




