KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

5hsd

where kids come first

(907) 714-8876

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

FAX (907) 262-7165

Page 1 of 14
RECAP
Bid #123-14
Due date 2-4-14

Description

(Item #

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }

# 01 IAMPLIFIER ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $360.00
Arctic Office Products $716.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $439.00
B&H Photo $424.00
Size -3.5"H / 2 rack spaces - 40 FuI_I compass $539.00
Ibs. Guitar Center $360.00
] . IMIG AV NO BID
Brand [QSC Audio Erofessmnal School Specialty NO BID
Power Amplifier RMX 1450
# 02 LOUDSPEAKER SYSTEM, ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $294.00
‘TWO-WAY Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $348.00
B&H Photo $295.00
Size -15"- 27" x 185" x 17" - 60,5 Ull Compass $415.00 Alt
bs. Guitar Center $415.00 Alt
IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |JBL 15” .Two-Way Speaker School Specialty NO BID
JRX115i
# 03 |MOUNTS, WALL ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $170.00
Arctic Office Products $291.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. Full Compass $185.00
Size -14.5 lbs. Guitar Center $170.00
Brand |Allen Steerables Wall Mount |MIG A/V NO BID
'zSAS-loo-WM School Specialty NO BID
# 04 MOUNT, SPEAKER FIXED  ACS of Anchorage NO BID Full Compass $158.00
‘TILT CABLE KIT Arctic Office Products $300.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size - Ful! Compass $158.00
Guitar Center $336.00
Brand |Allen Steerables Fixed Tilt IMIG AV NO BID
’éable Kit #TCK-010 School Specialty NO BID

* Does Not Meet Specifications
*** Not FOB: Soldotna

****Draw

** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*****No Award-bid as all or none >>All or None
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# 05 RECEIVER, TRUE ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $149.00
DIVERSITY UHE Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $174.00
B&H Photo $149.00
Size -8.27"W x 6.39'D x 1.73"H - - ull Compass $199.00
35.3 oz, Guitar Center $160.00
. ] IMIG AV NO BID
Brand ’ggigo-;e(:hmca ATW- School Specialty NO BID
# 06 ‘TRANSMITTER, ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $139.00
HANDHELD UHF Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $174.00
B&H Photo $139.00
. Full Compass $198.00
Size - Black Guitar Center $160.00
Brand IAudio Technica ATW-T220a |MIG A/V NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 07 |RECORDER ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $489.00
Arctic Office Products $1185.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $768.00
B&H Photo $489.00
. , , N Full Compass $793.00
Size églzvlgsls Hx1L.9°D- Guitar Center $865,99
] IMIG AV NO BID
Brand ;?stca;n SS—dCDRZOO Solid School Specialty NO BID
ate Recorder
# 08 |CABLE, SPEAKER ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $45.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. , Full Compass $117.50 Alt
Size - 100" rolls Guitar Center $45.00 Alt
Brand |Live Wire Elite #100035064 |1MIG A/V NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
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# 09 |PA SYSTEM, PORTABLE ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $235.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $330.00 Alt
B&H Photo $236.00
Size - FuI_I Compass $350.00
Guitar Center $235.00
Brand |Py|e Pro #PWMA1080I IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty $701.00 Alt
# 10 |MIXER, POWERED ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $327.00
Arctic Office Products $675.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $385.00
Size - Full Compass $450.00
Guitar Center $327.00
Brand |Yamaha EMX312SC IMIG AV NO BID
Powered Mixer School Specialty NO BID
# 11 UDIO SYSTEM, ACS of Anchorage NO BID AVES $586.00
’ﬁ\IFRARED Arctic Office Products $767.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $586.00
B&H Photo $673.00
. Full Compass $825.00
Size - Four Speaker System Guitar Center $972.00
Brand |Califone Infrared Classroom |MIG A/V NO BID
\AUdiO System PA-IRSYSB  school Specialty $698.72
# 12 |SPEAKER, PA ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $510.00
Arctic Office Products $1066.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $622.00
B&H Photo $599.00
Size -204°H x 12.6'W x 11.8'D - Ul compass $689.00
32 Ibs. Guitar Center $510.00
IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |QSC #K10 School Specialty NO BID
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# 13 TOTE BAG FOR PA ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $58.00
SPEAKER Arctic Office Products $106.00
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $75.00
B&H Photo $63.00
. Full Compass $90.00
Size -Black - 3 Ibs. Guitar Center $58.00
Brand |QSC K10TOTE IMIG ANV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 14 PCDI ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $101.00
(PERSONAL Arctic Office Products NO BID
COMPUTER/STEREO AVES Audio Visual Sup. $126.00
LINE INTERFACE) B&H Photo $104.00
. _ ) Full Compass $135.00
Size - Type: Passive Guitar Center $101.00
Brand |Whiriwind #PCDI IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 15 |CABLE, MICROPHONE ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $16.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $16.00
, Full Compass $45.00 Alt
-50' - Black .
Size -50 ac Guitar Center $16.00
Brand |Pro Co EXMSS-50 IMIG A/V NO BID
(Sweetwater #XLR50) School Specialty NO BID
# 16 |CABLE, MICROPHONE ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $11.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $11.00
, Full Compass $26.00 Alt
-10' - Black .
Size -10 ac Guitar Center $12.00 Alt
Brand |Pro Co EXMSS-10 IMIG AV NO BID
(Sweetwater #XLR10) School Specialty NO BID
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# 17 STAND, SPEAKER ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $26.00
ON-STAGE Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $36.00
. N Full Compass $65.00
Size -44 - 80H - Black Guitar Center $26.00
Brand |On-Stage Stands #SS7761B  |MIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 18 |BAG, SPEAKER STAND ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $14.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $24.00
. " i " Full Compass $45.00
Size -50"H x 10"L x 5"W - Black Guitar Center $14.00
Brand |On-Stage Stands #SSB6500 |MIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 19 |SPEAKERS, PA ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $205.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $345.00
si Full Compass $495.00
12€ - Guitar Center $205.00
Brand [Yamaha Club V Series IMIG AV NO BID
S115V #WC25670 School Specialty NO BID
# 20 MICRO HI-FI ACS of Anchorage NO BID NO BID
COMPONENT SYSTEM Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. Full Compass NO BID
Size - Black Guitar Center NO BID
Brand |Sony CMT-LX20i (B&H IMIG AV NO BID

Photo #SOCMTLX20I) School Specialty NO BID
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# 21 |RECORDER, HANDHELD ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $128.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $194.00
B&H Photo $128.00
Size - Full Compass $172.00
Guitar Center $130.00
Brand |Tascam DR40 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 22 |MBOX AUDIO INTERFACE ACS of Anchorage NO BID Full Compass $375.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size - Full Compass $375.00
Guitar Center $355.00**
Brand |Avid Pro Tools Express + IMIG AV NO BID
K/Ibox #5273513 School Specialty NO BID
# 23 MUSIC SYSTEM, ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $299.00
‘PORTABLE DIGITAL Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo $299.00
Size -6.75'Hx 12°W x 4D - 525 - ull Compass NO BID
Ibs. - Gloss Black Guitar Center NO BID
IMIG AV NO BID
Brand Bpge SoundDock Portable School Specialty NO BID
Digital Music System
# 24  |MOUNT, ARTICULATING  ACS of Anchorage NO BID NO BID
TV Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. ” » Full Compass NO BID
Size -19"-70 Guitar Center NO BID
Brand |@.com #DCD13019 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
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# 25 MOUNT, ARTICULATING ACS of Anchorage NO BID NO BID
ALL TV Arctic Office Products NO BID
SINGLE ARM AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size-33.5x16.9 x 19.3 inches - |l Compass NG BID
19 Ibs Guitar Center NO BID
. IMIG AV NO BID
Brand tlgntlc §|ngle Arm School Specialty NO BID
rticulating Wall Mount
# 26 |MOUNT, TILT WALL TV ACS of Anchorage NO BID NO BID
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -32.5x 2.5 x 10 inches ; 12 Ful! Compass NO BID
pounds Guitar Center NO BID
IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |[MountOlt #MI-303L School Specialty NG BID
# 27 |SMART TV, LED ACS of Anchorage $649.09 ACS of Anchorage  $649.09
Arctic Office Products NO BID 5% bidders
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID preference
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -44.56'W x 26.26°H x 3.19'D Ul Compass NO BID
-59.49 Ibs Guitar Center $630.00
o i IMIG AV NO BID
Brand [Vizio #E5001-A1 School Specialty NG BID
# 28  |PROJECTION SCREEN, ACS of Anchorage $2717.17 ACS of Anchorage  $2717.17
MOTORIZED Arctic Office Products $5863.00 5% bidders
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID preference
B&H Photo $3549.00
Full Compass $3630.00

ize -13'6" x 18’ - 429 Ibs. .
Size -13'6" x 18" - 429 Ibs Guitar Center $2630.00

Brand |Da-Lite Professional Electol 1MmIG A/V NO BID
81627 School Specialty $3432.92
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# 29 PUBLIC ADDRESS (PA) ACS of Anchorage See below
SYSTEM INCLUDES: Arctic Office Products
ITEMS 30-38 AVES Audio Visual Sup.
B&H Photo
Size - FuI_I Compass
Guitar Center
Brand |Visip|ex IMIG AV
School Specialty
# 30 CONTROLLER, COMPACT ACS of Anchorage $569.25 Guitar Center $520.00
IRELESS PAGING Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -9.75"W x 5.5"H x 2.5"D - Full Compass NO BID
Guitar Center $520.00
2.25 Ibs.
o IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |§|plex VS4§OO Compact School Specialty NO BID
ireless Paging Controller
# 31 HAND-HELD ACS of Anchorage $109.25 Guitar Center $115.00
MICROPHONE Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size - Full Compass NO BID
Guitar Center $115.00
Brand r/isiplex VS3005 Hand-Held MIG A/V NO BID
Microphone School Specialty NO BID
# 32 |RADIO TRANSCEIVER ACS of Anchorage $1604.25 Guitar Center $1475.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -3.5" H x 14"W x 11.5"D - Full Compass NG BID
Guitar Center $1475.00
8.45 Ibs.
4 Wisiol IMIG AV NO BID
Bran rélsm ex VS101-25 25 Watt School Specialty NO BID

adio Transceiver
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# 33 FCC LICENSE FOR ONE ACS of Anchorage $500.25 Guitar Center $435.00
MAIN SITE Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. . Full Compass NO BID
Size -10 year license Guitar Center $435.00
Brand |Visip|ex #VS-LIC IMIG A/V NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 34 IANTENNA KIT ACS of Anchorage $284.05 Guitar Center $269.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size - Full Compass NO BID
Guitar Center $269.00
Brand |Visip|ex VS654 Antenna Kit  |MIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 35 INLINE LIGHTNING ACS of Anchorage $101.20 Guitar Center $97.00
\ARRESTOR Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. » » Full Compass NO BID
Size -2.75"W x 1.5"H - 0.25 Ibs. Guitar Center $97.00
Brand |Visip|ex #VS642 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 36 COAX RF TRANSMISSION ACS of Anchorage $3.45 Guitar Center $3.50
LINE ASSEMBLY Arctic Office Products NO BID
RG-8/U AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. Full Compass NO BID
Size - Black Guitar Center $3.50
Brand [Visplex #VS660 IMIG ANV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 37 SPEAKER, PUBLIC ACS of Anchorage $75.90 Guitar Center $73.00
LDDRESS Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -7.3'Wx 9.77Hx 65D -54 Ul Compass NO BID
Ibs - White Guitar Center $73.00
o IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |V|S|plex #VNS2082 School Specialty NO BID




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

kphbs
where kids come first

(907) 714-8876

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

FAX (907) 262-7165

Page 10 of 14
RECAP

Bid #123-14
Due date 2-4-14

(Item #

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }

Description Vendors & Price Quoted
# 38 UDIO/VISUAL ACS of Anchorage $220.80 Guitar Center $205.00
CONTROLLER, Arctic Office Products NO BID
IRELESS AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -7.5"W x 4.5"H x 3'D - 1.9 gt'i't;c’g‘epnﬁf ;‘2%58'0'30
Ibs. - Liaht Grav '
o IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |V|S|plex #VNS2210 School Specialty NO BID
# 39 PUBLIC ADDRESS (PA) ACS of Anchorage See below
SYSTEM INCLUDES: Arctic Office Products
40-47 AVES Audio Visual Sup.
B&H Photo
. Full Compass
Size - Guitar Center
Brand IMIG A/V
School Specialty
# 40 CONTROLLER, COMPACT ACS of Anchorage $569.25 Guitar Center $520.00
}WIRELESS PAGING Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -9.75"W x 5.5"H x 2.5'D - Full Compass NO BID
2 95 |bs. Guitar Center $520.00
B IMIG AV NO BID
Brand ':Q/.smlex VS45pO Compact School Specialty NO BID
ireless Paging Controller
# 41 HAND-HELD ACS of Anchorage $109.25 Guitar Center $115.00
‘MICROPHONE Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. Full Compass NO BID
Size - .
Guitar Center $115.00
Brand |Visiplex VS3005 Hand-Held 1MIG A/V NO BID
rl\jlicrophone School Specialty NO BID
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# 42 TRANSMITTER, 6 WATT ACS of Anchorage $442.75 Guitar Center $415.00
INTERNAL Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
. Full Compass NO BID
Size - .
Guitar Center $415.00
Brand |Visiplex #VTX-6 6 Watt IMIG AV NO BID
Internal Transmitter School Specialty NO BID
# 43 FCC LICENSE FOR ONE ACS of Anchorage $500.25 Guitar Center $435.00
MAIN SITE Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -10 year license FUI.I Compass NO BID
Guitar Center $435.00
Brand |Visip|ex #VS-LIC IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 44 NTENNA, MAGNETIC ACS of Anchorage $85.10 Guitar Center $87.00
MOUNT Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -White Ful! Compass NO BID
Guitar Center $87.00
Brand |Visip|ex VS638 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 45 SPEAKER, PUBLIC ACS of Anchorage $75.90 Guitar Center $73.00
DDRESS Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -7.3Wx 9.7°H x 6.5°D - 5.4 Ul compass NO BID
Ibs - White Guitar Center $73.00
- IMIG AV NO BID
Brand |Visiplex #VNS2082 School Specialty NO BID
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(Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }
# 46 UDIO/VISUAL ACS of Anchorage $220.80 Guitar Center $205.00
CONTROLLER, Arctic Office Products NO BID
IRELESS AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Full Compass NO BID

Size -7.5"W x 4.5"Hx 3"D - 1.9

. Guitar Center $205.00
Ib.s..- Liaht Grav IMIG ANV NO BID
Brand |V|S|plex #VNS2210 School Specialty NO BID
# 47 SECONDARY SPEAKER ACS of Anchorage $41.40 Guitar Center $43.00
OUTPUT OPTION Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size - Full Compass NO BID
Guitar Center $43.00
Brand |Visip|ex VNS2281 IMIG A/V NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 48 LOUDSPEAKER, FULL- ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $505.00
RANGE POWERED Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $573.00
B&H Photo $505.00
: ” Full Compass $668,00
Size -8 - Black Guitar Center $523.00
Brand |Mackie DLM8 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 49 BRACKETS, WALL- ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $25.00
MOUNT SPEAKER Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $27.00
B&H Photo $25.00
) " " N Full Compass $50.00
Size -16.54" L x 4.53" W x 9.06" H Guitar Center $38.00 Alt
- Black IMIG AV NO BID

Brand |Pyle Pro PSTND6 School Specialty NO BID
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# 50 TRANSMITTER, ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $192.00
IRELESS HANDHELD Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $225.00
B&H Photo $192.00
Size - Black FuI_I Compass $264.00
Guitar Center $205.00
Brand [Shure ULX2/58-M1 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 51 TRANSMITTER, ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $149.00
IRELESS UHF Arctic Office Products NO BID
BODYPACK AVES Audio Visual Sup. $178.00
B&H Photo $149.00
Size - Black FuI_I Compass $205.00
Guitar Center $165.00
Brand [Shure ULX1-J1 IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 52 ||\/||CROPHONES, EARSET ACS of Anchorage NO BID B&H Photo $259.00
Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. $285.00
B&H Photo $259.00
Size -Tan Ful! Compass $299.00
Guitar Center $271.00
Brand |C0untryman E6IOWST-SL IMIG AV NO BID
School Specialty NO BID
# 53 LOUDSPEAKERS, 2-WAY  ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $3464.40
SELF POWERED Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Size -255'H x 18.32’W x 17.13p Ul compass $3590.00
7olbs. - Black Guitar Center $3464.40
' IMIG AV NO BID
Brand [EAW #JFSONT School Specialty NO BID
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# 54 BELT PACK, SINGLE ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $237.00
CHANNEL Arctic Office Products NO BID
AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID
B&H Photo NO BID
Full Compass $240.00

Size -4.58"H x 3.73"W x 1.34"D -

73 07 Guitar Center $237.00 Alt

' ' IMIG AV NO BID

Brand |CIear—Com RS601 School Specialty NO BID
# 55 |HEADSET, SINGLE EAR ACS of Anchorage NO BID Guitar Center $221.00

Arctic Office Products NO BID

AVES Audio Visual Sup. NO BID

B&H Photo NO BID

Size - Full Compass $230.00

Guitar Center $221.00

Brand |Clear-Com CC-300-X4 IMIG AV NO BID

School Specialty NO BID




