Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Re-Cap Bid #129-14

Award in Bold

Dell Optiplex 7010 DT Desktop w/o Monitor

Dell Latitude 14 5000 Series Laptop

PowerEdge T620 Server

Dell Serial ATA Hard Drive

Dell Venue 11 with Accessories

Microsoft Surface Pro 2 with Cover

Safeharbor 36-module Laptop Security Cart w/ Timer

Dell Venue - No Award

ACS

S 677.82
S 949.41
S 6,758.46
S 256.66
$1,114.36
No Bid

$ 2,309.16

CDW-G

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 995.00

No Bid

GCSIT
$ 499.00
$ 702.00
$ 5,169.00
$ 196.00
S 929.00
No Bid

$ 2,110.00

Staples
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 1,037.98

$1415.99 Alt



