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Bid #125-14

Due Date: 2-14-2014

[ Iltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

001  ICAFETERIA TABLE Arctic Office Products 1649.00 Alt School 1674.78
Size - |29,, High x 30" Wide x 12’ 1" Alaska Education No B!d Specialty
Brand [MITCHELL GP SERIES GP Lakeshore No Bid
Bid- |12/16 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144045 School Specialty 1674.78
#144024 Staples No Bid
002  |CAFETERIA TABLE Arctic Office Products 1589.00 Alt Meterials 1443.20
Size- |20" High x 30" Wide x 12’ Alaska Education No B!d Management of
Brand [MITCHELL NP SERIES NP Lakeshore No Bid AK
Bid- |12/16 “FOLD-N-ROLL" M_aterlals Management of AK 1443.20 Alt
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
SOHI Reconfig School SpECIalty 1922.74
Staples No Bid
003 CAFETERIA TABLE Arctic Office Products 1589.00 School 1063.36
MOBILE Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |29” High x 30" Wide x 12’ Lakeshore No Bid
Brand INATIONAL PUBLIC Materials Management of AK 1553.53
Bid-  |SEATING #MTS-MDF-PE Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 1650.00
School Specialty 1063.36
#144102 Staples No Bid
004 |CAFETERIA TABLE Arctic Office Products 759.00 Alt*  School 1344.96
ROUND Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - | Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |KI FURNITURE “UNIFRAME” Materials Management of AK  1365.06
Bid-  |Model 39924 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 1650.00
School Specialty 1344.96
#144172 Staples No Bid

* Does Not Meet Specifications

****Draw

** No Specificiations Provided

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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005 IACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 135.00 Arctic Office 135.00
RECTANGLE Alaska Education 112.00 Alt
Size - [30" W x 48" L x 17-25" H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [VIRCO 4000 Series #483048 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 132.01
#144108 Staples No Bid
006 CTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 172.00 Arctic Office 172.00
op RECTANGULAR Alaska Education 139.00 Alt
Lakeshore 224.87 Alt
Size- [30°D x 60"L x17-25"H Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Eir:f_‘d |VIRCO 4000 Series #483060 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
4144108 Staples No Bid
Skyview Reconfig
007 ACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products No Bid No Award
TRAPEZOID Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |48"W X 72" L Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |[SCHOLAR CRAFT 849 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- [SERIES Midwest Technology Product No Bid
(School Outfitters #SFT- School Outfitters No Bid
FSB49TR4872-2140) School Specialty 321.89 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144032
008 IACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 176.00 Arctic Office 176.00
TRAPEZOID Alaska Education No Bid
size- [30" x 30" x 60" Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |Caro|ina #705835 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144087 Staples No Bid
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009 CLASSROOM TABLE Arctic Office Products 345.00 Arctic Office 345.00
TRAPEZOIDAL Alaska Education No Bid
Size- [60 x 30 x 30 Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |COMMUNITY CLASSMATE Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  [SERIES 6030TRAP Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144074 Staples No Bid
010 HORSESHOE ACTIVTY Arctic Office Products 338.00 Arctic Office 338.00
TABDLEEEP CENTER CUT Alaska Education 262.00 Alt
Lakeshore 394.37 Alt
Size - [66" Wide X 60" Deep X 17 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Eir:r_‘d |V|RCO #48HORSEG0ODC Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
4144108 Staples No Bid
011 IACTIVTY TABLE Arctic Office Products 267.00 Alt  Arctic Office 267.00
ROUND Alaska Education 217.00 Alt
Size - |60" Diameter Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |CORRELL #A60-RND Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 400.00
School Specialty 474.72
#144032 Staples No Bid
012 ACTIVTY TABLE Arctic Office Products 210.00 Alt  Arctic Office 210.00
SQUARE Alaska Education 152.00
Size - |48" W x 48"W x 22" -29" |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |ARTCO-BELL 1200 Series  Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- 1205 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 178.07
SOHI Reconfig Staples No Bid
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013 TABLE Arctic Office Products 816.00 Alt  Arctic Office 816.00
With PNUEMATIC LIFT  Alaska Education No Bid
Size - [24” deep X 72" wide X 28 |akeshore No Bid
Brand [TRENDWAY STANDING Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  |HEIGHT #RHATG2472.GN  Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144682 Staples No Bid
014 |ROUND TABLE Arctic Office Products 445.00 Alt  School 567.45
WITH X-BASE Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |42" Diameter X 29" Height Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |GLOBAL #XRT-42 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 567.45 Alt
#144087 Staples No Bid
015  |FOLDING TABLE Arctic Office Products 375.00 School 288.00
Size- [24"W x 60°L x 29-1/2" H Alaska Education No B!d Outfitters
Brand [SOUTHERN ALUMINUM Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - LLULITE #A24602L. Mgtenals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 288.00
SOHI Reconfig School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
016 [FOLDING TABLE Arctic Office Products 348.00 Arctic Office 348.00
Size- 29" H x 30"W x 96" L Alaska Education No B!d
Brand ICEBERG INDESTRUC Lakeshore No Bid
Bid- |TABLES ) Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144063 School Specialty 397.55
Staples No Bid
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017 MULTIPURPOSE TABLE  Arctic Office Products 384.00 Arctic Office 384.00
WI?E%TE‘SE;ASE TOP Alaska Education No Bid
Lakeshore No Bid
Size - [30"D x 72"W Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Brand |HON HUDDLE Series - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
Bid- #3072GGCS (TOP); School Outfitters No Bid
fIMTLEG24CS (BASE) School Specialty 395.01
Staples No Bid
#144027
018 MULTIPURPOSE TABLE  Arctic Office Products 442.00 Arctic Office 442.00
NEHS'E*F'H\T(';RSXQ‘S WITH Alaska Education No Bid
Lakeshore No Bid
Size - [30" x 60" Materials Management of AK No Bid
Eirgr_‘d |HON HUDDLE Series Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 442.55
4144074 Staples No Bid
019 ACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 172.00 Alt  Arctic Office 172.00
RECTANGLE Alaska Education 139.00 Alt
Size - [30"x 60" x 21 - 30" Lakeshore 224.87
Brand [Lakeshore Rainbow Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  CN341YE Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 220.00 Alt
School Specialty 196.77 Alt
#144140 Staples No Bid
020 ACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 316.00 Alt  School 283.05
KIDNEY Alaska Education 223.00 Alt  Specialty
Size- [72"L x 48"W x 24-31"H | akeshore 337.87 Alt
Brand [JONTI-CRAFT Rainbow Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - |accents KYDZ #6423JCA003 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 300.00
School Specialty 283.05
#144103 Staples No Bid
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021 ACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 142.00 Alt  Arctic Office 142.00
RECTANGULAR Alaska Education 112.00 Alt
Size- [30"D x 48"W x 15-24"H | akeshore 190.97 Alt
Brand [JONTI-CRAFT BERRIES Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - 6473JCE180 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 160.00
School Specialty 153.89
#144140 Staples No Bid
022 ACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 197.00 Alt  Arctic Office 197.00
RECTANGULAR Alaska Education 164.00 Alt
Size- [30"D x 72"W x 15-24"H | akeshore 258.77 Alt
Brand [JONTI-CRAFT BERRIES Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - #6413JCE180 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 315.00
School Specialty 219.14
#144140 Staples No Bid
023 ACTIVITY TABLE Arctic Office Products 210.00 Alt  School 209.86
SQUARE Alaska Education 149.00 Alt  Specialty
size- [48"Square x 22-29'H  Lakeshore 190.97 Alt
Brand |School Specialty Classroom  Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- |Select #1334885 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 185.00 Alt
School Specialty 209.86 Alt
#144074 Staples No Bid
024 [PLANNER LAB STATION  Arctic Office Products 425.00 School 305.41
Size - |60,, Long x 30" Deep x 22 Alaska Education 341.Q0 Specialty
Brand [SMITH SYSTEM Model Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid-  |h4s50 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 455.00
#144087 School Specialty 305.14
Staples No Bid
025 [PLANNER LAB STATION  Arctic Office Products 510.00 School 374.73
Size - |84,, Long x 30" Deep x 22 Alaska Education 499.Q0 Specialty
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM Model Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid-  |p4570 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144087 School Specialty 374.73
Staples No Bid
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026 DINING TABLE Arctic Office Products No Bid
ROUND Alaska Education No Bid
Size - [48” Diameter top x 28.5" High [ akeshore No Bid
Brand |BLU DOT SPROUT Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  |COLLECTION Midwest Technology Product No Bid
#SP1-DNTB48-BLK School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
#144027
027 lLAPTOP CADDY Arctic Office Products 139.00 Arctic Office 139.00
Size- [25-314"W x 15-314'D x 21 Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |BALT “POP” #48752 Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid - Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 160.00
#144087 School Specialty 153.86 Alt
Staples No Bid
028 lLAPTOP CART Arctic Office Products 310.00 Arctic Office 310.00
Size- [B0W x 30°D x 28" H Alaska Education No Bid
Brand JANTHRO TECHNOLOGY Lakes_hore 281'37 Alt
Bid - EURNITURE ANTHROCART Materials Management of AK No Bid
GT26BN Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 495.27
#144682 Staples No Bid
029 |cABLE MANAGEMENT KIT  Arctic Office Products 43.00 Arctic Office 43.00
Size- [putty Alaska Education No B?d
Brand JANTHRO TECHNOLOGY Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid - ’éURNITURE 4CM2PG Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144682 School Specialty 43.86
Staples No Bid
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030 FLAT PANEL MONITOR Arctic Office Products 298.00 School 265.26
ARg"TANDARD Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
_ Lakeshore No Bid
Size - [Black Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bfgnd ANTHRO TECHNOLOGY Midwest Technology Product No Bid
Bid- [FURNITURE #LCDBK School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 265.26
Staples No Bid
#144682
031 lcAsTERS Arctic Office Products 135.00 Artic Office 135.00
Size- |5 Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |JANTHRO TECHNOLOGY Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - ’éURNITURE 451ECA Mgterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144682 School Specialty 159.05
Staples No Bid
032 [FLAT PANEL LCD ARM Arctic Office Products 321.00 School 298.68
Size - |B|ack Alaska Education No B!d Specialty
Brand JANTHRO TECHNOLOGY Lakeshore No Bid
Bid-  |FURNITURE “INNOVATIVE" Mgterlals Management of AK No B!d
770BK Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 298.68
#144682 Staples No Bid
033 |ADJUSTABLE sTOOL Arctic Office Products 249.00 School 203.41
Size - |Black Alaska Education 224.Q0 Specialty
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - L’11842 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 280.00
#144173 School Specialty 203.41
Staples No Bid
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034 lsTooL Arctic Office Products 139.00 Alaska 130.00
Size - Alaska Education 130.00 Education
Brand [SAFECO “ALPHABETTER” Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid-  |41205BE Materials Management of AK No Bid
}?ATD American #461145) Midwest Technology Product 171.81
School Outfitters 215.00
School Specialty 134.07
#144088 Staples No Bid
035 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 98.00 Arctic Office 98.00
STACK Alaska Education 113.00
Size- 120.5"D x 19.5"W x 18"H |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid-  INOODLE #11851 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 140.00
School Specialty 98.32
#144173 Staples No Bid
036 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 93.00 Arctic Office 93.00
STACK Alaska Education 108.00
Size- |18"D x 18"W x 16"H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid-  INOODLE #11852 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 138.00
School Specialty 93.70
#144173 Staples No Bid
037 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 91.00 Arctic Office 91.00
STACK Alaska Education 108.00
Size- [177D x 17.5"W x 14" H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  INOODLE #11853 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 160.00
School Specialty 92.85
#144173 Staples No Bid
03g  [STACKING CHAIRS Arctic Office Products No Bid School 67.08
Size - |18,, Alaska Education 81.4Q Alt  Specialty
Brand [ROYAL SEATING 4102 Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid- Liberty Series #4102-18 M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 92.00 Alt
#144027 School Specialty 67.08
Staples No Bid
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039  [STACKING CHAIRS Avrctic Office Products No Bid School 122.27
Size - |35_1/2.. H x 19-1/2" W x Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Brand |OFM COMFORTCLASS Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid-  |Heavy Duty #408277 M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 678.00
£#144047 School Specialty 122.27
Staples No Bid
040 |DRAFTING CHAIR Arctic Office Products 264.00 School 188.03
Size - [Black Fabric Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Brand |SAFCO PRODUCTS “Metro” Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - L'34428L Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product 286.30
School Outfitters 310.00
#144027 School Specialty 188.03
Staples No Bid
041 |STUDENT CHAIR Arctic Office Products 39.00 Arctic Office  39.00
Size- [16 inch Alaska Education 31.69 Alt
Brand |VIRCO 9000 Series Model Lakes.hore 41'8Q Alt
Bid - gom-so Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 44.25
#144087 School Specialty 29.84 Alt
Staples No Bid
042 lcHAIR Arctic Office Products 63.00 School 37.97
Size - |35_1/2,, High x 18" Wide x 22" Alaska Education No B?d Specialty
Brand |VIRCO 8917 Series Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid - L/8917RED2010 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144055 School Specialty 37.97 Alt
Staples No Bid
043 |STUDENT CHAIR Arctic Office Products 41.00 School 31.62
Size- [18inch Alaska Education 35.37 Alt  Specialty
Brand |VIRCO 9000 Series Model Lakes.hore 53'19 Alt
Bid - gms-so Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 52.00
SOHI Reconfig School Specialty 31.62 Alt
Staples No Bid
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044 CHAIR, STUDENT Arctic Office Products 79.00 Arctic Office 79.00
STACK Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |18 inch Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [VIRCO ZUMA SEATING Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  7u418 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 32.05 Alt
#144116 Staples No Bid
Skyview Reconfig
045 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 119.00 Alt  School 37.97
STACKING Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |17" W x 20"D x 33"H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [NORWOOD COMMERCIAL Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - [FURNITURE 250 Series Midwest Technology Product No Bid
(School Outfitters #NOR School Outfitters 67.65
-250F) School Specialty 37.97
Staples No Bid
#144063
#144095
046 lcHAIR Arctic Office Products 49.00 Arctic Office 49.00
Size- |18-3/8"W x 18°D x 26 Alaska Education 35.37_ Alt
Brand |VIRCO 2000 Series #2618 Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144101 School Specialty 51.80 Alt
Staples No Bid
047 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 74.00 Alt  School 43.35
STACKING Alaska Education 59.00 Specialty
Size- [31"H x 17-1/2"W x 22 Lakeshore No Bid
Brand INATIONAL PUBLIC Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - |SEATING 8500 Series Hl- Midwest Technology Product No Bid
TECH ULTRA COMPACT  School Outfitters 78.40
STACKER #8510 School Specialty 43.35
Staples No Bid

#144115
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048 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 199.00 Arctic Office 199.00
ARMLESS Alaska Education No Bid
size - 18" Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |COMMUNITY CLASSMATE Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  ISERIES J59D Midwest Technology Product No Bid
(Gaylord #WW-J59D) School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 217.29
Staples No Bid
#144074
049 GUEST CHAIR Arctic Office Products 98.00 Alt  Arctic Office 98.00
WITH ARMS Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |33-1/4" H x 22-1/2"W x 24 |akeshore No Bid
Brand |OFFICESTOR PLUS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - |(Office Depot #543564) Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144047 Staples No Bid
050 [RECEPTION CHAIR Arctic Office Products 119.00 Arctic Office 119.00
Size - |B|ue fabric Alaska Education No B?d
Brand [BOSS Model F10836BL Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid-  |4BOBS0BLUE M_aterlals Management of AK  No B!d
(Global Industrial Midwest Technology Product No Bid
TOA773164BL) School Ouftfitters No Bid
School Specialty 216.65 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144020
051 CHAIR, CLASSROOM Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 56.49
STACKING Alaska Education 28.56 Alt
Size - [13-1/2inch Lakeshore 56.49
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  KEE513BU Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 26.64 Alt
#144140 Staples No Bid
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052 STUDENT CHAIR Arctic Office Products 41.00 Alt  Alaska 35.37
STACKING Alaska Education 35.37 Education
Size- [30.5"H x 20.75"W x 22.5" | akeshore No Bid
Brand |ADVANTAGE Series #ADV- Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  [SSC-18BLK Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144134 Staples No Bid
053 STUDENT CHAIR Arctic Office Products 36.00 Alt  School 179.73/6
STACKING Alaska Education 31.69 Alt  Specialty
Size - |NaVy Lakeshore 41.80 Alt
Brand [ERCA4Kids Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - [(wWorthington #ELR-0195-NV) Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 42.00
School Specialty 179.73/6
#144133 Staples No Bid
054  ISCHOOL CHAIR Arctic Office Products 114.00 Alt  School 48.38
Size - |15_1/2,, Alaska Education 49.00 Specialty
Brand |ARTCO-BELL PRODIGY Lakeshore 41.80 Alt
Bid - ’geries 4ABC-P105 Mgtenals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144103 School Specialty 48.38
Staples No Bid
0s5  |ROCKER CHAIR Arctic Office Products 96.00 Alt  No Award
5 | " Alaska Education No Bid
ize- (14 )
Brand |ACCENT MEDALLION Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - ’QOCKER #ACA1AR M_aterlals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144103 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
0ss  |ROCKER CHAIR Arctic Office Products 99.00 Alt  No Award
Size- 16" Alaska Education No B?d
Brand [ACCENT MEDALLION Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - ’QOCKER #ACAL6R Mgterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144103 School Specialty No Bid

Staples No Bid
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057  |ROCKER CHAIR Arctic Office Products 112.00 Alt  No Award
s | " Alaska Education No Bid
ize - |18 .
Brand |ACCENT MEDALLION Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - ’QOCKER #ACA18R M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144103 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
058 |SIDE CHAIR Arctic Office Products 188.00 Alt  Arctic Office ~ 188.00
ALUMINUM Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |3o.5“ H x 15.25"W x 15" D [akeshore No Bid
Brand |ALSTON #AC2700 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144027 Staples No Bid
059 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 168.00 Alt  Arctic Office 168.00
FOLDING Alaska Education No Bid
Lakeshore No Bid

Size- [BOL/2'H x 181/2'W X 20 \paterials Management of AK No Bid
Brand IALERA Model FC9AVY40LG  Midwest Technology Product No Bid

Bid - School Ouffitters No Bid

School Specialty No Bid

4144087 Staples No Bid

060 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 64.00 Alt  School 23.28
FOLDING Alaska Education No Bid Specialty

Lakeshore No Bid

Size- [321/2"H x 19-1/2"W x 21 Materials Management of AK No Bid

Brand \COSCO BRIDGEPORT Midwest Technology Product No Bid

Bid - |ENDURA School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 23.28 Alt

Staples No Bid

#144053
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061 CHAIR Arctic Office Products 42.00 Alt  No Award
FOLDING Alaska Education No Bid
Lakeshore No Bid
Size - [Chicory fabric and frame Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Brand [MECO / SAMSONITE Midwest Technology Product No Bid
Bid- " |SUDDEN COMFORT School Oultfitters No Bid
School Specialty 28.15 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144211
062 LAB STOOL Arctic Office Products 68.00 Alt  School 32.04
STANDARD Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - [30” High Seat Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [NATIONAL PUBLIC Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - ISEATING 6200 Series #6230 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 72.00
School Specialty 32.04
#144027 Staples No Bid
063 |LAB STOOL Arctic Office Products 59.00 Alt  School 24.76
METAL Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |24" High Seat Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [NORWOOD COMMERCIAL Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid-  JFURNITURE 6200 Stool Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 47.00 Alt
School Specialty 24.76 Alt
#144179 Staples No Bid
064 |SHOP STOOL Arctic Office Products 59.00 Alt  School 24.76
BACKLESS Alaska Education 32.00 Alt  Specialty
Size- [24" High Seat Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |U|_|NE #H-1917N Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 50.00 alt
School Specialty 24.76 Alt
#144027 Staples No Bid
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065 GUEST CHAIR Arctic Office Products 169.00 School 148.41
SLED BASE Alaska Education 159.00 Specialty
Size - |Green Fabric Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SAFCO CAVA URTH Series Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - 7047GN Midwest Technology Product 224.03
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 148.41
#144027 Staples No Bid
066 GUEST CHAIR Arctic Office Products 119.00 Arctic Office 119.00
SLED BASE Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |34" H x 24" W x 22-1/2"D |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [BOSS MAHOGANY Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  \(Global Industries Midwest Technology Product No Bid
#TIAT73164BL) School Qutfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
#144020
067 lcHAIR Arctic Office Products 46.00 Arctic Office 46.00
Size- |18-3/8"W x 18°D x 26 Alaska Education 44.72_ Alt
Brand |VIRCO 2000 Series #2616 Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144101 School Specialty 48.30 Alt
Staples No Bid
068 IGUEST CHAIR Arctic Office Products 69.00 School 1180.73/
Size - |20_25,,W « 24D x 3325 Alaska Education No B?d Specialty 20
Brand |OFFICE STAR PRO-LINE Il Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144025 School Specialty 1180.73/20
Staples No Bid




(907)714-8876

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

FAX (907)262-7165

Page 17 of 38

RECAP

Bid #125-14
Due Date: 2-14-2014

[ Iltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

069 WORK CENTER Arctic Office Products 725.00 School 517.87
TRAPEZOID Alaska Education 575.00 Specialty
Size- [44"D x 96"W x 22-32’H  Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM PLANNER Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - 424590 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
(Demco #14906030) School Ouftfitters 745.00
School Specialty 517.87
Staples No Bid
#144059
070 |TABLET ARM CHAIR / Arctic Office Products 169.00 Alt  Arctic Office  169.00
DESK Alaska Education 209.00
Size - |18-5” H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand IARTCO -ELL H258 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 157.70
#144087 Staples No Bid
071 STACK CHAIR Arctic Office Products 168.00 School 143.25
WITH WRITING TABLET  Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |25” Wide X 21.5" Deep X Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |KFI Seating 2000 Series Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 143.25
#laalst Staples No Bid
072 CLASSROOM DESK WITH  Arctic Office Products 162.00 Arctic Office 162.00
'RHEEEA(?ggNBASKET Alaska Education No Bid
Lakeshore No Bid
Size - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Eir:r_‘d |V|RCO ZUMA #AHEXBRTM  Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid

#144095
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073  ISTUDENT CHAIRDESKS Arctic Office Products 124.00 Arctic Office  124.00
Size - Alaska Education 134.00 Alt
Brand |VIRCO Classic Series Model Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - L;OOBR Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 195.00
4144141 School Specialty 108.32 Alt
Staples No Bid
074 |STUDENT CHAIRDESK  Arctic Office Products 178.00 Alt  Arctic Office  178.00
COMBINATION Alaska Education 192.00
Size - |Desktop color: Gray Lakeshore No Bid
Brand IARTCO BELL H457 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
_ School Specialty 145.98
SOHI Reconfig Staples No Bid
075 |STUDENT CHAIRDESK  Arctic Office Products 129.00 School 64.90
COMBINATION Alaska Education 180.00 Alt  Specialty
Size - |Desktop color: Medium Oak | gkeshore No Bid
Brand |VIRCO 2000 Series V415 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 64.90 Alt
Skyview Reconfig Staples No Bid
076 COMPUTER TABLE Arctic Office Products 574.00 School 461.33
FLIP TOP Alaska Education 552.00 Specialty
Size - |30” W x 72"L x 24-32"H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [BRETFORD BASICS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  |QUATTRO VOLTEA Midwest Technology Product No Bid
#QFT3072 School Oultfitters 520.00
School Specialty 461.33
Staples No Bid

#144027
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077 [TABLE AND CHAIRS Arctic Office Products 428.00 Alt  Alaska 223.00
Size - | Alaska Education 223.00 Alt  Education
Brand [Kaplan Early Learning Lakes.hore 224'8.7 Alt
Bid-  [Company #70242 M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144143 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
o7s  [TABLE AND CHAIRS Arctic Office Products 659.00 Alt  School 312.54
Size - | Alaska Education 334.00 Alt  Specialty
Brand | akeshore PRETEND & Lakes.hore 394'3?7
Bid-  |pLAY #7858 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144143 School Specialty 312.54 Alt
Staples No Bid
079 |SIDE TABLE Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 56.49
HARDWOOD Alaska Education No Bid
size - [147D x 15"H Lakeshore 56.49
Brand | akeshore PRETEND & Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  [PLAY #EE369 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144143 Staples No Bid
080 ICRAFT TABLE AND STOOL  Arctic Office Products 189.00 School 160.00
Size - [Walnut Alaska Education No Bid Outfitters
Brand [STUDIO DESIGNS Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid- |~REATIVE TABLE AND Materials Management of AK No Bid
STOOL Model #13257 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 160.00
School Specialty No Bid
#144141 Staples No Bid
081 [WORKSTATION Arctic Office Products 227.00 School 215.20
Size - |28 14" W x 22 14" D x 30 Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Brand [SAFCO PICCO DUO Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - L1953MH Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product 338.44
School Outfitters No Bid
#144118 School Specialty 215.20
Staples No Bid
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082 |STUDENT CHAIR DESKS  Arctic Office Products 129.00 Arctic Office 129.00
Size - Alaska Education 134.00 Alt
Brand |VIRCO 2000 Series Model Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - L;OOBR Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144116 School Specialty 106.24 Alt
Staples No Bid
083 |STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 174.00 School 113.66
LIFT LID Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |26" Wide X 20" Deep X 22 |[akeshore No Bid
Brand |VIRCO 873SG-873 Series Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 113.66 Alt
#144101 Staples No Bid
084 STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 124.00 Alt  Arctic Office 124.00
LIFT LID Alaska Education No Bid
Size - [24” Wide X 18" Deep X 22 |[akeshore No Bid
Brand |SCHOLAR CRAFT Model Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- 2800 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 143.00
School Specialty 142.34 Alt
#144108 Staples No Bid
085 STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 78.00 Alt  School 66.08
OPEN FRONT Alaska Education 70.00 Alt  Specialty
Size - [24” Wide X 18" Deep X 22 |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [SCHOLAR CRAFT Model Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- 12900 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 117.00
School Specialty 66.08 Alt
#144108 Staples No Bid
086 WRITING CENTER Arctic Office Products No Bid School 229.98
Size - |58,,W X« 2334 D X 26 Alaska Education 237.00 Alt  Specialty
Brand [Lakeshore Kids Colors Lakeshore 416.97 Alt
Bid - L’ABQI?BU Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144140 School Specialty 229.98 Alt
Staples No Bid
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087 |STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 78.00 Alt  School 106.04
OPEN FRONT Alaska Education 70.00 Alt  Specialty
Size - |24” Wide X 18" Deep X 22 |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |ERC4KidS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 88.00
School Specialty 106.04/2
#144133 Staples No Bid
088 STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 289.00 Alaska 285.00
WITH BOOK BOX Alaska Education 285.00 Education
Size - |28" x 20" (Top dimension) Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SAFECO “AlphaBetter” Model Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid-  #1204GR Midwest Technology Product 369.23
School Outfitters 340.00
School Specialty 299.25
#144088 Staples No Bid
089 STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 164.00 School 124.82
TRAPEZOID Alaska Education 139.00 Specialty
Size - [30” Wide X 18" Deep X 22 | akeshore No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM HUDDLE-8 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- k01266 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 140.00
School Specialty 124.82
#144173 Staples No Bid
090 STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 168.00 School 122.53
TRAPEZOID Alaska Education 136.00 Specialty
Size - [30” Wide X 18" Deep X 22 |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM HUDDLE-6 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - 1401265 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 143.00
School Specialty 122.53
#144173 Staples No Bid
091 STUDENT DESK Arctic Office Products 183.00 School 133.84
TRAPEZOID Alaska Education 149.00 Specialty
Size - [30” Wide X 24" Deep X 22 |[akeshore No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM HUDDLE-8 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- k01267 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 165.00
School Specialty 133.84
#144173 Staples No Bid
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092 |CHAIR Arctic Office Products 115.00 Alt  Lakeshore 79.09
ASH Alaska Education No Bid
size - [12 inch Lakeshore 79.09 Alt
Brand |Kaplan Early Learning Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - |Company #70294 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144143 Staples No Bid
093 STORAGE UNIT Arctic Office Products No Bid School 204.55
20-CUBBY Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size- [13"D x 47-3/4"W x 40"H  Lakeshore 619.90 Alt
Brand |BIRD IN HAND Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - |(School Specialty #265341)  Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 204.55
#144103 Staples No Bid
094 |COFFEE TABLE Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 67.79
HARDWOOD Alaska Education No Bid
size- [24W x 14"D x 12"H Lakeshore 67.79
Brand |l akeshore PRETEND & Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  |PLAY #EE367 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 74.25 Alt
#144143 Staples No Bid
095 lcHAIR Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 145.77
Size- [25"W x 19-3/4°D x 20 Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |_akeshore EASY-CLEAN Lakeshore 145.77 Alt
Bid-  |COMEY #FF682 M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144143 School Specialty 228.95 Alt
Staples No Bid
lcoucH Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 202.27
096
Size- [36"W x 19-3/4’D x 20 Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |Lakeshore EASY-CLEAN Lakeshore 202.27 Al
Bid-  |COMEY #FF683 Mgterlals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144143 School Specialty 304.26 Alt
Staples No Bid
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097 [PRINTER STAND Arctic Office Products 148.00 School 133.57
Size - |22 14" W x 16 1/4" D x 15 Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Brand [SAECO PICCO DUO Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - Lv1954MH Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product 225.75
School Outfitters No Bid
4144118 School Specialty 133.57
Staples No Bid
098 STORAGE UNIT Arctic Office Products No Bid School 356.09
20-CUBBY Alaska Education 373.00 Alt  Specialty
Size- |14"D x 47"W x 30" H Lakeshore 394.37
Brand |_akeshore Classic Birch Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid- 113166 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 340.00 Alt
School Specialty 356.09 Alt
#144140 Staples No Bid
099 lcuBY UNIT Arctic Office Products No Bid School 378.24
Size - |46_1/2.. Wx15'D x30'y  Alaska Education 399.00 Alt  Specialty
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Lakes.hore 563'87
Bid - L'ABSZ?BU Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144103 School Specialty 378.24 Alt
Staples No Bid
100  [CUBBY STORAGEUNIT  Arctic Office Products No Bid School 413.80
Size - |17_3/4,, D x 40-1/2° W x 32 Alaska Education 428.00 Alt  Specialty
Brand |Lakeshore Classic Birch Big Lakes.hore 654'2.7
Bid-  |Bins #13109 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144147 School Specialty 413.80 Alt
Staples No Bid
101 lcuBBY STORAGE UNIT Arctic Office Products No Bid School 545.00
Size- [285'D x 24"W x 41" H Alaska Education 565.00 Alt  Outfitters
Brand WHITNEY BROTHERS Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid-  hyBO702 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 545.00
#144074 School Specialty 638.24
Staples No Bid
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102 CUBBIE STORAGE UNIT  Arctic Office Products No Bid School 417.84
WITHOUT TUBS Alaska Education 434.00 Specialty
Size- [15"D x 57-1/2"W x 35 Lakeshore 371.77 Alt
Brand |JONTI CRAFT #0304JC Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 530.00
School Specialty 417.84
#144103 Staples No Bid
103 CUBBIE MAILBOX Arctic Office Products No Bid Alaska 258.00
ORGANIZER Alaska Education 258.00 Alt  Education
Size - |11-1/2” D x 47-1/2"W x Lakeshore 90.39 Alt*
Brand |BIRD IN HAND Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - |(School Specialty #072000)  Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 375.83
#144103 Staples No Bid
104 CUBBY STORAGE UNIT  Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 258.77
Alaska Education 213.00 Alt
Size- [15"D x 19-1/8"W x 30"H [akeshore 258.77
Brand |Lakeshore Kids Colors Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  [#AB531BU Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 277.16 Alt
#144147 Staples No Bid
105 STORE AND TEACH Arctic Office Products No Bid Alaska 279.00
CENTiRWAY Alaska Education 279.00 Alt  Education
Lakeshore 371.77
Size- [22"W x 21"D x 27-3/4"H  \aterials Management of AK  No Bid
Brand | akeshore Kids Colors Sign-  Midwest Technology Product No Bid
Bid- " in #3234 School Oultfitters No Bid
School Specialty 314.89 Alt
Staples No Bid

#144147
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106 STORAGE UNIT Arctic Office Products 529.00 Alt  School 339.49
ALL-PURPOSE Alaska Education 358.00 Alt  Specialty
Size- |16"D x 46-1/2"W x 32 Lakeshore 450.87
Brand [Lakeshore Kids Colors Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - AB323BU Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 339.49 Alt
#144140 Staples No Bid
107 STORAGE UNIT Arctic Office Products 432.00 Alt  School 275.61
PRESCHOOL Alaska Education 290.00 Alt  Specialty
Size - [16" D x 46-1/2" W x 30 Lakeshore 371.77
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  AB322BU Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 275.61 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144140
108 |SAND AND WATER TABLE  Arctic Office Products 398.00 Alt  School 256.80
PRE-SCHOOL Alaska Education 260.00 Alt  Specialty
Size- [25"H x 46-1/2" W x 22D Lakeshore 337.87
Brand |Lakeshore #JJ512 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 275.00 Alt
School Specialty 256.80 Alt
#144140 Staples No Bid
109 |PAINTING CENTER Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 303.97
INDOOR / OUTDOOR Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |48" H x 30" W x 30"D Lakeshore 303.97
Brand |Lakesh0re #DD119 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 335.34 Alt
#laalar Staples No Bid
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110 |DRESS-UP CENTER Arctic Office Products No Bid School 234.01
SPACE-SAVER Alaska Education 242.00 Alt  Specialty
Size - |50-1/2” H x 18-1/4" W x Lakeshore 337.87
Brand |Lakeshore #WB885 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 505.00
School Specialty 234.01 Alt
#laalar Staples No Bid
111 [KITCHEN SET Arctic Office Products 1019.00 Alt Lakeshore 620.37
Size- [50-1/2" H x 18-1/4" W x Alaska Education No Bid
Brand [ akeshore PRETEND & Lakes.hore 620'3?7
Bid-  |PLAY #GRAS0X Mgterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144143 School Specialty 745.39 Alt
Staples No Bid
112 |KITCHEN SET Arctic Office Products 1019.00 Alt Alaska 799.00
DESIGNER Alaska Education 799.00 Alt  Education
size- [50-1/2"H x 18-1/4" W x  Lakeshore 880.27 Alt
Brand |Kaplan Early Learning Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - [company #87848-BL Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144143 Staples No Bid
113 |READING/ WRITING Arctic Office Products 529.00 Alt Lakeshore 450.87
CENTER Alaska Education No Bid
Size- [31"W x 28"D x 57"H Lakeshore 450.87 Alt
Brand [COPERNICUS ROYAL Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  [RC105-PTP5 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 750.49
#144103 Staples No Bid
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114 COMPUTER Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 281.37
,\(zggﬁ‘_TEAT'ON’ FORTWO  Alaska Education 299.00 Alt
Lakeshore 281.37
Size- [58'W x 23-314"D x 26 Materials Management of AK No Bid
gir:r_‘d |Lakeshore #DD195 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 287.90 Alt
4144103 Staples No Bid
115 lcoMMUNICATION CENTER  Arctic Office Products No Bid Alaska 329.00
Size - |16_7/8 "D x 26-3/4" W X Alaska Education 329.00 Alt  Education
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Sign- Lakes.hore 428'2.7 Alt
Bid- |n #AB639BU Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144103 School Specialty 412.90 Alt
Staples No Bid
116 [EASEL Arctic Office Products 249.00 Arctic Office 249.00
Size- [48°H x 25°W x 28"D Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |COPERNICUS EARLY Lakes_hore 202'2.7 Alt
Bid- | EARNING STATION #ELS1 Materials Management of AK No Bid
(Kaplan #13-62662) Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 502.91
#144091 Staples No Bid
117 [Book CENTER Arctic Office Products 329.00 Alt  Alaska 187.00
Size - |15_3/4 "D x 35-1/4" W x Alaska Education 187.00 Alt  Education
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Easy- Lakes.hore 281'3.7
Bid - Lccess 4ABGESBU Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144103 School Specialty 293.50 Alt
Staples No Bid
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#144558

118 BIG BOOK CENTER Arctic Office Products No Bid School 270.49
gﬁ_‘éNET'C WIPE & Alaska Education 281.00 Alt  Specialty
Lakeshore 337.87
Size- [15-7/8"D x 24" W x 37 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Brand |Lakeshore #DG247 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
Bid- School Outfitters 275.00 Alt
School Specialty 270.49 Alt
4144147 Staples No Bid
110  |ROLLING MARKETPLACE  Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 281.37
Size- [53-1/2"H x 36" W x 15 Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |Lakeshore #JJ816 Lakeshore 281.37
Bid - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144140 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
120  |STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products No Bid School 720.13
Size - |24,, D x 30" W x 72" H Alaska Education 769.00 Alt  Specialty
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Lakes.hore 789'87
Bid - }UABMBBU Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 720.13 Alt
#144147 Staples No Bid
121 STORAGE & WARDROBE  Arctic Office Products 1819.00 Alt School 1581.53
CABINET Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
WITH DRAWERS :
Lakeshore No Bid
Size - [24"D x 48" W x 66’ H Materials Management of AK No Bid
Eirg”d IRONWOOD Midwest Technology Product No Bid
" [MANUFACTURING School Outfitters 1750.00
(School Outfitters #IRN-2086- School Specialty 1581.53
CL-BK) :
Staples No Bid
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122  [STORAGE UNIT Arctic Office Products No Bid Alaska 476.00
Size- |15-3/4"D x 46-1/2"W x 36 Alaska Education 476.00 Alt  Education
Brand [Lakeshore Kids Colors Lakeshore o41.27
Bid- |SPACEMAKER #AB526BU M_aterlals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144147 Staples No Bid
123 [BookcAsE Arctic Office Products No Bid School 190.00
Size- |12"D x 36-1/2"W x 36" H Alaska Education 199.00 Outfitters
Brand |JONTL.CRAFT RAINBOW Lakeshore 224.87 Alt
Bid - LCCENT 400601C M_aterlals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 190.00
4144103 School Specialty 197.11
Staples No Bid
124 [BooK CENTER Arctic Office Products 669.00 Alt  Alaska 263.00
Size- |15-3/47D x 48" W x 30" H Alaska Education 263.00 Alt  Education
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Extra- Lakeshore 337.87 Al
Bid - }Wide 4ABGEOBU Mgterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144143 School Specialty 382.11 Alt
Staples No Bid
125 BOOKCASE Arctic Office Products No Bid School 242.24
MOBILE Alaska Education 337.00 Alt  Specialty
Size- [85-1/2"H x 47-3/4"W x 14 |akeshore 337.87 Alt
Brand |BIRD IN HAND Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - l(School Specialty #1291232) Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 242.24
#144087 Staples No Bid
126 [BookcAsE Arctic Office Products 1268.00 Arctic Office 1268.00
Size- [72"H x 48"W x 12" D Alaska Education No B!d
Brand [VIRCO Plateau Series Lakeshore No Bid
Bid - L/PTBC7248 M_aterlals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144058 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
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127 [Bookcase Arctic Office Products 619.00 Arctic Office 619.00
Size- 29"H x 48"W x 12" D Alaska Education No B?d
Brand |VIRCO Plateau Series Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - L/PTBC2948 M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144058 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
128 |BOOKCASE Arctic Office Products 221.00 Alt  Arctic Office 221.00
METAL Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |72" H x 36"W x 12"D Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |[NORWOOD COMMERCIAL Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - \EURNITURE Norwood Series Midwest Technology Product No Bid
BCS361272N School Ouftfitters 450.00
School Specialty 242.24 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144087
129 STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products 439.00 Arctic Office 439.00
30-DRAWER Alaska Education No Bid
Size - [30-5/8"W x 11-5/8"D x 33 |Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [TENNESCO 2085 03 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product 616.71
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144058 Staples No Bid
130 STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products 454.00 Arctic Office 454.00
30-DRAWER Alaska Education No Bid
Size - [30-5/8"W x 14-5/8"D x 33 [akeshore No Bid
Brand [TENNESCO 3085 214 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product 637.03
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144058 Staples No Bid
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131 |STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products 689.00 Alaska 545.00
MOBILE Alaska Education 545.00 Education
Size - |36” W x 24" D x 36" H Lakeshore 563.87 Alt
Brand |DIVERSIFIED Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - }WOODCRAFTS #4401K Midwest Technology Product 1048.57
School Outfitters 840.00
School Specialty 554.13
#144179 Staples No Bid
132 STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products 1298.00 Alaska 1084.00
TALL WITH DOORS  Alaska Education 1084.00  Education
Size- |36"W x 22"D x 84" H Lakeshore 789.87 Alt
Brand [DIVERSIFIED Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  \WOODCRAFTS #353-3622  Midwest Technology Product 1974.19
School Outfitters 1350.00
School Specialty 1095.55
#144095 Staples No Bid
133 IWIRE STORAGERACK  Arctic Office Products 206.00 School 195.36
Size - |36,, W x 24" D x 72" H Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Lakeshore No Bid

Brand [SAFCO #5288GR

Bid- | (eNasco #219574) Materials Management of AK No Bid

Midwest Technology Product 362.50

School Outfitters 240.00
#144027 School Specialty 195.36
Staples No Bid
134 POST KIT Arctic Office Products 173.00 School 166.91
STEEL Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
size - [85" H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [SAFCO #6254 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  |(eNasco #220054) Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 166.91
#144027 Staples No Bid
135 ISECURITY CABINET Arctic Office Products 5249.00 Alt No Award
Size- [43'W x34°D x 65’ H Alaska Education No Bid
Lakeshore No Bid

Brand [JAMCO PRODUCTS #BR . :
’J CO PRODUCTS 55 Materials Management of AK No Bid

Bid -
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144027 School Specialty No Bid

Staples No Bid
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136 SHELF Arctic Office Products 173.00 School 166.91
INDUSTRIAL STEEL Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size- [36"W x 24"D Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [SAFCO #6254 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  |(eNasco #220052) Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 166.91
#144027 Staples No Bid
137 WIRE SHELVING RACK Arctic Office Products 370.00 Alt  Arctic Office 370.00
WITH WHEELS Alaska Education No Bid
Size- |18"D x 47.5"W x 77"H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [TRINITY Eco Storage 6-Tier Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid-  #TBFZ-0907 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144558 Staples No Bid
138 |STORAGE CABINET Arctic Office Products No Bid School 115.00
Size- L7"W x 11"D x 11H Alaska Education No Bid Outiftters
Brand |JAKRO-MILS #19909 Lakes_hore No B!d
Bid - ’A Materials Management of AK  No Bid
(eNasco #220052) ) .
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 115.00
#144087 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
139 |CABINET Arctic Office Products 829.00 School 520.00
LOCKING Alaska Education No Bid Outfitters
Size - |46” W x 24"D x 78" H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [SANDUSKY LEE Elite Series Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 520.00
School Specialty 813.14
#144087 Staples No Bid
140 |cABINET, STORAGE Arctic Office Products 459.00 Arctic Office 459.00
Size- [727high X 36 wide x 24» Alaska Education No Bid
Brand |HON “BRIGADE” #SC2472-S Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144087 School Specialty 501.58
Staples No Bid
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141 |BOOK CART Arctic Office Products 266.00 School 240.29
DOUBLE-SIDED Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size- [29"H x 48"W x 12" D Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SAFECO “SCOOT” #5335BL Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product 460.11
School Outfitters 315.00
School Specialty 240.29
#144027 Staples No Bid
142 |aoo+< CART Arctic Office Products 309.00 School 305.68
DOUBLE-SIDED Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size- [42"H x 37"W x 18’ D Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SANDUSKY LEE #SV336 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 350.00
School Specialty 305.68
#144187 Staples No Bid
143 |BOOK CART Arctic Office Products 269.00 Alt  School 242.64
SINGLE-SIDED Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - |44" H x 26"W x 14" D Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |BRET|:ORD Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 475.00
School Specialty 242.64
#144025 Staples No Bid
144 [TVCART Arctic Office Products 368.00 School 120.00
Size- [55-1/2" H x 39-1/2° W x Alaska Education No B?d Specialty
Brand |SAFECO #8944BL Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - Materials Management of AK No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 120.00 Alt
#144087 School Specialty 360.07
Staples No Bid
s [cHAIR TRucK Arctic Office Products 539.00 Alt  School 302.46
Size - |67,, High x 33-1/4” Deep x 70" Alaska Education No B?d Specialty
Lakeshore No Bid

Brand INATIONAL PUBLIC

Bid-  |SEATING Model #84 Materials Management of AK No Bid

Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 550.00
#144045 School Specialty 302.46
Staples No Bid
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146  |cHAIR caDDY Arctic Office Products 369.00 School 280.48
Size- |106-1/2'W x 20-7/8"D x Alaska Education No B!d Specialty
Brand |k Platform Cadd Lakeshore No Bid
y . .
Bid - L'KVSO/BE/C M_aterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144047 School Specialty 280.48
Staples No Bid
147 LECTERN, FLOOR DELUXE Arctic Office Products 459.00 School 242.64
WITH SHELF Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - [25” Width x 20" Deep x 46"  |akeshore No Bid
Brand INORWOOD COMMERCIAL Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid-  [FURNITURE #FFLS3 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
(School Outfitters #NOR- School Oulffitters 265.00
FFLS3) School Specialty 242.64 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144653
#144087
148  |LECTERN/PODIUM Arctic Office Products 929.00 School 636.42
Size - |Medium Oak Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Brand |OKLAHOMA SOUND Lakeshore No Bid
Bid-  |[ORATOR #800X-LVM-6 Mgtenals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 695.00
#144054 School Specialty 636.42
Staples No Bid
149 PRESENTATION CART Arctic Office Products 209.00 School 205.00
LAPTOP CADDY Alaska Education No Bid Outfitters
Size- [18” Width x 30" Deep x 40 |akeshore No Bid
Brand [BALT #27519 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - [(School Outfitters #BAL Midwest Technology Product No Bid
-27519) School Outfitters 205.00
School Specialty 236.93 Alt
Staples No Bid
#144653

#144130
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150 |CHAIR CART, HANGING  Arctic Office Products 539.00 Alt  School 302.46
DOUBLE TIER Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Size - Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |Decker Equipment #984T Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 590.00 Alt
School Specialty 302.46 Alt
#144189 Staples No Bid
157 [BOOK RETURN BOX Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size- |19"W x 19"L x 45" T Alaska Education No B?d
Brand |KINGSLEY “EASE Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid-  |QUIETDROP"” #40-0620-BK Mgterlals Management of AK No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144118 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
152 [BINS, CLEAR VIEW Arctic Office Products No Bid School 160.40
Size - |13_1/2,, L x 8W x 5 H Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Brand |_akeshore Kids Colors Lakes.hore 152'5.5
Bid - L'LM103 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
#144140 School Specialty 160.40 Alt
Staples No Bid
153 CLEAR-VIEW BINS Arctic Office Products No Bid Lakeshore 62.15
Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |13-1/2"L x 8"W x 5"H Lakeshore 62.15
Brand [Lakeshore Kids Colors Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid-  mwT111 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 64.16 Alt
#144147 Staples No Bid
154 SHELVING UNIT Arctic Office Products No Bid
MOBILE Alaska Education No Bid
Size- [52"H x 37"W x 24" D Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [Gaylord Genesis Series Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - [#G48DFS-M with #G48BPC  Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#144118 Staples No Bid
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155 SHELF AND DRAWER Arctic Office Products 2169.00  Alaska 1865.00
CABINET Alaska Education 1865.00 Education
Size- [27"D x 84"H x 36" W Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS  Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - 1477604.647 xx0xx Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 1972.61
#144569 Staples No Bid
156 [TRAY CABINET Arctic Office Products 1649.00 Alaska 1399.00
Size- 277D x 84"H x 36" W Alaska Education 1399_.00 Education
Brand |FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS Lakes.hore No B!d
Bid - L77284.647.XX0XX Mgterlals Management of AK  No B!d
Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
4144569 School Specialty 1490.38
Staples No Bid
157 |BASE SHELF/DRAWER  Arctic Office Products 1465.00  Alaska 1233.00
CABINET Alaska Education 1233.00 Education
Size- [26"D x 36"H x 36" W Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - L'72327.664.xx1xx Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 1378.05
#144569 Staples No Bid
158 WALL CABINET Arctic Office Products 1099.00 Alaska 487.00
WITH DOORS Alaska Education 487.00 Education
Size- [26"D x 36"H x36"W Lakeshore No Bid
Brand [FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - 1476040.606.xx1xx Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 536.86
#144569 Staples No Bid
159 BASE SINK CABINET Arctic Office Products 1509.00 Alaska 1337.00
WITH SINK & FAUCET  plaska Education 1337.00 Educaton
Size- [26"D x 36"H x 36" W Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - 1#72194.664.xx1xx Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 1417.02
#144569 Staples No Bid
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160 STORAGE UNIT WITH Arctic Office Products No Bid School 248.87
LI\?ERRA'ﬁZZEIlSPLAY BASE  Alaska Education No Bid Specialty
Lakeshore 676.87 Alt
Size - [35-3/4" W x 14-3/4"D x 74 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
gir:r_‘d |childcraft #1301808 Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 248.87
4144118 Staples No Bid
161 |TODDLER TOY AND Arctic Office Products 372.00 Alt  Alaska 254.00
BLOCK SHELF Alaska Education 254.00 Alt  Education
Size - [30-1/8" W x 42-3/8"L x 23 |akeshore 281.37 Alt
Brand |Chi|dcraft #074531 Materials Management of AK  No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 349.89
#144118 Staples No Bid
162 |SAND AND WATER TABLE  Arctic Office Products No Bid School 259.27
WITH COVER Alaska Education 299.00 Alt  Specialty
Size - [30-1/8"W x 42-3/8"L x 23 Lakeshore 337.87 Alt
Brand |Chi|dcraft #296129 Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 259.27
#144118 Staples No Bid
163 |PORTABLE PARTITION Arctic Office Products 1429.00 School 1080.83
FREESTANDING Alaska Education 1098.00  Specialty
size- [16'9"L x 60" H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SCREENFLEX FSL609-EN  Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 1400.00
School Specialty 1080.83
#144074 Staples No Bid
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164 |PORTABLE PARTITION Arctic Office Products 789.00 School 601.05
FREESTANDING Alaska Education 610.00 Specialty
size- [579"L x 60" H Lakeshore No Bid
Brand |SCREENFLEX FSL603-EN  Materials Management of AK No Bid
Bid - Midwest Technology Product No Bid
School Outfitters 740.00
School Specialty 601.05

#144074 Staples No Bid




