
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
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139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669
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Page 1  of 10

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #128-14

Due Date:  3-07-2014 

01 SAXOPHONE
            ALTO 

YAMAHA YAS-26

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

887.00
No Bid
No Bid
979.00
No Bid
1019.00
978.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

887.00

02 SAXOPHONE
            BARITONE

SELMER BS500;
YANAGISAWA B-901

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music

Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

2712.00;
3738.90
3250.00 (S)
No Bid
2797.00 (S)
No Bid
3010.00 (S)
2980.00 (?)

Cascio
Interstate Music

2712.00

#144178

03 SAXOPHONE
            TENOR

YAMAHA YTS-475

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1821.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
1879.00 Alt
No Bid
1907.00
1905.00 Alt

Cascio
Interstate Music

1821.00

04 EUPHONIUM

YAMAHA YEP-201 Series;
JUPITER 468L

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music

Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1218.00;
1287.00
1020.00 (J)
No Bid
1350.00 (Y)
No Bid
1109.00 (J)
996.00 (J)

Cascio
Interstate Music

1218.00

#144113
#144171
#144178

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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05 FRENCH HORN
    INTERMEDIATE

HOLTON H378

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

2144.00
2480.00
No Bid
2279.00
No Bid
2315.00
2330.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

2144.00

06 TRUMPET

BUNDY BTR-300 Series
#WBT-BD61LQ

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

403.00
330.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
320.00

Woodwind &
Brasswind

320.00

07 TROMBONE
          TENOR

YAMAHA YSL-447G

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc 
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

897.00
No Bid
No Bid
975.00
No Bid
985.00
950.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

897.00

08 BASS CLARINET

YAMAHA YCL 221; SELMER
1430LP

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music

Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1371.00;
1639.70
1570.00 (S)
No Bid
1430.00 (S)
No Bid
1417.00 (S)
1485.00 (S)

Cascio
Interstate Music

1639.70



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 3  of 10

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #128-14

Due Date:  3-07-2014

09 CLARINET

CONN-BUNDY Model BCL
-300; SELMER PRELUDE
CL711

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

242.00 (Bu)
210.00 (Bu)
No Bid
259.00 (S)
No Bid
255.00 (S)
225.00 (Bu)

Guitar Center 210.00

10 BASSOON

FOX RENARD MODEL 222;
FOX RENARD MODEL 240

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music

Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

4712.00;
7277.00
5150.0(22)
No Bid
7505.0(24)
No Bid
5589.00 *
5475.0(22)

Cascio
Interstate Music

4712.00

11 FLUTE

GEMEINHARDT 2SP

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

236.75
235.00
No Bid
287.00
No Bid
270.00
240.00

Guitar Center 235.00

12 OBOE

FOX RENARD Model 333
PROTEGE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

2427.00
2625.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2549.00
2535.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

2427.00
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13 PICCOLO

JUPITER 303S

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

424.00
450.00
No Bid
439.00
No Bid
425.00
440.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

424.00

14 GUITAR
    ACOUSTIC
Natural with Rosewood

ROGUE RA-090 
DREADNOUGHT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc 
K and S Music 
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
39.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
70.00

Guitar Center 39.00

15 PIANO
       DIGITAL

ROLAND RM-700

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#144153

16 XYLOPHONE

MAJESTIC CONCERT
PERCUSSION

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1687.00
1475.00
No Bid
1595.00
No Bid
1750.00
1890.00

Guitar Center 1475.00
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17 DRUM SET WITH
CYMBALS

LUDWIG ACCENT COMBO
W/ZILDJIAN ZBT CYMBALS;
PEARL EXPORT FUSION

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
460.00 (Lu)
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
610.00 (Lu)
720.00 (Lu)

Guitar Center 460.00

#144040

18 TIMBALES
     STEEL

SCHALLOCH PERCUSSION

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
130.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center 130.00

#144040

19 SNARE DRUM
      MARCHING
Piano Black

LUDWIG LFF024D USA;
PEARL CONCERT SERIES
CRP1465102

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship

Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

333.90 (Pe)
540.00 (Lu)
No Bid
543.00;
365.00
No Bid
629.00 (Lu)
No Bid

Awarded per
Brand.  These
items not equal.

#144040
#144153

20 CONCERT BASS DRUM
   WITH T-BASS STAND &
COVER

YAMAHA CBT640BC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1681.00
1560.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2429.00
No Bid

Guitar Center 1560.00

#144153
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21 SNARE STAND

PEARL 900 Series S900

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

65.90
44.00
No Bid
75.00
No Bid
93.00 Alt
No Bid

Guitar Center 44.00

22 CYMBALS

13”

ZILDJIAN A CUSTOM
MASTERSOUND HI-HAT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

238.90
215.00
No Bid
239.00
No Bid
260.00
225.00

Guitar Center 215.00

#144092

23 CYMBAL STAND

PEARL H2000/C
ELIMINATOR HI-HAT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

197.00
215.00
No Bid
229.00
No Bid
220.00
219.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

197.00

24 MARCHING BELLS

MUSSER M-65-V

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

867.00
1050.00
No Bid
975.00
No Bid
1059.00
960.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

867.00

#144153

25 SYMPHONIC GONG

24”

SABIAN #52402

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

259.00
260.00
328.00
No Bid
No Bid
297.00
235.00

Woodwind &
Brasswind

235.00

#144113
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26 TUBANO DRUM

12 inch diameter X 27 inches

REMO  100 SERIES #TU
-1112-PM

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc 
K and S Music 
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

207.00
174.00
No Bid
237.00
No Bid
323.00
180.00

Guitar Center 174.00

#144086

27 CONGA SET WITH
BONGOS AND STAND
NATURAL

LP ASPIRE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

307.90
350.00
No Bid
595.00
No Bid
973.00
415.00

Cascio
Interstate Music

307.90

#144113

28 BASS DRUM PEDAL

MAPEX 500

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc 
K and S Music 
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
35.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.00
48.00

Guitar Center 35.00

#146482

29 CLAVES

LUDWIG LE-2368

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

21.45
9.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
25.00
13.00

Guitar Center 9.50

30 XYLOPHONE
     DIATONIC

SONOR PRIMARY LINE FSC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc 
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

435.00
425.00
No Bid
589.00
No Bid
529.00
440.00

Guitar Center 425.00

#144086
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31 GLOCKENSPIEL
     DIATONIC

SONOR PRIMARY LINE FSC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

129.00
115.00
No Bid
184.00
No Bid
145.00
135.00

Guitar Center 115.00

#144061

32 XYLOPHONE
     DIATONIC

SONOR PRIMARY LINE FSC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

333.90
320.00
No Bid
390.00
No Bid
420.00
330.00

Guitar Center 320.00

#144061
#144086

33 XYLOPHONE
     DIATONIC

SONOR PRIMARY LINE FSC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1338.90
890.00
No Bid
935.00
No Bid
1065.00
820.00

Woodwind &
Brasswind

820.00

#144086

34 CONTRA BASS BARS

STUDIO 49 WEST12
ROSEWOOD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

1677.00
890.00
No Bid
1870.00
No Bid
2135.00
2110.00

Guitar Center 890.00

#144154
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35 DJEMBE SET

TOCA FREESTYLE
COLORSOUND

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
145.00
295.00
269.00
No Bid
765.00
No Bid

Guitar Center 145.00

#144061
#144086

36 STUDENT BELL KIT

GAMMON PERCUSSION
JBGS30

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid#144092

37 SYMPHONIC CHIMES

ADAMS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

4197.00
4135.00
No Bid
6860.00
No Bid
4679.00
4750.00

Guitar Center 4135.00

#144153

38 MUSIC STAND STORAGE
CART
Black

HAMILTON KB100

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

324.00
275.00
No Bid
360.00
No Bid
365.00
388.00

Guitar Center 275.00

#144092
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39 STORAGE CART

92” L  x  43” T  x  22” W

MANHASSET #1910 “RACK
AND ROLL”
(Musician’s Friend #450180)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
Guitar Center Inc
K and S Music
Sam Ash Quikship
Suzuki Music USA
Washington Music Center
Woodwind & Brasswind Inc

343.00
275.00
No Bid
455.00
No Bid
429.00
No Bid

Guitar Center 275.00

#144157


