
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

001 RUBBER FLOOR MAT 
     CENTER
4’  x  4”  x  1/2”

HUMANE
MANUFACTURING CO
“LOKTUFF STANDARD”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

66.77
36.00 Alt
No Bid
99.36 Alt
No Bid
89.00***

Jungle Jim’s 66.77

#144414

002 RUBBER FLOOR MAT
     BORDER
4’  x  4”  x  1/2”

HUMANE
MANUFACTURING CO
“LOKTUFF STANDARD”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

66.77
36.00 Alt
No Bid
99.36 Alt
No Bid
89.00***

Jungle Jim’s 66.77

#144414

003 RUBBER FLOOR MAT
     CORNER
4’  x  4”  x  1/2”

HUMANE
MANUFACTURING CO
“LOKTUFF STANDARD”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

66.77
36.00 Alt
No Bid
99.36 Alt
No Bid
89.00***

Jungle Jim’s 66.77

#144414

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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004 EQUIPMENT FLOOR MAT

3’  X   6’

Power Systems Ultra #62801
-15

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
55.60
No Bid
75.00 Alt***

Power Systems 55.60

#144414

005 POWER RACK
         DOUBLE-SIDED

PRO INDUSTRIES “PRO
POWER” #PP260

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

2549.10 Alt
No Bid
4570.99 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1950.00***
3115.00
Alt***

BSN Sports 2549.10

144289

006 WEIGHT TRAINING RIG

Finished size:  74’  x

ROGUE FITNESS
“MONSTER LITE CUSTOM”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
14170.00
Alt***

No Award

144399



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 3  of 31

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

007 WEIGHT TRAINING RIG

Black

ROGUE FITNESS “INFINITY”
I-44

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
7499.00
Alt***

No Award

144410

008 SAFETY SPOTTER ARMS

24” Long  X  14” High

ROGUE FITNESS #RA0167

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
286.00 A***

No Award

144410

009 MEDICINE BALL TOWER

Black

Power Systems Ultra #27148

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

377.30 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
208.85 Alt
No Bid
315.00 A***

Power Systems 208.85

#144414
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010 STORAGE RACK
         3-TIER
66” L  x  21” W  x 40.5” H

ROGUE FITNESS #RF0031-
DB-DB-DB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
1322.80 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
495.00 A***
285.00 A***

No Award

144412

011 STORAGE RACK
         3-TIER
66” L  x  21” W  x 40.5” H

ROGUE FITNESS #RF0031-
KB-KB-KB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
1520.80 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
525.00 A***
925.00 A***

No Award

#144412

012 STORAGE RACK
         3-TIER
78” L  x  21” W  x 40.5” H

ROGUE FITNESS #RF0031-
MB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
925.00 A***

No Award

#144410

013 DUMBBELL VERTICAL
RACK
      DOUBLE 
26” L  x  22” W  x  54” H

POWER SYSTEMS #61790

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

315.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
299.00 A***

ProMaxima 299.00

#144414
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014 BARBELL RACK

29” L x 32” W x 53” H

TROY
(Gopher Performance #70
-606)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
1000.62 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
415.00 ***
299.00 A***

ProMaxima 299.00

#144414

015 GLUTE HAM DEVELOPER

66” L  x  34” W  x  50” H

SORINEX MACH-II GHD
(Rogue Fitness #SOGHD1)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
1465.59 Alt

No Bid
460.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
409.00 A***

No Award

#144399
#144412

016 GLUTE HAM DEVELOPER

70” L  x  40” W  x  48.5” H

Rogue Fitness GH-1 Abram
#RF0097-E

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
1465.59 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
585.00 A***
620.00 A***

No Award

#144410

017 PLYO BOX

12”

BIOKINETIC #5727

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

188.70 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
75.00 A***

ProMaxima 75.00

#144414
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018 PLYOMETRIC BOX

Small (16” H , 19” H, 22” H;

DETONATE TRIFECTA
(Gopher Performance #70
-984)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

855.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
150.00 A***

ProMaxima 150.00

#144414

019 SUPER COMBO BENCH

18” H x 26” W x 47” L

PRO INDUSTRIES “PRO
POWER” #PP340

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

855.00 Alt
No Bid
874.09 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
525.00 ***
385.00 A***

Pro Industries 525.00

#144289

020 PULL-UP BAR

124” W (total length)

Gopher Performance #85-292

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
645.00 A***

ProMaxima 645.00

144414

021 ALUMINUM TRAINING BAR

72”

Power Systems #61850

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

140.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
130.62
No Bid
189.00 A***

Power Systems 130.62

#144399
#144412
#144414



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 7  of 31

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

022 PRO POWER BAR

86” long

Power Systems #61815

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

197.40 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
163.91
No Bid
239.00 A***

Power Systems 163.91

#144399

023 OLYMPIC POWER BAR
         WITH COLLAR
7’ long

POWER PLACE PRODUCT
#OPB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

347.45 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
225.00 A***
315.00 Alt*

Pro Industries 225.00

#144289

024 MEDICINE BALL

4 LB

DYNAMAX HOOVER

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.80
No Bid
30.00 Alt***

Power Systems 65.80

#144410

025 MEDICINE BALL

6 LB

DYNAMAX HOOVER

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
71.72
No Bid
35.00 Alt***

Power Systems 71.72

#144410
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026 MEDICINE BALL

8 LB

DYNAMAX “ACCELERATOR
1”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

167.95
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
64.00
No Bid
77.64
No Bid
38.00 Alt***

MFAC LLC 64.00

#144399

027 MEDICINE BALL

10 LB

DYNAMAX “ACCELERATOR
2” #DX10-BR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
68.00
No Bid
83.56
No Bid
40.00 Alt***

MFAC LLC 68.00

#144412

028 MEDICINE BALL

12  LB

DYNAMAX “STOUT 1”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

206.90
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
72.00
No Bid
89.48
No Bid
41.00 Alt***

MFAC LLC 72.00

#144399

029 MEDICINE BALL

14 LB

DYNAMAX “STOUT 2”
#DX14-BR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
78.00
No Bid
99.90
No Bid
45.00 Alt***

MFAC LLC 78.00

#144412
#145007
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030 MEDICINE BALL

16  LB

DYNAMAX “HEFTY 1”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
82.00
No Bid
105.82
No Bid
44.00 Alt***

MFAC LLC 82.00

#144399

031 MEDICINE BALL

20 LB

DYNAMAX “BURLY”
(Power Systems #24005-20)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

264.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
86.00
No Bid
117.66
No Bid
50.00 Alt***

MFAC LLC 86.00

#144399
#145007

032 MEDICINE BALL

8  LB

ROGUE D-BALL
“KEYSTONE SPEED BALL”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

35.25 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
31.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
30.00 Alt***

No Award

#144399

033 MEDICINE BALL

16  LB

D-BALL “KEYSTONE
STRENGTH BALL”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

56.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.00 Alt***

No Award

#144399
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034 MEDICINE BALL

20  LB

D-BALL “KEYSTONE
STRENGTH BALL”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

58.60 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.00 Alt***

No Award

#144399

035 MEDICINE BALL

55 cm

VERSABALL #80015
(Power Systems #80006-5C-
CB)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

25.50 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
17.95
No Bid
35.00 Alt***

Power Systems 17.95

144414

036 MEDICINE BALL

65 cm

VERSABALL #80026
(Power Systems #80006-6C-
CB)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

27.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
20.70
No Bid
40.00 Alt***

Power Systems 20.70

144414

037 MEDICINE BALL

15  LB

PLYOBALL
(JumpUSA #PLYBAL15)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

69.90 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 65.00

#144412
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038 MEDICINE BALL

20  LB

PLYOBALL
(JumpUSA #PLYBAL20)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

111.30 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
75.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 75.00

#144412

039 MEDICINE BALL

30  LB

PLYOBALL
(JumpUSA #PLYBAL30)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

144.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
115.00Al***

ProMaxima 115.00

#144412

040 MEDICINE BALL

6 pound

ELITE POWER MED-BALL
(Power Systems #25200-06)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

35.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
30.63
No Bid
30.00 Alt***

Power Systems 30.63

#144414

041 MEDICINE BALL

2 pound

ELITE POWER MED-BALL
(Power Systems #25200-02)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

23.10 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
18.19
No Bid
31.00 Alt***

Power Systems 18.19

#144414
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042 MEDICINE BALL

4 LB

ELITE POWER MED-BALL
(Power Systems #25200-04)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

27.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
22.61
No Bid
33.00 Alt***

Power Systems 22.61

#144414

043 MEDICINE BALL

8 LB

ELITE POWER MED-BALL
(Power Systems #25200-08)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

43.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
38.65
No Bid
33.00 Alt***

Power Systems 38.65

#144414

044 MEDICINE BALL

10 LB

ELITE POWER MED-BALL
(Power Systems #25200-10)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

49.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
43.67
No Bid
42.00 Alt***

Power Systems 43.67

#144414

045 SLAM BALL

10 LB

MUSCLE DRIVER USA “THE
SLAMMER” #SB10 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

42.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
43.00 Alt***

BSN Sports 42.80

#144410
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

046 SLAM BALL

20 LB

MUSCLE DRIVER USA “THE
SLAMMER” #SB20

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

58.60 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
52.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 52.00

#144410

047 SLAM BALL

30 LB

MUSCLE DRIVER USA “THE
SLAMMER” #SB30

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

85.85 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
60.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 60.00

#144410

048 SLAM BALL

40 LB

MUSCLE DRIVER USA “THE
SLAMMER” #SB40 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
80.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 80.00

#144410

049 SLAM BALL

50 LB

MUSCLE DRIVER USA “THE
SLAMMER” #SB50 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
110.00Al***

ProMaxima 110.00

#144410
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

050 MEDICINE BALL

8 lb

GOPHER PERFORMANCE
ULTRAFIT SLAMBALL #68
-489

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

35.25 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
31.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
35.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 35.00

#145974

051 MEDICINE BALL

GOPHER PERFORMANCE
ULTRAFIT SLAMBALL #74
-101

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
966.26  Alt
No Bid
1468.00***

ProMaxima 1468.00

#144395

052 WEIGHT BALL

GOPHER PERFORMANCE
ULTRAFIT #68-845

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
195.54 Alt
No Bid
285.00 ***

Power Systems 195.54

#144414

053 BARBELL
          FIXED
20 lb

TROY
(Gopher Performance #70
-607)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
57.10 ***
125.00Al***

ProMaxima 125.00

#144414
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14 

Due Date:  1-28-2014

054 BARBELL
          FIXED
30 lb

TROY
(Gopher Performance #70
-608)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
81.40 ***
150.00Al***

ProMaxima 150.00

#144414

055 BARBELL
          FIXED
40 lb

TROY
(Gopher Performance #70
-609)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
110.00 ***
160.00Al***

ProMaxima 160.00

#144414

056 BARBELL
          FIXED
50 lb

TROY
(Gopher Performance #70
-610)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
135.70 ***
180.00Al***

ProMaxima 180.00

#144414

057 DUMBBELL
         RUBBER
OCTAGONAL

4 LB

Power Systems #61501-04

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
8.03
No Bid
4.00 Alt***

Power Systems 8.03

#144399
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  1-28-2014

058 DUMBBELL
         RUBBER
OCTAGONAL

5 LB

Power Systems #61501-05

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
9.40
7.50 Alt ***
8.00 Alt***

Power Systems 9.40

#144414

059 DUMBBELL
         RUBBER
OCTAGONAL

10 LB

Power Systems #61501-10

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
17.52
15.00 Alt ***
16.00 Alt***

Power Systems 17.52

#144414

060 DUMBBELL
         RUBBER 
OCTAGONAL

12 LB

Power Systems #61501-12

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
21.55
18.00 Alt ***
20.00 Alt***

Power Systems 21.55

#144399
#144414

061 DUMBBELL
         RUBBER
OCTAGONAL

15 LB

Power Systems #61501-15

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
26.29
22.50 Alt ***
25.00 Alt***

Power Systems 26.29

#144399
#144414
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

062 DUMBBELL
             RUBBER
OCTAGONAL

20 LB

Power Systems #61501-20

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
35.06
30.00 Alt ***
28.00 Alt***

Power Systems 35.06

#144399
#144414

063 DUMBBELL
             RUBBER
OCTAGONAL

25 LB

Power Systems #61501-25

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
43.83
37.50 Alt ***
31.00 Alt***

Power Systems 43.83

#144399

064 DUMBBELL
    RUBBER OCTAGONAL

35 lb

Power Systems #61501-35

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
60.72
52.50 Alt ***
41.00 Alt***

Power Systems 60.72

#144399

065 DUMBBELL
            RUBBER HEX

15 lb

Rogue Fitness # IP0023-2

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

88.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
20.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

066 KETTLEBELL

9lb /4kg

ADER PREMIER #AR11204A

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

33.65 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
28.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
12.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 12.00

#144399

067 KETTLEBELL

18lb /8kg

ADER PREMIER #AR11208A

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

66.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
34.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
24.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 24.00

#144399

068 KETTLEBELL

26lb /12kg

ADER PREMIER #AR11212A

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

73.35 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
45.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
36.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 36.00

#144399

069 KETTLEBELL

35lb /16kg

ADER PREMIER #AR11216A

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

102.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
56.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
47.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 47.00

#144399
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

070 KETTLEBELL

53lb /24kg

ADER PREMIER #AR11224A

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

202.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
78.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 65.00

#144399

071 KETTLEBELL

18 lb

Rogue Fitness IP0003

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
24.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410

072 KETTLEBELL

26 lb

Rogue Fitness IP0004

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
34.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410

073 KETTLEBELL

35 lb

Rogue Fitness IP0005

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
46.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

074 KETTLEBELL

44 lb

Rogue Fitness IP0006

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
58.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410

075 SPEED ROPE

7 foot

POWEROPE
(Power Systems #35105-7F)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

3.10
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
3.69 Alt
No Bid
8.00 Alt***

BSN Sports 3.10

#144414

076 SPEED ROPE

Red

Rogue Fitness #SR-3S

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
14.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410

077 BUMPER PLATE

45 lb

ROGUE HI-TEMP #HTR45LB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

186.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
145.00/2 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
75.00 Alt***

No Award

#144399
#144410
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

078 BUMPER PLATE
     SOLID RUBBER

10 lb

Power-Systems Premium
#60872

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

110.60 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
60.00 Alt
No Bid
77.25
49.00 Alt ***
36.00 Alt***

Power Systems 77.25

#144412

079 BUMPER PLATE
     SOLID RUBBER

25 lb

Power-Systems Premium
#60874

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

189.40 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
85.00 Alt
No Bid
125.67
70.00 Alt ***
84.00 Alt***

Power Systems 125.67

#144412

080 BUMPER PLATE
     SOLID RUBBER

45 lb

Power-Systems Premium
#60876

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

372.40 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
145.00 Alt
No Bid
226.24
64.30 Alt ***
150.00Al***

Power Systems 226.24

#144412

081 GRIP PLATE
   OLYMPIC

VTX #GO-V

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

1660.60 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
825.00 ***
660.00Al***

Pro Industries 825.00

#144289
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       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

082 GRIP PLATE
   OLYMPIC

2.5 lb

POWER SYSTEMS  ELITE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

8.45
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
6.56
No Bid
7.00 Alt***

Power Systems 6.56

#144414

083 GRIP PLATE
   OLYMPIC

5 lb

POWER SYSTEMS  ELITE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

13.25
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
12.55
No Bid
8.75 Alt***

Power Systems 12.55

#144414

084 GRIP PLATE
   OLYMPIC

10 lb

POWER SYSTEMS  ELITE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

32.40
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
25.12
No Bid
17.50 Alt***

Power Systems 25.12

#144414

085 WEIGHT COLLAR
       UNIVERSAL
Black

PROLOC 1 #PL0001

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

42.85
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
48.00 Alt***

BSN Sports 42.85

#144399
#144410
#144412
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  1-28-2014

086 STRENGTH BAND
          LIGHT
1-1/8” W  x  41” L

Power Systems #68165

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

26.35 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
19.00 Alt
No Bid
15.69
No Bid
19.00 Alt***

Power Systems 15.69

#144412

087 STRENGTH BAND
          MEDIUM
1-3/4” W  x  41” L

Power Systems #68166

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

39.40 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
26.00 Alt
No Bid
20.49
No Bid
29.00 Alt***

Power Systems 20.49

#144412

088 STRENGTH BAND
         HEAVY
2-1/2” W  x  41” L

Power Systems #68167

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

45.10 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
33.00 Alt
No Bid
27.20
No Bid
38.00 Alt***

Power Systems 27.20

#144412

089 STRENGTH BAND
         MONSTER
4” W  x  41” L

Power Systems #68168

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

94.75 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
58.00 Alt
No Bid
47.62
No Bid
48.00 Alt***

Power Systems 47.62

#144412
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  1-28-2014

090 STRENGTH BAND
         MONSTER
41” L

Rogue Fitness RF Pull-Up
Package

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

138.20 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
64.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
87.00 Alt***

No Award

#144399

091 BAR - PLATE RACK
       OLYMPIC
29”  x  20” W

POWER SYSTEMS #40460

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

254.60  Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
68.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
95.00 Alt***

ProMaxima 95.00

#144414

092 RESISTANCE TUBING

Gopher UltraFit  #69-591

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

54.90 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
7.00 Alt
No Bid
29.91 Alt
No Bid
75.00 Alt***

Power Systems 29.91

#145807

093 RESISTANCE BAND

13-1/2”

VERSA 8 LIGHT #84205
(Power Systems #84201-LT)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

8.85 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
12.00 Alt
No Bid
4.62
No Bid
13.00 Alt***

Power Systems 4.62

#144414
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094 RESISTANCE BAND

13-1/2”

VERSA 8 MEDIUM #84210
(Power Systems #84201-MD)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

9.55 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
12.00 Alt
No Bid
4.99
No Bid
14.00 Alt***

Power Systems 4.99

#144414

095 RESISTANCE BAND

13-1/2”

VERSA 8 HEAVY #84215
(Power Systems #84201-HV)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

10.25 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
12.00 Alt
No Bid
5.29
No Bid
15.00 Alt***

Power Systems 5.29

#144414

096 JUMP ROPE
           CABLE

Ultra Speed
(Rogue Fitness #JR006)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
10.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
14.00 Alt***

No Award

#144410

097 WEIGHT BELT

Small (23” - 29” Waist)

Gopher #68-304

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

21.55 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
23.00 Alt***

BSN Sports 21.55

#144395
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098 WEIGHT BELT

Medium (28” - 34” Waist)

Gopher #68-305

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

21.55 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
23.00 Alt***

BSN Sports 21.55

#144395

099 FITNESS BAR

Gopher Performance UltraFit
#69-188

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
899.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2450.00***

ProMaxima 2450.00

#145092

100 BOSU

Gopher PerformancePro
ClassPlus  #69-197

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

1964.70
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
135.00 *
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2151.00 ***

BSN Sports 1964.70

#144395

101 DUMBBELL CHARTS

Gopher #68-365

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
50.00***

ProMaxima 50.00

#144414
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102 MEDICINE BALL CHARTS

Gopher #68-213

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
50.00***

ProMaxima 50.00

#144414

103 PULL-UP REVOLUTION

Gopher #70-506

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
62.00 Alt
No Bid
73.99
No Bid
75.00***

Power Systems 73.99

#144414

104 DUO-FLEX TESTER

ASSESSPRO
(Gopher #67-077)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
299.00***

ProMaxima 299.00

#144414

105 PUSH-UP BAR

Gopher Performance #70-531

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
47.40 Alt***

ProMaxima 47.40

#144414



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 28  of 31

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #114-14

Due Date:  1-28-2014

106 AGILITY LADDER
    SOLID

NO-FUSS
(Gopher Performance #70
-854)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

90.40
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
45.00 Alt***

BSN Sports 90.40

#144414

107 AB SLINGS

PRO AB
(Gopher Performance #74
-010)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

69.40 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
40.40
No Bid
26.00 Alt***

Power Systems 40.40

#144414

108 JUNGLE GYM

LIFELINE USA JUNGLE
GYM XT #93894

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
72.00
No Bid
91.42
No Bid
125.00
Alt***

MFAC LLC 72.00

#144414
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109 TIMER
      INTERVAL
1 x 2 inches

GYMBOSS #18128
(Power Systems Ultra
#18128)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
16.00
No Bid
18.05
No Bid
30.00 ***

MFAC LLC 16.00

#144414

110 STEP HURDLE

6” H  x  18” W

Power Systems Ultra #30101
-6I

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

82.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
6.50 A ***

Power Systems 6.69

#144414

111 EXERCISE BIKE

70” L  x  21.75” W  x  54.5” H

NORDICTRACK
COMMERCIAL VR PRO
RECUMBENT SERIES
#NTEX07912

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
2378.75 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1395.00
Alt***

Life Fitness &
Hammer
Strength

2378.75

#144399
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112 EXERCISE BIKE

41” L  x  26” W  x  48” H

SPORTSART FITNESS C510
INDOOR CYCLING

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

836.25 Alt
No Bid
1269.56 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
715.00Al***

Life Fitness &
Hammer
Strenght

1269.56

#145108

113 EXERCISE BIKE
        UPRIGHT

SCHWINN AIRDYNE AD2
(Sports Authority #12066061)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

659.95 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1299.00
Alt***

ProMaxima 1299.00

#144414

114 ROWER

96” L  x  24” W  x  14” Seat

CONCEPT 2 MODEL D
WITH PM3
(Rogue Fitness #C20003)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
1171.71

No Bid
965.00 *
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
999.00
Alt***

Life Fitness &
Hammer
Strength

1171.71

#144399
#144412
#144410
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115 ELLIPTICAL

72”  X  34”  X  18”

PROFORM 7.0 RE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

1672.10 Alt
No Bid
3710.29 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1995.00
Alt***

ProMaxima 1995.00

#144414

116 TREADMILL

78” L  x  38” W  x  53” H

SPORTSART FITNESS T611

Size -

Brand
Bid -

BSN Sports
Gopher
Life Fitness & Hammer
Strength
Jungle Jim’s Floorcovering
MFAC LLC
Nasco
Power Systems
Pro Industries
ProMaxima

No Bid
No Bid
3834.30 Alt

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2095.00
Alt***

Life Fitness &
Hammer
Strength

3834.00

#145108


