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Soldotna, Alaska  99669
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BID #132-14
Due date 3-27-14

Item #

01 PROJECTOR
WITH NO LENS

Alaska Audio/Visual 
CDW Government
Creative Lighting & Sound
GCSIT
Howard Technology
Pyramid Audio/Video
Washington Pro. Systems 

No Bid
$4200.00
$3275.00 Alt
$415100 Alt
$4188.00 Alt
$5186.00
$5395.00 Alt

NO AWARD#

Size -

Brand EPSON PowerLite Pro
G6750WUNL V11H542020

02 PROJECTOR
WITH NO LENS

Alaska Audio/Visual
CDW Government
Creative Lighting & Sound
GCSIT
Howard Technology
Pyramid Audio/Video
Washington Pro. Systems 

No Bid
No Bid
$10,495.00 Alt
No Bid
$7058.00
$7875.00
$6099.00

Washington Pro.
Systems

$6099.00#

Size -

Brand CHRISTIE DIGITAL
DHD675-E

03 PROJECTOR LENS Alaska Audio/Visual
CDW Government
Creative Lighting & Sound
GCSIT
Howard Technology
Pyramid Audio/Video
Washington Pro. Systems 

No Bid
$1200.00
$2600.00
No Bid
$1420.00
$1756.00
$1800.00

NO AWARD#

Size -

Brand EPSON V12H4M04

04 PROJECTOR LENS Alaska Audio/Visual
CDW Government
Creative Lighting & Sound
GCSIT
Howard Technology
Pyramid Audio/Video
Washington Pro. Systems 

No Bid
No Bid
$3335.00
No Bid
$2900.00
$3497.00
$2746.00

Washington Pro.
Systems

$2746.00#

Size -

Brand CHRISTIE DIGITAL
DHD670-E 133-103105-

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None


