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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #138-14

Due Date:  4-22-2014

01 LIFTING STATION

YORK (Gopher #70-945)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

5373.93
4527.55 Alt
2665.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 4527.55

#145869

02 EXERCISE STATION

BODY-SOLID G9S
(Gopher #70-684)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

4205.43
4191.65 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

LifeFitness 4191.65

#145812

03 FITNESS MACHINES
      JUNIOR COMPLETE
CIRCUIT

CARDIO KIDS
(Gopher  #68-806)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

13,144.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 13,144.45

#145863

04 MEDICINE BALL RACK
     OVERSIZE

Gopher UltraFit #70-986

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

431.17
No Bid
249.00Al***
No Bid

Gopher 431.17

#145974

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14

Due Date:  4-22-2014

05 MEDICINE BALL RACK
     3-TIER

Gopher UltraFit #68-673

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

337.69
No Bid
324.00Al***
No Bid

Gopher Sport 337.69

#145828

06 DUMBBELL RACK

Gopher #84-895

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

372.75
No Bid
845.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 372.75

#145828

07 KETTLEBELL RACK

Gopher Performance UltraFit
#69-128

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

454.54
No Bid
744.00 Alt
668.37 Alt

Gopher Sport 454.54

#145828

08 KETTLEBELL  RACK
              MOBILE

Gopher UltraFit #70-178

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

583.08
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 583.08

#145868

09 VERTICAL BAR RACK

IRONRANGE
(Gopher Performance #74
-267)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

185.79
No Bid
182.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 185.79

#145828
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14

Due Date:  4-22-2014

10 RACK
      SINGLE

MAGNUS “SPACE SAVER”
(Gopher #69-554)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

105.10
No Bid
324.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 105.10

#145974

11 MEDICINE BALLS
    WITH RACK

Gopher Evolution UltraFit #71
-987

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1167.33
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1167.33

#145828

12 MEDICINE BALLS
          WITH RACK

Gopher UltraFit “Evolution
Kompact” #69-216

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1424.40
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1424.40

#145868

14 PULL-UP STATION
SYSTEM
    WALL-MOUNT

IRONRANGE
(Gopher Performance #74
-221)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

185.79
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 185.79

#145838

15 OLYMPIC TRAINING BAR

20 kg / 45 lb; 86” long

Gopher Performance #70-981

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

326.01 Alt
244.19 Alt
319.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 244.19

#145008
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14

Due Date:  4-22-2014

16 CHINNING BAR
      WALL-MOUNTED

Gopher UltraFit #85-288

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

150.73
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 150.73

#145974

17 CHINNING BAR
      WALL-MOUNTED

Gopher UltraFit #85-286

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

192.80
No Bid
369.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 192.80

#145812

18 CURL BAR
       DELUXE

Gopher Performance #70-066

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

232.53
269.49 Alt
111.00Al***
No Bid

Gopher Sport 232.53

#145838

20 BUMPER WEIGHT PLATE

10 LB

Gopher #69-447

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

46.67
59.06 Alt
125.00/Pr
No Bid

Gopher Sport 46.67

#145008

21 BUMPER WEIGHT PLATE

25 LB

Gopher #69-449

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

75.89
109.74 Alt
195.00/Pr
No Bid

Gopher Sport 75.89

#145008
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14
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22 BUMPER WEIGHT PLATE

35 LB

Gopher #69-450

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

99.26
136.74 Alt
255.00/Pr
No Bid

Gopher Sport 99.26

#145008

24 BUMPER WEIGHT PLATE

45 LB

Gopher #69-451

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

122.69
71.20 Alt
380.00/Pr
No Bid

Gopher Sport 122.69

#145008

25 TRAINING PLATE
      TECHNIQUE

CHRISTIAN’S FITNESS
FACTORY
 #2061 CFF-TTP-005

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

No Bid
116.62 Alt
64.00/Pr
No Bid

No Award

#145828

26 KETTLEBELL
        RUBBER

Gopher UltraFit #69-393

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1459.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1459.45

#145812
#145863
#145881

27 KETTLEBELL
      CONTOUR

Gopher UltraFit #70-190

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1050.48
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1050.48

#145871
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14
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33 KETTLEBELL

Gopher “TyroBall” #68-841

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

34.99
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 34.99

#145831

34 KETTLEBELL

Gopher “TyroBall” #68-839

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

23.34
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 23.34

#145831

35 KETTLEBELL

Gopher UltraFit “IronWorks”
#69-969

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

52.52
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 52.52

#145838

36 KETTLEBELL

Gopher UltraFit “IronWorks”
#69-970

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

64.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 64.20

#145838

37 KETTLEBELL

Gopher UltraFit “IronWorks”
#69-971

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

75.89
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 75.89

#145838
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       RECAP
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38 KETTLEBELL

Gopher UltraFit “IronWorks”
#69-972

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

87.57
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 87.57

#145838

39 KETTLEBELL
         FOAM

Gopher IntroFit  #49-522

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

209.16
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 209.16

#145868

40 DUMBBELL
        50 LB

Gopher #69-681

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

105.10
80.07 Alt
206.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 80.07

#145869

41 DUMBBELL

Gopher #69-683

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

127.36
110.43 Alt
227.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 110.43

#145869

42 DUMBBELL

Gopher #69-685

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

150.73
123.04 Alt
280.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 123.04

#145869
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       RECAP
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43 DUMBBELL

Gopher #69-687

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

174.10
135.28 Alt
322.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 135.28

#145869

44 DUMBBELL

Gopher #69-689

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

197.47
147.89 Alt
354.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 147.89

#145869

45 DUMBBELL
             HEX

Gopher UltraFit #68-153

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1752.81
1702.95 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

LifeFitness 1702.95

#145812

46 DUMBBELL
             HEX HEAD

YORK
(Rogue Fitness #YK34051)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

No Bid
16.16 Alt
60.50 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 16.16

#145828

47 DUMBBELL
             HEX HEAD

YORK
(Rogue Fitness #YK34053)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

No Bid
41.19 Alt
85.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 41.19

#145828
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14
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48 DUMBBELL
             HEX HEAD

YORK
(Rogue Fitness #YK34055)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

No Bid
53.79 Alt
115.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 53.79

#145828

49 DUMBBELL
             HEX HEAD

YORK
(Rogue Fitness #YK34057)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

No Bid
66.39 Alt
145.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 66.39

#145828

50 DUMBBELL
             HEX HEAD

YORK
(Rogue Fitness #YK34059)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

No Bid
97.93 Alt
185.00 Alt
No Bid

LifeFitness 97.93

#145828

52 SLAM BALL

20 LB

Gopher Performance #69-492

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

70.04
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 70.04

#145007
#145008

53 BALANCE AND STABILITY
CIRCUIT PACK

Gopher UltraFit” CircuitPro”
#96-574

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1517.88 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award

#145843
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14
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54 PRO TRAINER PACK
            BASIC

Gopher UltraFit  #68-009

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

4088.58
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 4088.58

#145852

55 STABILITY BALL
       ANTI-BURST

Gopher “UltraFit” #72-301

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

244.21
No Bid
58.00 Alt***
No Bid

Gopher Sport 244.21

#145807

56 STABILITY BALL

Gopher “UltraFit” #71-021

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

30.31
No Bid
58.00 Alt
25.48 Alt

Gopher Sport 30.31

#145829

57 STABILITY BALL

Gopher “UltraFit” #71-022

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

33.82
No Bid
64.00 Alt
35.21 Alt

Gopher Sport 33.82

#145829

58 STABILITY BALL
       ANTIBURST

GOPHER ULTRAFIT #70 
-221

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

805.09
No Bid
52.00 Alt*
No Bid

Gopher Sport 805.09

#145843
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       RECAP
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59 MEDICINE BALL

8 lb

GOPHER PERFORMANCE
ULTRAFIT SLAMBALL #68
-489

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

46.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 46.67

#145974

60 MEDICINE BALL

20 lb

GOPHER ULTRAFIT
SLAMBALL #68-492

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

70.04
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 70.04

#146674

61 MEDICINE BALL

GOPHER ULTRAFIT
EVOLUTION KOMPACT
#69-205

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

37.33
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 37.33

#145828

62 MEDICINE BALL

GOPHER ULTRAFIT
EVOLUTION #70-987

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

980.37
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award

#145828

63 MEDICINE BALL

15 lb

GOPHER PERFORMANCE
ULTRAFIT SLAMBALL #68
-491

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

64.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 64.20

#145974
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       RECAP
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64 MEDICINE BALL

Gopher “IntroFit” #49-523

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

150.73
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 150.73

#145831

65 MEDICINE BALL

Gopher “IntroFit” #49-524

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

174.10
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 174.10

#145831
#145861
#145868

66 MEDICINE BALL

Gopher “ENFORCER”  #69
-620

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

42.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 42.00

#145869
#145871

67 MEDICINE BALL

Gopher “ENFORCER”  #69
-621

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

50.18
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 50.18

#145869
#145871

68 MEDICINE BALL

Gopher UltraFit “Evolution”
#69-878

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

57.19
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 57.19

#145838
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14
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69 MEDICINE BALL

Gopher UltraFit “Evolution”
#69-877

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

53.68
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 53.68

#145838

72 RESISTANCE BAND

Gopher #69-015

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

34.99
No Bid
37.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 34.99

#145007
#145828

73 RESISTANCE BAND

Gopher #69-016

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

40.83
No Bid
43.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 40.83

#145007
#145828
#145838

74 RESISTANCE BAND

2-1/2” W  x  41” L  x  3/8”

Gopher #69-017

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

49.01
No Bid
49.00 Alt***
No Bid

Gopher Sport 49.01

#145007
#145838

75 RESISTANCE BAND

Gopher #69-018

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

70.05
No Bid
58.00 Alt***
No Bid

Gopher Sport 70.05

#145007
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       RECAP
   Bid #138-14

Due Date:  4-22-2014

76 RESISTANCE TUBING

GopherUltraFit ProTex #69
-172

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

875.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 875.20

#145831

77 RESISTANCE TUBING

Gopher UltraFit  #69-591

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

58.36
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 58.36

#145807

78 RESISTANCE TUBING
     FIGURE 8

Gopher UltraFit  #91-211

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

9.28
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 9.28

#145851

79 TUBING WITH PLASTIC
HANDLES

Gopher UltraFit #86-980

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

64.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 64.20

#145807

80 RESISTANCE TUBING
     FIGURE 8

Gopher UltraFit  #91-212

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

10.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 10.45

#145851
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81 RESISTANCE TUBING
     FIGURE 8

Gopher UltraFit  #91-213

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

11.62
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 11.62

#145851

82 RESISTANCE TUBING
     FIGURE 8

Gopher UltraFit  #91-214

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

12.79
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 12.79

#145851

83 BALANCE DISC

Gopher “IntroFit” #49-532

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

181.11
No Bid
33.00 Alt*
No Bid

Gopher Sport 181.11

#145831

84 BALANCE BOARD

Gopher “UltraFit” #68-302

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

58.36
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 58.36

85 BALANCE TRAINER

BOSU “EZ-REACH PACK”
(Gopher #68-963)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

2405.94
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 2405.94

#145852



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 16  of 17

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #138-14

Due Date:  4-22-2014

86 SPRING COLLAR

Gopher #84-518

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

16.29
5.16 Alt *
12.50 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 16.29

#145869

88 FITNESS BAR
    WITH MOBILE RACK

Gopher  “UltraFit” #68-647

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1249.12
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1249.12

#145841

89 FITNESS BARS

Gopher UltraFit Pro
ClassPlus  #68-656

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1401.03
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1401.03

#145828

90 FITNESS BARS

Gopher UltraFit Pro #69-187

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

1868.43
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sport 1868.43

#145863
#145868

95 AB SLING

PROGRYP
(Gopher #68-975)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

75.89
No Bid
60.00 Alt***
No Bid

Gopher Sport 75.89

#145861
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96 LIFTING CHALK

Gopher UltraFit Pro #69-187

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Gopher Sport
LifeFitness
Perform Better (MFAC LLC)
School Health Corporation

17.46
No Bid
40.00 Alt
No Bid

Gopher Sport 17.46

#146674


