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Iltem # Item Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price
010004 BINDER, FLEXIBLE RING (DARK Arctic Office $6.43 Staples $1.55/each
BLUE) Pyramid School No Bid Acco #39702
Size/Clr> |Dark Bl 1/" School Specialty ~ [$1.23
1z&/Ar ark blue, - Staples $1.55
Brand>  |Acco #39702 Timberline Millwork |$2.97
National Art & No Bid
School
010005 |BINDER, ROUND RING (1/2" Arctic Office $1.30 Arctic Office $1.30/each
/WHITE) Pyramid School No Bid BSN #09951
Size/Cl ‘1/2” Whi School Specialty $2.39
Izeltir> » White Staples $1.58
Brand> ‘WLJ36213W Timberline Millwork |$2.88
National Art & No Bid
School
010007 ‘BlNDER, D RING (2"/WHITE) Arctic Office $4.10 Arctic Office $4.10/each
. " . Pyramid School No Bid WLJ #38644W
Size/Clr>  [2"-White School Specialty ~ [$4.01
Brand>  |WJ #38644W Staples $5.15
Timberline Millwork [$8.95
National Art & No Bid
School
010010 ‘BINDER, ROUND RING Avrctic Office $1.41 Staples $1.25/each
; " Pyramid School No Bid WLJ #36814NBL
Size/Clr> 1™-Roval School Specialty  [$1.92
Brand> ‘WLJ36814NBL Staples $1.25
Timberline Millwork [$2.05
National Art & No Bid
School
010012 ‘BlNDER, ROUND RING (GREEN) Arctic Office $2.22 Staples $1.25/each
. . Pyramid School No Bid WLJ #36814GN
Size/Clr> ‘1 “Green School Specialty $2.61
Brand> |WLJ36814GN Staples $1.25
Timberline Millwork |$2.05
National Art & No Bid
School
010014 ‘BlNDER, ROUND RING (RED) Arctic Office $1.40 Staples $1.25/each
. N Pyramid School No Bid WLJ #36814NR
Size/Clr>  |1"-Red School Specialty  [$1.81
Brand> |KMCK31110RD Staples $1.25
Timberline Millwork [$2.05
National Art & No Bid

School

*Does Not Meet Specification

****Draw

**No Specifications Provided

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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010059 ‘BOOK POCKETS (LOW BACK) Arctic Office $23.99(box) Timberline $.065/each
. Pyramid School No Bid Demco #P125
Size/Clr> [Low back School Specialty ~ [$21.09 -0003
Brand> |Demco #P125-0003 Staples $.11
Timberline Millwork |$.065
National Art & No Bid
School
010060 ‘MAGAZINE FILE Arctic Office $1.41 Staples $1.19/each
Size/Clr> ‘Lar o Pyramid School No Bid Fellows #07223
g School Specialty $6.29(pack 3)
Brand> |Fellows #FEL-07223 Staples $1.19
Timberline Millwork [$2.08
National Art & No Bid
School
010069 ‘CALCULATOR, SOLAR Arctic Office $3.45 School Specialty |$1.76/each
Size/Clr> ‘4,, Pyramid School No Bid SS #084087
School Specialty $1.76
Brand> ‘Sharp #EL-243C & Sharp #EL-243SB Staples $1.93
Timberline Millwork |$4.12
National Art & No Bid
School
010090 ‘CARDS, INDEX (3"X4"/RULED) Arctic Office $.53 Staples $.38/pkg
. i Pyramid School No Bid ESS31
Size/CIr> |3"x5" Ruled School Specialty $.94
Brand> |Ampad #23300 Staples $.38
Timberline Millwork |$.93
National Art & No Bid
School
010096 ‘CARDS, INDEX (3"X5"/BLANK) Arctic Office $.52 Staples $.38/pkg
. g Pyramid School No Bid ESS30
Size/Clr> ‘3 x5” Blank School Specialty $.88
Brand> ‘ESS30 Staples $.38
Timberline Millwork [$1.02
National Art & No Bid
School
010141 ‘CLlPBOARD (LETTER) Arctic Office $1.15 Staples $.76/each
. Pyramid School No Bid OIC #83500
Size/Clr> \Letter School Specialty $1.95
Brand> |OIC #83500 Staples $.76
Timberline Millwork [$2.16
National Art & No Bid

School

*Does Not Meet Specification

**No Specifications Provided

****Draw

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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010146 ‘CL|P, BINDER (3/4") Arctic Office $.30 Staples $.19/box
; ” Pyramid School No Bid Staples #103523
Size/Clr> ‘3/4 School Specialty $.34
Brand>  |Acco #72020 Staples $.19
Timberline Millwork |$.4.80
National Art & No Bid
School
010147 ‘CLIP, BINDER (1-1/4") Arctic Office $.72 Staples $.50/box
. i Pyramid School No Bid Staples #103549
Size/Clr> |1-1/4 School Specialty $.57
Brand> ‘ACCO #72050 Staples $.50
Timberline Millwork [$7.50
National Art & No Bid
School
010171 ‘CORRECTlON FLUID (WHITE) Arctic Office $.99 Staples $.42/each
. . Pyramid School No Bid BIC #50367
Size/Clr> ‘18 il School Specialty $1.24
Brand> \Papermate #56301 Staples $.42
Timberline Millwork |$1.24
National Art & No Bid
School
010175 ‘CORRECTION TAPE Arctic Office $.1.93 Staples $1.64/each
. . Pyramid School $2.29 Tombo #68620
Size/Clr> ‘Whlte School Specialty $1.77
Brand> [TOM68620 Staples $1.64
Timberline Millwork |$3.08
National Art & No Bid
School
010227 ‘ENVELOPE, CLASP (10"X13") Arctic Office $7.95 Arctic Office $7.95/box
. - Pyramid School No Bid BSN #36665
Size/Clr> ‘10 x13 School Specialty $13.82
Brand> |OP #37897 Staples $8.76
Timberline Millwork |$18.89
National Art & No Bid
School
010267 |FOLDERS, PORTFOLIOS Arctic Office $9.40 School Specialty |$5.13/box
(WITHOUT FASTENERS) Pyramid School No Bid SS #084900
Size/Cl \A Col School Specialty $5.13
ize/Clr> |Asst. Colors Staples $5.17
Brand> \Smead #SMD486A Timberline Millwork ($19.25
National Art & No Bid

School

*Does Not Meet Specification

****Draw

**No Specifications Provided
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010358 ‘GLUE STIC (.25 0Z) Arctic Office $.38 Pyramid $15.each
' Pyramid School $.15 Dixon #15083
Size/Clr> "25 0z School Specialty $.38
Brand> |Ross #95300BD2 Staples $.15
Timberline Millwork |$.48
National Art & No Bid
School
010361 ‘GLUE STIC (.75 O2) Arctic Office $1.57 Pyramid $.40/each
. Pyramid School $.40 Dixon #15155
Size/Clr> "75 0z School Specialty $.96
Brand> |Dixon #026052 Staples $.47
Timberline Millwork |$.67
National Art & No Bid
School
010362 ‘GLUE, WHITE (GLUE-ALL) Arctic Office $1.82 Staples $.32/each
. Pyramid School No Bid Staples #855975
Size/Clr> ‘4 0z. School Specialty $1.47
Brand> |Borden #E372 Staples $.32
Timberline Millwork |$1.73
National Art & No Bid
School
010409 ‘MARKER, SHARPIE (8 COLOR SET) Arctic Office $5.20 National Art $3.85/set
' Pyramid School $3.95 Sanford #30078
Size/Clr> \8/co|or set School Specialty $5.20
Brand> |Sanford #30078 Staples $4.42
Timberline Millwork |$7.15
National Art & $3.85
School
010410 |MARKER, SHARPIE ULTRA FINE Arctic Office $.64(each) National Art $5.85/dozen
(BLACK) Pyramid School $5.94 Sanford #37001
Size/Cl ‘BI K School Specialty $7.95
izeltir> ac Staples $6.69
Brand> ‘Sanford #37001 Timberline Millwork |$9.75
National Art & $5.85
School
010424 \pEN, GEL (BLACK) Arctic Office $.97 Staples $.12/each
. Pyramid School No Bid Staples #11246
Size/Clr> \Black School Specialty $6.83
Brand> \Staples #11246 Staples $.12
Timberline Millwork |$.72
National Art & No Bid

School

*Does Not Meet Specification

**No Specifications Provided
****Draw
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010427 ‘PEN, RUBBERIZED BALL (BLUE) Arctic Office $.77 Staples $.24/each
. . Pyramid School No Bid Staples #18275
Size/Clr> [Blue - Fine School Specialty ~ [$9.11
Brand>  |Bic #SGSF11 Staples $.24
Timberline Millwork |$.79
National Art & No Bid
School
010431 ‘MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER (GREEN) Arctic Office $.47 Staples $.22/each
Size/CIr> |Green Pyramid School $.36 Sanford #25026
School Specialty $6.22
Brand> |San #25026 Staples $.22
Timberline Millwork |$.68
National Art & $.36
School
010433 ‘MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER (PINK) Arctic Office $.47 National Art $.36/each
. . Pyramid School $.36 Sanford #25009
Size/Clr> ‘Pmk School Specialty $6.24
Brand> |PAP #20701 Staples $.40
Timberline Millwork |$.68
National Art & $.36
School
010434 |MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER Arctic Office $.47 Staples $.33/each
(LAVENDER) Pyramid School $.36 Avery #24060
. School Specialty No Bid
Size/Clr> \Lavender Staples $.33
Brand> ‘San #25019 Timberline Millwork |$.68
National Art & $.36
School
010438 |MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER (5 Arctic Office $2.40 Pyramid $1.87/set
COLOR SET) Pyramid School $1.87 Sanford
) School Specialty $2.55
Size/Clr> ‘5/clr/set Staples $2.07
Brand> ‘Sanford #27075 Timberline Millwork |$3.68
National Art & $1.97
School
010439 ‘MARKER, DRY ERASE (BLACK) Arctic Office $.83 National Art $.57/each
. Pyramid School $.64 Sanford #84001
Size/Clr> \Black School Specialty $8.87
Brand> \Sanford #84001 Staples $.71
Timberline Millwork |$1.15
National Art & $.57

School

*Does Not Meet Specification

****Draw
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010446 |MARKER, PERMANENT Arctic Office $.62 each National Art $5.64/dozen
(SHARPIE®) (BLACK) Pyramid School $5.94 Sanford #30001
Size/Clr> \BI " School Specialty $7.97
1z&/Ar ac Staples $6.69
Brand> |Sanford #30001DZ Timberline Millwork |$9.89
National Art & $5.64
School
010458 |MARKER, WASHABLE (MR. Arctic Office $9.94 National Art $4.70/set
SKETCH) Pyramid School $4.72 Sanford #19072
Size/Cl ‘12/ ot/ School Specialty $6.74
ize/Clr> color/se Staples $6.47
Brand> ‘Sanford #19072 Timberline Millwork |$8.95
National Art & $4.70
School
010496 ‘PENClL, WRITING (#2) Arctic Office $.20 each Pyramid School  |$1.38/dozen
. Pyramid School $1.38**** Ticonderoa
Size/Clr> |HB2 School Specialty ~ $1.90 #13882
Brand> \Ticonderoa #13882 Staples $1.38%***
Timberline Millwork |$1.79
National Art & No Bid
School
010633 ‘STAPLES, STANDARD Arctic Office $.82 Staples $.49/box
. . . Pyramid School No Bid Swingline
Size/Clr> \Chlsel Point School Specialty $1.07 435108
Brand> ‘Swin_qline #35108 Staples $.49
Timberline Millwork |$1.50
National Art & No Bid
School
010656 ‘TAPE, BOOK MENDING (2"X45) Arctic Office $6.45 School Specialty |$2.13/roll
. " . Pyramid School $3.96 3m #8452
Size/Clr> ‘2 x45 School Specialty $2.13
Brand>  |3M #8452 Staples $4.12
Timberline Millwork |$6.95
National Art & $3.88
School
010680 ‘TAPE, MASKING Arctic Office $6.20 National Art $3.09/roll
) . Pyramid School $3.54 3M #23434
Size/CIr>  [3/47x60 yds. Sehool Specialty 95,04
Brand>  |3M #23434 Staples $3.69
Timberline Millwork |$5.80
National Art & $3.09

School

*Does Not Meet Specification

****Draw

**No Specifications Provided

*** Not FOB: Soldotna




Item Description

010690 |TAPE, MENDING
Size/Clr> [3/4"x1296”
3M Magic #81034

Bid Recap
Bid #139-14-W

Vendors & Price Quoted

Arctic Office $2.30
Pyramid School $1.91
School Specialty $15.69(6 pk)

Staples $2.03
Timberline Millwork [$2.97
National Art & $1.38
School

Page 7

Vendor Awarded & Price

National Art $1.38/roll
3M #81034

*Does Not Meet Specification

**No Specifications Provided
****Draw

*** Not FOB: Soldotna




