
BID SPECIFICATION RECAP SHEETS                                                      

COUNTRY FOODS FSA TTM

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

75 case 500/.97 Advance #3-1416 500/.97 oz 3141600 $69.05 CARTWRIGHT 876547 $69.06 PIERCE

150 case 400/.90 oz Advance  Pierre #3822 400/.90oz 382200 $57.06 CARTWRIGHT 544873 $57.05 PIERCE

100 case 48 Redi Bake #40402 48/2.5 oz 404020 $21.39 SALESCORP 413313 $21.27 SALESCORP

100 case 120 Fathers Table 01197 120/2 oz NO BID 456525 $42.68 ACOSTA

150 case 96 Butcher Boy #1081501 96/3 oz 88888 $37.02 CARTWRIGHT

Butcher Boy #1081501 72/2.7 OZ $36.41 PIERCE

301

Beef, Country Fried Steak Finger  Breaded fully cooked beef 

steak . This product must be CN labeled. Four fingers must 

provide 2 oz mma                                                                                                  

13-1013

302

Pork Riblet w/ Honey Sauce   CN Label   4/.90 oz nuggets 

provide 2 M/MA                                                                           

13-1045

303

Benefit Bars  Banana Choc Chip WG 51% No trans Fat 

305

304

Bars, Cherry Apple Crunch 2 oz bar

Burrito, Breakfast Egg & Cheese bulk CN Label                                                              

13-2013
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

300 case 60 Butcher Boy  #2961001 60/ 6.2 oz 88888 $59.64 CARTWRIGHT

BUTCHER BOY#42966501 72/5 OZ $59.19 CARTWRIGHT

25 case 4/5# Land O Lakes 25104 4/5# 88888 $73.89 DOT $69.63 ADVANTAGE WAYPOINT

SCHREIBER#29394 4/5# 242051 $58.30 SCHRIEBER

25 case 4/5# Schrieber / SCHOOL CHOICE 4/5# 101397 $56.60 SCHREIBER

Land O Lakes 4/5#  NO BID

400 case 192/2oz

Max #7738712722 192/1.93 oz 88888 $53.14 CONAGRA 598654 $53.38 ACOSTA

BB-PF TACO SNACK  YF  CN Label                                                            

308

Cheese - Mozzarella made w/ part skim milk, shredded 5# bags                                                                                                                                                               

12-1096

Cheese, Cheddar, Reduced Fat,Reduced Sodium  Yellow, 

Shredded, 5# Bag                                                                                                           

12-1098

Pizza Sticks - 51% Whole Grain Ovenable, low-fat skim mozzarella 

cheese wrapped with a pizza style crust, Ovenable      CN    Lable                                                                                                                                           

13-2095

306

307

309
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

300 case 30# Pilgrim #61210 525/.61 oz 88888 $55.29 CARTWRIGHT 634732 $39.79 PIERCE

30#

TYSON#2155-0328 720/.67 OZ 243549 $53.24 ADVANTAGE

200 case 30# Pilgrim #66210 105/3.05 oz 88888 $55.29 CARTWRIGHT 988199 $39.83 PIERCE

TYSON#2154-0328 150/3.08 OZ 445257 $60.00 ADVANTAGE

200 case 72/3.30 oz Advance Pierre #9468 72/3.30 oz 88888 $43.72 CARTWRIGHT 992944 $43.51 PIERCE

200 case 72 /3.11 oz Integrated Food Service #826005 72/3.11 oz 88888 $49.65 CARTWRIGHT 407515 $49.71 JG NEIL

Chicken Breast Fillets-Unbreaded with BBQ Sauce, Flame Broiled 

Chicken Breast Cutlets 2-Dimensional with BBQ Sauce                                      

13-3005312

Chicken Nugget -Whole Grain breaded fully cooked CN labeled 

chicken nuggets w/ISP.  No other types of TVP permitted.  Nuggets to 

be batter breaded with whole grain crumb style breader.  CN label to 

provide 2 oz. m/ma and 1 bread serving.  Minimum piece count to be 

stated on label.  Product to provide zero grams trans fat.                                                                                                            

13-3021

313

Beef &Cheese Chalupa (WG Tostada Bowl) .CN Label

Chicken Breast Patty, Breaded Whole grain breaded fully cooked CN 

labeled chicken patties w/ISP.  No other types of TVP permitted.  

Patties to be batter breaded with whole grain crumb style breader.  1 

CN patty  guaranteed by CN label to provide 2 oz. m/ma and 1 breade 

serving.  Minimum piece count to be stated on label.  Product to 

provide zero grams trans fat.                                                                                                                                                                     

13-3015 

310

311
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

75 case Foster Farm #96180 1/10#

Pilgrims Pride 1325 30#

Tyson#60224-0571 1/10# NO BID

CHIX  STRIP SW STYLE NTF 1/10# 757039 $36.43 ADVANTAGE WAY

25 case 192/1.85oz Otis Spunkmeyer 

Hope's Country Fresh 

Redi Bake#14921 180/cs 88888 $45.00 COSTAL $59.43 SALES CORP

500 case 10# Foster Farms #96086 10# 108222 $24.04 CARTWRIGHT 250491 $23.94 PIERCE

  

  

75 case 6/5.6 # Asian Food Solutions 22101 6/5.6# bag 775311 $74.40 ACOSTA

NO BID

316

Chicken - Fajita Strips Oven roasted fully cooked fajita flavor 

marinated whole muscle chicken strips produced from young broilers.  

Product is to have heat applied grill marks for added flavor and 

apperance. Product is to be well seasoned with a southwest fajita 

style seasoning.  Product is to be cut into natural strips and IQF 

frozen. 2.05 oz of fajita meat guaranteed by CN label to provide 2 oz 

M/MA. Product to provide zero trans fat.                                                                                                                     

13-3026

Corn Pup Dogs, Whole Grain Low Fat 6 mini corn dogs must provide 

2 oz m/ma and 2 servings bread alternate.  CN Label required                                                                                                                                                    

13-3516

Cookie Dough,  1 oz Reduced Fat 51% Whole GrainChocolate Chip

Chow Mein Noodles-tossed with mixed vegetables and teriyaki sauce.  

No MSG Added, No Trans Fat  CN Lable

314

315

317

BID #136-14

CHILL/FREEZE 4 OF 15



BID SPECIFICATION RECAP SHEETS                                                      

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

300 case 60

Minh #69202 60/4.4 oz 69202 43..89 CARTWRIGHT 962771 $47.84 PIERCE

400 case 255/cs Michaels Foods 46025-85880 255 sticks 88888 $39.90 CARTWRIGHT 545419 $40.38 PIERCE

   

75 case 36/6oz JTM #5990 36/ 6oz 88888 $27.56 CARTWRIGHT $28.71 RATCLIFF

50 case 2/5# Wawona#4453 2/5# $24.18 AWONA LISA CARTER

Simplot 06311 4/5# 88888 $54.01 ALPINE 202609 $53.71 PIERCE

319

Fruit  Frozen Berry Triple Bulk, Thaw & Serve Berry Blend                                                                                   

12-2505

318

Egg Roll,51 % WG  4.4 ozChicken & Vegetables CN must provide 2 

oz equivalent meat/meat alternate, 2 oz equivalent grains, and 1/4 cup 

vegetable. Portion to provide a minimum  of 240 calories with no more 

than 11 fat grams. Must contain a minimum of 2 grams of fiber and 

less than 780 milligrams sodium.  CN label required                                                                                                                    

320

WGR Steel Cut Oatmealw/ Brown Sugar  CN ( portion pack)

Whole Grain Maple Glazed French Toast Sticks fully cooked, 3 sticks 

to provide 1 oz meat meat alternate 1.5  bread equivalent. CN Label                                                                                                                                               

13-5001

321
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

250 case 96 J&J 23060025 96/4 oz 88888 $36.29 SALESCORP 626877 $37.64 SALES CORP

150 case 96 J&J 23060020 96 8888 $36.29 SALESCORP 976499 $37.64 SALES CORP

1500 case 72 Olympic  72

Ardmore NO BID

or 48 Vita Fresh 48

96 FSA 96 688165 $26.37 FSA

Carbotrol

1000 case 72 Olympic  72

Ardmore

or 48 Vita Fresh 48 NO BID

96 FSA 96 688204 $28.46 FSA

Carbotrol

325

Juice, Orange- frozen, foil top cup, waxed carton, or K-pack  4 oz. 

liquid, 100% juice, US Grade A  (carbotrol is self stable)                                                                                                                   

12-2721

Juice, frozen Whole Fruit Premium 100% Juice Cups Mixed Berry & 

Lemon Swirl each 4 fl oz cup provides up to 1/2 cup of single 

strength juice            12-2590                                        

323

324

322

Juice, Apple- frozen, foil top cup, waxed carton, K-pack,     4 oz. 

liquid, 100% juice,  US Grade A (carbotrol is self stable)                                                                                                                                                                          

12-2717

Juice, frozen Whole Fruit Premium 100% Juice Cups Orange 

Pineapple & Cherry Swirl each 4 fl oz cup provides up to 1/2 cup of 

single strength juice                        12-5995                            
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

100 case 102 Michael 89243 102/3.25 OZ 88888 $66.47 CARTWRIGHT 529471 $65.19 PIERCE

150 case 4/96 oz Lean Cuisine /Nestle 12102363 4/96 oz tray 980841 $84.21 PIERCE

NO BID

75 case 168 SCHRIEBER FOODS INC  19148 168  /1 oz 218794 $42.46 FSA

Ameri Herit 218794

NO BID

20 case 2/5# Hormel 4/3# 403524 $62.08 SUPERIOR

Margherita 2/5# 117368 $38.99 DOT FOODS

NO BID

Quesadilla w/Turkey Sausage/Egg/Cheese  CN Label                                                                                                                       

13-2015

Lasagna, whole grain with meat sauce.   No Trans Fat

326

329

Pepperoni, Turkey Vac Pack                                                                                                                                          

13-9503

327

328

CHEESE STRING IW     1 oz.                                                            
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

150 case 128/3.2 oz Tony's #63912 128 159014 $52.91 CARTWRIGHT 623185 $52.62 PIERCE

400 case 96 Tony's #250296 96 /4.48 Z 888888 $55.99 CARTWRIGHT 250296 $55.31 PIERCE

400 case 72 Big Daddy's 78637 72 serv/cs 888888 $73.90 CARTWRIGHT 102744 $74.13 PIERCE

Big Daddy#582703

100 case 48 Redi bake #40401 48/ 2.5 oz 888888 $21.51 SALESCORP 402653 $21.09 SALESCORP

332

Benefit Bar Oatmeal Chocolate Chip WG 51%   Zero Trans Fat 

Pizza, Big Daddy's 16" Whole Grain 51% Four Cheese (8 cut)                                                                                                                                                 

13-5023

333

330

Pizza: Breakfast Pizza,51% Whole Grain Turkey Sausage (red sauce)                                                                                                                                                                      

13-5015

Pizza, Tony's Pizza 4X6  WGR CN NTF                                                                                                                                          

331
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

200 case 100 Pierre #3817 100/3.25 888888 $58.96 CARTWRIGHT 421937 $58.54 PIERCE

400 case 6/5# Simplot Tater Pals 9221227 6/5# 888888 $21.44 CARTWRIGHT 136220 $23.10 PIERCE

Rus-Ettes#R45 6/5# 670839 $27.78 ACOSTA

150 case 6/5#

McCain #MCL03622 6/4# 401709 $26.86 SUPERIOR

Simplot 47014 6/5# 888888 $28.48 ALPINE 746183 $30.52 PIERCE

 

Lamb Weston D73 6/5# 277546 $30.55 SUPERIOR

200 case 6/4# Simplot 47007 6/4# 888888 $22.63 ALPINE 56482 $23.68 PIERCE

337

Potatoes, Shoe String - Ovenable Only!

1/4" cut (No Trans Fat)                                                                                                                                                       

12-4040

336

Potatoes, Seasoned Curly -- Ovenable Only!

Seasoned, Skin on, Extra Crisp texture Coated. No Trans Fat.

                                                                                                                                                                           

12-4045

335

Potato, Crinkle Cut 1/2" Ovenable No Trans Fat                                                                                                                                                                       

12-4034

334

Pork Rib, Sweet Honey BBQ Smokie Grill Rib  CN labeled. Must not 

contain MSG.                                                                                                                                            

13-1010

BID #136-14
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

200 case 6/5# McCain  #OIF00215 6/5# case

Simplot #00418 6/5# case 888888 $22.79 ALPINE 468423 $24.33 PIERCE

(ORE-IDA#OIF00215A) 237175 $25.00 SUPERIOR

100 case 30# Lamb Weston A10 30# 442259 $29.01 ACOSTA

Oreida #01F00880 6/5# 412668 $26.89 SUPERIOR

Simplot 47801-10 6/5# 888888 $26.28 ALPINE 181129 $28.33 PIERCE

75 case 50/cs J & J Snacks #30110 50/cs 888888 $34.63 SALESCORP 224244 $33.49 SALESCORP

50 case 6/2.5# Simplot #16380 6/2.5# 888888 $27.12 SALESCORP 183629 $26.65

Potato, Wedges Seasoned Jo Jo's ovenable No Trans Fat                                                                                                                          

12-4031

340

Pretzels - Soft 2.5 oz. pre-baked 51% WW , all natural, no 

preservatives or fat, layer pack, w/wo salt                CN Lable                                                                                                                         

12-7503

338

Potatoes, Tater Tots, Ovenable Only!  Made with chopped potatoes, 

par-fried No Trans Fat                                                                                                                                                                            

12-4060

339

341

Edemane Succotash 50% Edemane,Corn 44% , Diced red peppers 6 

% 
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

100 case 72/2.64 oz General Mills #37308 72/2.64 oz 888888 $35.48 CARTWRIGHT NO ID $32.18 PIERCE

50 case 6/2.5 LB Simplot #020356 6/2.5 LB 888888 $21.92 ALPINE 543833 $23.08 PIERCE

344 250 case 10# Sausage - Low fat Low Sodium, Skinless sausage pre cooked,  

CN label, no lard, tropical oils or MSG                                                                                                                                

Jones Dairy Farm 888888 $27.46 ALPINE 815136 $27.68 JG NEIL

20# Quincy 012007 20# 704581 $59.57 FSA

400 case 36/6.75oz Apple & Eve # 84529TPE 36/6.75 oz NO BID NO ID $14.39 DMM

343

345

Fruitables plus Tropical Twist 100% Juice, Aseptic Pack w/straw CN  

1/2 C veg.

342

Phillbury Mini French Tst Trp Berry  CN                                                                                                                          

Sweet Potato  Crinkle Cut 3/8"

BID #136-14
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

50 case 6/2# Sara Lee 6/2# NO BID

Hormel 492668 $58.52 SUPERIOR

Similar

(MADRONA MARKET) 985742 $55.78 FSA

(HILLSHIRE) 651684 $44.79 ADV WAY PNT

40 case 12/pk Mission 12/pk 888888 $30.87 SUPERIOR 808799 $40.81 SUPERIOR

Rio Viejo

Like Brand (MEX ORIG) NO ID $35.01 ADV WAY PNT

20 case 12/pk Mission 12/pk 888888 $26.25 SUPERIOR

Rio Viejo

Like Brand

Similar (MEX ORIG) 660539 $21.76 ADV WAY PNT

10 case 6/2.5# Roastworks 6/2.5# 888888 $32.69 ALPINE 736481 $31.73 PIERCE

Similar

349

Vegetable, Onion & Pepper Mix Roasted W/ light seasoning                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

12-8010

346

Turkey Breast O/R  .67 oz Sliced                                                                                                                                         

13-9551                                          

347

Tortilla Wraps- Flour- Frozen, 8 inch,         WG                                                                                                                         

12-7851

Tortilla Wraps- Tomato Basil Wrap 12"     WG 

348
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

30 case 12/32 oz Simplot 12/32 oz 88888 $33.06 ALPINE 380163 $33.04 PIERCE

Similar

100 case 12/2# Norpac 12/2# 888888 $31.21 ALPINE 633321 $31.78 PIERCE

Similar

20 case 36/1# Glow 89032SNG 36/1#/cs NO BID 321772 $53.08 PIERCE

Similar

50 case 6/5# Land O Lake 46288 6/5# NO BID 770943 $92.16 DOT FOODS

Similar (SCHOOL CHOICE) 234927 $77.66

350

Vegetable: Santa Fe Blend Cut corn, Broccoli Florets, Black Beans, 

Diced Red Peppers                                                                                                                

12-8015 

351

352 Butter Blend Euro Style (Chill)                                                                                          

11-0010

Vegetables, Winter Mix No Carrots                                                                                

12-8005

Cheese-Cheddar American Slice Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium 

Pasteurized Process (Chill)                                                                                                                                                                                              

11-0035

353
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

5 case 1/5# Kraft #61545 1/5# 888888 $27.11 SUPERIOR 144797 $25.21 SUPERIOR
Similar

100 CASE 96/2.8OZ JSB # 12228 96/2.8oz 888888 $77.45 JG NEIL 166691 $71.79 JG NEIL

JSB # 12229

50 CASE 10 LB ELITE 55300 .5 OZ

FSA #294394 .5 OZ

(JTM 5030CE) 888888 $98.28 RATCLIFF

(SIG 5STAR#01989 284821 $33.41 FSA

200 CASE 30 LB TYSON   #70368-0928 888888 $88.31 DOT 955153 $62.21 ADV WAY PNT

200 CASE 48-50 PIECE TYSON #1298-0928 2/9LB 888888 $67.06 DOT 216259 $49.93 ADV WAY PNT

Similar

Sunflower Seed Butter & Grape Sandwich WG   CN Label354

354 Cheese, Parmesan, grated  5#, (Chill)                                                                                                                                              

11-0030

355 MEATBALLS BEEF COOKED 1/2 OZ      CN Lable

356 Chicken  POPCORN , Breaded Whole grain breaded fully 

cooked CN labeled chicken Pieces w/ISP.  No other types of 

TVP permitted.  Pieces to be batter breaded with whole grain 

crumb style breader.  13-3023

357 Chicken 8  Way  Breaded Oven Easy  CN Lable
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IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 

DISTRIBUTOR 

STOCK#

PRICE PER 

CASE

BROKER                              

NAME 
NO BID

150 CASE 10 LB Superior 1/10# 888888 $28.76 SUPERIOR 60598 $27.28 SUPERIOR

200 CASE 10# PEIRCE 10#

TRIDENT #418311 10# 888888 $20.75 SUPERIOR 959885 $20.15 PIERCE

FSA #959885

358 CHICKEN STRIPS SPICY GOLDEN NTF

13-3022

359  SEAFOOD: POLLOCK  NUGGETS  WG OVEN READY  CN                                                                                                         

 WG OVEN READY CN 
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