(907)714-8876

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

FAX (907)262-7165

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Page 1 of 19

RECAP

Bid #137-14/A

Due Date: 5-02-2014

[ Iltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

01 lcYMNASIUM DIVIDER LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand IDRAPER TOP-ROLL GYM
Bid-  [DIVIDER
#145807
02 TREADMILL LifeFitness 7187.87 Alt LlfeFitness 7187.87
w/ LED Display LIfeFitness 8181.18 Alt
Size - School Specialty No Bid
Brand [Power-Systems “Centurion ~ US Games No Bid
Bid - 23TX3" Model CV-23T
#48000-01
#145826
03 ELLIPTICAL LifeFitness 6027.71 Alt LIlfeFitness 5440.66
w/ HDTV LIfeFitness 5440.66 Alt
Size - School Specialty 1363.58 Alt
Brand |Power-Systems “Centurion ~ US Games No Bid
Bid- |S25EX” #48015-01
#145826
04 CROSS-COUNTRY SKIING LifeFitness No Bid
oL A]gsl\g(ESSHlﬁ_c':K School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand |FISCHER
Bid - (Gopher #75-530)
#145863

* Does Not Meet Specifications

****Draw

** No Specificiations Provided

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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05 ONE-COURT SYSTEM, LifeFitness No Bid School 2793.43
COIRI/'IP:'E'(E)EER School Specialty 2793.43 Specialty
) US Games 3357.60
Size -
Brand [SPALDING SLIDE SYSTEM
Bid-  [(Gopher #86-225)
#145823
06 TWO-COURT ADAPTER LifeFitness No Bid US Games 1952.75
STANDARD School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games 1952.75
Brand |SPALDING SLIDE SYSTEM
Bid - [(Gopher #86-226)
#145823
07 [FLOOR SLEEVE LifeFitness No Bid US Games 199.80
Size - School Specialty 259.48
US Games 199.80
Brand |SPALDING
Bid - (Gopher #85-139)
#145823
08 |POST PAD FOR TWO- LifeFitness No Bid US Games 387.45
COURT SLIDE SYSTEM School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games 387.45
Brand |SPALDING
Bid - (Gopher #86-257)

#145823
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bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 5-02-2014
[ Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
09 GAME STANDARDS, LifeFitness No Bid US Games 428.15
LIGFIIDTOVI\E_E;'JE School Specialty 77.25 Alt *
US Games 428.15
Size -
Brand |Gopher #85-600
Bid -
#145885
10 TABLE TENNIS TABLE LifeFitness No Bid School 815.50
WITHNET AND POSTS  gchool Specialty 815.50 Alt  Specialty
Size - US Games 1629.85 Alt
Brand [Gopher Advantage 500 #16
Bid- |g55
#145974
11 VOLLEYBALL SYSTEM LifeFitness No Bid US Games 619.50
WIRELESS School Specialty 234.63 **
Size - US Games 619.50 Alt
Brand [GARED MONGOOSE
Bid-  (US Games #1138214)
#145881
12 INDOOR FLOOR ADAPTER LifeFitness No Bid US Games 180.00
PLATES School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games 180.00
Brand [GARED MONGOOSE
Bid-  [US Games #1138211)
#145881
13 [REBOUNDER LifeFitness No Bid School 298.06
Size - School Specialty 298.06 Alt  Specialty
US Games No Bid

Brand JUMPSPORT
Bid - (Gopher #69-598)

#145812
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14 IANCHOR STATION LifeFitness No Bid
SINGLE School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand \WARRIOR STRONGHOLD
Bid-  [Gopher #70-111)
#145838
15 BASKETBALL LifeFitness No Bid US Games 2092.40
BACKBOARD School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games 2092.40
Brand [BISON “UNBREAKABLE
Bid- [GLASS”
(Gopher #65-259)
#145828
16 CROSS-COUNTRY SKIING LifeFitness No Bid
oL A?SESNPI(I?SSHIID?AEK School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand IFISCHER
Bid-  \(Gopher #75-531)
#145825
17 |CROSS-COUNTRY SKI LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid

Bid- RHCWFO03

#145867

Brand LI?OSSIGNOL EVO FIRST AR
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Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

18 |CROSS-COUNTRY SKI LifeFitness No Bid
BINDING School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand [ROSSIGNOL T3
Bid-  |[AUTOMATIC #RJ31005
#145867
19 |CROSS-COUNTRY SKI LifeFitness No Bid
BOOT School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |ROSSIGNOL X-1 ULTRA
Bid-  HR12WA14
#145867
20 |CROSS-COUNTRY SKI LifeFitness No Bid
POLE School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |ROSSIGNOL X-T 700
Bid-  #RD29100
#145867
1 |BIKE HELMET LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand |BONTRAGER SOLSTICE
Bid - [Model
#145867
27 |ski TRAINER LifeFitness No Bid
Size . School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #68-798
Bid -

#145812
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93 lski RACK LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand IARTECH Mohn #6113
Bid -
#145851
o4 SNOWSHOE LifeFitness No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |REDFEATHER “YOUTH 2"
Bid - [(Gopher #17-778)
#145825
#145861
#145863
o5 SNOWSHOE LifeFitness No Bid
CLASSROOM PACK School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand |REDFEATHER
Bid - [(Gopher #75-717)
#145851
26 SNOWSHOES LifeFitness No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand [REDFEATHER
Bid-  [*CONQUEST”

#145861

(Gopher #75-624)
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> lsNowsHOE LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand [REDFEATHER “HIKE”
Bid - (Gopher #10-241)
#145867
08 lsNowsHOE LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand [REDFEATHER “HIKE”
Bid - (Gopher #10-242)
#145867
29 |GEOCACHING LifeFitness No Bid School 2429.28
CLASSPLUS School Specialty 2429.28 Specialty
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #75-660
Bid -
#145863
30 ORIENTEERING KITS LifeFitness No Bid US Games 332.70
INSTRUCTOR’S School Specialty 89.47/4*
Size - US Games 332.70

Brand |BRUNTON
Bid - (Gopher #91-039)

#145821
#145825
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[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
31 12-ACTIVITY TEAM- LifeFitness No Bid
BU'EE’EZSPF;?_CU*; School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand |Gopher #01-110
Bid -
#145863
32 CIRCUIT PACK LifeFitness No Bid
12-STATION School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher ClassPlus IntroFit
Bid - |#49-508
81145863
33 |SINKING RAFT TEAM LifeFitness No Bid
BUILDING CHALLENGE School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |S & S Worldwide #60141200
Bid -
#145863
34 |HURDLES LifeFitness No Bid School 49.34
TRAINING School Specialty 49.34 Specialty
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #38-374
Bid -
#145831
35 |HURDLES LifeFitness No Bid School 61.82
TRAINING School Specialty 61.82 Specialty
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #38-833
Bid -

#145831
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36 |sTEPPERS LifeFitness No Bid US Games 197.40
Size - School Specialty 306.06
_ US Games 197.40
Brand [Gopher “UltraFit ClassSteP”
Bid - t49.537
#145883
37 [MINI TRAMPOLINE LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 90.10 Alt *
US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #19-351
Bid -
#145873
38 [EQUIPMENT CART LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 566.99*
US Games 405.00*
Brand (GORILLACARTS
Bid - \(Gopher #89-561)
#145812
39 IMAT TRUCK LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 73.50*
US Games 459.00 Alt
Brand |Gopher TumblePro #96-542
Bid -
#145823
40 |RECESS RACK LifeFitness No Bid No Award
ALL-TERRAIN School Specialty 484.99 Alt *
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #89-631
Bid -

#145831
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Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted

a1 HYBRID CART LifeFitness No Bid No Award
ALL-TERRAIN School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games 642.20 *
Brand IMAGNUS
Bid - (Gopher #89-582)
#145851
42 pumP ROPE CART LifeFitness No Bid US Games 179.60
Size - School Specialty 223.50 Alt
US Games 179.60 Alt
Brand IMAGNUS
Bid - [(Gopher #41-006)
#145828
. laumP ROPE RACK LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 28.38 Alt *
US Games No Bid
Brand MEASUREUP
Bid - [(Gopher #41-056)
#145843
44 [BALL RACK LifeFitness No Bid School 80.06
Size - School Specialty 80.06 Specialty
Brand [BALLBASIX US Games 84.65
Bid - (Gopher #89-711)
#145881
45 STORAGE CART LifeFitness No Bid US Games 354.15
BADMINTON School Specialty 426.70
Size - US Games 354.15

Brand |RACQUETKING
Bid - (Gopher #51-207)

#145825
#145828
#145852
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% (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #137-14/A
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[ Iltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
46 STORAGE CART LifeFitness No Bid US Games 261.95
ARCHERY School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games 261.95 Alt
Brand [TC Sports
Bid - (Gopher #72-139)
#145825
#145856
47 STORAGE CART LifeFitness No Bid No Award
FLOOR HOCKEY School Specialty 517.48 Alt
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand [RINKKING
Bid - [(Gopher #17-952)
#145828
48 [VOLLEYBALL CART LifeFitness No Bid School 120.39
Size - School Specialty 120.39 Specialty
US Games 124.70
Brand [MIKASA
Bid - (Gopher #85-058)
#145828
49 [BALL CART LifeFitness No Bid School 300.00
Size - School Specialty 300.00 Specialty
US Games No Bid
Brand [TOTEMASTER PLUS
Bid - (Gopher #89-530)
#145838
50 [BALL CART LifeFitness No Bid School 445.00
Size - School Specialty 445.00 Specialty
US Games 354.00*

Brand [TOTEMASTER FULL SIZE
Bid-  \(Gopher #85-098)

#145838
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51 [BALL CART LifeFitness No Bid US Games 423.85
Size - School Specialty 556.92 Alt
US Games 423.85 Alt
Brand |Gopher UltraCart
Bid - IMountainGoat #89-611
#145852
52 |MOBILE GROSS MOTOR  LifeFitness No Bid School 368.98
CART School Specialty 368.98 Alt  Specialty
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Kaplan Early Learning #13
Bid- 170162
#145851
- [TENNIS BALL BASKET LifeFitness No Bid School 50.40
Size - School Specialty 50.40 Specialty
US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher #52-020
Bid -
#145821
54 IMEDICINE BALL LifeFitness No Bid School 50.40
Size . School Specialty 50.40 Specialty
_ US Games 69.55
B.rand Gopher UltraFit HandleBars”
Bid - l468-173
#145873
55 [RESISTANCE TUBING LifeFitness No Bid US Games 688.55
Size - School Specialty No Bid
_ US Games 688.55
Brand |Gopher UltraFit #86-985
Bid -

#145868
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[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
56 [FITNESS TESTING PACK  LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand JASSESSPRO
Bid-  |[FITNESSGRAM
(Gopher ClassPlus #67-177)
#145974
57 |FLEXIBILITY TESTER LifeFitness No Bid US Games 188.80
Size - School Specialty 127.08 Alt
US Games 188.80
Brand |IASSESSPRO
Bid - [(Gopher #72-012)
#145863
£g [PUSH-UP TESTER LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand |ASSESSPRO REP-
Bid-  |ADDITION
(Gopher #67-017)
#145828
59 [TESTER LifeFitness No Bid US Games 291.80
Size - School Specialty 107.54 Alt
US Games 291.80
Brand JASSESSPRO FLEX-SOLO
Bid - IpLus
(Gopher #67-068)

#145828
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60 [TRAINING MAZE LifeFitness No Bid School 81.82
Size - School Specialty 81.82 Specialty
US Games No Bid
Brand |AGILITY MATRIX
Bid - (Gopher #68-817)
#145825
#145874
61 IAGILITY LADDER LifeFitness No Bid School 23.20
Size - School Specialty 23.20 Specialty
US Games 78.60
Brand |Gopher #86-938
Bid -
#145831
62 [TUMBLING MAT LifeFitness No Bid School 416.39
Size - School Specialty 416.39 Alt  Specialty
US Games 441.75 Alt
Brand [TUMBLEPRO
Bid - (Gopher #85-021)
#145874
#145879
63 [TUMBLING MAT LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 453.81 Alt
US Games1371346-24 747.20 Alt
Brand |Gopher TumblePro #85-022
Bid -
#145828
64 [TUMBLING MAT LifeFitness No Bid US Games 536.00
Size - | School Specialty 331.75 Alt
US Games 536.00 Alt

Brand TUMBLEPRO
Bid - [(Gopher #85-295)

#145881
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Vendors & Price Quoted
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65 [WORKOUT MAT LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand [EXERFIT
Bid - (Gopher ClassPlus #69-77(*)
#145825
#145868
#145877
66 [WORKOUT MAT LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand |ECOFIT
Bid - (Gopher ClassPlus #69-63(*)
#145831
67 WORKOUT MAT LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 17.62/ea*
US Games No Bid
Brand [EXERFIT
Bid - (Gopher #69-774)
#145974
68 WORKOUT MAT LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty 127.20*
US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher “MAXFIT” #86-041
Bid -
#145873
69 [WORKOUT MAT LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher “MAXFIT” #69-179
Bid -

#145868
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20 ALL STRIPS LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Ef'égg/”“u'\" WITH School Specialty 35.52 Alt *
US Games 315.60 Alt *
Size -
Brand |Gopher #85-271
Bid -
#145828
- IWALL MAT LifeFitness No Bid No Award
REMOVABLE School Specialty 76.48 Alt *
Size - US Games 257.70 Alt *
Brand |Gopher TumblePro #85-163
Bid -
#145828
- IWEDGE LifeFitness No Bid School 351.92
Size - School Specialty 351.92 Specialty
US Games 401.25
Brand |85-135
Bid -
#145812
23 labMAT LifeFitness No Bid No Award
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games 140.40
Brand |AbMAT (Gopher #68-455)
Bid -
#145974
24 [voGA MAT LifeFitness 63.93 School 13.60
Size - School Specialty 13.60 Specialty
US Games 19.55
Brand |Gopher #69-114
Bid -

#145807
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[ Iltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
75 INTERLOCKING FOAM LifeFitness No Bid School 81.99
PUZZLE MATS School Specialty 81.99 Specialty
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |POPCORN
Bid-  [INTERNATIONAL
WONDERMAT
(School Specialty #502210
#145851
76 INTERLOCKING FOAM LifeFitness No Bid School 1.77
PUZEZLI)_CEEMQATSDWG School Specialty 1.77 Specialty
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand |POPCORN
Bid - INTERNATIONAL
WONDERMAT
(School Specialty #502210
#145851
77 INTERLOCKING FOAM LifeFitness No Bid School 5.80
PUZZLE MATS School Specialty 5.80 Specialty
CORNER END .
US Games No Bid
Size -
Brand |IPOPCORN
Bid - INTERNATIONAL
WONDERMAT
(School Specialty #502207
#145851
78 liuMP2BFIT PROGRAM LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid

Brand |JUMP2BFIT
Bid - (Gopher #41-015)

#145829
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79 |EXERCISE CIRCUIT LifeFitness No Bid School 36.54
PROGRAM School Specialty 36.54 Specialty
Size - US Games 53.90
Brand |HOT SPOT
Bid-  [(Gopher #68-81(*)
#145843
80 EXERCISE CIRCUIT LifeFitness No Bid School 36.54
PROGSBI"Z'\IQILITY BALL School Specialty 30.54 Specialty
US Games 53.90
Size -
Brand |HOT SPOT
Bid - (Gopher #68-69(*)
#145843
81 BALANCE AND STABILITY LifeFitness No Bid
CIRCUIT PACK School Specialty No Bid
STATIONBOARDS /)& 5 No Bid
CARDS ONLY ames o bl
Size -
Brand |Gopher UltraFit CircuitPro
Bid-  |4#70-045
#145843
82 BASKETBALL TRAINING LifeFitness No Bid
STATION PACK School Specialty No Bid
STATIONBOARDS /)& 5 No Bid
CARDS ONLY ames o bl
Size -
Brand [SPORTSKILLZ
Bid -

#145843

(Gopher #60-121)




(907)714-8876

139 E. Park Avenue

Soldotna, Alaska 99669
FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

Page 19 of 19

RECAP

Bid #137-14/A
Due Date: 5-02-2014
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83 SOCCER TRAINING LifeFitness No Bid
STATION PACK School Specialty No Bid
STATION BOARDS / US G No Bid
CARDS ONLY ames 0 bl
Size -
Brand |SPORTSKILLZ
Bid-  [(Gopher #62-161)
#145843
84 VOLLEYBALL TRAINING LifeFitness No Bid
STATION PACK School Specialty No Bid
STATION BOARDS / US G No Bid
CARDS ONLY ames o bl
Size -
Brand |SPORTSKILLZ
Bid - (Gopher #60-505)
#145843
85 TUMBLING STATION LifeFitness No Bid
BOARDS School Specialty No Bid
Size - US Games No Bid
Brand |Gopher UltraFit” CircuitPro”
Bid - t96-574
#145843
86 NUTRIKNOCKDOWN LifeFitness No Bid
Size - School Specialty No Bid
US Games No Bid
Brand [NUTRIPLAY
Bid -

#145841

NUTRIKNOCKDOWN
(Gopher #26-062)




