
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 1  of 41

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B 

Due Date:  5-02-2014

001 UTILITY BALL

Gopher “CharacterEd” #71
-514

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145825

002 UTILITY BALL

Gopher “UltraPlay”  #71-602

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
44.68 Alt
29.15 Alt

US Games 29.15

#145807

003 UTILITY BALL

Gopher UltraPlay #71-603

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty 
US Games

No Bid
55.98 Alt
34.30 Alt*

School
Specialty

55.98

#145861

004 PLAYGROUND BALL
          COATED-FOAM

Gopher “PlayBall Screamin’
Rainbow” #71-346 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty 
US Games

No Bid
63.97 Alt
81.50 Alt

US Games 81.50

#145807

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

005 PLAYGROUND BALL
          COATED-FOAM

Gopher “PlayBall Screamin’
Rainbow” #71-345

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
87.33 Alt
66.05 Alt

US Games 66.05

#145807
#145829
#145842

006 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher #71-304

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
4.55 Alt
5.35 Alt

US Games 5.35

#145879

007 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher “Screamin’” #72-304

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
38.34 Alt
24.60 Alt

US Games 24.60

#145877

008 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher “Screamin’” #72-304

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.21/ea Alt
32.10 Alt

US Games 32.10

#145825
#145879
#145883

009 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher #71-305

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
12.15  Alt
10.10  Alt

US Games 10.10

#145825
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

010 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher #71-306

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.71  Alt
13.70  Alt

US Games 13.70

#145863

011 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher “DuraBall’” #71-321

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
28.74  Alt
36.90  Alt

School
Specialty

28.74

#145842

012 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher “4-Square” #47-113

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.71/ea Alt
30.00 Alt

US Games 30.00

#145843
#145883

013 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher “SoffPlay” #47-003

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
29.39 Alt
31.75 Alt

US Games 31.75

#145876

014 PLAYGROUND BALL

Gopher  #71-303

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
4.02 Alt
4.10 Alt

US Games 4.10

#145852
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       RECAP
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015 BALL, SOCCER
    INDOOR

MIKASA “SUPER-SOFT”
(Gopher #61-677)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
56.28/6 Alt
12.35 Alt

No Award

#145861

016 BALL, SOCCER
    INDOOR

MIKASA “SUPER-SOFT”
(Gopher #62-026)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
56.28/6 Alt
12.35 Alt

No Award

#145861

017 BALL, SOCCER
    INDOOR

BRINE “VORACITY”
(Gopher #62-005)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
16.42 Alt
32.45

US Games 32.45

#145974

018 BALL, SOCCER

BRINE SBI-HV
(Gopher #61-774)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
12.15 Alt
25.25

US Games 25.25

#145869
#145871

019 BALL, SOCCER
    INDOOR

WILSON “STIVALE”
(Gopher #62-065)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
20.40
29.75

School
Speciatly

20.40

#145838



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 5  of 41

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B
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020 BALL, SOCCER
   RUBBER

Gopher “Performer Plus” #61
-644

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
60.52 Alt
54.10 Alt

US Games 54.10

#145856
#145881

021 SOCCER BALL

Gopher “UltraPlay” #71-919

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
41.78 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

41.78

#145869
#145871

022 SOCCER BALL

Gopher “UltraPlay” #71-918

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
42.02 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

42.02

#145876
#145877

023 BALL, SOCCER
    TRAINER

Gopher “Supra” #62-080

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
74.75 Alt *
No Bid

No Award

#145823
#145825
#145828
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024 BALL, SOCCER
    INDOOR

Gopher “Indoor Striker” #61
-778

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.67 Alt
13.80 Alt

US Games 13.80

#145868

025 BALL, SOCCER

Sportime “SENSORY
SOCCER” #1478833

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.32 Alt *
No Bid

No Award

#145873

026 BALL, SOCCER
    INDOOR

Gopher EZ Shot #62-147

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145868

027 LACROSS BALL

Gopher #38-634

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
31.55

US Games 31.55

#145974

028 LACROSS

Gopher ReLAX #38-777

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883
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       RECAP
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029 BALL

ResisDent
(Gopher #42-551)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
13.70 Alt

US Games 13.70

#145851

030 BALL
        COATED-FOAM

Gopher SuperBounce #71
-872

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145851

031 TUFF BALL

VOIT “SEVEN” TUFF BALL
(US Games #1369579)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
48.28  Alt
81.50

US Games 81.50

#145831

032 KIN-BALL

OMNIKIN
(Gopher #11-319)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
175.00
264.20

School
Specialty

175.00

#145823

033 OMNIKIN BALL

OMNIKIN
(Gopher #10-931)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
75.00
164.40

School
Specialty

75.00

#145868
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       RECAP
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034 REPLACEMENT BLADDER

OMNIKIN
(Gopher #10-947)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
25.00
47.20

School
Specialty

25.00

#145823
#145838

035 CAGEBALL
     ULTRA LIGHT

US GAMES #1140194

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
220.00
171.60

US Games 171.60

#145831

036 CAGE BALL
            MULTIPURPOSE

Gopher “D-Lite” #71-770

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
38.00 Alt
45.45 Alt

School
Specialty

38.00

#145843

037 CAGEALL

Gopher #58-474

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145868

038 BEACH BALL

Gopher #11-027

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145868
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

039 BEACH BALL

CHAMPION
(School Specialty #1352409)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3.17
2.65 Alt

School
Specialty

3.17

#145850

040 TENNIS BALL
        PRESSURELESS

Gopher #51-109

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
11.88 Alt
9.90 Alt

US Games 9.90

#145821
#145841
#145868

041 TENNIS BALL
       FOAM

Gopher #52-506

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
75.52 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

75.52

#145829

042 PICKLE-BALL
     CLASSPLUS

Gopher “PaddlePro Plus” #56
-033

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
357.60 Alt

US Games 357.60

#145829
#145868
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

043 PICKLE-BALL

Gopher “PaddlePro” #56-037

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
24.82 Alt
35.40 Alt

US Games 35.40

#145868
#145883

044 PICKLE-BALL

DURA FAST 40
(Gopher #56-076)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
24.82 Alt
30.00

US Games 30.00

#145838

045 FLEECE BALL

Gopher #41-802

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
11.00/6  Alt
48.90/doz
Alt

School
Specialty

11.00

#145843

046 FLEECE BALL

Gopher #41-808

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.17 Alt
55.00 Alt

School
Specialty

15.17

#145831

047 FLEECE BALL

Gopher #41-518

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145823
#145825
#145828
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

048 JUMP BALL

Gopher #10-768

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883

049 NUBBY BALL

Gopher “Rainbow” #41-753

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
28.61 Alt
32.60 Alt

School
Specialty

28.61

#145876

050 SENSORY BALL

Sportime SLO-MO #006310

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
25.87
No Bid

School
Specialty

25.87

#145873

051 VOLLEYBALL

White

TACHIKARA SENSI-TEC
#SV-5WS
(Gopher #61-752)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
43.89
36.10

US Games 36.10

#145828
#145861

052 VOLLEYBALL

TACHIKARA FUZZIE SS
-5YS
(Gopher #61-699)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145861
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

053 VOLLEYBALL

Sportime Max
(Sportime #016591)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
40.05
No Bid

School
Specialty

40.05

#145831

054 VOLLEYBALL

Gopher “UltraPlay”  #71-911

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
40.05 Alt
54.10 Alt

School
Specialty

40.05

#145838
#145842
#145868

055 VOLLEYBALL

MIKASA VSL215
(Gopher #61-779)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
13.40
No Bid

School
Specialty

13.40

#145826
#145856
#145861

056 VOLLEYBALL

MIKASA “VQ2000 PLUS”
(Gopher #61-775)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
28.44
37.85

School
Specialty

28.44

#145974

057 VOLLEYBALL

MIKASA “VQ2000 PLUS”
(Gopher #60-738)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
43.85

US Games 43.85

#145823
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

058 VOLLEYBALL

Gopher “Rally Lite” #60-773

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145831

059 VOLLEYBALL

Gopher “Comp 1000”  #62
-513

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.62 Alt
29.75 Alt

US Games 29.75

#145841

060 VOLLEYBALL TRAINER

Gopher “SpyroSoft” #60-765

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#147764

061 VOLLEYBALL TRAINER

Sportime VB-Trainer II Elite
#023784

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
12.76
No Bid

School
Specialty

12.76

#145850

062 VOLLEYBALL TRAINER

Gopher Supra #61-665

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145828
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       RECAP
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063 VOLLEYBALL TRAINER

Gopher “Biggie  #61-265 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145823

064 VOLLEYBALL TRAINER

Gopher “SoftPlay  #62-500

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
17.10 Alt

US Games 17.10

#145863

065 VOLLEYBALL TRAINER

Sportime “Sarratt” #1268775

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.08
No Bid

School
Specialty

5.08

#145873

066 VOLLEYBALL FLOATER

Flaghouse “FAR-OUT” #W
-10609

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
14.40 Alt *

No Award

#145873

067 BASKETBALL
   WOMEN’S

WILSON “EVOLUTION”
(Gopher #61-147)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
39.87
62.20

School
Specialty

39.87

#145974
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

068 BASKETBALL

SPALDING TF-1000
CLASSIC
(Gopher #60-069)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
43.24
52.55

School
Specialty

43.24

#145838

069 BASKETBALL

SPALDING TF-1000
CLASSIC
(Gopher #60-070)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
42.58
52.55

School
Specialty

42.58

#145838

070 BASKETBALL
   MEN’S

WILSON “EVOLUTION”
(Gopher #61-182)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
48.70
62.20

School
Specialty

48.70

#145974

071 BASKETBALL
   WOMEN’S

Anaconda Sports “THE
ROCK” #MG-4500PC-NF 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.09 Alt
36.10 Alt

No Award

#145871

072 BASKETBALL
   MEN’S

Anaconda Sports “THE
ROCK” #MG-4000PC-NF 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.30 Alt
36.10 Alt

No Award

#145871
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

073 BASKETBALL

Gopher “Performer” #61-226

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
47.88 Alt
56.80 Alt

US Games 56.80

#145825

074 BASKETBALL
   RUBBER

Gopher Performer #61-214

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145828

075 BASKETBALL
   RUBBER

Gopher Performer #61-204

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145828

076 BASKETBALL

Gopher “CharacterEd” #71
-507

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145825

077 BASKETBALL
   RUBBER

Gopher Performer #71-913

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

078 BASKETBALL

Gopher “UltraPlay” #71-916

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
9.54 Alt
14.40 Alt

US Games 14.40

#145826

079 BASKETBALL

Gopher “UltraPlay” #71-917

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
9.88 Alt
14.40 Alt

US Games 14.40

#145826

080 FOOTBALL

POOF
(Gopher  #41-565)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
4.12
7.70

School
Specialty

4.12

#145821

081 FOOTBALL

Gopher “UltraPlay”  #71-922

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
64.12 Alt
71.25 Alt

US Games 71.25

#145881

082 FOOTBALL
      FOAM

Gopher “DELUSCIOUS”  #71
-363

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
9.89 Alt*
99.50 Alt

US Games 99.50

#145830
#145841
#145877
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

083 FOOTBALL
      FOAM

Gopher “DELUSCIOUS”  #71
-566

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
17.19  Alt*
No Bid

No Award

#145829

084 FOOTBALL
     OFFICIAL

WILSON #TD Series “TDY”
(Gopher #61-417)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
40.63 Alt*
49.35

US Games 49.35

#145821
#145841

085 RUBBER FOOTBALL
      INTERMEDIATE

TACHIKARA “SF SERIES”
#SF4R
 (Gopher #61-557)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
14.24 Alt
9.05 Alt

US Games 9.05

#145826

086 FOOTBALL

TACKIKARA SF Series
“SF5R”
(Gopher  #61-556)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
14.62 Alt
10.20 Alt

US Games 10.20

#145826
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087 FOOTBALL
       TRADITIONAL

Gopher “Grip Zone”  #62-560

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
83.90

US Games 83.90

#147709
#145843

088 FOOTBALL

Gopher “Performer  #61-320

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
46.80 Alt*
75.75

US Games 75.75

#145869
#145871
#145874

089 FOOTBALL

Gopher “Performer”  #62-350

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
45.14 Alt*
81.15

US Games 81.15

#145869
#145871

090 FOOTBALL

Gopher “CharacterEd”  #71
-500

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145881

091 FOOTBALL

Gopher “Victory 1000” #62
-361

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
40.38 Alt
No Bid

No Award

#145974
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092 FOOTBALL
       SPIRAL

Gopher “UltraPlay”  #71-501

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
39.00 Alt*

No Award

#145823
#145869
#145871

093 DODGEBALL

Gopher “EZTEAM” #71-746

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
57.35 Alt
64.35 Alt

No Award

#145823

094 DODGEBALL
     COATED-FOAM

Gopher #41-550

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
69.15 Alt*
124.40 Alt

US Games 124.40

#145838

095 DODGEBALL
     COATED-FOAM

Gopher #71-713

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145807

096 DODGEBALL
     DURACOATED-FOAM

Gopher #71-517

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145828
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097 DODGEBALL
       COATED-FOAM

Gopher “SCREAMIN’
RAINBOW” #71-349

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145821
#145877
#145879

098 DODGEBALL
     DURACOATED-FOAM

Gopher #71-516

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145841
#145877

099 DODGEBALL
     DURACOATED-FOAM

Gopher #71-518

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
81.00 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

81.00

#145842

100 DODGEBALL
     COATED-FOAM

Gopher #71-510

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
24.89 Alt
25.70 Alt

School
Specialty

24.89

#145851
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101 DODGEBALL
     COATED-FOAM

Gopher #41-590

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145851

102 DODGEBALL

NATIONAL DODGEBALL
LEAGUE
(Gopher #71-722)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145869
#145871

103 DODGEBALL

NATIONAL DODGEBALL
LEAGUE
(Gopher #71-726)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145861

104 KICKBALL

Gopher “UltraFlite” #71-555

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
11.79 Alt*
54.10

US Games 54.10

#145974

105 KICKBALL

MIKASA
(Gopher #47-004)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
11.29
10.80

School
Specialty

11.29

#145831
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106 TETHERBALL

Gopher #71-164

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145830

107 TETHERBALL

FUN GRIPPER
(Gopher #71-024)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
16.30

US Games 16.30

#145843

108 TETHERBALL

TACHIKARA #SSTB “SOF T”
 (Gopher #71-004)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
12.48
No Bid

School
Specialty

12.48

#145861

109 NITROBALL

ACTION!
(Gopher #58-144)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883

110 BOUNCER
     SMALL

Gopher “HOP-ALONG” #10
-027

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
16.79/ea
No Bid

School
Specialty

16.79

#145812
#145831



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 24  of 41

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

111 BOUNCER
     MEDIUM

Gopher “HOP-ALONG” #10
-028

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
18.05/ea
No Bid

School
Specialty

18.05

#145812
#145831

112 BOUNCER
     LARGE

Gopher “HOP-ALONG” #10
-032

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
25.58/ea
No Bid

School
Specialty

25.58

#145831

113 SCATTERBALL

SCATTERBALL
(US Games #1161953)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
29.08
48.05

School
Specialty

29.08

#145831

114 MINI PLAYBALL

VOIT “SOFT-LOW BOUNCE”
TUFF BALL
(US Games #1181555)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
54.05

US Games 54.05

#145831

115 RAGBALL

9”

RAGBALLS        (GLS #20.
RB-9Y;Nasco #PE00692E;
US Games #8907)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
1.63
4.85

School
Specialty

1.63

#145831
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116 DISC

FRISBEE ULTIMATE
(Gopher #10-394)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
10.08
12.00

School
Specialty

10.08

#145838

117 DISC

Gopher “SOFTSOAR” #20
-520

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.51 Alt
37.75 Alt

US Games 37.75

#145842
#145850

118 DISC

SPIN JAMMER
(Gopher #10-266)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3.22
4.55

School
Specialty

3.22

#145825

119 DISC

AEROBIE SUPERDISC
(Gopher #10-255)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
9.45

US Games 9.45

#145812

120 DISC

AEROBIE SUPERDISC
(Gopher #19-953)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
12.00

US Games 12.00

#145812
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121 DISC
    ALL-AROUND

Gopher “Dynamix” #20-547

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
72.00/6 Alt

US Games 72.00

#145869

122 DISC

Gopher “AIRRANGER” #47
-007

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
10.39 Alt
12.00 Alt

School
Specialty

10.39

#145829

123 DISC

Gopher “AIRMASTER” #20
-823

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
2.25/ea Alt
36.00 Alt

School
Specialty

2.25/ea

#145829
#145831

124 DISC

Gopher ”EnormaSport
TremenDisc” #20-533

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145831

125 DISC

Gopher “ENDZONE” #18-312

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
72.00/6 Alt

US Games 72.00

#145838
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126 DISC

Gopher “AIRRANGER” #10
-302

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
10.39 Alt
12.00 Alt

School
Specialty

10.39

#145825

127 DISC

Gopher “BONANZA” #20-526

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145881

128 DISC GOLF

CLASSPLUS
“COMPLETECOURSE”
(Gopher #20-900)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
777.20 Alt*
925.50

US Games 925.50

#145807

129 DISC GOLF

CLASSPLUS DX
(Gopher #20-891)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
318.00 Alt

US Games 318.00

#145807
#145828

130 DISC GOLF

CLASSPLUS DELUXE
(Gopher #20-833)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145807
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131 DISC TARGET
      PORTABLE

Gopher QuikShot #20-816

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3060.00 Alt
1715.00
Alt*

School
Specialty

3060.00

#145828

132 DISC GOLF TARGET

INNOVA
(Gopher DISCatcher” #20
-824)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
6683.40

US Games 6683.40

#145869

133 DISC GOLF TARGET

(Gopher DISCatcher
Traveler” #18-302

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
186.99
1715.00 Alt

US Games 1715.00

#145881

134 HULA HOOPS

REVOLUTION
(Gopher #43-502)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
63.06 Alt *
87.20

US Games 87.20

#145851

135 HULA HOOP

DURAHOOP
(Gopher  #43-505)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
50.99 Alt
76.20 Alt

School
Specialty

50.99

#145807
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136 HULA HOOP

DURAHOOP PLUS
(Gopher  #43-509)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
73.85 Alt
98.20 Alt

School
Specialty

73.85

#145828

137 HOOP HOLDERS

Sportime #019047; BSN #BS
-1812XXXX

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
25.83
33.45

School
Specialty

25.83

145873

138 DICE
    BIG FOAM

Gopher #10-021

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
17.60 Alt
25.70 Alt

School
Specialty

17.60

#145825
#145852
#145874

139 DICE
    BIG FOAM

Gopher #10-022

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
17.23 Alt
25.70 Alt

School
Specialty

17.23

#145825
#145852
#145868
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140 TEAM BEANBAG

Gopher #43-225

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145851

141 ANIMAL BEANBAG

Gopher “Aqua Animal” #20
-257

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
60.00 Alt*
No Bid

No Award

#145831

142 BEANBAG

Gopher “Indestruct-O” #20
-523

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
20.92 Alt*
No Bid

No Award

#145863

143 BEANBAGS

Gopher #20-553

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852

144 JUGGLING BEANBALL

Gopher #20-476

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
57.36 Alt
102.60 Alt

School
Specialty

57.36

#145821



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 31  of 41

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/B

Due Date:  5-02-2014

145 JUGGLING CUBES

Gopher #20-432

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
105.30 Alt

US Games 105.30

#145828

146 JUGGLING SCARVES

Gopher #20-045

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
75.73 Alt
63.20 Alt

US Games 63.20

#145821

147 JUGGLING STICKS

MYSTIX
(Nasco #PE05613E)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#147345

148 COMETTAIL

Gopher #58-110

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.85 Alt
61.80 Alt

School
Specialty

15.85

#145831

149 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-673

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
13.26 Alt
9.30 Alt

US Games 9.30

#145883
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150 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-671

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.58 Alt
8.40 Alt

US Games 8.40

#145825
#145843
#145883

151 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-674

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
13.20 Alt

US Games 13.20

#145883

152 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-672

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
9.60 Alt
8.70 Alt

US Games 8.70

#145843
#145883

153 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-675

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
14.88 Alt
17.10 Alt

School
Specialty

14.88

#145843
#145883

154 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-670

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
8.10 Alt

US Games 8.10

#145843
#145868
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155 JUMP ROPE

Gopher #11-676

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145825

156 JUMP ROPE
              PRO-VINYL BALL-
BEARING

Gopher #11-847

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.54 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

8.54

#146674

157 JUMP ROPE
              PRO-VINYL BALL-
BEARING

Gopher #11-849

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.38 Alt
10.30 Alt

School
Specialty

8.38

#146674

158 JUMP ROPE
              PRO-VINYL BALL-
BEARING

Gopher #11-848

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.14 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

8.14

#146674

159 JUMP ROPE
     SEGMENTED

Gopher  #41-069

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145812
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160 JUMP ROPE
     SEGMENTED

Gopher  #41-070

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.76 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

15.76

#145812

161 JUMP ROPE
     SEGMENTED

Gopher  #41-071

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
16.30 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

16.30

#145812

162 JUMP ROPE
     SEGMENTED

Gopher  #41-072

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
17.08 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

17.08

#145812

163 JUMP ROPE
     SEGMENTED

Gopher  #41-074

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.84 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

8.84

#145812

164 JUMP ROPE
      WITH FOAM HANDLES

Gopher #11-866

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
16.80 Alt

US Games 16.80

#145838
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165 JUMP ROPE
      WITH FOAM HANDLES

Gopher #11-867

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
14.40 Alt

US Games 14.40

#145838

166 JUMP ROPE
      WITH FOAM HANDLES

Gopher #11-868

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
15.60 Alt

US Games 15.60

#145838

167 JUMP ROPE
      WITH FOAM HANDLES

Gopher #11-869

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
15.90 Alt

US Games 15.90

#145838

168 SPEED ROPE
     STANDARD

Gopher #10-090

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.93 Alt
10.50 Alt

School
Specialty

8.93

#145851
#145877
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169 SPEED ROPE
     STANDARD

Gopher #10-091

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.41 Alt
11.50 Alt

School
Specialty

7.41

#145877
#145879
#145881

170 SPEED ROPE
     STANDARD

Gopher #11-322

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
17.20 Alt

US Games 17.20

#145877

171 SPEED ROPE
     STANDARD

Gopher #10-092

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.86 Alt
12.50 Alt

School
Specialty

7.86

#145874
#145877
#145881

172 SPEED ROPE
     STANDARD

Gopher #11-950

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
8.40 Alt

US Games 8.40

#145851
#145879
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173 SPEED ROPE

8’ long

Gopher #41-060

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145974

174 SPEED ROPE

Gopher #41-061

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145974

175 SPEED ROPE

Gopher #41-062

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
10.30 Alt

US Games 10.30

#145974

176 SPEED ROPE

Gopher #41-064

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145868

177 SPEED ROPE

Gopher UltraFit “Turn-N-
Burn” #41-350

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145829
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178 SPEED ROPE

Gopher UltraFit “Turn-N-
Burn” #41-351

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145829

179 SPEED ROPE

Gopher UltraFit “Turn-N-
Burn” #41-352

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145829

180 JUMP ROPE
     DOUBLE-DUTCH

Gopher  #11-677

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
5.40 Alt

US Games 5.40

#145812
#145825
#145851

181 JUMP ROPE
     DOUBLE-DUTCH

Gopher  #11-679

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
11.40 Alt

US Games 11.40

#145829

182 JUMP ROPE
     DOUBLE-DUTCH

Gopher  #11-678

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
7.20 Alt

US Games 7.20

#145851
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183 JUMP ROPE
              CHINESE

MELAIMEE
(Gopher #11-739; Sportime
#029851)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
33.00
42.90 Alt

School
Specialty

33.00

#145831

184 CLIMBING ROPE

Gopher  #85-241

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145829

185 CLIMBING ROPE

Gopher  #85-458

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
155.01
No Bid

School
Specialty

155.01

#145881

186 CLIMBING ROPE

Gopher  #87-498

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
173.19
No Bid

School
Specialty

173.19

#145881

187 CLIMBING ROPE

Gopher  #85-597

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
214.25
No Bid

School
Specialty

214.25

#145881
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188 TUG-O-WAR ROPE

Gopher #85-591

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
145.55 Alt*

No Award

#145881

189 INFLATOR
        HEAVY-DUTY

Gopher #66-456

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
91.65 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

91.65

#145829

190 INFLATOR / DEFLATOR

Gopher #66-455

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
101.07 Alt
166.85 Alt

School
Specialty

101.07

#145838

191 INFLATOR / DEFLATOR

METRO “MAGIC AIR”
(Gopher #61-800; Sportime
#1004509)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
65.31
77.40

School
Specialty

65.31

#145812
#145821
#145863
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192 INFLATOR / DEFLATOR

METRO “MAGIC AIR”
(Gopher #66-102)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
147.69
217.45

School
Specialty

147.69

#145873

193 INFLATOR, COMPACT
   ELECTRIC

Gopher #66-620

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
86.45 Alt
80.40 Alt

US Games 80.40

#145828
#145874

194 KICK-OFF TEE

Gopher #66-653; GLS #W15.
KOT-2

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.87 Alt
3.30 Alt

US Games 3.30

#145812

195 BALL INFLATION NEEDLE

Gopher #66-622

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
6.10 Alt
7.50 Alt

School
Specialty

6.10

#145821
#145838
#145874


