
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us
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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/C 

Due Date:  5-02-2014

01 FLOOR HOCKEY
    INDOOR / OUTDOOR

COSOM “ELEMENTARY
HOCKEY”
(Gopher  #10-802)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
93.46
156.00

School
Specialty

93.46

#145831
#145841

02 FLOOR HOCKEY

DOM “SUPERSAFE”
(Gopher #10-372)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
130.94 Alt
196.25 Alt

School
Specialty

130.94

#145841
#145877

03 FLOOR HOCKEY
      INDOOR

Gopher UltraSoft #10-815

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty 
US Games

No Bid
96.40 Alt
161.70 Alt

School
Specialty

96.40

#145841

04 FLOOR HOCKEY

Gopher PowerPlay #17-576

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty 
US Games

No Bid
186.33*
359.65 Alt

US Games 359.65

#145828

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

05 FLOOR HOCKEY

Gopher PowerPlay #17-577

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
240.57 Alt
No Bid

No Award

#145828

06 FLOOR HOCKEY

Gopher UltraSoft #17-478

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
209.99 Alt
323.40 Alt

School
Specialty

209.99

#145838

07 POLO

Gopher ClassPlus UltraSoft
#17-755

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145868

08 FLOOR HOCKEY
    INDOOR / OUTDOOR

COSOM “PLASTIC SHAFT”
(Gopher  #17-502)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
163.85
260.00

School
Specialty

163.85

#145841
#145856

09 FLOOR HOCKEY
      INDOOR

SHIELD
(Gopher #10-180)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
182.60
243.45

School
Specialty

182.60

#145856
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10 FIELD HOCKEY

DOM
(Gopher #53-516)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
149.23
269.45

School
Specialty

149.23

#145863
#145881

11 POLO & FLOOR HOCKEY

SOFT-STIX
(Gopher #17-535)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
87.64 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

87.64

#145842

12 GOALIE STICK 

COSOM
(Gopher #10-786)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
31.20

US Games 31.20

#145841

13 SHOT PUCK
       SOFT
2-3/4” diameter

Gopher #17-975

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
28.80 Alt
35.20 Alt

School
Specialty

28.80

#145831

14 FLAG BELT SYSTEM
    ADJUSTABLE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #01-654)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
79.20 Alt

US Games 79.20

#145856
#145863
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15 FLAG BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-876)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
43.20 Alt

US Games 43.20

#145974

16 FLAG LOOP BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-082)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
50.20 Alt *
73.20 Alt

US Games 73.20

#145829

17 FLAG LOOP BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-083)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
73.20 Alt

US Games 73.20

#145829

18 FLAG LOOP BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-084)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
47.06 Alt *
73.20 Alt

US Games 73.20

#145829

19 FLAG LOOP BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-085)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
73.20 Alt

US Games 73.20

#145829
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

20 FLAG BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-879)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
43.20 Alt

US Games 43.20

#145831

21 FLAG BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

RIP FLAG
(Gopher #63-877)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
43.20 Alt

US Games 43.20

#145974

22 FLAG LOOP BELT SYSTEM
    QUICK-RELEASE

Gopher “Infinite” #63-101

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852

23 FLAG FOOTBALL FLAGS

SONIC CONVERSION
PACKAGE
(BSN #8670023)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
32.45

Us Games 32.45

#145850

24 FLAG FOOTBALL

SONIC FLAG-A-TAG
(Nasco #Z40426A)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
187.95

US Games 187.95

#145883
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25 FLOOR HOCKEY GOALS
WITH NETS
       FOLDING

RINKPRO
(Gopher #17-621)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#147780

26 FLOOR HOCKEY GOALS
WITH NETS

MYLEC “COMPACT PRO”
(Gopher #17-265)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
106.00
259.00

School
Specialty

106.00

#145869

27 SOCCER GOAL, MID-SIZE
       FOLDING 

JAYPRO
(Gopher  #73-658)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
302.41
No Bid

No Award

#145881

28 FLOOR HOCKEY GOALS
WITH NETS

RINKPRO
(Gopher #17-623)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
96.16 Alt *
No Bid

No Award

#145829
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

29 FLOOR HOCKEY PUCK

DOM “SUPERSAFE”
(Gopher #10-368)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3.25
5.40

School
Specialty

3.25

#145841
#145874
#145877

30 FLOOR HOCKEY PUCK

SHIELD
(Gopher #17-976)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
102.24 Alt
36.00 Alt

US Games 36.00

#145883

31 SCOOTERS

Gopher “FastTrack” #86-700

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
245.18 Alt
386.00 Alt

School
Specialty

245.18

#145812
#145841

32 SCOOTERS

Gopher “Connect-A-Scooter”
#86-066

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
173.99 Alt
236.90 Alt

School
Specialty

173.99

#145833

33 CONNECT-A-SCOOTERS

Gopher #86-300

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
139.27 Alt
172.60 Alt

School
Specialty

139.27

#145831
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34 SCOOTER
     INDOOR

Gopher “SST Scooter”  #57
-330

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
267.24 Alt *
386.00 Alt *

No Award

#145852
#145876

35 SST SCOOTERS

Gopher ClassPlus SST #57
-031

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
1760.30Alt*

No Award

#145843

36 SUPER SCOOTER
      WITH HANDLES

Flaghouse #W-15357

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
72.72 Alt
65.10 Alt *

School
Specialty

72.72

#145873

37 ROLLER RACER

ROLLER RACER
(Gopher #85-355)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
99.28
131.30

School
Specialty

99.28

#145843

38 ROLLER RACER

ROLLER RACER “DELUXE”
(Gopher #57-901) 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145812
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       RECAP
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39 POGO STICK

JUMPAROO
(Gopher #10-131)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145831

40 POGO STICK

MASTER
(Gopher #17-493)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
53.75

US Games 53.75

#145831
#145861

41 POGO STICK

MAVERICK
(Gopher #17-494)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
46.75

US Games 46.75

#145831
#145861

42 BUNGEE JUMPER

BUNGEE JUMPER (School
Specialty #022578)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
22.70
27.00 Alt

School
Specialty

22.70

#145873

43 COMPOUND BOW

GENESIS
(Gopher #72-01*)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
246.00

US Games 246.00

#145812
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44 COMPOUND BOW

GENESIS
(Gopher #72-022)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
246.00

US Games 246.00

#145812
#145861

45 COMPOUND BOW

GENESIS ORIGINAL

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
246.00

US Games 246.00

#145883

46 COMPOUND BOW

GENESIS ORIGINAL #12231

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
246.00

US Games 246.00

#145883

47 BOW

BEAR FIREBIRD
(Gopher #72-146)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
42.99
66.40 Alt

School
Specialty

42.99

#145825
#145856

48 ARCHERY

Gopher #72-415

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
2055.00 Alt

US Games 2055.00

#145831
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49 ARROW

GENESIS
(Gopher #72-280)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145812
#145828
#145829

50 ARROW

Gopher #72-209

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
175.38 Alt *
56.15 Alt *

No Award

#145821
#145825
#145856

51 TARGET STAND,
ARCHERY
     ROLL-AWAY

Gopher #72-199

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
78.00 Alt
130.00 Alt

School
Specialty

78.00

#145825
#145856

52 ARROW

EASTON #1820
TRUEFLIGHT Version 2
(NASP #10940)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

53 ARCHERY TARGET

Gopher #72-169

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
303.00 Alt
395.15

School
Specialty

303.00

#145825
#145856
#145879

54 ARCHERY TARGET

FIELD LOGIC “THE BLOCK”
(NASP #10994) 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883

55 BOWRACK

BOWTREE
(NASP #11376)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883

56 TARGET FACES
     ARCHERY

Gopher Bull’s-Eye #72-173

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
24.26 Alt
25.25 Alt

School
Specialty

24.26

#145821
#145825
#145856
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57 TARGET ARMGUARD

BEAR
(Gopher #72-123)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.09
11.70

School
Specialty

7.09

#145812
#145825
#145856

58 ARCHERY REPAIR KIT

LANCASTER ARCHERY
SUPPLY
(NASP #10997) 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145883

59 RACQUET,
      BADMINTON

CARLTON AIRBLADE C9750
(Gopher #53-393)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
10.70
11.70 Alt

School
Specialty

10.70

#145828
#145863
#145874

60 RACQUET,  OVERSIZE
      TENNIS 

Gopher #52-212

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
25.25 Alt

US Games 25.25

#145821
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

61 RACQUET,
      BADMINTON

YONEX B500
(Gopher #53-309)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
4.40 Alt
11.70 Alt

School
Specialty

4.40

#145856

62 RACQUET,
      BADMINTON

Gopher “G1000” #51-048

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
41.45 Alt

US Games 41.45

#145807

63 RACQUET,
      BADMINTON

Gopher “G1000” #51-008

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
91.20 Alt

No Award

#145869

64 RACQUET,
      BADMINTON

Gopher “G1000 JUNIOR” #53
-423

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.74 Alt
6.75 Alt

US Games 6.75

#145852

65 NET SYSTEM
           PORTABLE

ULTRANET
(Gopher #53-417)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
98.71
282.20

School
Specialty

98.71

#145830
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

66 TENNIS NET AND POSTS

WILSON EZ TENNIS
(Gopher #52-149)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145821

67 TABLE TENNIS

Gopher “1 Star” #16-945

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145869

68 REPLACEMENT NET,
          VOLLEYBALL

Gopher RallyNet #66-703

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
29.76 Alt *
35.15 Alt

US Games 35.15

#145825

69 REPLACEMENT NET,
CLUB
       BADMINTON

Gopher #56-503

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
22.31 Alt*
28.80 Alt

US Games 28.80

#145825
#145838
#145856

70 SHUTTLECOCK

Yellow

CARLTON T800 (Gopher #51
-114)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.80
No Bid

School
Specialty

7.80

#145807
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   Bid #137-14/C

Due Date:  5-02-2014

71 SHUTTLECOCK

CARLTON T800
(Gopher #51-113)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
7.80
No Bid

School
Specialty

7.80

#145841

72 SHUTTLECOCK

Yellow

CARLTON T800
(Gopher #51-113)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Duplicate #71

#145828

73 SHUTTLECOCK

CARLTON T800
(Gopher #51-821; BSN #BS-
T800WHBL)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
6.99 Alt
13.50

US Games 13.50

#145826
#145841
#145856

74 SHUTTLECOCK

Gopher S1 Recreational #53
-480

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
7.50 Alt

US Games 7.50

#145830

75 SHUTTLECOCK

Gopher S1 Recreational #53
-481

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145869
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

76 BATTER’S HELMET

RAWLINGS
(Gopher #44-902)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
27.70 Alt*

No Award

#145830

77 BASEBALL GLOVE

Gopher Diamond Pro #42
-123

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
48.70 Alt*

No Award

#145841

78 BASEBALL GLOVE

Gopher Diamond Pro #42
-124

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
48.70 Alt *

No Award

#145841

79 BASEBALL GLOVE

Gopher “ALLSTAR”  #18-801

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
17.15 Alt

US Games 17.15

#145838

80 BASEBALL GLOVE

Gopher “ALLSTAR”  #18-800

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
17.15 Alt

US Games 17.15

#145838
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81 SOFTBALL BAT
       SLOW PITCH

Gopher DESIGNATOR #42
-540

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
38.30 Alt

US Games 38.30

#145851

82 SOFTBALL BAT
       SLOW PITCH

EASTON HAMMER
(Gopher  #42-902)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
38.30 Alt

No Award

#145974

83 SOFTBALL BAT
       SLOW PITCH

EASTON HAMMER
(Gopher  #42-050 or #42
-900)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
20.93
No Bid

School
Specialty

20.93

#145974

84 BASEBALL BAT

Gopher Phenom  #42-048

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
6.43
7.20 Alt

School
Specialty

6.43

#145881

85 BATTING AND CATCHING

Gopher ClassPlus
“Intermediate”  #02-038

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
618.45 Alt

US Games 618.45

#145830
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86 SOFTBALL

Gopher ClassPlus
“DiamondKing”  #42-308

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145821

87 BASEBALL BASES

Gopher #42-295

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145881

88 BASEBALL BATTING TEE

Gopher #44-720

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
262.50 Alt*

No Award

#145851

89 ADJUSTABLE TEE
        DELUXE

Gopher  #71-231

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
39.71 Alt*
43.75 Alt*

No Award

#145842
#145974

90 SOFTBALL
   COATED FOAM

Sportime School Smart
#009185

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
4.76
4.55 Alt

School
Specialty

4.76

#145850
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91 SOFTBALL

EASTON INCREDiBALL
“SOFTOUCH”
(Gopher #41-873)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.63
71.40/12

School
Specialty

5.63

#145841
#145874
#145881

92 SOFTBALL
      RUBBER

Gopher #41-888

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
4.50 Alt

US Games 4.50

#145863


