
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 1  of 27

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

001 PEDOMETER

Gopher “FITstep Pro
Uploadable”  #76-041

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852

002 PEDOMETER

Gopher “RightStep 300”  #76
-018

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145843

003 PEDOMETER

Gopher “RightStep 300”  #01
-054

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145821
#145885

004 PEDOMETER

Gopher “RightStep 100”  #01
-052

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145863

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

005 PEDOMETER STORAGE
SYSTEM

Gopher “QuikID”  #76-015

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145843

006 HEART RATE MONITOR

SKECHERS “GO WALK”
(Gopher  #67-165)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145831

007 HEART RATE MONITOR

EKHO E-15

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
1835.00/30
No Bid

School
Specialty

1835.00

#145863

008 PULSE MONITOR

INSTA-PULSE
(Gopher  #91-161)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
19.41 Alt*
140.25

US Games 140.25

#145823

009 PULSE MONITOR

INSTA-PULSE
(Gopher  #91-146)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
120.00 Alt*
384.00

US Games 384.00

#1458
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

010 STOPWATCH

PACER 200
(Gopher #91-007)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
36.56 Alt
49.80 Alt

School
Specialty

36.56

#145831

011 STOPWATCH

ACCUSPLIT SURVIVOR III
MAGNUM XL
(Gopher #91-911)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.18
20.75

School
Specialty

8.18

#145828

012 INTERVAL TIMER

Gopher #69-460

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
256.70 Alt

No Award

#145828
#145838

013 ELECTRONIC TIMER

MEGATIMER TEACHING
TOOL
(Nasco #TB23484E)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#147345



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 4  of 27

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

       RECAP
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014 ELECTRONIC WHISTLE
      3-TONE
Gray

WINDSOR
(Gopher #95-489; School
Speciatly #1427483US
Games #1309980)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
14.28
18.00

School
Specialty

14.28

#145831
#145868

015 WHISTLE

FOX 40 “CLASSIC”
(Gopher #66-603)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3.76
5.10

School
Specialty

3.76

#145838

016 WHISTLE
    PEA-STYLE

ACME THUNDERER 660
(Gopher #66-541)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
3.01
27.00/12

School
Specialty

3.01

#145861

017 WHISTLE
    PEA-STYLE

BAKELITE
(Gopher #66-682)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
9.00/12 **

No Award

#145874
#145881
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

018 MEGAPHONE

FANON
(Nasco #Z17403E)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
37.74 Alt *
85.55 Alt *

No Award

#147345

019 MEGAPHONE

FANON
(Gopher #25-409)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
43.88 Alt
85.88 Alt

School
Specialty

43.88

#145812
#145885

020 SHIN GUARD

KICKSHIELD “OFFICIAL”
(Gopher #62-101)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.18 Alt *
14.40 Alt

US Games 14.40

#145830

021 SHIN GUARD

KICKSHIELD “OFFICIAL”
(Gopher #62-102)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
5.66 Alt *
14.40 Alt

US Games 14.40

#145830

022 GOGGLES

U.S.DIVERS VISION
(Gopher #86-677)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
15.80 Alt

US Games 15.80

#145974
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

023 GOGGLES

U.S.DIVERS VISION
(Gopher #86-678)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
379.20 Alt

US Games 379.20

#145828

024 EYEWEAR
     PROTECTIVE

Gopher #53-381

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
12.60

US Games 12.60

#145812

025 MEASURING TAPE
              CLOSED REEL

Gopher #38-259

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
18.00

US Games 18.00

#145821
#145885

026 MEASURING TAPE
              OPEN REEL

Gopher #38-253

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
16.47
No Bid

School
Specialty

16.47

#145829

027 KANGASACK

Gopher “KANGASACK” #12
-007

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
48.22 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

48.22

#145841
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

028 RELAY BATONS
        FOAM

Gopher #12-521

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
14.25 Alt
12.00 Alt

US Games 12.00

#145841
#145874

029 BLINDFOLDS

(Gopher #58-024; US
GAMES #1140217)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.33 Alt
16.20

US Games 16.20

#145843

030 SCOOP

Gopher UltraCatch #58-174

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
50.84
42.90 Alt*

School
Specialty

50.84

#145825

031 FOAM RODS

FUNoodles
(Gopher #10-120)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
67.46 Alt
94.35

US Games 94.35

#147709

032 FOAM ROD CONNECTORS
        WITH HOLES

FUNoodles
(Gopher #10-121)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145831
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

033 SLED
     PLASTIC

PARICON WINTER
LIGHTNING

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145851

034 TACTILE BALANCE
BOARD SET

(Gopher #87-502; Palos
Sports #15041)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
510.00
No Bid

School
Specialty

510.00

#145851

035 BUMP BOARD
     VOLLEYBALL

MIKASA SPORTS #BB1

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145812

036 BALANCE BOARD

SPOONER
(Gopher #10-100)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
78.87 Alt*
297.40

US Games 297.40

#145873

037 BALANCE BOARD

SPOONER
(Flaghouse #18295)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
13.95 Alt*
55.00

US Games 55.00

#146871
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

038 BALANCE BOARD

SPOONER
(Gopher #10-101)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145873

039 BALANCE BOARD

SPOONER
(Gopher #17-700)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145873

040 TACTILE BEAM
    WAVY

Gopher #17-516

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145851

041 BALANCE BEAM
   FIGURE-8

Gopher #17-710

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
154.20

US Games 154.20

#145851

042 POLY BEAM

Flaghouse #W-5063

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
87.48 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

87.48

#145873
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

043 BALANCE STRIP

School Specialty Abilitations
Integrations #1302187

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
34.84
No Bid

School
Specialty

34.84

#145873

044 SPIN JUMPER

Gopher #41-922; US Games
#1088779

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
19.93 Alt*
27.45

US Games 27.45

#145861
#145876

045 HI-STEP WALKER

Gopher #10-009

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
68.00 Alt
No Bid

No Award

#145851

046 PARACHUTE
     WITH HANDLES

ELEVAIR
(Gopher #83-904)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
244.49 Alt
288.10 Alt

No Award

#145843

047 PARACHUTE

Gopher #83-920

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
122.65 Alt
121.25 Alt

School
Specialty

121.25

#145823
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

048 PARACHUTE

Gopher #83-922

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
386.00 Alt
426.00 Alt

School
Specialty

386.00

#145868

049 TUNNEL

PATHWAY
(Gopher #17-878)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
83.78 Alt *
No Bid

No Award

#145831

050 MESH BAG
  X-LARGE

Gopher “VersaBag” #89-829

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145825
#145881

051 MESH BAG

Gopher “VersaBag” #89-812

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
42.00
31.20

US Games 31.20

#145821

052 MESH BAG

Gopher “VersaBag” #89-815

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
38.00
No Bid

School
Specialty

38.00

#145881
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

053 MESH BAG

Gopher “VersaBag” #89-814

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145828

054 MESH BAG

Gopher “VersaBag” #89-836

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145828

055 MESH VEST

Gopher FitPro Competitor
#29-401

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
2.36 Alt
5.50 Alt

School
Specialty

2.36

#145828

056 MESH VEST

Gopher FitPro Champion #29
-188

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
5.50 Alt

No Award

#145829

057 MESH VEST

Gopher FitPro Champion #29
-189

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
5.50

No Award

#145829
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

058 MESH VEST

Gopher FitPro Champion #29
-204

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
5.50 Alt

US Games 5.50

#145842

059 MESH VEST
        NUMBERED 1-12

Gopher FitPro #29-18(*)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
54.00 Alt *

No Award

#145843
#145883

060 MESH VEST
        NUMBERED 1-12

Gopher FitPro #29-274

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
41.00 Alt *
54.00 Alt *

No Award

#145843
#145883

061 PINNIES

Gopher FitPro Champion #29
-238

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145869

062 PINNIES

Gopher FitPro Champion #29
-239

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145869
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

063 PINNIES

Gopher FitPro Champion #29
-240

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145869

064 CONE CAPS STATION
MARKERS
      FITNESS STATION SET

Gopher #01-189

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145825
#145874

065 CONE
      VINYL

Gopher #85-835

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
11.47 Alt
13.10 Alt

School
Specialty

11.47

#145821
#145861
#145881

066 CONE
     VINYL

Gopher #85-858

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
27.39 Alt
34.50 Alt

School
Specialty

27.39

#145881
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

067 CONE
     VINYL

Gopher #85-887

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
46.40 Alt
56.70 Alt

School
Specialty

46.40

#145821
#145825
#145831

068 CONE
     VINYL

Gopher #85-816

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
81.46 Alt
78.60 Alt

US Games 78.60

#145828
#145874

069 CONE
     HEAVYWEIGHT VINYL

Gopher #85-834

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
111.25 Alt
270.00 Alt

School
Specialty

111.25

#145829

070 HALF-CONE

PRO-TUFF
(Gopher #93-011)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
31.67 Alt
25.20 Alt

US Games 25.20

#145843
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       RECAP
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Due Date:  5-02-2014

071 DOME CONE

Gopher #12-600

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
48.78 Alt *
74.45

US Games 74.45

#145825
#145881

072 DOME CONE
           SOFT

Gopher #41-998

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
56.53 Alt
74.45 Alt

School
Specialty

56.53

#145852

073 CONE SIGN HOLDER

US Games #1281798

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
52.45 Alt *
6.40

US Games 6.40

#145831

074 CONE SIGN HOLDER

SMARTCONES
(Gopher #93-100)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
58.83 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

58.83

#145843
#145883

075 CONE FOLDERS

Nasco #PE08745E

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
58.45
No Bid

School
Specialty

58.45

#145883
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       RECAP
   Bid #137-14/D

Due Date:  5-02-2014

076 FLOOR TAPE
        DELUXE

Gopher #77-85(*)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
8.24 Alt *
6.40 Alt *

No Award

#145823
#145874
#145863

077 FLOOR TAPE
            DELUXE

Gopher Deluxe #93-05(*)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145974
#145823

078 FLOOR TAPE
        DELUXE

Gopher #77-85(*)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
6.46 Alt *
14.35 Alt *

No Award

#145823

079 DODGEBALL SET

ACTION!  DODGEMANIA
(Gopher #58-333)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
255.00 **

No Award

#145823

080 YUKI-BALL SET

ACTION!  YUKI-BALL
(Gopher #58-150)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852
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       RECAP
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081 BOWLING

TEAM PINGUARD
(Gopher # 01-694)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852

082 BOWLING

CHAMPION
(School Specialty #1005615)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
46.19
74.65

School
Specialty

46.19

#145850

083 BOWLING
      TRADITIONAL

CHAMPION “BASIC”
(Gopher #45-964)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
76.07  Alt *
129.30

US Games 129.30

#145861

084 2-LANE BOWLING

Gopher “PIN DECK” #45-523

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
276.14 Alt
No Bid

School
Specialty

276.14

#145830

085 TEAM LAUNCH
VOLLEYBALL SET

ACTION!
(Gopher #01-520)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145823
#145829
#145873
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       RECAP
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086 PADDLEMONIUM

ACTION!
(Gopher #58-371)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145868

087 PARTNER ANKLE / LEG
BAND

Gopher #95-532

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
17.91 Alt
42.00/12 Alt

School
Specialty

17.91

#145825

088 RUN AND SPELL GAME

ACTIVE ACADEMICS
(Gopher #01-660)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
216.00 Alt

US Games 216.00

#145821

089 SCRAMBLE GAME

ACTIVE ACADEMICS
(Gopher #93-108)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145821

090 TEAM PINBLITZ

Gopher “PinStop” #58-071

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145841
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091 CLOWN BEAN BAG
BOARD GAME
   LARGE

US Games #1310283

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
47.09 Alt *
141.80

US Games 141.80

#145851

092 COOPERATIVE MAZE
GAME

COOPERATIVE MAZE
(Gopher #01-358)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145863

093 BEANBAG BOARD GAME

Gopher Gameplay BagMania
#58-382

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
114.46 Alt
No Bid

No Award

#145868

094 CATCH SETS

Gopher Bull’s-Eye Velcro #58
-487

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
12.93 Alt
92.40 Alt

No Award

#145868

095 OBJECT-RETRIEVAL TEAM
BUILDING SYSTEM

OBJECT-RETRIEVAL
(Gopher #81-107)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
42.66 Alt *
No Bid

No Award

#145863
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096 SPIDER’S WEB TEAM
CHALLENGE

SPIDER’S WEB
(Gopher #87-224)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
505.00
488.50

US Games 488.40

#145863

097 SPINNING PLATE

Nasco #PE07369E

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
25.16 Alt
42.90

School
Specialty

25.16

#145883

098 RIBBON WANDS

Gopher #11-320

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
9.99 Alt *
23.10 Alt *

No Award

#145841
#145851
#145877

099 RIBBON WANDS

Gopher #16-009

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145873

100 RIVER STONES

Gopher #87-523

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
51.60

US Games 51.60

#145873
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101 HILLTOPS

Gopher #87-522

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145873

102 STEP-A-STONES
            STEPPING BUCKET
BALANCE BUILDER SET 

School Smart #018901

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
40.78
No Bid

School
Specialty

40.78

#145873

103 RHYTHM STICKS

Gopher #16-020

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
56.00 Alt
60.00 alt

No Award

#145829

104 RUBBER FROG

Gopher #12-656

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
30.60
51.00

School
Specialty

30.60

#145831

105 RUBBER FISH

Gopher #12-659

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
37.50

US Games 37.50

#145825
#145831
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106 MOVE CUBE

Flaghouse MOVE CUBE
#W17810

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
26.62
No Bid

School
Specialty

26.62

#145873

107 BODY SOX

BODY SOX
(School Specialty #705469)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
22.36
No Bid

School
Specialty

22.36

#145873

108 BODY FAT AND MUSCLES
REPLICAS

Gopher #01-696

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
286.00

US Games 286.00

#145843

109 ANIMAL ACTION CARDS
         BODY POETRY

ROYLCO
(School Specialty #1281961)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
20.85
No Bid

School
Specialty

20.85

#145851

110 GROSS MOTOR EXERCISE
CARDS
         BUSY BODY

ROYLCO
(School Specialty #1281960)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
20.85
No Bid

School
Specialty

20.85

#145851
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111 MY INCREDIBLY AMAZING
BODY

ROYLCO
(Nasco #SB47652E)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#147345

112 TEAM RELAY PUZZLES

Gopher #34-805

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145825

113 MR MUSCLES
                   FLOOR PUZZLE

Gopher #34-052

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty 
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
54.45

US Games 51.45

#145843

114 EXERCISE & STRETCHING
POSTERS

Nasco #PE05503E

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
75.00 Alt
No Bid

No Award

#147345

115 SPOTS, NUMBERED

ALPHA-SPOT
(Gopher #84-706)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
629.00 Alt *

No Award

#145823
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116 FLAG SET

KWIK-KORNER
(Gopher #61-854)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
119.55 Alt
54.00 Alt *

School
Specialty

119.55

#145881

117 SPOTS, LETTERED

ALPHA-SPOT
(Gopher #93-305)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145852

118 SPOTS, VINYL

Gopher #10-829

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
15.79 *
48.60

US Games 48.60

#145825
#145881

119 SPOTS, VINYL

Gopher #85-821

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
53.86 *
48.60

US Games 48.60

#145861

120 SPOTS, FITNESS

Gopher #17-841

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
49.12
73.50

School
Specialty

49.12

#145873
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121 SPOTS

Gopher STAY-N-PLAY #93
-063

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
96.60 Alt

No Award

#145868

122 BALANCE FEATHERS

Gopher #20-413

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
13.40 Alt
24.95 Alt

School
Specialty

13.40

#145843
#145861

123 BALANCE FEATHERS

Gopher #20-325

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
40.20 Alt
74.85 Alt

School
Specialty

40.20

#145829

124 CHRISTY LANE’S HIP HOP
MUSIC FOR TEACHERS,
VOLUME 1   CD 

Gopher #16-122

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
18.10

US Games 18.10

#145843

125 CHRISTY LANE’S CIRCUIT
TRAINING AND PE 
STATIONS CD

Gopher #16-088

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145843
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126 CHRISTY LANE’S DARE TO
DANCE MUSIC CD
      MUSIC VOLUME 1

Gopher #12-236

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#145874

127 ALL TIME FAVORITE
DANCES CD

Gopher #12-179

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
12.37
No Bid

School
Specialty

12.37

#145829
#145841

128 150 HOOP GAMES FOR
KIDS DVD

JOE DINOFFER’S
(Gopher #43-730)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

LifeFitness
School Specialty
US Games

No Bid
34.35
45.10

School
Specialty

34.35

#145883


