KPBSD Student Nutrition

Bid #143-14 Milk & Dairy Products

1% LOW FAT MILK, Half Pint, Case

1% LOW FAT MILK, Gallon

SKIM CHOCOLATE MILK, Half Pint, Case

SOY MILK, VANILLA FLAVOR 8 oz

SKIM CHOCOLATE MILK, Gallon

SOUR CREAM, LITE, 5#

BUTTERMILK, 1% LOW FAT, Case

COTTAGE CHEESE, NON-FAT, 5#

YOGURT, NON-FAT, Assrt Flavor, 4 oz

YOGURT, NON-FAT, NON-FAT PLAIN, Quart

AWARD IN BOLD

FSA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Peterkin

S 21.39

S 3.88

S 23.84

S 127

S 419

$2.15

S 24.88

S 10.51

S 043

S 331

Country Foods

$20.38

$3.15

$21.95

$1.19

$3.53

$7.65

$23.04

$8.60

$0.44

$3.76



