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020952 COVERSTOCK (PASTEL GREEN) $10.98
$11.90
$14.43
$11.52

$10.98/ream
Staples #490886

Pastel GreenSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

WAUSAU #82351Brand>

021023 COVERSTOCK (GAMMA GREEN) $16.58
$18.20
$16.98
$16.80

$16.58/ream
Wausau #22741

Gamma GreenSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Wausau #22741Brand>

021024 COVERSTOCK (TERRESTRIAL
TEAL)

$16.58
$18.20
$16.98
$16.80

$16.58/ream
Wausau #22109

Blue (Terrestrial Teal)Size/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Hammermill #10297-0 & Wausau #22109Brand>

021134 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER  (F.
GREEN)

$2.92
No Bid
$5.88
$3.70

$2.92/pkg
Tru-Ray #3038

Festive GreenSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Wausau #S8018Brand>

021143 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (WHITE) $2.92
No Bid
$5.88
$3.33

$2.92/pkg
Tru-Ray #3058

WhiteSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Wausau #S9818Brand>

021144 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER 
(YELLOW)

$2.92
No Bid
$5.88
$3.53

$2.92/pkg
Tru-Ray #3036

YellowSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Wausau #S8418Brand>

021147 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (SK PINK) $2.92
No Bid
$5.88
$4.08

$2.92/pkg
Tru-Ray #3045

Shock PinkSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Tru-Ray #3045Brand>

021160 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (GREEN) $1.45
No Bid
$5.88
$1.95

$1.45/pkg
Tru-Ray #3006

Festive GreenSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Wausau #S8012Brand>

021168 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (WHITE) $1.45
No Bid
$2.87
$1.72

$1.45/pkg
Tru-Ray #3026

WhiteSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Tru-Ray #3026Brand>
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021169 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER
(YELLOW)

$1.45
No Bid
$2.89
$1.82

$1.45/pkg
Tru-Ray #3004

YellowSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

Staples

Tru-Ray #3004Brand>

021186 COPY PAPER  (BLUE) $5.19/ream
$52.00
$84.08
$50.38

$50.38/case
Xerox #3R11050 

BlueSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Xerox #3R11050Brand>

021190 COPY PAPER  (GOLDENROD) $5.19/ream
$52.00
$84.08
$50.38

$50.38/case
Xerox #3R11055

GoldenrodSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Xerox #3R11055Brand>

021191 COPY PAPER  (WHITE) (8.5X11) $24.76*
$30.50*
$61.73
$30.82

$30.82/case
GP Spectrum
#997058.5"x11”, WhiteSize/Clr>

Staples
Unisource
Value Retail Group
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Xerox #3R2047Brand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                                        ****Draw 


