KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

F Purchasing Department
kpbs
where kids come first

Page 1 of 11

RECAP-Updated
Bid #112-15
Due date 12-12-14

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876 FAX (907) 262-7165

(Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }
#01  |AIRMOVER A&W Wholesale Co. $335.65 Alt Waxie $170.74
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $299.99 Alt
Unisource $190.00 Alt
Size - Waxie $170.74
WCP $182.93 Alt
Brand axie AirMover Base Model Oreck Floor Care No Bid
571782
153488
# 02 EXTRACTOR, CARPET A&W Wholesale Co. $1599.22 Alt*  Unisource $1995.00
(COMPACT) Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $2573.15 Alt
Unisource $1995.00 Alt
Size -30"L x 19"W x 28"H Waxie $1624.02 Alt *
WCP $2911.82
Brand [Tennant Nobles Strive Oreck Floor Care $3199.00 Alt
Compact
153548
# 03 EXTRACTOR, CARPET A&W Wholesale Co. $1599.22 Alt * No Award

(LOW PROFILE)

Frontier Paper

No Bid

Grainger $2573.15 Alt
Unisource $1995.00 Alt
Size - Waxie $1624.02 Alt *
WCP $2261.99
Brand [Tennant E5 Oreck Floor Care $1499.00 Alt *
$3199.00 Alt

153461

* Does Not Meet Specifications
*** Not FOB: Soldotna ****Draw

** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*****No Award-bid as all or none >>All or None
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RECAP-Updated
Bid #112-15
Due date 12-12-14

Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876  FAX (907) 262-7165

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }

Description Vendors & Price Quoted
# 04 EXTRACTOR, CARPET A&W Wholesale Co. $2853.78 Frontier Paper $2800.00 (1)
(SELF-CONTAINED) Frontier Paper $2800.00
Grainger No Bid Unisource $2385.00 (1)
Unisource $2385.00 Alt School chose as
. Waxie $2903.82 alt. for no award
Size - ' item #3.
WCP $2596.30 Alt
Brand |Advance Aquaclean 18FLX Qreck Floor Care $3199.00 Alt
56265001
153541
# 05 EXTRACTOR, CARPET A&W Wholesale Co. $1846.98 Alt NO AWARD
(WIDE TRACK) Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $1575.00 Alt
Size - 27.5"H 13"W 24" D . $1425.00 Alt
Waxie $1814.13 Alt
Brand |Rug Doctor Wide Track WCP No Bid
Oreck Floor Care No Bid
153491
# 06 FLOOR FINISH A&W Wholesale Co. $310.00 Alt * Waxie $942.29
PPLICATOR SYSTEM Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $1999.99
Unisource $1095.00
. Waxie $942.29
Size -
WCP $966.82
Brand |Diversey TrailBlazer Oreck Floor Care No Bid
5122912
153548
# 07 FLOOR MACHINE, A&W Wholesale Co. $2331.84 Alt WCP $1962.73
ORBITAL Frontier Paper $1529.00 Alt
Grainger $2410.96
Unisource $2395.00 Alt
Size - Waxie $1469.66 Alt
WCP $1962.73
Brand ([Tennant F14 Oreck Floor Care $1799.00 Alt

153437
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Description

# 08 FLOOR MACHINE, A&W Wholesale Co. $803.00 Alt * Waxie $1803.32
ARIABLE SPEED Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $1995.00
Size -26"L X 22"W x 48"H Waxie $1803.32
WCP $1090.16 Alt *
Brand |NSS Maverick 300 Oreck Floor Care No Bid
153493
# 09 FLOOR WAND ASSEMBLY A&W Wholesale Co. $330.50 WCP $299.63
Frontier Paper $395.00
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $399.50
, Waxie $593.92
Size -
WCP $299.63
Brand IAdvance #56265305 Oreck Floor Care No Bid
153541
# 10 HOSE ASSEMBLY, A&W Wholesale Co. $169.00 A&W Wholesale Co. $169.00
FLEXIBLE SOLUTION & Frontier Paper $229.00
RECOVERY Grainger No Bid
Unisource $225.00
. Waxie $169.79
Size -15 foot
WCP $198.40
Brand |Nilfisk-Advance #56265174 Qreck Floor Care No Bid
153541
# 11 MOP BUCKET & A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid Grainger $90.21
RINGER SYSTEM Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $90.21 Alt
Unisource $190.00
. Waxie $173.34
Size -35 gt - Yellow
q WCP $178.03
Brand |Rubbermaid WaveBrake Oreck Floor Care No Bid

FG767700

153481
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# 12 |PADS, STRIPPER A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid Waxie $50.26
Frontier Paper $65.00
Grainger $31.19 (5/cse)
Unisource $67.95
. Waxie $50.26
Size -20” x 14" - Black - 10/case
WCP $56.23
Brand [3M 7200 #00048011592572 Oreck Floor Care No Bid
(Waxie #260172)
153541
# 13 SCRUBBER, FLOOR A&W Wholesale Co. $6246.50 Alt Unisource $5295.00
(COMPACT) Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $5295.00
. Waxie $6412.13 Alt
Size -51" x 29" x 42"
WCP $5771.94
Brand |Clarke Focus Il BOOST L20 Oreck Floor Care $8999.00 alt
153527
# 14 SCRUBBER, FLOOR A&W Wholesale Co. $10473.60 Alt  Waxie $9580.87
(MICRO RIDER) Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $16988.24 Alt
Unisource $9995.00 Alt
. Waxie $9580.87 Alt
Size -60"L x 33.25" (w/squeegee
; (wisqueegee) \, -p $11302.33
X 50"H
Brand It 7 Oreck Floor Care $12499.00 Alt
rand [Tennant $10599.00 Alt
153495
# 15 SCRUBBER, FLOOR A&W Wholesale Co. $3915.00 Alt A&W Wholesale Co. $3915.00
(WALK BEHIND) Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $4606.80
Unisource $3875.00 Alt
. Waxie $3924.05 Alt
Size -48"L x 30" (w/squeegee) X
pod (wisqueegee) x \yop $4400.00
Oreck Floor Care $3699.00 Alt

Brand [Tennant T3 17" Pad Assist

153495
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# 16 SCRUBBER, FLOOR A&W Wholesale Co. $5246.50 Alt Unisource $4695.00
(WALK BEHIND) Frontier Paper No bid
Grainger $6163.40
Unisource $4695.00 Alt
. Waxie $4416.48 Alt
Size -50.25"L x 30" (w/squeegee
Ny (wisqueegee) \\op $6106.00
. Oreck Floor Care $5299.00 Alt
Brand [Tennant T3 20" w/Drive Non $4399.00 Alt *
FasT #9003581 '
153527
# 17 SCRUBBER, FLOOR & A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid WCP $1456.75
CARPET Frontier Paper $1529.00
Grainger $2410.96 Alt
Unisource $2395.00 Alt
. Waxie $1469.66
Size -
WCP $1456.75
Brand |Square Scrub EBG-20-E Oreck Floor Care $1599.00 Alt
153541
# 18 SCRUBBER, FLOOR & A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid Frontier Paper $2249.00 (3)
CARPET Frontier Paper $2249.00
Grainger $2410.96 Alt Oreck Floor Care $1599.00 (1)
Unisource $2895.00 Alt
. Waxie $2694.00
Size -
WCP $2350.25
Brand |Square Scrub EBG-20/C Oreck Floor Care $1599.00 Alt
153461 (1), 153484 (1),
153546 (1), 153541 (1)
# 19  |UPHOLSTERY TOOL A&W Wholesale Co. $125.45 A&W Wholesales $125.45
SSEMBLY Frontier Paper $159.00
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $145.00
. Waxie $214.50
Size -
WCP $143.43
Brand |Nilfisk-Advance #56220070 Qreck Eloor Care No Bid

153541
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# 20 |VACUUM BAGS A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid Waxie $93.28
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $118.00
) Waxie $93.28
Size -Black
WCP No Bid
Brand [NSS 1093011 Oreck Floor Care No Bid
153538
# 21 |VACUUM TOOL KIT A&W Wholesale Co. $82.35 Alt * Unisource $105.00
Frontier Paper $131.00
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $105.00
i Waxie $105.10
Size -
WCP $109.92
Brand [Pro Team #107187 Oreck Floor Care No Bid
153546
# 22 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $365.22 Alt Waxie $359.95
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $253.57 Alt
Unisource $425.00
Size -25"H x 8"W x 8"L . $350.00 Alt
Waxie $359.95
Brand |NSS Outlaw BV 6706751/ \wcCP No Bid
Kit 6790141 Oreck Floor Care $299.00 Alt
153491
# 23 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $425.00 Alt Waxie $318.88

Size -

Frontier Paper
Grainger
Unisource
Waxie

WCP

Brand |Pro Team Super CoachVac Qreck Eloor Care
HEPA #107119 / Kit 107100

153492

$458.00
$399.99 Alt
$338.50
$318.88
$340.81
$319.00 Alt
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# 24 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $425.00 Alt Waxie $318.88
Frontier Paper $458.00
Grainger $399.99 Alt
Unisource $338.00
Size - Waxie $318.88
1z€ WCP $340.81
Brand |Proteam Super Coach Pro  Qreck Floor Care $319.00 Alt
107304 / Kit B #107098
153495
# 25 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $425.00 Alt Waxie $318.88
Frontier Paper $458.00
Grainger $399.99 Alt
Unisource $338.50
Siz Waxie $318.88
€ WCP $340.81
Brand |Proteam Super Coach Pro  Qreck Floor Care $319.00 Alt
10 #107303
153548
# 26 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $425.00 Alt Waxie $318.88
Frontier Paper $458.00
Grainger $399.99 Alt
Unisource $338.50
Size Waxie $318.88
'z WCP $340.81
Brand |Proteam Super Coach Pro  Qreck Floor Care $319.00
10 #107303 / Kit D #107100
153488
# 27 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $425.00 Alt Waxie $319.63

Frontier Paper $440.00
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $338.50
. Waxie $319.63
Size - WCP $335.81
$299.00 Alt

Brand Lljroteam Super Coach Pro 6 QOreck Floor Care

107310

153546
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# 28 |VACUUM, BACK PACK A&W Wholesale Co. $425.00 Alt Waxie $255.11
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $539.99 Alt
Unisource $390.00
; " $338.50 Alt
Size -23.7"H x 8.8"W x 8.5"D .
'z X Waxie $255.11
Brand |VVindsor VP10 #1.014-005.0 wcCP No Bid
Oreck Floor Care $319.00
153482
# 29 |VACUUM, CANISTER A&W Wholesale Co. $441.10 Alt WCP $344.48
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $350.25
Unisource $470.00 Alt
Size - Waxie $351.93 Alt
WCP $344.48
Brand [Tennant V6 Oreck Floor Care $399.00 Alt
153527
# 30 |VACUUM, PORTABLE A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid Waxie $1326.99
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger No Bid
Unisource $1320.00
. Waxie $1326.99
Size -32"H x 16.5"L x 12"W
_ _ WCP No Bid
Brand [NSS M-1 “Pig” / Kit Oreck Floor Care No Bid
3093619
153491 (2)
153538 (1)
# 31 |VACUUM, UPRIGHT A&W Wholesale Co. $433.44 Alt Oreck Floor Care $399.00
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $479.99 Alt
Unisource $425.00 Alt
. . . Waxie $306.00 Alt *
Size - 14" cleaning width - Blue
1z nng WCP No Bid
Brand [Powr-Flite PF14 Oreck Floor Care $399.00

153530
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# 32 ACUUM, UPRIGHT A&W Wholesale Co. $487.80 Alt Unisource $525.00
(DUAL MOTOR) Frontier Paper $365.00 Alt
Grainger $699.99 Alt
Unisource $525.00
: Waxie $457.75 Alt
Size -13" x 18" x 44"
WCP $548.55
Brand |Clarke Carpetmaster 218 Oreck Floor Care $799.00
9060508010
153422
# 33 ACUUM, UPRIGHT A&W Wholesale Co. $433.44 Alt Unisource $425.00 (3)
(DUAL MOTOR) Frontier Paper $365.00 Alt
Grainger $699.99 Alt Waxie $306.00 (1)
Unisource $425.00 Alt $
i WCP 595.42 (1)
Size - 14.5"L x 14’W x 47°H Waxie $306.00 Alt
_ . wcee $595.42
Brand [Tennant Heavy Duty Upright Oreck Floor Care $590.00 Alt
V-HDU-14
153527 (3), 153495 (1) &
153548 (1)
# 34 |VACUUM, WET/DRY A&W Wholesale Co. $730.54 Alt Waxie $501.02
Frontier Paper $849.00
Grainger $826.00 Alt
Unisource $533.00
. Waxie $501.02
Size -20 gallon
9 WwCP $636.14
Brand |ProTeam Pro Guard 20 Oreck Floor Care $599.00 Alt
107131/ Squeegee
107185

153546 (1)
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Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }

# 35 |VACUUM, WET/DRY A&W Wholesale Co. $730.54 Alt A&W Wholesale Co $730.54
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $399.99 Alt *
Unisource $565.00 Alt
. Waxie $650.00 Alt
Size -34"H x 30”"L x 20"W - 16 gal
'z 98" wep $1236.72
Brand [Tennant V-WD-16P & Oreck Floor Care $528.00 Alt
Nobles #190108 (squeegee) $599.00 Alt
153495
# 36 ACUUM, WET/DRY - A&W Wholesale Co. $730.54 Alt Unisource $533.00
PLUS TOOL KIT Frontier Paper $849.00
Grainger $826.00 Alt
Unisource $533.00
i Waxie $644.78
Size - 20 gallon
9 WCP $636.14
Brand [ProTeam Pro Guard 20 Oreck Floor Care $599.00 Alt
107360/Squeegee 107185/
Kit 107187
153548
# 37 ACUUM, WET/DRY A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid No Award
(CANISTER) Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $99.99 Alt
Unisource No Bid
. Waxie $359.08 Alt
Size -12 gallon - orange
ee e g 9 WCP No Bid
Brand |[Ridgid WD1270 Oreck Floor Care No Bid
WDC
# 38 |VACUUM, WIDE AREA A&W Wholesale Co. $1914.90 Alt* WCP $1922.41

Frontier Paper

$1295.00 Alt *

Grainger $2115.83 Alt
Unisource $2495.00
. Waxie $2378.15
Size -43.5"L x 31.75"W x 36"H
WCP $1922.41 Alt
Brand [NSS Pacer 30 Oreck Floor Care $2249.00 Alt

153484
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# 39 |\/ACUUM, WIDE AREA A&W Wholesale Co. $1914.90 Alt A&W Wholesale Co. $1914.90
Frontier Paper No Bid
Grainger $1269.10 Alt *
Unisource $2480.00
Size - 26" _ $2325.00 Alt
Waxie $2361.74
Brand indsor NuWave Wide Area \WwcCp No Bid
acuum #1.012-533.0 Oreck Floor Care $2499.00 Alt
153482
# 40 WASTE COLLECTOR A&W Wholesale Co. No Bid Grainger $328.16/each
(MOBILE) Frontier Paper $2250.00/pkg of
Grainger 3
PKG OF 3 EACH Unisource $328.16/each
, Waxie $499.00/each
Size -52.5"L x 27.5"W x 42.5"H -
Black WCP $445.22/each
_ Oreck Floor Care No Bid
Brand |Rubbermaid Mega BRUTE No Bid

153488

HOW71




