KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 1 of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
' (907)714-8876 FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
001 CAFETERIA TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Brodart Co 1942.29
STOOT_§CTANGLE Wi Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. 1942.29

Size - [96" Long x 29" High x 30" Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid

Brand |K| UNIFRAME UFS3008P Materials Management 1187.69 Alt *

Bid - of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
4153559 School Specialty 969.93 Alt *
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
002 CAFETERIA TABLE Alaska Education 1799.00 Materials 1127.21
/BEﬁiiTANG'-E Arctic Office Products  1435.00 Management of
Brodart Co. No Bid Alaska
size- [12'1"Long x 20" High X | akeshore Learning  No Bid
Brand IMIDWEST #MBU12 “MOBILE Materials Management 1127.21 Alt
Bid- [BENCH" of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 1159.55 Alt
Ziggjég Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
003 |CAFETERIA TABLE Alaska Education 1421.00 Alt  Arctic Office 1246.00
ROUND W/ STOOLS  Arctic Office Products  1246.00 Alt
Size - |60” Diameter x 29” High Brodart Co. 1902.00
Brand |KI UFS60C Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Bid - Materials Management 1394.92 Alt
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153558 School Specialty 1210.47 Alt
Staples 1195.00 Alt
Unisource No Bid

* Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****DraW
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RECAP

Bid #116-15
Due Date: 1-27-2015

[ ltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

004 CONVERTIBLE BENCH Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 649.00
TAB'-IEECTANGLE Wi Arctic Office Products  649.00 Alt *
BENCH Erida:]t Co.L _ 280303
: , Lakeshore Learnin o Bi
Size- |06 Long x 29" High x 29 Materials Managergent 926.42 Alt
Bf:nd |KI UNIFRAME Model UCB8 ¢ Alaska
? School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 558.92 Alt
#154019 Staples 682.00 Alt
Unisource No Bid
005 CAFETERIA TABLE Alaska Education 1799.00 Alt Materials 1127.21
BENCRHECTANGLE Wi Arctic Office Products 1414.00 Alt  Management of
Brodart Co. No Bid Alaska
Size- [12'Long x 29" High x 30" | sxeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand INELSON ADAMS NACO Materials Management 1127.21
Bid-  IModel BT293012 of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 1258.91 Alt
#153555 Staples 2004.00 Alt
Unisource No Bid
006 CAFETERIA TABLE Alaska Education 1427.00 Alt School Specialty  969.93
BENCRHECTANG'-E Wi Arctic Office Products  1221.00 Alt
Brodart Co. No Bid
Size - [8'1” Long x 29" High 30" | 5keshore Learning  No Bid
Eirgr_‘d IAmTab Model #MBT8 Materials Management 1071.61 Alt
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
4153452 School Specialty 969.93 Alt
Staples 1012.00 Alt
Unisource No Bid
007 CAFETERIA TABLE Alaska Education 1599.00 Alt School Specialty  1156.94
STOOIT_IESCTANGLE wi Arctic Office Products  1246.00 Alt
Brodart Co. No Bid
Size- [10'Long x 29" High x 30" Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand |C|assr00m Select #1433627 Materials Management 1213.61 Alt
Bid - of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
4153554 School Specialty 1156.94
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
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RECAP

Bid #116-15
Due Date: 1-27-2015

[ Iltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

008  |STUDENT DESK
OPEN FRONT

Size - 23" wide x 15 1/2" deep and

Brand |Classroom Select Traditional

Bid- |Series Model 159

Alaska Education

Brodart Co. No Bid
Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

92.00 Alt
Arctic Office Products 139.00 Alt

School Specialty  76.17

School Outfitters No Bid
#153617 School Specialty 76.17
#153615 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
009 |STUDENT DESK Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  115.81
Size - Arctic Office Products 117.00
Brodart Co. 138.48

Brand SMITH SYSTEM 01476C
Bid-  [ELEMENTAL WAVE

Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

#153397 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 115.81
Staples 125.00
Unisource No Bid
010  ISTUDY CARREL Alaska Education 207.00 Arctic Office 194.00

Size - |31-1/4”W X 24"D x 45

Brand |BALT INC. LUMINA
Bid - |STARTER #90082
(Hertz #BLC-3024S)

Arctic Office Products 194.00
Brodart Co. 221.89
Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid
#154018 School Specialty 194.60 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource 240.00
011 |STUDY CARREL STARTER  Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |36,,W x 29-7/8" D x 48 Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [RONWOOD : :
Bid-  [MANUFACTURING Lakeshore Learning No Bid
GLACIER SERIES #L.c3s  Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153626 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 4 _of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
"- (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
012 |TABLET ARM CHAIR / Alaska Education 203.00 Staples 170.00
DESK Arctic Office Products  134.00 Alt
size - [18.5"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |ARTCO -BELL H258 Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153685 School Specialty 247.43
Staples 170.00
Unisource No Bid
013 STACK CHAIR Alaska Education 134.16 Alaska Education 134.16
WITHWRITING TABLET  Arctic Office Products  168.00
Size- [25”Wide X 21.5"Deep X  Brodart Co. 163.39

Brand |KF| Seating 2000 Series - P- Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - ISHAPED WRITING TABLET Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153625 School Specialty 157.65
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
014 STACK CHAIR Alaska Education 134.16 Alaska Education 134.16
WITHWRITING TABLET  Arctic Office Products  168.00
Size - [25”" Wide X 21.5" Deep X Brodart Co. 163.39

Brand |KF| Seating 2000 Series - P- Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - ISHAPED WRITING TABLET Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153625 School Specialty 157.65
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
015 |STUDENT TABLE Alaska Education 368.00 Alt Arctic Office 299.00
SCIENCE Arctic Office Products 299.00 Alt
Size - |54” L x24"W x 30"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |Carolina Biological #705133 ~ Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153599 School Specialty 292.19 Alt *
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 5_of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
"- (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
016 STUDENT TABLE Alaska Education 423.00 Alt Alaska Education  423.00
SCIENCE Arctic Office Products 569.00
Size- |72"L x 30"D x 30"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [DIVERSIFIED Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  \WOODCRAFTS INC Materials Management No Bid
#P7151K30N of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 444.67
#153602 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
017 CAFE OVAL TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 866.00
+ POWER Arctic Office Products 866.00
Size- A2"D x 72"W x 42" H Brodart Co. 125.29 *
Brand [SMITH SYSTEM #01544 +  Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- f01788 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153397 School Specialty 831.31/130.51
#153429 Staples 810.00 *
Unisource No Bid
018 PLANNER GRAPHIC ARTS  Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  323.24
TABLE Arctic Office Products  332.00
Size- [36”W x 24”D x 29-39°H  Brodart Co. 389.67
Brand [SMITH SYSTEM Model Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- 27346 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153588 School Specialty 323.24
Staples 350.00
Unisource No Bid
019 STUDENT DESK Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  154.18
TRAPEZOID Arctic Office Products  999.00
Size - Brodart Co. 184.96
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM HUDDLE-6 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- 1401265 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153429 School Specialty 154.18
Staples 950.00

Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 6_of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
' (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
020 STUDENT DESK Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  156.00
TRAPEZOID Arctic Office Products 158.00
Size - Brodart Co. 188.75
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM HUDDLE-8 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- 1401266 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153429 School Specialty 156.00
Staples 1290.00
Unisource No Bid
021 COMPUTER Alaska Education No Bid
OLIF;*;SAT;J'F?SFERENCE Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. No Bid

CENTER CLUSTER
Size - |Teack Laminate with Sliver
Brand [NATIONAL SCHOOL

Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid

Bid-  JFURNITURE #161065 of Alaska , .
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
4153615 Stgples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
022 COMPUTER Alaska Education 363.00 Arctic Office 324.00
WORKSTATION Arctic Office Products  324.00
size- [60"W x 30"D x 25-1/25t0 Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [BALT BRAWNY Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |(School Specialty #1302555) Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153733 School Specialty 386.68 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
023 WORKSTATION Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 298.00
2-STATION Arctic Office Products  298.00
Size- [30"D x 60"W x 22"-32"H Brodart Co. 468.61
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM PLANNER Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - 1401994 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153686 School Specialty 391.48
Staples 390.00

Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 7_of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 RECAP
& (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ Iltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
o024  ICOMPUTER CART Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |Black Arctic Office Products No B?d
Brand |VERSATABLE BFC Series Brodart Co. : No B!d
Bid - Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
#153419 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
025 COMPUTER Alaska Education No Bid Lakeshore 337.87
l\(zggﬁ_TEAT'ON’ FORTWO  Arctic Office Products  No Bid Learning
Brodart Co. No Bid
Size- [58"W x 23-314"D x 26 Lakeshore Learning  337.87
Eir:r_‘d |Lakesh0re #DD195 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
4153617 School Specialty 286.2_0 Alt *
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
026 COMPUTER STATION Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  562.86
3-STUDENT Arctic Office Products  564.00
Size- [24’D x 84"W x 22"-32"H Brodart Co. 675.54
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM PLANNER Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- JACCESS #11146 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153429 School Specialty 562.86
Staples 580.00
Unisource No Bid
027 |COMPUTER TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 226.00
RECTANGULAR Arctic Office Products  226.00
Size - |72” Long x 24" Deep x 22 Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO 8700 Series #872472 Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153624 School Specialty 470.08 Alt
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 8 of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
o (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
028 |COMPUTER TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 183.00
RECTANGULAR Arctic Office Products 183.00
Size - |60” Long x 24" Deep x 22 Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO 8700 Series #872460 Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153624 School Specialty 444.20 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
029 IACTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  233.10
HORSESHOE Arctic Office Products 286.00 Alt
Size - |48" x72" Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |School Fix #BFH4872 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153600 School Specialty 233.10 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
030 CTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 149.00
op RECTANGULAR Arctic Office Products  149.00
Brodart Co. No Bid

Size- [30°D x 60°L x22:30"H | akeshore Learning  No Bid
Brand |V|RCO 4000 Series #483060 Materials Management No Bid

Bid - of Alaska
School Outfitters 212.00
4153631 School Specialty 163.01 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource 250.00
031 CTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 149.00
op RECTANGULAR Arctic Office Products  149.00 Alt
Brodart Co. No Bid
Size- [30°W x 60" L x19-30" H Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand INORWOOD COMMERCIAL  Materials Management No Bid
Bid-  JFURNITURE #RCE3060C  nf Alaska
School Outfitters 298.00
School Specialty 163.01 Alt
#153588 Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid




(907)714-8876

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department
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Soldotna, Alaska 99669
FAX (907)262-7165
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RECAP

Bid #116-15
Due Date: 1-27-2015

[ ltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

032 IACTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 480.00
HORSESHOE Arctic Office Products  491.00
size- [60"D x 66"W x 21-30’H  Brodart Co. 599.58
Brand [SMITH SYSTEMS #01933  Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153429 School Specialty 502.02
Staples 480.00
Unisource No Bid
033 ACTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 280.00
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  491.00
Size- M8"L x 24"W x 24-34H  Brodart Co. 354.39
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM PLANNER Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- 25810 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153397 School Specialty 297.15
Staples 280.00
Unisource No Bid
034 ACTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 569.00
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  608.00
Size- K48"D x 72"W x 24-34"H  Brodart Co. 748.43
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM PLANNER Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- 25730 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153400 School Specialty 629.18
Staples 569.00
Unisource No Bid
035 PRE-K ACTIVITY TABLE  Alaska Education No Bid Staples 244.00
ROUND Arctic Office Products  249.00
Size- K2"D x 42°W x 15-24"H  Brodart Co. 303.02
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM HUSKY Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid- 1404326

#153400

Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 412.36
Staples 244.00
Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 10 of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
"' (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
036 ACTIVITY TABLE, LOW Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 212.00
RECTANGULAR Arctic Office Products  212.00 Alt
Size - |30" x 48" x 15 - 24" Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [Lakeshore Kids Colors Lakeshore Learning 236.17
Bid-  WMEE544BU Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153617 School Specialty 169.10 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
037 ACTIVITY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  283.45
KIDNEY Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - 48" x 72" x 21 - 30" Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [Lakeshore Group Kids Colors Lakeshore Learning 383.07
Bid-  HEE521BU Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153617 School Specialty 283.45 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
038 PRESCHOOL TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 294.00
HORSESHOE Arctic Office Products 294.00 Alt
Size - [Maple-tone top Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |Gopher / Play with A Purpose Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - t#88-827 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153646 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
039 PRE-SCHOOL ACTIVITY  Alaska Education No Bid No Award
TABLERECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  149.00
Brodart Co. No Bid
Size - |30"Wx 48" L x 17-25"H Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand \VIRCO 4000 Series Materials Management No Bid
Bid - 1#483048L0O of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 133.93 Alt
#154111 Staples No Bid

Unisource 199.00




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 11 of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 RECAP
b |
; (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
040 LIBRARY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 476.00
ROUND Arctic Office Products  489.00
Size - (48" Diameter x 29" H Brodart Co. 684.80
Brand \COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  |LINCOLN SERIES Materials Management No Bid
#l 148R-29 (Demco of Alaska
#WF14207050) School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 479.30
4153654 Staples 476.00
Unisource No Bid
041 LIBRARY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 442.16
ROUND Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - |48” Diameter x 29" H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |PARAGON FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - B48R-LT Materials Management No Bid
(School Outfitters #PAR-48R- of Alaska
LT) School Outfitters 590.00
School Specialty 442.16
4153686 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
042 LIBRARY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 587.05
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size- [30"W x 72"L x 29"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |PARAGON FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  #3072-LT Materials Management No Bid
(School Outfitters #PAR of Alaska
-3072-LT) School Outfitters 640.00
School Specialty 587.05
4153686 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
043 LIBRARY TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 605.00
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  605.00
Size- [60"W x 30"D x 22-32"H  Brodart Co. 694.38
Brand |SMITH SYSTEMS UXL Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- INEST AND FOLD #NL3060  Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153429 School Specialty 572.70 *
Staples 680.00

Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 12 _of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
"- (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
044 FOLDING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 531.00
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products 531.00
Size - [48"W x 24"D x 30"H Brodart Co. 601.17
Brand |SMITH SYSTEMS UXL Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- INEST AND FOLD #NL32448 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153400 School Specialty No Bid
Staples 610.00
Unisource No Bid
045 FOLDING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty 516.88
ROUND Arctic Office Products  566.00
Size- J48"W x 48"D x 30" H Brodart Co. 629.29
Brand [SMITH SYSTEMS UXL Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - INEST AND FOLD #NL48RD  Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153399 School Specialty 516.88
Staples 645.00
Unisource No Bid
046 |FOLDING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  257.89
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  279.00
Size- [30"W x 72"Lx 29" H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |ULINE H-2232 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153404 School Specialty 257.89
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
047 LI\//IVULTIPURPOSE TABLE  Alaska Education No Bid Unisource 375.00
RECTANGULAR TOP Arctic Office Products  No Bid
ITH T-LEG BASE

_ Brodart Co. No Bid
Size- [24"D x 84"W Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Brand yv-ivON HUDDLE Series Table Materials Management No Bid

Bid- " with Base of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 359.77/195.51
#153654 Staples 495.00

Unisource 375.00




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 13 of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
b |
; (907)714-8876 FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
048 MULTIPURPOSE TABLE  Alaska Education No Bid Staples 265.00
RECTANGULAR TOP Arctic Office Products  319.00
ITH T-LEG BASE

_ Brodart Co. No Bid
Size- [24"D x 48"W Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand yv-ivON HUDDLE Series Table Materials Management No Bid

Bid - |with Base of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 197.19/195.51
#153654 Staples 265.00
Unisource 450.00
049 |FOLDING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  56.83
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  195.00
Size- [30"W x 72" Lx 29"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |ULINE H-2750FOL Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153658 School Specialty 162.58
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
050 FOLDING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  256.72
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  389.00
Size- |18"W x 60" L x 29-3/4"H  Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [SOUTHERN ALUMINUM Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- JALULITE #A18602L Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153640 School Specialty 256.72
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
051 |FOLDING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 385.00
RECTANGLE Arctic Office Products  409.00
size- [24”W x 60" L x 29-1/2"H  Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [MAYLINE “SYNC” #SY2460 Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153685 School Specialty No Bid
Staples 385.00

Unisource 495.00




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
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RECAP

Bid #116-15
Due Date: 1-27-2015

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted

052 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 199.00
ARMLESS Arctic Office Products  199.00
Size - |18” Brodart Co. 267.58
Brand |COMMUNITY CLASSMATE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  [SERIES 59D Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153654 School Specialty 199.02
Staples 204.00
Unisource No Bid
053 CHAIR, STUDENT Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 74.00
CANTILEVERED Arctic Office Products  74.00
Size - [19 inch Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO ZUMA SEATING Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  #7CANT18 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153637 School Specialty 86.96 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
054 CHAIR, STUDENT Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 99.00
ROCKING Arctic Office Products  99.00
Size - [18 inch Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |VIRCO ZUMA SEATING Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  |ROCKS #ZROCK18 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153637 School Specialty 93.77 Alt
#154018 Staples No Bid
Unisource 185.00
055 CHAIR, STUDENT Alaska Education 33.00 Alt Arctic Office 57.00
STACK Arctic Office Products 57.00
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO ZUMA SEATING Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  7u413 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153608 School Specialty 37.80 Alt *
#153617 Staples No Bid
Unisource 115.00




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 15 of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 RECAP
& (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
056 CHAIR, STUDENT Alaska Education 38.00 Alt Arctic Office 59.00
STACK Arctic Office Products  59.00
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO ZUMA SEATING Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  7uU415 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153608 School Specialty 43.30 Alt *
#153617 Staples No Bid
Unisource 110.00
057 CHAIR, STUDENT Alaska Education 43.00 Alt Arctic Office 69.00
STACK Arctic Office Products  69.00
Size - [18 inch Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO ZUMA SEATING Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  t7U418 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153608 School Specialty 45.47 Alt *
#153617 Staples No Bid
Unisource 110.00
058 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid School Outfitters ~ 68.00
STACKING Arctic Office Products  99.00 Alt
Size- [17"W x 20"D x 33"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [NORWOOD COMMERCIAL Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - JFURNITURE 250 Series Materials Management No Bid
(School Outfitters #NOR of Alaska
-250V) School Outfitters 68.00
School Specialty No Bid
4153630 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
059  [STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 39.50 Alt Arctic Office 37.00
Size- |18 nch Arctic Office Products 37.0Q
_ Brodart Co. No Bid
prand F/IRCO 9000 Series Model Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- 19018 ) :
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
#153639 School Outfitters 51.50
School Specialty 31.83 Alt *
Staples No Bid

Unisource 65.00
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060 |STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 71.00
Size- |18 nch Arctic Office Products 71.0Q
Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [VIRCO MARTEST 21 3000 . :
Bid-  |Series #3018 Lakes_hore Learning No B!d
(Demco #171-1265) Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters 93.50
#153588 School Specialty 58.45 Alt *
Staples No Bid
Unisource 125.00
061 |PRESCHOOL STUDENT  Alaska Education 27.66 Alt School Outfitters ~ 31.00
CHAIR Arctic Office Products  28.00 Alt
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |SPROGS 100 Series #1011  Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |(School Outfitters #SPG- Materials Management No Bid
SO1011) of Alaska
School Outfitters 31.00
School Specialty 23.40 Alt
#153454 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
062 |PRESCHOOL STUDENT  Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 49.73
CHAIR Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand JANGELES BASELINE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - '?AB7911 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153642 School Specialty 49.73
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
063 |PRESCHOOL STUDENT Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  56.38
CHAIR Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand JANGELES BASELINE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - '?AB7913 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153642 School Specialty 56.38
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid
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064 IDRAFTING CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 206.00
Size - |Seat & Back fabric: Interlink Arctic Office Products 206'90
Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |OFFICE STAR Worksmart . .
Bid- |pcaso Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
#153419 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 246.74
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
065  |DRAFTING CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 179.00
Size - |Black Arctic Office Products 179.QO
Brand |BOSS 4B16215 Brodart Co. . No B!d
Bid - Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
#153639 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
066 |SIDE CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid
ALUMINUM Arctic Office Products  No Bid
size- [30.5"H x 15.25"W x 15"D Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand IALSTON #AC2700 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153419 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
067 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  102.86
STACK Arctic Office Products  123.00
Size- [20.5"D x 19.5"W x 18"H Brodart Co. 125.80
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  INOODLE #11851 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153397 School Specialty 102.86
Staples 135.00

Unisource No Bid
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068 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  91.42
STACK Arctic Office Products  106.00
Size- [18"D x 18"W x 16"H Brodart Co. 118.63
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  INOODLE #11852 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153397 School Specialty 91.42
#153429 Staples 129.00
Unisource No Bid
069 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 105.22
STACK Arctic Office Products  107.00
Size- [17"D x 17.5"W x 14" H Brodart Co. 117.09
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  INOODLE #11853 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153429 School Specialty 105.22
Staples 129.00
Unisource No Bid
070 ISTUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 33.00 Alt School Specialty  24.44
Size- [Blue Arctic Office Products 29.00 Alt
Brodart Co. 70.91

Brand [SCHOLAR CRAFT CDF EVO

Bid- |STYLE 3100 #3114 Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska

#153642 School Oultfitters No Bid
School Specialty 24.44 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid

071 |STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 38.00 Alt School Specialty  28.80
Size - [Size B; 16” Arctic Office Products 33.00 Alt

Brodart Co. 72.29

Brand [SCHOLAR CRAFT CDF EVO

Bid- |STYLE 3100 #3116 Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska

#153642 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 28.80 Alt
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid
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072 |STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 39.50 Alt Alaska Education  39.50
Size - |Beige Arctic Office Products  37.00 Alt
Brand |SCHOLAR CRAFT 180 Brodart Co. , 111'0.8
Bid-  |Series #187 Lakes_hore Learning No B!d
Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
#153470 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 58.45 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
073 STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 28.81 Alt School Specialty ~ 23.92
FOURLEG Arctic Office Products  29.00 Alt
Size - [Black Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [CLASSROON SELECT Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  [TRADITIONAL SERIES Materials Management No Bid
Model 13.5” of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 23.92
#153615 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
074 STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 72.00 Alt School Specialty  56.83
FOURLEG Arctic Office Products  54.00 Alt
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [CLASSROON SELECT Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- ICONTEMPORARY SERIES  Materials Management No Bid
Model 18" of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 56.83
#153658 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
075 |STUDENT CHAIR Alaska Education 82.00 Alt School Specialty  66.88
FOURLEG Arctic Office Products  59.00 Alt
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |CLASSROON SELECT Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- |CONTEMPORARY SERIES ~Materials Management No Bid
Model 20"A+ of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 66.88
#153658 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
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076 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Staples 59.00
PADDED, STACK Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - Brodart Co. 549.16
Brand INATIONAL PUBLIC Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - [SEATING 8600 Series Materials Management No Bid
Signature #8640 of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#153686 Staples 59.00
Unisource No Bid
077 |CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 449.00
ARMLESS LOUNGE Arctic Office Products  449.00
Size - |29" D x 23-1/2W x 32"H Brodart Co. 608.51

Brand ‘COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning  No Bid

Bid- |ENCORE SERIES #EN9210 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid

#153400 School Specialty 587.73

#153626 Staples 449.00

Unisource No Bid

078 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 194.00

MODULAREND ARM  Arctic Office Products  194.00

Size- [23"D x 7"W x 24-1/2’D  Brodart Co. 262.20

Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid-  |ENCORE SERIES Materials Management No Bid
HEN9220UW-R of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid

School Specialty 268.26

ziggggg Staples 222.00

Unisource No Bid

079 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 194.00

MODULAR END ARM  Arctic Office Products  194.00

Size- [23"D x 7"W x 24-1/2°D  Brodart Co. 262.20

Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid-  [ENCORE SERIES Materials Management No Bid
HEN9220UW-L of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid

School Specialty 268.26

#153400 Staples 222.00

#153626

Unisource No Bid
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080 OVAL COFFEE TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 526.00
UVF‘J’HOSIE)STFEE é 5 BASE Arctic Office Products  526.00
Brodart Co. 722.00

Size- [27D x 16-1/2-26-1/2"W X | akeshore Learning  No Bid
Brand \COMMUNITY FURNITURE  Materials Management No Bid

Bid- [ENCORE SERIES of Alaska
#EN2142B School Ouffitters No Bid
School Specialty 625.44
Staples 575.00
#153626 Unisource No Bid
081 LINKING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 357.00

WOOD TOP / Arctic Office Products 357.00

UPHOLSTERED BASE

Brodart Co. 500.14
Lakeshore Learning No Bid
COMMUNITY FURNITURE ~ Materials Management No Bid

Size - |21—1/2” D x 42-1/2" W x
Brand

Bid-  [ENCORE SERIES #EN22B ¢ Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 443.66
#153626 Staples 391.00
Unisource No Bid
082 I\NEDGE BENCH Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 319.00
LOUNGE Arctic Office Products  319.00
Size - [25-1/2" D x 26-1/2"W x Brodart Co. 452.99
Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - IENCORE SERIES #EN9713 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153626 School Specialty 424.49
Staples 358.00
Unisource No Bid
083 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 206.00
THREE-POSITION Arctic Office Products  206.00
Size - [23-1/4"D x 19"W x 30 Brodart Co. 306.89

Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- |CALCULUS SERIES #49D  Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid
#153626 School Specialty 258.76

Staples 233.00

Unisource No Bid
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084 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 166.00

SLED BASE Arctic Office Products 166.00
Size - |20-1/4"D x 19"W x 32 Brodart Co. 253.63

Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- |CLASS ACT SERIES #19D Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153626 School Specialty 218.00
Staples 192.00
Unisource No Bid
085 |CHAIR, ARMLESS Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 463.00
LOUNGE Arctic Office Products  463.00
Size - |29" D x 26-1/2°W x 32°H Brodart Co. 626.81
Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- |ENCORE SERIES #EN9213 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153626 School Specialty 619.83
Staples 515.00
Unisource No Bid
086 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 414.00
LOUNGE Arctic Office Products  414.00
Size- [31-1/2"D x 26-3/4” W x Brodart Co. 589.21

Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- |CADET SERIES #8911D Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153786 School Specialty 528.91
Staples 440.00
Unisource No Bid
087 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 231.00
TWO SEAT Arctic Office Products 231.00
Size- [31-1/2"D x 51"W x 34"H Brodart Co. 985.54

Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  |CADET SERIES #8912D Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid
#153786 School Specialty 907.57

Staples 745.00

Unisource No Bid
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088 CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 979.00
THREE SEAT Arctic Office Products 979.00
Size- [31-1/2"D x 75"W x 34"H Brodart Co. 1341.10
Brand |COMMUNITY FURNITURE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  |CADET SERIES #8913D Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153786 School Specialty 1267.68
Staples 1032.00
Unisource No Bid
0gg  IsTooL Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 76.13
Size - |Charcoal Gray Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. 743.84
Brand |NATIONAL PUBLIC . :
Bid- |SEATING “ELEPHANT Z- Lakes_hore Learning No B!d
STOOL” Materials Management No Bid
(School Specialty #1366662) Of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 76.13
#153447 Staples 81.00
Unisource No Bid
090 |SHOP STOOL Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 64.00
W/ BACKREST Arctic Office Products  64.00
Size - [25-33" High Seat Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |U|_|NE #H-2506B Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid - Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153685 School Specialty 102.31
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
091 |KID’s ergoErgo SEAT Alaska Education No Bid
Size- |15” High x 14" Diameter Arctic Office Products No B?d
Brand |ergoErgo.com “Student Size” Brodart Co. . No B!d
' Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid - (Gopher #63-523)

#154015

Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
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092 LECTERN Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 459.00
NON-SOUND Arctic Office Products  459.00 Alt
Size - |24"W x 20"D x 45"H Brodart Co. 1238.75

Brand [AMPLIVOX CHANCELLOR Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - (#W470-MH (Global Industrial Materials Management No Bid

#B966823) of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#153419 Staples No Bid
Unisource 1095.00
093 EASEL Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  263.70
TEACHER’S LEARNING  Arctic Office Products  272.00
CENTER
Brodart Co. 317.24

Size- [26-3/4"D x 38"W x 55 Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand [BEST-RITE TLC-2 Model 805 Materials Management No Bid

Bid - \(Quill #901-303150BAL) of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 263.70
#153617 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
094 |READING WRITING Alaska Education No Bid School Outfitters ~ 325.00
CENTER Arctic Office Products  469.00
Size - Brodart Co. 587.68
Brand [COPERNICUS REGAL Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - }URClO? Materials Management No Bid
(Really Good Stuff #303987) of Alaska
School Outfitters 325.00
School Specialty 473.53
#153649 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
095 [BookcAse Alaska Education 197.00 Alaska Education 197.00
Arctic Office Products 249.00

Size - |12" D x 36-1/2" W x 36" H

Brand |JONTI-CRAFT RAINBOW
Bid - CCENT #0960JC

Brodart Co. 277.96
Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska

4153617 School Outfitters 268.00 Alt
School Specialty 205.42
Staples No Bid

Unisource 240.00
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096 ART DISPLAY PANEL Alaska Education 286.00 Arctic Office 272.00

2 PANELS Arctic Office Products 272.00
Size- |6'H x 4" w Brodart Co. No Bid

Brand [BEST-RITE TLC-2 Model 805 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |(School Specialty #1335507) Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153419 School Specialty 474.85
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid

097 |BOOK DISPLAY Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  193.75

Size- [25"W x 25"D x 44" H Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. 410.69

Brand |GUIDECRAFT “4-SIDED

Bid- | |BRARY” #G97012 Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
4153646 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 193.75
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
098 |LITERATURE FLOOR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 279.00
DISPLAY RACK Arctic Office Products  279.00
Size - |36" H x 12-4/5"W x 18 Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand IA'-BA Model DDEXPO6 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153453 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
099 DISPLAY RACK Alaska Education No Bid Brodart Co. 380.00
FLOOR STAND Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size- [21-1/4”W x 64"H x 14’D  Brodart Co. 380.00
Brand \WOODEN MALLET #AC12- Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- [Fs Materials Management No Bid
(Demco #WF14925140) of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
#153654 Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid
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100 [BULLETIN BOARD Alaska Education 248.00 Alt Alaska Education  248.00
Size- 122W x 4 H Arctic Office Products 279.00
Brodart Co. 346.23
Eir:r_]d BALT Model #321RM-95 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
(Grainger #15Y230) Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
#153471 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 306.05 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
101 WHITEBOARD Alaska Education 450.00 Alt * School Specialty  716.50
MAGNETIC Arctic Office Products  839.00 Alt
Size- [16W x 4'H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |MYWHITEBOARD.COM Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |ICONTRACTOR SERIES #MI- Materials Management No Bid
CB-416 of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 716.50 Alt
#153419 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
102 HITEBOARD WITH MAP  Alaska Education 128.00 Alt Alaska Education 128.00
RAII\/ITAGNETIC Arctic Office Products  249.00 Alt
Brodart Co. No Bid
size- W x 4'H Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Eirgr_‘d |EVERWH|TE Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
4153438 School Specialty 211.59 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
103 HITEBOARD WITH MAP  Alaska Education 225.00 Alt Alaska Education 225.00
RAII\I/TAGNETIC Arctic Office Products  419.00 Alt
Brodart Co. No Bid
Size- [#W x 8'H Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Brand |EVERWHITE Materials Management 499.00
Bid - of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
4153438 School Specialty 379.49 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
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104 l\/\/HITEBOARD Alaska Education 175.00 Alt Arctic Office 136.00
MELAMINE Arctic Office Products 136.00
size- [6'W x 4'H Brodart Co. 379.66
Brand |QUARTET #5537 Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153615 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
105 MARKERBOARD Alaska Education 225.00 Alt Arctic Office 211.00
WITH ABC FRAME Arctic Office Products 211.00
size- |4 x & Brodart Co. 617.23
Brand [BEST-RITE TUF-RITE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - [standard #2H1NH Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153643 School Specialty 293.66
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
106 |PORTABLE PARTITION  Alaska Education 2110.00 School Specialty ~ 1808.24
FREE STANDING  Arctic Office Products  2329.00
Size - |24’ 1" Long x 8 High Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |SCREENFLEX Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters 2020.00
#153574 School Specialty 1808.24
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
107 |PORTABLE PARTITION Alaska Education 1425.00 School Specialty  1226.45
FREE STANDING  Arctic Office Products 1572.00
Size - |13’ 1" Long x 8 High Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |SCREENFLEX Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid -

#153574

Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

School Outfitters 1550.00
School Specialty 1226.45
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
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108 |PORTABLE PARTITION Alaska Education 985.00 School Specialty ~ 885.49
FREE STANDING  Arctic Office Products  1098.00
Size - [0'5" Long x 68" High Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [SCREENFLEX FSL685 Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters 1210.00
#153577 School Specialty 855.49
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
109 PORTABLE PARTITION Alaska Education 985.00 School Specialty  855.49
FREE STANDING  Arctic Office Products  1210.00
W/ MULTI CONNECTOR Brodart Co. No Bid
Size - [9"57Long x 68" High Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Brand |SCREENFLEX FSL685- Materials Management No Bid
Bid- |pG/GL of Alaska
School Outfitters 950.00
School Specialty 855.49
#153598 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
110 PORTABLE PARTITION Alaska Education No Bid
FREE STANDING  Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - [8'6'Long x 7' 6" High Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand VERSARE 360 “ROOM Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  [DIVIDER” Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#154014 School Specialty No Bid
#153576 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
111 PAPER RACK Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  466.30
HORIZONTAL Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size- [25"w X 38”1 X 52-1/2"h Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [BULMAN STANDARD ROLA- Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- |RACK (Demco #146-0177;  Materials Management No Bid
School Specialty #009114 of Alaska
-050) School Outfitters 515.00
School Specialty 466.30
4153649 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
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112 |PAPER RACK Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 612.76
HORIZONTAL Arctic Office Products  No Bid
size- [50"W x 25"D x 52-1/2"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |BULMAN STANDARD Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  |DELUXE ROLA-RACK R398 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters 842.00
#153588 School Specialty 612.76
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
113 |SAFETY CABINET Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 1109.00
FLAMMABLE Arctic Office Products  1109.00
Size - |35" H x 23"W x 18" D Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |[EAGLE Model #1925 RED  Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153578 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
114  [|STORAGE CABINET Alaska Education No Bid
Size- [32°W x 18D x 72'H Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [SALISBURY INDUSTRIES : )
Bid- kDESIGNER WOOD” Lakes.hore Learning No B!d
Standard Model 3078 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153787 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
115  |STORAGE CABINET Alaska Education 585.00 Arctic Office 509.00
Size- [36"W x 24°D x 78'H Arctic Office Products 509.00
Brodart Co. 602.55
srand [SANDUSKY LEE CORP Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |Model EA42362478-09 ) )
(Gaylord #SA36824) Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153685 School Specialty 569.39
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid
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116 [STORAGE CABINET Alaska Education 510.00 Arctic Office 509.00
Size- [46"W x 24°D x 42°H Arctic Office Products 509.00
Brodart Co. 503.93
srand |SANDUSKY LEE CORP Lakeshore Learnin No Bid
Bid-  [ELITE SERIES” _ 9 _
(Teacher Direct Materials Management No Bid
EA2R46244201 LM) of Alaska
School Ouftfitters No Bid
School Specialty 519.03
#153447 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
117 |STORAGE CABINET Alaska Education 316.00 Alaska Education  316.00
Size- [36"W x 24’ D x 42'H Arctic Office Products 349.Q0
Brodart Co. No Bid
prand [SANDUSKY LEE CORP Lakeshore Learnin No Bid
Bid - [#CA21362442-09 _ 9 !
(Gaylord #SBL3624) Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153685 School Specialty 342.41
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
118 STORAGE CABINET Alaska Education 643.00 Arctic Office 565.00
MOBILE Arctic Office Products 565.00
Size- [7/8"H x 36"W Xx 24" D Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [TENNESCO #7824 + Ck24 Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - [caster Kit Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153659 School Specialty 737.81
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
119 STORAGE CABINET UNIT  Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 559.00
MOBILE Arctic Office Products 559.00
Size - [42-5/8"W x 19"D x 42 Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM CASCADE Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Bid- [MEGA-CABINET
#620106090PSNAOS
-020300203002030000

#153400

Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska

School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 983.86
Staples 1264.00
Unisource No Bid
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120 STORAGE CABINET UNIT  Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 749.00
MOBILE Arctic Office Products  749.00
Size- |42-5/8"W x 19"D x 60 Brodart Co. 966.80
Brand |SMITH SYSTEM CASCADE Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  IMEGA-TOWER Materials Management No Bid
H920009093PS of Alaska
-030310303103031000 School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 1242.23
4153400 Stqples 1445_.00
Unisource No Bid
121 |BASE SHELF / DRAWER Alaska Education 1430.00 Alaska Education 1430.00
CABINET Arctic Office Products  1790.00
Size - |26" D x 36"H x36"W Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - Lv72327.664.xx1xx Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153607 School Specialty 1507.26
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
122 WALL CABINET Alaska Education 557.00 Alaska Education  557.00
WITH DOORS Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size- [26"D x 36"H x36"W Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |FLEETWOOD ILLUSIONS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - 1476040.606.xx1xx Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153607 School Specialty 587.15
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
123 TEACHER STORAGE UNIT  Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  504.27
LOCKABLE Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - |20" D x 71-1/4’H x36”"W  Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |CHILDCRAFT Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |(School Specialty #296411)  Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153447 School Specialty 504.27
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 32 _of 44
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
& (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #116-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 1-27-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
124 ALL CABINET Alaska Education 279.98 School Specialty ~ 270.97
WITH DOORS Arctic Office Products  294.00
Size- [15"D x 26"H x 35" W Brodart Co. 331.84
Brand [JONTI-CRAFT #0945]C Lakeshore Learning ~ No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153652 School Specialty 270.97
Staples No Bid
Unisource 375.00
125 STORAGE CABINET Alaska Education No Bid
FOLDING Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size- [15"D x 24"H x 48" W Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |Ace Educational Supplies Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid- QS WS-12500 Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153447 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
126 CHAIR CADDY Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  174.95
MULTI-PURPOSE Arctic Office Products  No Bid
size- [106"L x 20-1/2°W x 35"H Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand K| Folding Chair Caddy Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - |(Adirondack #09766) Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153602 School Specialty 174.95 Alt
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
127  [BookTrRUCK Alaska Education No Bid Brodart 288.5
Size- |18"D x 44-1/2" H Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brodart Co. 288.50

Lakeshore Learning No Bid

Brand L?emco “LibraryQuiet”
Materials Management No Bid

Bid - k\wWM12228990

of Alaska

#153654 School Ouftfitters No Bid
School Specialty 335.68/53.72
Staples 420.00 Alt

Unisource No Bid
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128 DINING TABLE Alaska Education No Bid No Award
ROUND Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - 148" Diameter top x 28.5” High Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |BLU DOT SPROUT Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid-  |COLLECTION Materials Management No Bid
#SP1-DNTB48-BLK of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
School Specialty 387.68 Alt
#153419 Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
129 |SOFA Alaska Education No Bid
3 PIECE Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size- [35"H x 23"W x 18" D Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand [NEWCO KIDS Model #80135 Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153951 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
130 BENCH Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  62.64
DOUBLE Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size- |9"H x 30"W x 13"D Brodart Co. 128.62
Brand \WOOD DESIGNS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - tWD31800BN Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters 135.00
#154114 School Specialty 62.64
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid
131 |SEAT LOCKER Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  564.40
8-SECTION Arctic Office Products  623.00 Alt
Size- [49"H x 15D x 54"W Brodart Co. 699.26
Brand WOOD DESIGNS #WD51008 Lakeshore Learning  No Bid
Bid - Materials Management No Bid
of Alaska
School Outfitters 605.00
#153470 School Specialty 564.40
Staples No Bid

Unisource No Bid
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132 WORKSHOP Alaska Education No Bid
PLASTIC Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - Brodart Co. No Bid
Brand |STEP2 REAL PROJECTS Lakeshore Learning No Bid
Bid - 1762700 Materials Management No Bid

of Alaska
School Outfitters No Bid
#153951 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
Unisource No Bid




