
Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
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139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669
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RECAP
Bid #120-15

Due date 2-10-15

Item #

01 ADAPTER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$29.50
$50.00
$26.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $26.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Norcostco #F108-US

02 ADAPTER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$33.50
$53.00
$26.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $26.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Norcostco #F108-SU

03 ADAPTER, LIGHTING B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$9.00
$38.20 Alt
$4.00 Alt
No Bid
$7.00 Alt

Guitar Center $4.00#

Size -

Brand Cable Up #DMX-X3M-X5F

04 ADAPTER, LIGHTING B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$9.00
$36.10 Alt
$4.00 Alt
No Bid
$7.00 Alt

Guitar Center $4.00#

Size -

Brand Cable Up #DMX-X5M-X3F

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None
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RECAP
Bid #120-15

Due date 2-10-15

Item #

05 AMPLIFIER, POWER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$330.00
$369.00
$649.00
$305.00
$415.00
$424.00

Guitar Center $305.00#

3.5”H x 10.1”D x 19”WSize -

Brand QSC GX5

06 BLU-RAY  DISC PLAYER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$124.00 Alt*

No Award#

BlackSize -

Brand Samsung Bd-fm51

07 BOOM, TELESCOPING B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$11.00
$12.00
$40.00
$9.00
No Bid
$8.00

Westlake Pro $8.00#

Size -

Brand Ultimate Support JS-TB100

08 CABLE, AUDIO SNAKE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$175.00
No Bid
$39.00 Alt
No Bid
$39.00

Guitar Center $39.00#

10’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co Sound RoadMaster
#RM0800FF-10

09 CABLE, AUDIO SNAKE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$40.00
No Bid
$39.00 Alt
No Bid
$30.00 Alt

Westlake Pro $30.00#

3’ - 6 pack - BlackSize -

Brand GLS Audio #37-288



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue 
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  3  of  19

RECAP
Bid #120-15

Due date 2-10-15

Item #

10 CABLE, E-STRING (6
OUTLET)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$95.00 Alt
$140.00
$98.00
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

23’ - BlackSize -

Brand Norcostco E-String #F524

11 CABLE, E-STRING (6
OUTLET)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$150.00
$195.00
$147.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $147.00#

50’ - BlackSize -

Brand Norcostco E-String #F524

12 CABLE,
GUITAR/INSTRUMENT

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$6.97
$12.00
No Bid
$7.00
No Bid
$8.00 Alt

B&H Photo $6.97#

25’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #SEG25

13 CABLE, HDMI B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$5.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
$8.00 Alt
No Bid
$5.00 Alt

Westlake Pro $5.00#

6’Size -

Brand Link Depot HDMI1-3-6
(Walmart 551580863)

14 CABLE, LIGHTING B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$10.00 Alt
$17.00
$29.50
$8.00 Alt
No Bid
$10.00 Alt

Guitar Center $8.00#

10’ - BlackSize -

Brand Cable Up #DMX-XX5-10



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  4  of  19

RECAP
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Due date 2-10-15

Item #

15 CABLE, LIGHTING B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$16.00 Alt
$24.50
$43.20
$13.00 Alt
No Bid
$13.00 Alt

Guitar Center $13.00#

20’ - BlackSize -

Brand Cable Up #DMX-XX5-20

16 CABLE, MIC B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$32.00
$50.00
$85.00
$30.00 Alt
No Bid
$13.00 Alt*

Guitar Center $30.00#

30’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co AmeriQuad 30-MIC-
XX-SQ

17 CABLE, MICROPHONE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$10.00 Alt
$14.00
$21.00
$22.00 Alt
No Bid
$8.00 Alt

Westlake Pro $8.00#

10’ - BlackSize -

Brand Cable Up #MIC-XX-10

18 CABLE, MICROPHONE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$11.00
$18.00
$19.00 Alt
No Bid
$6.00 Alt*

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$11.00#

6’ - BlackSize -

Brand Cable Up #MIC-XX-6

19 CABLE, MICROPHONE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$42.00
$60.00
$160.00
$49.00
No Bid
$49.00

B&H Photo $42.00#

75’ - BlackSize -

Brand Hosa CMK-075AU
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20 CABLE, PATCH B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$12.00 Alt
No Bid
$12.00 Alt

Guitar Center $12.00#

3’ - 6 pack - Multiple colorsSize -

Brand Peavey #00054570

21 CABLE, PHONE SPEAKER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$19.00
$25.00
$75.00
$14.00 Alt
No Bid
$22.00 Alt

Guitar Center $14.00#

10’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #10-SPK12-QQ

22 CABLE, PHONE SPEAKER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$89.00 Alt
$100.00
$326.00
$46.00 Alt
No Bid
$86.00 Alt

Guitar Center $46.00#

100’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #100-SPK12-QQ

23 CABLE, PHONE SPEAKER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$89.00 Alt
$50.00
$115.00
$23.00 Alt
No Bid
$32.00 Alt

Guitar Center $23.00#

25’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #25-SPK12-QQ

24 CABLE, POWERCON AC B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$47.00
$44.00
$160.00
$39.00
No Bid
$42.00

Guitar Center $42.00#

15’ - BlackSize -

Brand Whirlwind NAC3-015
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25 CABLE, POWERCON
EXTENSION

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$38.00
$75.00
$53.00
No Bid
No Bid

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$38.00#

10’ - BlackSize -

Brand Norcostco #F723

26 CABLE, POWERCON
EXTENSION

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$53.00
$100.00
$53.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$53.00#

 - Black25’Size -

Brand Lex Products #PE700J-25-
PCN

27 CABLE, SAFETY B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$5.00
$5.00
$14.00
$5.00
No Bid
No Bid

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$5.00#

36” - BlackSize -

Brand Altman #SC-36-BK

28 CABLE, SPEAKER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$167.00 Alt
No Bid
$220.00 Alt

Guitar Center $167.00#

250’Size -

Brand Gepco 1200-250

29 CABLE, SPEAKON
SPEAKER

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$90.00 Alt
$100.00
$304.00
$47.00 Alt
No Bid
$85.00 Alt

Guitar Center $47.00#

100’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #100-SPK12/2-SQ
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30 CABLE, SPEAKON
SPEAKER

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$21.00
$92.00
$17.00 Alt
No Bid
$19.00 Alt

Guitar Center $17.00#

25’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #25-SPK14/2-SQ

31 CABLE, SPEAKON
SPEAKER

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$35.00
$138.00
$32.00 Alt
No Bid
$31.00 Alt

Westlake Pro $31.00#

50’ - BlackSize -

Brand Pro Co #50-SPK14/2-SQ

32 CABLE, VGA B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$24.00 Alt
No Bid
$22.00 Alt

No Award#

35’ - BlackSize -

Brand Monoprice Super VGA M/M
CL2

33 CASE, ROTO MOLDED
RACK EXPANSION 

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$235.00
$250.00
$785.00
$205.00
No Bid
$302.00

Guitar Center $205.00#

25.5L x 26W x 15"H - BlackSize -

Brand SKB Cases 1SKB-R1906
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Bid #120-15

Due date 2-10-15

Item #

34 CD PLAYER & MINIDISC
RECORDER (COMBO)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$588.00
No Bid
$1285.00
$659.00
No Bid
$737.00

B&H Photo $588.00#

19”W x 3.7”H x 12.1”D -
Black

Size -

Brand Tascam #MD-CD1MKIII

35 CD RECORDER/PLAYER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$419.00
No Bid
$880.00
$415.00
No Bid
$468.00

Guitar Center $415.00#

19.0 x 3.7 x 12.2" - BlackSize -

Brand Tascam CD-RW901MKII

36 COMPRESSOR / LIMITER
/ GATE

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$96.44
$155.00
No Bid
$102.00
No Bid
$174.00

B&H Photo $96.44#

1.75" x 5.75" x 19"Size -

Brand Harman DBX 266xs
#H72801000000000

37 CONNECTORS B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$35.00
$78.00
$39.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$35.00#

Size -

Brand Union Connector #15-ADU-
GF/GPM
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Item #

38 CONNECTORS B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$8.00
$10.00
$6.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $6.00#

ClearSize -

Brand Norcostco Bates #F216

39 CONNECTORS B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$8.00
$10.00
$6.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $6.00#

ClearSize -

Brand Norcostco Bates #F211

40 CONSOLE, ROTO RACK
(10X6)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$169.00
$193.00
$625.00
$135.00
No Bid
$248.00

Guitar Center $135.00#

23.25L x 23.5W x 21.25"D -
Black

Size -

Brand SKB 1SKB-R106

41 CONTROL CONSOLE,
LIGHTING

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$6890.00
$6500.00
$9100.00
$6350.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $6350.00#

5.2" H x 17.9"W x 18.2"D -
Black

Size -

Brand ETC ION-1000
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Bid #120-15

Due date 2-10-15

Item #

42 CYCLORAMA/WALL
WASH LUMINARIES

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$1899.00
$2019.00
$3600.00
$1890.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $1890.00#

Size -

Brand Altman Spectra Cyc 200
#SS-CYC-200-RGBA-BK

43 EQUALIZER, DUAL
CHANNEL

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$289.00
$337.00
$565.00
$255.00
No Bid
$364.00

Guitar Center $255.00#

5.25" H X 19" W X 7.9" D -
Black

Size -

Brand DBX 1231

44 EQUALIZER/LIMITER,
GRAPHIC

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$410.00
$484.00
$777.00
$375.00
No Bid
$514.00

Guitar Center $375.00#

3.5" H X 19" W X 7.9" D -
Black

Size -

Brand DBX Dual 31-Band #2231

45 FADER WING,
UNIVERSAL

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$1887.60
$1660.00
$3700.00
$1895.00
No Bid
No Bid

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$1660.00#

2 x 20Size -

Brand ETC FADW2X20
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Item #

46 FIXTURES, LED
  SOURCE FOUR LUSTR+

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$2177.00
$1626.00
$3000.00
$1580.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $1580.00#

BlackSize -

Brand ETC Source Four LED Lustr
+ (Full Compass #S4LEDLS
-0B)

47 FIXTURES, SCOOP (NO
CLAMP)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$253.00
$284.00
$640.00
4265.00
No Bid
No Bid

B&H Photo $253.00#

16” - blackSize -

Brand Altman 161

48 KIT, AUDIO ADAPTER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$119.00
No Bid
$270.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

B&H Photo $119.00#

Size -

Brand Comprehensive AAK-BH1

49 LED STRIP, QUAD COLOR B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$680.00
$740.00
$1500.00
$640.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $640.00#

40.25”L x 8.5”W x 9”HSize -

Brand Elation Pro Lighting ELED-
QW-STRIP
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50 LENS TUBE (EDLT) B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$209.00
$205.00
$420.00
$205.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $205.00#

BlackSize -

Brand ETC 426EDLT

51 LIGHT, LED PAR 64 B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$65.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $65.00#

7.5" H x 10.5" D x 7.5" WSize -

Brand Lighting LED PAR 64

52 LIGHT, MUSIC STAND
(ORCHESTRA)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$49.00
No Bid
No Bid
$37.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $37.00#

Size -

Brand Mighty Birght 53510

53 LOUDSPEAKER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$345.00
$365.00
$705.00
$345.00
$295.00
$356.00

Troxell
Communications

$295.00#

11.8 x 11.8 x 12.0Size -

Brand JBL AWC82

54 MICROPHONE,
SUBMINIATURE

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$66.68
$66.00
$142.00
$68.00
No Bid
$95.00

Creative Lighting &
Sound

$66.00#

Size -

Brand Shure WL93T
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Bid #120-15
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Item #

55 MICROPHONE, VOCAL
CARDIOID

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$89.53
$88.00
$180.00
$79.00
No Bid
$96.00

Guitar Center $79.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Shure SM58-LC

56 MIP WALL PLATE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$135.00
No Bid
$103.00
No Bid
$132.00

Guitar Center $103.00#

Size -

Brand Whirlwind MIP3S

57 MIXER, POWERED B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$774.99
No Bid
$1500.00
$715.00
No Bid
$869.00

Guitar Center $715.00#

17-3/8" x 19-3/8" x 6-1/8" -
Black

Size -

Brand Yamaha EMX5016CF

58 MIXER, RACKMOUNT B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$250.00
No Bid
$529.00
$245.00
No Bid
$284.00

Guitar Center $245.00#

5.25”H x 6.25”D x 19”WSize -

Brand Alesis MultiMix 10

59 MOUNT, TILT TV B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid#

3”L x 27”W x 3.5”H - BlackSize -

Brand Stanley Tlr-ec3211t
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Bid #120-15
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Item #

60 OPTICAL SPLITTER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$103.00
No Bid
$260.00
$76.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $76.00#

9 x 5.3 x 1.8in - BlackSize -

Brand Chauvet Data Stream 4

61 PORTASTUDIO, DIGITAL B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$274.87
No Bid
$499.00
$267.00
No Bid
$254.00

Westlake Pro $254.00#

11.4"W x 2.1"H x 8.2"DSize -

Brand Tascam DP-03

62 POWER CONDITIONER B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$137.04
$150.00
$360.00
$113.00
No Bid
$183.00

Guitar Center $113.00#

19” W x 10.5” D x 1.75” HSize -

Brand Furman PL-8C

63 PROJECTOR, DIGITAL B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$2875.00 Alt
No Bid
$2830.00
$2635.79
No Bid

Troxell
Communications

$2635.79#

Size -

Brand Hitachi CP-WX8255

64 RACK MOUNT KITS B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$37.72
No Bid
$75.00
$33.00
No Bid
$63.00

Guitar Center $33.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Yamaha RK5014
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65 RACK, DESKTOP B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
$680.00
$285.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $285.00#

18.18”D x 17.20”D - BlackSize -

Brand Lowell LDRF-1418

66 RECEIVER, STEREO
(NATURAL SOUND)

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$295.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

B&H Photo $295.00#

17-1/8"W x 6"H x 15-1/4"D -
Black

Size -

Brand Yamaha R-S500BL

67 REMOTE CONTROL,
WIRELESS

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$830.00
$1770.00
$2700.00
$2020.00
No Bid
No Bid

B&H Photo $830.00#

Size -

Brand ETC Radio Focus Remote
(RFR) #Net3-RFR

68 SCANNER, LED B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$575.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $575.00#

Size -

Brand American DJ #VIZISCANLP
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69 SCREEN, PROJECTOR B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$129.00  Alt*
No Bid
No Bid
$990.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

106” diagonal - 69.6" H x
101.1" W x 3.1" D

Size -

Brand Elite Screens
#ELECTRIC106X

70 SHELF, AUDIO VIDEO B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$83.19 Alt.
$65.00
$150.00
$40.00
No Bid
$51.00

Guitar Center $40.00#

17”W x 11”D x 3.37" HSize -

Brand SKB Cases 1SKB-AV

71 SPEAKER, BOOKSHELF B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid#

19" H x 9.25" W x 12.3" DSize -

Brand Klipsch RB-81 II #1011850

72 STAND, MICROPHONE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$100.00
$270.00
$69.00
No Bid
$49.00

Westlake Pro $49.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Ultimate Support TOUR-MT
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73 SUBWOOFER, POWERED B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$850.00
$1000.00
$1745.00
$805.00
$1092.11
$1011.00

Guitar Center $805.00#

 14"W x 26"H x 28-1/10"D
(including casters)

Size -

Brand QSC KSub

74 SUBWOOFER, POWERED B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid#

16”H x 14.5”W x 19”D -
Black pica

Size -

Brand Klipsch SW-112

75 SYSTEM, PA B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
$275.00
$490.00
$230.00
No Bid
$259.00

Guitar Center $230.00#

Size -

Brand TC-Helicon VoiceSolo
FX150

76 SYSTEM, SOUND
   ALL-IN-ONE PORTABLE

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$1480.00
No Bid
$2878.00
$1695.00
$1469.83
No Bid

Troxell
Communications

$1469.83#

Size -

Brand Amplivox Digital Audio
Travel Partner #SW915
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77 TAPE, CLOTH B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$11.00
No Bid
$26.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

B&H Photo $11.00#

1/2” x 20 yds - 4 Fluorescent
Colors

Size -

Brand Pro Spike Stack
#001UPCGS1220MFLUOR

78 TAPE, CONSOLE B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
$15.00
$6.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center 6.00#

Size -

Brand Norcostco #T414

79 TAPE, GAFF B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
$25.00
$13.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $13.00#

2"W x 55 YDS - BlackSize -

Brand Pro-Gaff (Norcostco #T406)

80 TELEVISION, HDTV B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid#

50” - BlackSize -

Brand RCA LED50B45RQ
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81 TOOL LEASH B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
$40.00
$24.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $24.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Setwear (Norcostco #B653)

82 WIRELESS SYSTEM
   DUAL CHANNEL
COMBO

B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$403.29
$510.00
$788.00
$395.00
No Bid
$509.00

Guitar Center $395.00#

Size -

Brand Shure BLX1288/CVL

83 WRENCH, MEGA-COMBO B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

No Bid
No Bid
$30.00
$12.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $12.00#

Silver/BlackSize -

Brand Norcostco #B637

84 YOKE KIT B&H Photo
Creative Lighting & Sound
Norcostco
Guitar Center
Troxell Communications
Westlake Pro

$56.25
$56.25
$110.00
$49.00
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center $49.00#

BlackSize -

Brand Altman SSCYC200-YOKE-B


