(907)714-8876

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669

bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

FAX (907)262-7165

Page 1 of 23

RECAP

Bid #122-15
Due Date: 2-17-2015

[ Iltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

001 |CONFERENCE TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 894.26
OCTAGONAL Arctic Office Products  1040.00
Size- [06"L x 42"W x 295H  Lewis & Lewis 894.26
Brand [LESRO INDUSTRIES INC School Specialty 1136.41
Bid- ICONTEMPORARY Series  Staples 979.00
Model V1896T6
#153602
002 CONFERENCE TABLE Alaska Education 922.00 Lewis & Lewis 765.24
BOAT-SHAPE Arctic Office Products  769.00
Size- [06"L x 48" W x 29H Lewis & Lewis 765.24
Brand |MAYLINE CSIl ACCORDE  School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |Series Model R94BP Staples 794.00
(National Business Furniture
#40583)
#153644
003 DESK Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 448.14
RIGHT PEDESTAL Arctic Office Products 529.00
Size- [66"L x 30"D x 29-1/2 H Lewis & Lewis 448.14
Brand [HON 10500 Series School Specialty 588.01
Bid - #10583RNN Staples 524.00
#153447
004 DESK Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 349.42
LEFT RETURN Arctic Office Products  398.00
Size- K8"L x 24"D x 29-1/2 H Lewis & Lewis 349.42
Brand |HON 10500 Series School Specialty 445.41
Bid - #10516LNN Staples 397.00
#153447

* Does Not Meet Specifications

** No Specificiations Provided

****Draw

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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005 |DESK DRAWER Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 68.95
CENTER Arctic Office Products  72.00
size- [22°W x 15.375"D x 25"  Lewis & Lewis 68.95
Brand [HON #1522 School Specialty 80.43
Bid - Staples 72.00
#153447
006  |[KEYBOARD PLATFORM  Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 76.30
Size - Arctic Office Products  79.00
Brand |HON Slide Away #4022C Lewis & Lewis 76.30
Bid - e Away School Specialty 85.13
Staples 79.00
#153447
007 |STANDING DESK UNIT Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  319.18
Size - Arctic Office Products No Bid
Brand |VARIDESK SINGLE PLUS Lewis & Lewis 233.92
Bid - School Specialty 319.18 Alt
Staples No Bid
#153652
008  ISTAND-UP WORKSTATION Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 194.61
Size - |Cherry Arcti.c Office .Products 239.00
Brand |SAFECO PRODUCTS MUV Lewis & Lews 194.61
Bid - L1923CY School Specialty 246.52
Staples 239.00
#153621
009 IpESK SHELL Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 200.94
Size- |60"W x 30°D x 29" H AI’C'[I.C Office .Products 220.00
_ Lewis & Lewis 200.94 Alt
Brand |OFFICE SOURCE PL Series : :
Bid- |pL103 School Specialty No Bid
1. Staples No Bid

(Officefurniture2go.com #10

KDA118)

#153631
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[ Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
ol0  |OFFICE DESK Alaska Education No Bid
Size- [59.5"W x 967D x 68.75"H Arctl_c Office _Products No B!d
Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand [SAUDER VIA COLLECTION : :
Bid- |y13282 School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
#153646
011 DESK Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 249.55
BOW FRONT Arctic Office Products  715.00
Size- [29-1/2"Hx 42"D x 71"W  Lewis & Lewis 249.55 Alt
Brand INational Business Furniture ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |Signature Series Staples 913.00
Contemporary Collection
15774
#153640
012 loFFICE DESK Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 720.00
Size- [71"W x 71D x 29" H Arctic Office .Products 720.00
Lewis & Lewis 1632.96 Hon
Brand [NATIONAL BUSINESS School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  |FURNITURE #13156 choot specially 0 Bl
Staples 1135.00
#153646
013 |TEACHER DESK Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 565.00
DOUBLE PEDESTAL Arctic Office Products 565.00 Alt
Size- [60"W x 30"D x 29-1/2'H  Lewis & Lewis 645.16 Alt
Brand |SCHOOL FIX #TDL6030 School Specialty 677.99 Alt
Bid - Staples No Bid
#153659
014 TEACHER DESK Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 458.00
SINGLE PEDESTAL Arctic Office Products  458.00 Alt
Size- [48"W x 30"D x 29-1/2"H  Lewis & Lewis 522.36 Alt
Brand [SCHOOL FIX School Specialty 461.85 Alt
Bid - #TDL4830BLACKGRAYNEB Staples No Bid

#153659




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
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Page 4_of 23
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Due Date: 2-17-2015

[ ltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand

015 DESK Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 619.35
DOUBLE PEDESTAL Arctic Office Products  734.00
Size - [29-1/2" high X 60" wide X  Lewis & Lewis 619.35
Brand |HON 38000 Series School Specialty 771.42
Bid - #H38155NS Staples 702.00
#153675
016 RETURN, FLUSH Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 386.42
RIGHT Arctic Office Products ~ 449.00
Size- [29-1/2"Hx24"D x 48"W  Lewis & Lewis 386.42
Brand [HON 38000 Series School Specialty 476.58
Bid - 38215RNS Staples 418.00
#153675
017 PEDESTAL DESK Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 586.80
LEFT Arctic Office Products  679.00
Size- [29-1/2"H x 30"D x 66"W  Lewis & Lewis 586.80
Brand |HON 38000 Series School Specialty 720.68
Bid - 1382921 NS Staples 637.00
#153675
018 |DESK, DOUBLE PEDESTAL Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 503.32
STEEL Arctic Office Products  612.00
size- [29-1/2Hx 30D x 60°W  Lewis & Lewis 503.32
Brand |HON MENTOR #A88962DS ~ School Specialty 627.59
Bid - Staples 561.00
#153618
019 DESK MOUNTED Alaska Education No Bid Staples 272.00
O\?VTTSI—T?)IJIELNMONITOR Arctic Office Products 288.00
_ Lewis & Lewis 298.68
Size- [42'H x 27.63'W x 30'D  gepqo Specialty 371.33
Brand |BALT UP-RITE #90531 Staples 272.00

Bid -

#153646




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 5 of 23
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
1
) (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #122-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 2-17-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
020  |DESK Alaska Education 179.00 Lewis & Lewis 172.80
Size- |29.8"H x 35.6"W x 26.8" Arctl_c Office _Products 259.00
Lewis & Lewis 172.80
Brand |BUSH INDUSTRIES SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |n #WC90436A P y
Staples 175.00
#153725
021  |HUTCH Alaska Education 399.00 Lewis & Lewis 339.74
Size- |18-1/4"H x 63'W x 15" D Arctl_c Office _Products 379.00
Lewis & Lewis 339.74
orand IMAYLINE OFFICE School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  [FURNITURE MEDINA P y
COLLECTION Model Staples 378.00
MNH63
#153609
022 |FILE Alaska Education 266.00 Alaska Education 266.00
LATERAL Arctic Office Products  472.00 Alt
Size- 27"W x 19-1/2'D x 30 Lewis & Lewis 384.00 Alt
Brand |BUSH FURNITURE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - IBENNINGTON Staples No Bid
COLLECTION #WC65554-03
#153686
023 FILE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 325.00
LATERAL Arctic Office Products  459.00
size- [30"W x 185/8"D x 41'H  Lewis & Lewis 516.89
Brand |HIRSH INDUSTRIES School Specialty 512.72 Alt
Bid - [(ATD American #190001) Staples 325.00

#153469




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

Page 6 _of 23
139 E. Park Avenue
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& (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #122-15

bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 2-17-2015

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted

024 |FILE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 484.00
LATERAL Arctic Office Products  484.00 Alt
Size- [36”W x 18.63"D x 68.63" Lewis & Lewis 850.98 Alt
Brand |HIRSH INDUSTRIES School Specialty 802.69 Alt
Bid - |HL10000 Series Commercial ~Staples No Bid
#153685
025 FILE Alaska Education No Bid No Award
VERTICAL Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - [35.5"H x 14.25"W x 18"D |Lewis & Lewis 217.34 Alt
Brand |OFFICEDESIGNS Model School Specialty No Bid
Bid- (17438 Staples No Bid
#153618
026 [FILE CREDENZA Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 668.62
Size- |62"W x 18-7/8"D x 29" H Arctic Office .Products 1420.00 Alt
Lewis & Lewis 668.62 Alt
srand VIRCO PLATEAU SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid - WpTCF2062FCFL P y :
Staples No Bid
#153621
027 SINGLE LD WITH Alaska Education No Bid Staples 443.00
WORKSURFACE + Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - Lewis & Lewis 451.40
Brand [ERGOTRON WORKFIT-A School Specialty No Bid
Bid - 124-317-026 Staples 443.00
#153397
028 IDESK, ADJUSTABLE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 729.00
Size - |p6"- 46.5"H Arcti.c Office .Products 729.QO
Brand |ERGO DEPOT ADL17 Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Bid - School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid

#153621




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 7_of 23
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 REC_AP
b |
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bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 2-17-2015
[ ltem # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
029 ORKSURFACE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 182.00
CORNER Arctic Office Products  259.00
Lewis & Lewis No Bid
_ School Specialty No Bid
- |p4"D x 48"W
Size- 24D x Staples 182.00
Brand |ALLSTEEL #834824RA
Bid -
#153917
030 IWORKSURFACE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 64.00
PRIMARY Arctic Office Products  99.00
Size- |24 D x 24" W Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #832424A School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 64.00
#153917
031 I\NORKSURFACE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 68.00
PRIMARY Arctic Office Products  99.00
size- [24’D x 30"W Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #832430A School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 68.00
#153917
032 |SUPPORT, END PANEL Alaska Education No Bid Staples 60.00
FREESTANDING Arctic Office Products  89.00
Size- [24"D x 29-1/2"H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #CEP2429F School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 60.00
#153917
033 |SUPPORT, END PANEL Alaska Education No Bid Staples 54.00
FREESTANDING Arctic Office Products  79.00
size- [24’D x 29-1/2" H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #CSL2429F School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 54.00

#153917
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Bid #122-15
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034 |MODESTY PANEL Alaska Education No Bid Staples 42.00
FULL HEIGHT Arctic Office Products  72.00
Size- [24"W x 29-1/2"H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #CS249 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 42.00
#153917
035 |MODESTLY PANEL Alaska Education No Bid Staples 45.00
FULL HEIGHT Arctic Office Products  74.00
size- [29-1/2"H x 30" W Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #CS309 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 45.00
#153917
036 |MODESTY PANEL Alaska Education No Bid Staples 50.00
FULL HEIGHT Arctic Office Products  85.00
Size - |48" W x 29-1/2" H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand IALLSTEEL #CS489 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 50.00
#153917
037 |LEG Alaska Education No Bid Staples 39.00
CORNER Arctic Office Products  62.00
size - [29-1/2" H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |ALLSTEEL #CDL29 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 39.00
#153917
038 [FILE CABINET, MOBILE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 218.00
Size- |8 H x 19-7/8" D Arctic Office _Products 319.00
Brand |ALLSTEEL #PM187-203B Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Bid - ) School Specialty No Bid
Staples 218.00

#153917
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[ ltem # Description
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Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

039 |cENTER DRAWER Alaska Education No Bid Staples 48.00
Size- [3'H x 14-3/4°D x 19°W Arctic Office Products 76.00
Brand IALLSTEEL 4CSDCL9 Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Bid - School Specialty No Bid
Staples 48.00
#153917
040 |KEYBOARD TRAY WITH  Alaska Education No Bid Staples 197.00
CLIP MOUSE Arctic Office Products  247.00
Size - Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |HUMANSCALE #6G 900 90 ~ School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 197.00
#153917
041  |DESK Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 360.00
Size- [48"W x 24°D x 29-1/2°H Arctic Office Products  360.00
_ Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand [MAXON SURPASS Series : :
Bid-  |uM-MDWRT2448 & #M- School Specialty No Bid
MDDS2448HP Staples No Bid
#153613
042 [PENCIL TRAY Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 49.00
Size- [48"W x 24°D x 29-1/2°H Arctl_c Office _Products 49.0Q
Brand |MAXON SURPASS Seri Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Bid - e school Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
#153613
043 IpESK Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 331.00

Size - |36”W X 24"D x 29-1/2"H

Brand [MAXON SURPASS Series
Bid-  [#M-MDWRT2436 & #M-
MDDS2436HP

#153613

Arctic Office Products 331.00

Lewis & Lewis No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid
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044 [RETURN / BRIDGE SHELL  Alaska Education 126.00 Lewis & Lewis 104.66
Size - [47-1/4"W x 23-5/8"D x 29 Arctic Office Products 220.00
Brand [ALEVA VALENCIA Series ;e\;]ws l&SLew!sl ¢ ;0456.2
Bid-  |#VA35-4824MY chool Specialty 0 bl
(Northern Office Furniture Staples 148.00
ALEVA354824MY)
#153731
045 IpESK SHELL Alaska Education 183.00 Lewis & Lewis 159.12
Size - |65"W % 29-1/2°D x 29 Arctic Office Products 372.00
Brand [ALEVA VALENCIA Series ;e\;lws l&SLew!sl ¢ ;5981d2
Bid - l#\A21-6630MY chool specialty o bl
(Northern Office Furniture Staples 226.00
ALEVA216630MY)
#153731
046 [PEDESTAL FILE Alaska Education 183.00 Lewis & Lewis 139.06
Size- [15-5/8"W x 20-1/2"D x 28 Arctic Office .Products 279.00
Brand [ALEVA VALENCIA Series ;e\;]ws ;&SLew!sl ¢ ;39802
Bid - lx/A53-2822MY chool specialty O bl
(Northern Office Furniture Staples 187.00
ALEVA532822MY)
#153731
047 [PEDESTAL FILE Alaska Education 183.00 Lewis & Lewis 139.06

Size - |15-5/8”W x 20-1/2"D x 28

Brand |ALEVA VALENCIA Series
Bid - tvA54-2822MY
(Northern Office Furniture
ALEVA542822MY)

#153731

Arctic Office Products 279.00

Lewis & Lewis 139.06
School Specialty No Bid
Staples 187.00
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048 KEYBOARD / MOUSE Alaska Education 37.00 Lewis & Lewis 29.34
SHEU'-,\'I:DERDESK Arctic Office Products  71.00
_ Lewis & Lewis 29.34
Size- [28"W x 12D School Specialty No Bid
Brand |ALEVA VALENCIA Series Staples 38.00
Bid - #VA31-2821MY
(Northern Office Furniture
#ALEVA312812MY)
#153731
049 FILE Alaska Education 277.00 Lewis & Lewis 228.34
LATERAL Arctic Office Products  489.00
Size - [34”W x 22-3/4"D x 29 Lewis & Lewis 228.34
Brand |ALEVA VALENCIA Series School Specialty No Bid
Bid - VA51-3622MY Staples 315.00
(Northern Office Furniture
#ALEVA513622MY)
#153731
0so  |DESK Alaska Education 318.00 Staples 202.00
Size- |60"W x 30°H x 27" D Arctl_c Office _Products 269.00
Lewis & Lewis 224.40
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |A #WC14560A P y
Staples 202.00
#153609
051 DESK Alaska Education No Bid Staples 249.00
WITH PENCIL DRAWER  Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - [48"W Lewis & Lewis 312.30 Alt
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - SMA009TP Staples 249.00

#153609
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052 |DESK Alaska Education 197.00 Lewis & Lewis 189.31
Size- [48"W x 30"H x 27" D Arctic Office Products  229.00
Lewis & Lewis 189.31
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES : :
Bid - L#W014548A School Specialty No Bid
Staples 192.00
#153609
053 |DESK Alaska Education 179.00 Lewis & Lewis 172.80
Size- [36"W x 30"H x 27" D Arctic Office Products 209.00
Lewis & Lewis 172.80
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES : :
Bid - \A#WCl4536A School Specialty No Bid
Staples 173.00
#153609
054  ICORNER HUTCH Alaska Education 463.00 Lewis & Lewis 447.72
Size- [47.25"W x 36.50" H x Arctic Office Products 529.00
Lewis & Lewis 447.72
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES : :
Bid-  |a #WC14567 School Specialty No Bid
Staples 449.00
#153609
055 lHuTCH Alaska Education 308.00 Lewis & Lewis 293.86
Size- W7-1/2’W x 13-7/8'D x 36 Arctic Office Products  349.00
Lewis & Lewis 293.86
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES : :
Bid - HWC14549 School Specialty No Bid
Staples 296.00
#153609
056 FILE Alaska Education 388.00 Lewis & Lewis 372.22
LATERAL Arctic Office Products ~ 459.00
Size - [35.75" W x 29-875"H X Lewis & Lewis 372.22
Brand |BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |a #WC14554ASU Staples 524.00

#153609




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 13 of 23
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669 M
b |
) (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #122-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 2-17-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
057 FILE CABINET Alaska Education 261.00 Lewis & Lewis 253.99
MOBILE Arctic Office Products 274.00
Size - [15.5"W x 20-25"D x Lewis & Lewis 253.99
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialty No Bid
Bid - A #WC14552SU Staples 313.00
#153609
058 FILE CABINET Alaska Education 245.00 Lewis & Lewis 229.84
MOBILE Arctic Office Products  498.00
Size - |15.5"W x 20-25"D x Lewis & Lewis 229.64
Brand [BUSH FURNITURE SERIES School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |a #WC14553SU Staples 317.00
#153609
0s9  |PENCIL DRAWER Alaska Education 85.00 Staples 59.00
Size - [Black Arcti.c Office .Products 89.00
Lewis & Lewis 80.91
Brand |BUSH FURNITURE SERIES : .
Bid - #AC99850 School Specialty No Bid
Staples 59.00
#153609
060 ICENTER DRAWER Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  104.32
size- |20"W x 16D Arcti.c Office .Products 125.QO
Brand |OFFICE STAR MENDOCINA Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Bid-  |COLLECTION School Specialty 104.32
(National Business Furniture Staples 115.00
90903)
#153618
061  |[KEYBOARD DRAWER Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 31.99
Size- |2.13H x 22'L x 11.63'D Arctic Office .Products 39.00
Lewis & Lewis 31.99
Brand |FELLOWES OFFICE SUITES : :
Bid-  |49140303 School Specialty No Bid
Staples 50.00

#153731




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department Page 14 of 23
139 E. Park Avenue
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1
- (907)714-8876  FAX (907)262-7165 Bid #122-15
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us Due Date: 2-17-2015
[ ltem# Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]
062 |BOOKCASE Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 196.06
STEEL Arctic Office Products  223.00
size - |Light Gray Lewis & Lewis 196.06
Brand |HON #S72ABCQ School Specialty 251.82
Bid - Staples 224.00
#153659
063  |[BOOKCASE Alaska Education No Bid No Award
Size- |13 Deep x 60" High x 30" Arctl_c Office _Products No Bid
Lewis & Lewis 219.73 Alt
Brand [NORWOOD COMMERCIAL School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |FURNITURE Norwood Series = 100! SPeCIally o Bl
Staples No Bid
#153471
064 [BookcASE Alaska Education No Bid No Award
Size- |13 Deep x 30" High x 30" Arctic Office _Products No Bid
Lewis & Lewis 148.54 Alt
Brand [NORWOOD COMMERCIAL School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |[FURNITURE Norwood Series = 100! SP€cialty o bl
Staples No Bid
#153469
065 BOOKCASE Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 209.00
STEEL Arctic Office Products  209.00
Size - |18’ Deep x 30" High x 36"  Lewis & Lewis 122.38 Alt
Brand |SANDUSKY LEE ELITE School Specialty 209.88
Bid - |Series #8BA10361830-09 Staples 238.00
#153685
066 [Bookcase Alaska Education No Bid Staples 210.00
Size- |13 Deep x 48" High x 31.5" Arctic Office _Products No Bid
Lewis & Lewis 283.47 Alt
Brand [PREPAC “SONOMA”Model School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  |4MDL-3248 chool Specialty 0 Bi
Staples 210.00

#153652
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Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

067  |BOOKCASE Alaska Education 211.00 Lewis & Lewis 180.81
Size- |11-3/4' Deep x 48" High x Arctl_c Office _Products 358.00
Brand IALERA #ALEBCS44836MY Lewis & Lewis 180.81
Bid - School Specialty No Bid
Staples 241.00
#153685
068 [Bookcase Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  320.01
Size- |36"W x 16'D x 49" H AI’C'[I.C Office .Products 626.00
Brand [OFFICE STAR Mendogino Lewis & Lewis 130.42 Alt
Bid-  |Collection School Specialty 320.01
(National Business Furniture Staples 574.00
32768)
#153618
069 [Bookcase Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 199.00
Size- |30"W x 12-3/4'D x 72" H Arctl_c Office _Products 199.00
Lewis & Lewis 821.51 Alt
orand. [BUSH BENNINGTON School Specialt No Bid
Bid - |Collection #WC65515-03 pecialty !
Staples No Bid
#153686
070 |TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid No Award
MID-BACK Arctic Office Products  229.00 Alt
size- [43-34"H x 39-U2°W x  Lewis & Lewis 118.39 Alt
Brand |QUANTUM REALSPACE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - IPRO 9000 Series #510830  Staples No Bid
#153456
#153504

#153505
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071 TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid No Award
MID-BACK Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - W1-1/4"H x 28-1/4"W x 27 Lewis & Lewis 118.39 Alt
Brand |REALSPACE CALUSA School Specialty No Bid
Bid - 4857562 Staples No Bid
#153521
072 TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 118.39
WITH ARMS Arctic Office Products  179.00 Alt
Lewis & Lewis 118.39 Alt
Size - |Overa|| Dimensions: 24-2/5" School Specialty No Bid
Brand |WORKPRO 769T #OM06769 Staples No Bid
Bid - |Office Max #24114815)
#153387
073 TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Staples 156.00
WITH ARMS Arctic Office Products  209.00
_ Lewis & Lewis 218.52 Alt
Size - [Black School Specialty 194.99
Brand |GLOBAL INDUSTRIES Staples 156.00
Bid-  IMESH HIGH BACK
(School Specialty #1367426;
Demco #P122-4521)
#153432
#153675
074 [rASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 93.00
Size - [Blue Arctl_c Office _Products 93.00 Alt
Brand [HON 7900 Series Lewis & Lewis 158.07
Bid- hEVERYDAY” #7901AB90T  SCnoOl Specialty No Bid
Staples No Bid

#153447
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075 TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 130.00
Arctic Office Products 130.00
Size - [18 inch Lewis & Lewis 239.30
Brand VIRCO ZUMA TASK School Specialty No Bid
Bid - ISEATING "KEYBOARDER”  Staples No Bid
# ZTASK18
#153624
076 loFFICE CHAIR Alaska Education 187.00 Alaska Education 187.00
Size - [Black AI’C'[I.C Office .Products 347.00
Lewis & Lewis 194.80
Brand [A| ERA ELUSION SERIES School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  [EL42ME10B chool specialty O bl
Staples No Bid
#153433
077 |OFFICE CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 310.00
BIG & TALL Arctic Office Products  310.00
size - [Black Lewis & Lewis 321.53 Alt
Brand [FLASH FURNITURE School Specialty No Bid
Bid - |HERCULES Series Staples No Bid
GO1235BKLEAA
#153454
078 TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 122.00
WITHOUT ARMS Arctic Office Products  122.00 Alt
Lewis & Lewis 127.42 Alt
Size - |Black fabric and mesh School Specialty 182.82
Brand |OFM INC Model 130 Staples No Bid

Bid -

#153602
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079 TASK STOOL Alaska Education No Bid Staples 189.00
Arctic Office Products 219.00
Size - |Black fabric and mesh Lewis & Lewis 230.22 Alt
Brand [OFM INC MESH BACK School Specialty 262.36
Bid - |COMFYSEAT MODEL Staples 189.00
#411278
#154013
080 |MANAGERS CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Lewis & Lewis 137.06
Arctic Office Products 239.00
Size - |Black fabric and mesh Lewis & Lewis 137.06 Alt
Brand |OFFICE STAR PRODUCTS School Specialty 225.85
Bid- 5500 PROFESSIONAL Staples 209.00
DARK ARI GRID BACK
#153665
081 OFFICE CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid
WITH ARMS Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - [Black Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand [HERMAN MILLER “AERON" School Specialty No Bid
Bid - WAE123AWB Staples No Bid
#153640
082 OFFICE CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid
WIO ARMS Arctic Office Products No Bid
Size - [Black Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand [HERMAN MILLER “AERON” School Specialty No Bid
Bid - WAE123AWB Staples No Bid

#153640
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083 IWORK sSTOOL Alaska Education No Bid
Size - |size B Arctl_c Office _Products No B!d
Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |HERMAN MILLER “AERON” School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  [¥AE713AWBGL/AJNNBBBK3 SCN00! Specially o Bl
DO Staples No Bid
#153618
084 |TASK CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Staples 97.00
WIDE SEAT W/IO ARMS  Arctic Office Products  164.00
Size - |Black frame and fabric Lewis & Lewis 358.39 Alt
Brand [BOSS #B9090-BK School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 97.00
#153652
085 lcuesT cHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Staples 268.00
Size - Arctic Office Products No Bid
Lewis & Lewis 199.60 Alt
Brand [NATIONAL BUSINESS School Specialt No Bid
Bid-  JFURNITURE SYMPHONY chool speclalty 0 Bl
COLLECTION #75338 Staples 268.00
#153665
086  IGUEST CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty ~ 184.44
Size- |23-2/3'W x 23-3/4D x 36 Arctl_c Office _Products 219.00
Brand |HON BASYX Lewis & Lewis 187.78
Bid - L'BSXVL853NSP11 School Specialty 184.44
Staples 202.00
#153733
087 |GUEST CHAIR Alaska Education 228.00 Lewis & Lewis 178.57
STACKING Arctic Office Products  286.00
Size - |Black Frame; Black Mesh Lewis & Lewis 178.57
Brand |ALERA Model EK43ME10B  School Specialty No Bid
Bid - Staples 224.00

#153606
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088 GUEST CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 174.00
Arctic Office Products 174.00
size- [22"W x 25"D x 33"H Lewis & Lewis 225.70 Alt
Brand [MLP Seating #7201 School Specialty No Bid
Bid - [(National Business Furniture ~ Staples 250.00
#53819)
#153644
0ss  INESTING CHAIR Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 139.00
Size - Arctic Office Products 139.00 Alt
Brand ki TORSION ON THE GO! Lewis & Lewis 182.86 Alt
Bid - L'TGW APB School Specialty 416.45
Staples 400.00
#153665
090 lsoFA Alaska Education No Bid Arctic Office 1209.00
Size- [74"W x 32D x 32'H AI’C'[I.C Office .Products 1209.00
Brand [COMMUNITY HUDSON Lewis & Lewis 600.42 Alt
Bid- | OUNGE FURNITURE School Specialty 1427:58
(Demco #P121-5584) Staples No Bid
#153439
091 COUCH Alaska Education 685.00 Lewis & Lewis 521.84
LOVESEAT Arctic Office Products  589.00
Size- [485"W x 26"D x 325"H  Lewis & Lewis 521.84
Brand [LESRO BELMONT School Specialty 728.88
Bid-  [COLLECTION #G1551K4 Staples 670.00
(National Business Furniture
#53982)

#153644
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092 CHAIR Alaska Education 620.00 Lewis & Lewis 416.16
LARGE Arctic Office Products  459.00
Size- [29.5"W x 26"D x 325"H  Lewis & Lewis 416.16
Brand |LESRO BELMONT School Specialty 510.98
Bid- ICOLLECTION #G1651K4  Staples 554.00
(National Business Furniture
#53982)
#153644
093 |SORTING TABLE BASE Alaska Education 425.00 Lewis & Lewis 346.83
Size- |60°W x 28”-36"H x 30°D Arctic Office Products  379.00
Brand [SAFCO E-Z SORT SORTING Lewis & Lewis 340.83
Bid- |TABLE BASE 7749BL School Specialty 386.83
ES3470-7749BL Staples 410.00
#153463
094 |SORTING TABLE TOP Alaska Education 209.00 Lewis & Lewis 159.54
Size- |60°W x 1"H x 30°D Arctic Office Products 182.00
Brand [SAFCO E.7 SORT TABLE Lewis & Lewis 159.54
Bid-  |rop 77500y School Specialty 208.89
ES3471 Staples 198.00
#153463
095  [SLOT SORTERMODULE  Alaska Education 278.00 Lewis & Lewis 243.32
Size- [575"W x 14.25'H x 13'D Arctl_c Office _Products 269.00
Brand [SAFCO E-Z SORT SORTER Lewis & Lewls 243.32
Bid- |MODULE 775161 School Specialty 286.97
ES3472-7751BL Staples 292.00

#153463




(907)714-8876

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department
139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska 99669
FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 22 of 23

RECAP

Bid #122-15
Due Date: 2-17-2015

[ ltem # Description
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096 |SORTING TABLERISER  Alaska Education 157.00 Lewis & Lewis 146.96
Size - |57.5,,W % 14"H x 13" D Arctic Office Products 154.00
Brand |SAFCO E.2 SORT RISER Lewis & Lewis 146.96
Bid- |77508L School Specialty 160.60
Staples 165.00
#153463
097 |SORTING MAIL TRAYS Alaska Education 36.00 Lewis & Lewis 30.77
Size - |11,,W x 125D Arctl_c Office _Products 33.00
Brand [SAFCO E.Z SORT Lewis & Lewis 30.77
Bid- |ADDITIONAL MAIL TRAYs ~ oCN00l Specialty 33.48
2753BL Staples 36.00
#153463
098 STORAGE CART Alaska Education No Bid
WIDE Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size - [20"W x 14D x 57" H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |STANTON 14-DRAWER School Specialty No Bid
Bid- 402011 Staples No Bid
#153613
099 STORAGE CART Alaska Education No Bid
WIDE Arctic Office Products  No Bid
Size- |20"W x 14D x 41"H Lewis & Lewis No Bid
Brand |STANTON 6 + 2 DRAWER  School Specialty No Bid
Bid - 1402009 Staples No Bid
#153613
100 [END TABLE Alaska Education No Bid School Specialty  283.72
Size - |22,,W % 22D x 21" H AI’C'[I.C Office .Products 309.00
Brand |HIGH POINT FURNITURE Lewis & Lewis 346.78 Alt
Bid- |NEXSTEP COLLECTION School Specialty 283.72
793MAH Staples 289.00

#153644
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101  |coFFEe TABLE Alaska Education No Bid Staples 387.00
Size- [47.25"W x 23.5'D x 18" H Arctl_c Office _Products 410.00
Brand |HIGH POINT EURNITURE Lewis & Lewis 108.37 Alt
Bid- [NEXSTEP COLLECTION School Specialty 388.20
Z90MAH Staples 387.00

#153644




