KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Page 1 of 12

Purchasing Department
F 139 E. Park Avenue RECAP
g Soldotna, Alaska 99669 Bid #121-15
W

here kids come first ~ (907) 714-8876  FAX (907) 262-7165 Dated: 2-13-15
(Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }
# 01 IABMATS Alaska Education No Bid Power Systems Inc. $26.75
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $27.41
Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid

Size -15"L x 12"W x 2-1/2"H -

MAFC LLC $28.00
Black .
Nasco No Bid
Brand IAbMat #AB10 Power Systems Inc. $26.76
Rep Fitness $20.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 02 BACKBOARDS, WALL- Alaska Education No Bid No Bid
MOUNT Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
. R - . Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size —60. Wide x 38" High x 3/8 MAFEC LLC No Bid
Thick .
Nasco No Bid
Brand |Goalsetter GS60 Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness No Bid
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 03 BALL, MEDICINE Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $59.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $40.64 Alt*
_ Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -10 Ib. MAFC LLC $59.00 Alt
Brand |Dynamax Accelerator Il Nasco $18.50 Alt*
(Power Systems 24005-10) power Systems Inc. $72.27
Rep Fitness $60.00 Altr*+*
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $49.28 Alt*

* Does Not Meet Specifications  ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB: Soldotna ****Draw *****No Award-bid as all or none >>All or None
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# 04 |BALL, MEDICINE Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $63.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $49.14 Alt
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -12lb. MAFC LLC $63.00 Alt
Brand [Dynamax Stout | (Power Nasco No Bid
Systems 24005-12) Power Systems Inc. $77.13
Rep Fitness $65.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $55.56 Alt
# 05  [BALL, MEDICINE Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $47.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $22.74 Alt
, Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -4 Ib. MAFC LLC $47.00 Alt
Brand [Dynamax Stinger | (Power Nasco $13.48 Alt
Systems 24005-04) Power Systems Inc. $57.69
Rep Fitness $50.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $37.98 Alt
# 06 BALL, MEDICINE Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $51.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $27.24 Alt
_ Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -6 1b. MAFC LLC $51.00 Alt
Brand |Dynamax Stinger Il (Power Nasco $13.18 Alt
Systems 24005-06) Power Systems Inc. $62.55
Rep Fitness $50.00 Altr**
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $43.00 Alt
# 07  [BALL, MEDICINE Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $55.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $31.84 Alt
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -8 Ib. MAFC LLC $55.00 Alt
Brand [Dynamax Accelerator | Nasco $15.65 Alt
(Power Systems 24005-08)  power Systems Inc. $67.41
Rep Fitness $55.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid

School Specialty Inc. $49.28 Alt
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# 08 |BALL, SLAM Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $24.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $29.24 Alt*
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -10 Ib. MAFC LLC $24.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness Echo Slam  Nasco No Bid
Ball #1P0200 Power Systems Inc. $23.48 Alt
Rep Fitness $30.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $110.48 Alt
# 09  [BALL, SLAM Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $28.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $32.44 Al
, Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -15 Ib. MAFC LLC $28.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness Echo Slam  Nasco $44.71 Alt
Ball #1P0201 Power Systems Inc. $28.63 Alt
Rep Fitness $40.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $145.08 Alt
#10 [BALL, SLAM Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $35.74 Alt*
_ Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -201b. MAFG LG $32.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness Echo Slam  Nasco $53.20 Alt
Ball #1P0202 Power Systems Inc. $33.78 Alt
Rep Fitness $50.00 Altr**
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 11 BALL, SLAM Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $35.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $38.94 Alt*
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -25 lb. MAFC LLC $35.00 Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness Echo Slam  Nasco $60.91 Alt
Ball #1P0203 Power Systems Inc. $38.94 Alt
Rep Fitness $60.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
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# 12 |BALL, SLAM Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $42.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $42.24 Alt*
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -30 lb. MAFC LLC $42.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness Echo Slam  Nasco $73.91 Alt
Ball #1P0204 Power Systems Inc. $47.09 Alt
Rep Fitness $65.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 14  [BANDS, RESISTANCE Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $12.88 Alt*
, Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -#4 - Black MAFC LLC $36.00 Alt*
Brand [Rogue Fitness #HB0004-2 Nasco $65.83 Alt*
Power Systems Inc. $40.40 Alt*
Rep Fitness $64.000 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $2946.70 Alt*
# 15 BANDS, RESISTANCE Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $15.88 Alt*
_ Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -#5 - Purple MAFC LLC $44.00 Alt*
Brand |Rogue Fitness #HB0005-2 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $53.27 Alt*
Rep Fitness $90.00 Altr**
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $132.66 Alt*
# 16  [BANDS, RESISTANCE Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $12.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $15.88 Alt*
Size -Micro #0 - Orange ulin;gh[{s&:Cover Sports ;‘szég Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness #HB0000-2 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $12.16 Alt
Rep Fitness $18.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $112.18 Alt*
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# 17 |BANDS, RESISTANCE Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
. - Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -Mini #1 - Red MAFC LLC $12.00 Alt*
Brand |Rogue Fitness #HB0001-2 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $15.97 Alt*
Rep Fitness $12.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 18 BANDS, RESISTANCE Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
. - Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size - Monster-mini #2 - Blue MAEC LLC $16.00 Alt*
Brand |Rogue Fitness #HB0002-2 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $24.59 Al
Rep Fitness $30.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 19 BARBELL, MEN’'S Alaska Education No Bid Gopher $234.54
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $234.54 Alt
_ Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size - 20KG MAFC LLC $235.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness Beater Bar  Nasco $101.25 Alt
LPWBEAT Power Systems Inc. $217.35 Alt
Rep Fitness $164.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 20 BARBELL, WOMEN’'S Alaska Education No Bid Gopher $207.24
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $207.24 Alt
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size - 15KG MAFC LLC $210.00 Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness The Bella 2.0 Nasco No Bid
LvRA0584—BLBR Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness $164.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
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# 21 |BUMPER PLATE Alaska Education No Bid Power Systems Inc. $19.16
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $87.24/pr Alt
Size -10 Ib - 17.72’D X 1"W u”A”;pCh[{SCCO\’er Sports g‘?ﬁg Al
Brand [Rogue HG #RFGR10 Nasco $26.24 Alt*
Power Systems Inc. $19.16 Alt
Rep Fitness $20.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 22 BUMPER PLATE Alaska Education No Bid Power Systems Inc. $28.73
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $105.74/pr Alt
. » » Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -151b-17.72"D x 1-3/8"W MAEC LLC No Bid
Brand |Rogue HG #RFGR15 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $28.73 Alt
Rep Fitness $22.50 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 23 BUMPER PLATE Alaska Education No Bid Power Systems Inc. $47.89
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $134.84/pr Alt
_ " N Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -251b-17.72"D x 2"W MAEC LLC $125.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue HG #RFGR25 Nasco $51.11 Alt*
Power Systems Inc. $47.89 Alt
Rep Fitness $32.50 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 24 BUMPER PLATE Alaska Education No Bid Power Systems Inc. $67.04
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $173.74/pr Alt
Size -35 Ib - 17.72"D X 2-3/4"W u”A”;pCh[{SCCO"er Sports g‘fsg'_g o Al
Brand [Rogue HG #RFGR35 Nasco $85.95 Alt*
Power Systems Inc. $67.04 Alt
Rep Fitness $47.50 Alt+**
Riddell No Bid

School Specialty Inc. No Bid
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# 25 |BUMPER PLATE Alaska Education No Bid Power Systems Inc. $86.20
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $224.14/pr Alt
Size -45 b - 17.72"D X 3-1/4"W u”A”;pCh[{SCCO"er Sports ;\;lfg?_g o Al
Brand [Rogue HG #RFGR45 Nasco $101.23 Alt
Power Systems Inc. $86.20 Alt
Rep Fitness $57.50 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 26 [BUMPER STACKER WITH Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $115.00
}WHEELS Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
Size -24"L x 24"W x 38"H - Black u:r'r:]pch[{séCover Sports gfllzlg 0 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #RF0488 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness No Bid
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 27 COLLARS, HD Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $30.24
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $30.24 Alt
_ Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size - Black MAFC LLC $35.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness HG #AD0050 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $39.41 Alt
Rep Fitness $34.70 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 28 COLLARS, SPRING Alaska Education No Bid Nasco $7.07
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size - Gray MAFC LLC $8.00 Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness #IP0063 Nasco $7.07 Alt
Power Systems Inc. $8.21 Alt
Rep Fitness $7.90 Altr+*
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
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# 29 |GLUTE HAM DEVELOPER Alaska Education No Bid MAFC LLC $495.00
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size - Black MAFC LLC $495.00 Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness GH-1 Abram Nasco No Bid
GHD #RF0097E Power Systems Inc. $530.10 Alt
Rep Fitness $449.00 Altr**
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 30 GYM FLOOR COVER Alaska Education $8186.00 Alt Gopher Sport $10108.80
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $10,108.80 Alt
, Humphrys Cover Sports $11,942.37 Alt
Size -9720 sq ft - Navy MAEC LLC No Bid
Brand [Covermaster Ultima 5000  Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness No Bid
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $3564.19 Alt*
# 31 HURDLES, ALUMINUM Alaska Education No Bid Buddy’s All Stars $176.35
(HIGH SCHOOL) Buddy’s All Stars $176.35
Elite Athletic $179.00
Gopher Sport No Bid
Size - Gate tubes - Navy Blue '\H/Il:\n;(p:h[)ll_sCCWer Sports gflglg 0 Alt*
Brand |Gill #402C13 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness No Bid
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $283.08 Alt*
# 32 KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $24.24
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $24.24 Alt
Size -13 Ib. - 1.2"D Handle u”A”;pChﬁsccover Sports g‘;f&g Al
Brand [Rogue Fitness #IP0002 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $26.74 Alt*
Rep Fitness $22.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $71.40 Alt
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# 33 |KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $38.74
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $38.74 Alt
: » Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -18 Ib. - 1.2"D Handle MAEC LLC $31.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #IP0003 Nasco $45.97 Alt
Power Systems Inc. $32.32 Alt*
Rep Fitness $29.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $93.50 Alt
# 34 KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $48.44
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $48.44 Alt
, . Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -26 |b. - 1.4"D Handle MAEC LLC $42.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #IP0004 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $40.74 Alt*
Rep Fitness $30.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $109.20 Alt
# 35 KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $45.44
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $45.44 Alt
_ " Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -35 Ib. - 1.5"D Handle MAEC LLC $55.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #IP0005 Nasco $82.50 Alt
Power Systems Inc. $52.84 Alt*
Rep Fitness $47.00 Alt+**
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $137.78 Alt
# 36 KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $58.44
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $58.44 Alt
: » Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -44 Ib. - 1.5"D Handle MAEC LLC $64.00 Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness #IP0006 Nasco $105.27 Alt
Power Systems Inc. $66.18 Alt*
Rep Fitness $55.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $113.82 Alt




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department
Shsd

139 E. Park Avenue
where kids come first

Page 10 of 12

RECAP
Bid #121-15
Dated: 2-13-15

Soldotna, Alaska 99669
(907) 714-8876  FAX (907) 262-7165

(Item # Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand }
# 37 |KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $64.94
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $64.94 Alt
. " Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -53 Ib. - 1.5"D Handle MAEC LLC $25.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #IP0007 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $80.41 Alt*
Rep Fitness $62.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $125.04 Alt
# 38 KETTLEBELLS Alaska Education No Bid Gopher Sport $70.84
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport $70.84
, . Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -63 |b. - 1.5"D Handle MAEC LLC $89.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #/P0008 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $88.23 Alt*
Rep Fitness $69.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $153.13 Alt
# 39 RIG MATADOR Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
_ , N N » Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -24"L x 27"W x 10"H x 1-7/8 MAEC LLC $245.00 Alt
D - Black .
) . Nasco No Bid
Brand |Rogue Fitness Monster Lite Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Matador #RA0383 Rep Fitness $80.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 40  |RIG SPOTTER ARMS, Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
SAFETY Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
: » » Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -24°L x 3'W - Black MAFC LLC $395.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness SAML-24 Nasco No Bid
Monster Lite #RA0402 Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness $145.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
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# 41 RIG, WEIGHT TRAINING  Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
34 FOOT Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
: Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -34 1t MAFC LLC $7750.00
Brand [Rogue Fitness Monster Lite Nasco No Bid
Custom #RF0439 Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness $4275.00 Altr**
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 42 RINGS, GYMNASTIC Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
}\NOOD Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
. Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -Black straps MAFC LLC $65.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #RA0022 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. $47.60
Rep Fitness $65.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 43 ROPE, CLIMBING Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
_ , , Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -1.57x 20 MAFG LG $150.00 Alt
Brand |Rogue Fitness #KRC20 Nasco $132.57 Alt
Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness $100.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $266.88 Alt
# 44 SOCCERBALL Alaska Education No Bid No Award
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
Size - 20 ball pack ulin;gh[{s&:Cover Sports Eg 2:3
Brand [Select Real #26011 (Soccer. Nasco $7.57 Alt
com #64914) Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness No Bid
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. $202.08 Alt
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# 45 TIMING SYSTEM, DIGITAL Alaska Education No Bid Elite Athletic $3850.00
BASED Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic $3850.00
Gopher Sport No Bid
Size - Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
MAFC LLC No Bid
Brand [FlashTiming #FT-FAT120  Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness No Bid
Riddell No Bid
School Specialty Inc. No Bid
# 46 |\NALL BALL TARGET Alaska Education No Bid NO AWARD
Buddy’s All Stars No Bid
Elite Athletic No Bid
Gopher Sport No Bid
, . Humphrys Cover Sports No Bid
Size -16°D - Black MAFC LLC $150.00 Alt
Brand [Rogue Fitness #RF0486 Nasco No Bid
Power Systems Inc. No Bid
Rep Fitness $70.00 Alt***
Riddell No Bid

School Specialty Inc. No Bid




