
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #125-15 Re-Cap CDW-G Dell GCSIT Lewis & Lewis Microsoft Staples

  

Dell Optiplex 7020 Desktop w/o Monitor No Bid 529.77$      499.00$     641.64$  No Bid No Bid

Dell Latitude E5450 Touchscreen Laptop No Bid 881.79$      799.00$     866.00$  No Bid No Bid

Dell Professional Topload 14.1 (460-BBMO) No Bid 44.99$        33.00$        45.99$     No Bid No Bid

Dell Professional Topload 14.1 (460-BBLH) No Bid 32.45$        33.00$        45.99$     No Bid No Bid

Dell MS111 USB Optical Mouse No Bid 14.99$        12.00$        15.79$     No Bid No Bid

E-Port Plus, 130W Advanced Port Replicator, USB 3.0 No Bid 164.99$      123.00$     166.62$  No Bid No Bid

Anthro YES Cart Mini-LapTop No Bid 1,522.78$  1,158.00$  No Bid No Bid 1,345.99$  

Microsoft Surface Pro 3, 128GB 925.00$  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 934.29$      

Microsoft Surface Pro 3, 64GB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 765.99$     

Microsoft Surface Pro 3, 256GB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,484.99$  

Microsoft Type Cover for Surface Pro 3, Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 94.99$        

Microsoft Type Cover for Surface Pro 3, Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 94.99$        

Microsoft Power Cover, Charcoal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Microsoft Type Cover 2, Charcoal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 94.99$        

Microsoft Arc Touch Mouse, Surface Edition No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.99$        

Microsoft Surface Pro 3 Docking Station No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 149.99$     


