
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

126-15 School Furniture

Re-Cap

Lounge Chair w/Arms Drawing Table Stool Cabinet

Arctic Office 998.00$   No Bid 81.00$     $1349.00 Alt

Grainger 249.99 Alt $699.99 Alt 129.99$   899.99$     

Midwest Technology No Bid 1,313.00$  106.50$   1,574.00$  

Paxton Patterson No Bid 1,352.00$  $143.00/2 1,736.00$  

School Specialty No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,636.72$  

Think Office 961.00$  No Bid No Bid No Bid



$1349.00 Alt


