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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

       RECAP
   Bid #129-15 

Due Date:  4-17-2015

01 SAXOPHONE
            ALTO

YAMAHA YAS-26

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

914.90
380.00 Alt
791.60 Alt
899.00 Alt
995.00 Alt
972.00
No Bid
925.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1030.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

914.90

#156170
#156176

02 SAXOPHONE
            BARITONE

SELMER BS500

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

2992.90
1958.00 Alt
3533.59
3100.00
3495.00 Alt
3200.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
3498.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

2992.90

#156176

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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       RECAP
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03 SAXOPHONE
            BARITONE

YAMAHA YBS-52

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

4104.90
3243.00 Alt
3770.96 Alt
3999.00 Alt
3995.00 Alt
4153.00
No Bid
4610.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
4715.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

4104.90

#156170

04 CLARINET
        STANDARD

BUNDY BCL-300 Model
#WWC-BD41NK

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

266.00 Alt
144.00 Alt
178.32
249.00 Alt
239.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
265.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
350.00

Guitar Center 178.32

#156188
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       RECAP
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05 CLARINET
        INTERMEDIATE

YAMAHA YCL450 or
YCL450NM DUET+

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

758.90
721.00 Alt
747.48 Alt
830.00 Alt
1998.00 Alt
950.00/804.00
1037.88
900.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1040.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

758.90

#156170
#156173

06 CLARINET
       STUDENT

BUFFET CRAMPON B12
(BC2540)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

429.90
186.00 Alt
427.46
462.00
595.00 Alt
500.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
480.00

Guitar Center 427.46

#156184
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07 CLARINET
      BASS

BUFFET CRAMPON 1183
Prestige Low Eb

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

7069.90
7215.00
7328.17
7826.00
No Bid
9927.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
7605.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

7069.90

#156178

08 TRUMPET

BUNDY BTR-300 Series
#WBT-BD61LQ

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

214.90 Alt
159.00 Alt
178.75
299.00 Alt
319.00 Alt
350.00 Alt
No Bid
255.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
390.00

Guitar Center 178.75

#156184
#156188
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09 TRUMPET
           STANDARD

YAMAHA YTR-2330

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

483.90
274.00 Alt
746.40 Alt
399.00 Alt
549.00 Alt
510.00
No Bid
525.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
555.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

483.90

#156170

10 TROMBONE
           STANDARD

YAMAHA YSL-354

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

492.90
186.00 Alt
841.46 Alt
399.00 Alt
No Bid
510.00
No Bid
525.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
555.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

492.90

#156176
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11 TROMBONE
           BASS

GETZEN ETERNA SERIES
“INDEPENDENT BASS”
#1052FD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

2553.90
1536.00 Alt
2754.25
3100.00 Alt
No Bid
3355.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2780.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

2553.90

#156174

12 TROMBONE
           BASS

GETZEN ETERNA SERIES
“DEPENDENT BASS”
#1062FD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music 
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

2553.90
1536.00 Alt
2754.25
3100.00 Alt
No Bid
3355.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2625.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

2553.90

#156174
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13 TROMBONE
           TENOR

BACK STRADIVARIUS
Model #36BO

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

2237.90
1441.00 Alt
2648.66
2304.00 Alt
No Bid
3300.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2688.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

2237.90

#156174

14 EUPHONIUM
        INTERMEDIATE

YAMAHA YEP-321

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

1719.90
952.00 Alt
1479.60 Alt
1295.00 Alt
1295.00 Alt
1705.00
No Bid
2115.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1991.00

The Music Man 1705.00

#156170
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15 TUBA
        INTERMEDIATE

YAMAHA YBB-321WC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

4628.90
4247.00 Alt
6659.99
3600.00 Alt
No Bid
4065.00
No Bid
5030.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
5550.00

The Music Man 4065.00

#156170
#156174#156176

16 DOUBLE HORN
      STANDARD

CONN Artist Series Model 6D

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

2398.90
1220.00 Alt
2833.36
2464.00
No Bid
2800.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2840.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

2398.90

#156176
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17 FLUTE

GEMEINHARDT 2SP

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

229.90
155.00 Alt
243.40
225.00
229.00 Alt
400.00
No Bid
245.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
250.00

Horn Doctor Music 225.00

#156183
#156184

18 FLUTE
      STANDARD
Silver

YAMAHA YFL-221

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

359.00
155.00 Alt
567.92 Alt
299.00 Alt
498.00 Alt
375.00
No Bid
405.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
420.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

359.00

#156170
#156173
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       RECAP
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19 DRUM SET WITH
CYMBALS
Jet Black

PEARL EXPORT FUSION

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

744.00
No Bid
500.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
830.00
1215.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Guitar Center Inc 500.95

#156185

20 TIMBALES

Brushed Nickel with Goldtone

LP MATADOR Model #M257-
BNG

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

328.90
No Bid
263.72
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
423.00
No Bid
No Bid
320.00

Guitar Center Inc 263.72

#156178
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       RECAP
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21 PERCUSSION COMBO KIT

LUDWIG ‘PERCUSSION
LEARNING CENTER”
#LE2482R

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

327.90 Alt
No Bid
317.52 Alt
265.00 Alt
No Bid
450.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Horn Doctor Music 265.00

#156170

22 ORFF BASS BAR

SONOR NKS60PB
ROSEWOOD CONTRA
(West Music #200176)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

292.90
No Bid
281.05
430.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
345.00
No Bid
392.13 Alt
290.85
425.00

Guitar Center 281.05

#156188
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23 ORFF BASS BAR

SONOR NKS100PE
ROSEWOOD SUB-CONTRA
(West Music #200077)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

459.90
No Bid
466.48
660.00
No Bid
575.00
No Bid
520.00
No Bid
442.41 Alt
474.81
640.00

Cascio Interstate
Music

459.90

#156188

24 ORFF BASS BAR

SONOR SUB-CONTRA
BASS PALISONO

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

506.90
No Bid
483.00
640.00
No Bid
550.00
No Bid
510.00
No Bid
482.26 Alt
458.85
No Bid

West Music
Company

458.85

#156183
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25 ORFF BASS BAR

SONOR PAO ROSA
CONTRA BASS BAR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

349.90
No Bid
205.28
320.00
No Bid
250.00
No Bid
340.00
No Bid
392.13 Alt
203.59
No Bid

West Music
Company

203.59

#156183

26 ACOUSTIC GUITAR

Natural

YAMAHA F325 GIGMAKER
STD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

152.90
No Bid
101.40
105.00
No Bid
100.00
122.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

The Music Man 100.00

#156186
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27 GUITAR
      CLASSICAL

YAMAHA CGS104AII

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

122.90
No Bid
90.57
89.00
No Bid
85.00
No Bid
105.00
No Bid
244.17 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

The Music Man 85.00

#156174

28 GUITAR CASE
    ACOUSTIC

YAMAHA HC-CG

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Cascio Interstate Music
DF Music Enterprise
Guitar Center Inc
Horn Doctor Music
K and S Music
The Music Man Inc
Natl Educational Music
Nick Rail Music
Percussion Source
Peripole Inc
West Music Company
Woodwind &
Brasswind Inc

88.90
No Bid
58.41
55.00
No Bid
55.00****
No Bid
70.00
No Bid
132.41 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

The Music Man 55.00

#156174


