
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #135-15-W Paper

Re-Cap

Award in Bold Arctic Office Contract Paper Group Frontier Paper School Specialty Staples WCP Solutions

020950 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", Pastel Blue 12.96 (6.48/pk) No Bid No Bid 18.33 No Bid 11.52$    

Neenah

020952 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", Pastel Green 12.96 (6.48/pk) No Bid No Bid 18.33 No Bid $11.52 Alt

Neenah Domtar

020956 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", Pastel Peach 12.96 (6.48/pk) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.52 Alt

Neenah

021022 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", Lift-off Lemon 20.90 (10.45/pk) No Bid No Bid 18.33 No Bid 16.00$    

Neenah

021023 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", Gamma Green 20.90 (10.45/pk) No Bid No Bid 18.33 No Bid $16.00 Alt

Neenah

021026 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", Re-entry Red 20.90 (10.45/pk) No Bid No Bid 18.33 No Bid $16.00 Alt

Neenah

021028 Coverstock, 8.5" x 11", White 12.84 (6.42/pk) No Bid No Bid 16.98 No Bid $10.60 Alt

Neenah Domtar

021032 Text Paper, 8.5" x 11", Cosmic Orange 10.56 No Bid No Bid 18.4 No Bid $8.00 Alt

Riverside Neenah

021040 Text Paper, 8.5" x 11", Solar Yellow 10.56 No Bid No Bid 22.63 No Bid $8.00 Alt

Neenah

021135 Construction Paper, 12" x 18", Gray 3.75$       No Bid No Bid 6.4 No Bid 4.15 Alt

Pacon TruRay TruRay

021137 Construction Paper, 12" x 18", Sky Blue 3.64$       No Bid No Bid 5.91 No Bid 4.05 Alt

Pacon TruRay TruRay

021138 Construction Paper, 12" x 18", Lilac 3.64$       No Bid No Bid 7.13 No Bid 4.05 Alt

Pacon TruRay

021139 Construction Paper, 12" x 18", Orange 4.42$       No Bid No Bid 7.14 No Bid 4.83 Alt

Pacon TruRay TruRay

021143 Construction Paper, 12" x 18", White 3.68$       No Bid No Bid 4.27 No Bid 4.05 Alt

Pacon



021144 Construction Paper, 12" x 18", Yellow 3.91$       No Bid No Bid 7.08 No Bid 4.27 Alt

Pacon

021162 Construction Paper, 9" x 12", Sky Blue 1.90$       No Bid No Bid 3.67 No Bid 2.27 Alt

Pacon

021167 Construction Paper, 9" x 12", Violet 2.18$       No Bid No Bid 3.75 No Bid 2.27 Alt

Pacon TruRay

021182 Copy Paper, 8.5" x 11", Salmon 45.40 (4.54/rm) No Bid No Bid $94.90 (9.49/rm) No Bid 50.38$     

Domtar

021188 Copy Paper, 8.5" x 11", Pink 45.40 (4.54/rm) No Bid No Bid $95.70 (9.57/rm) 46.9 50.38$     

Domtar Staples

021191 Copy Paper, 8.5" x 11", White 35.41 (3.541/rm) 35.30$     No Bid 52.47 27.99 30.82$    

Fascopy/Mill Domtar Georgia-Pacific

021197 Copy Paper (Three Hole Punched), 8.5" x 11", White 38.88$    No Bid No Bid 74.75 29.76 46.30$     

Georgia-Pacific


