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ltem # Item Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price
010001 ‘ADHESIVE STICK Arctic Office $2.251/3/pk Pyramid School  |$.62/each
. Lewis & Lewis $4.37/5/pk 3M #6307
Size/Clr> "26 0z Pyramid School $.62
Brand> ‘Sm #6307 School Specialty $.63
Staples $.34*
CDNatschool No Bid
010025 ‘BlNDING COMBS Arctic Office $5.31/box Arctic Office $.05/each
. y Lewis & Lewis $6.45/box GBC #4000044
Size/Clr> ‘3/8 , Black Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> |GBC4000044 School Specialty ~ [$.11
Staples $.0643
CDNatschool No Bid
010090 ‘CARDS, INDEX Arctic Office $.503 Arctic Office $.503/pkg
: — Lewis & Lewis $.78 Oxford #31
Size/Clr> ‘3 X5" Ruled Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> \Ampad #23300 School Specialty $1.01
Staples $.68
National Art No Bid
010094 ‘CARDS, INDEX Arctic Office $.874 Arctic Office $.874/pkg
; iy Lewis & Lewis $1.45 ESS41
Size/Clr>[4°x6” Ruled Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> ‘ESS41 School Specialty $1.82
Staples $1.31
National Art No Bid
010149 ‘CLIP, PAPER Arctic Office $.180 Arctic Office $.180/box
. Lewis & Lewis $2.89/pkg OIC #99911
Size/Clr> ‘Reqular Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> ‘Acco #72380 School Specialty $4.02/pkg
Staples $.222
National Art No Bid
010152 \cup, PAPER Arctic Office $.551 Staples $.491/box
. Lewis & Lewis $8.11/pkg Staples #472506
Size/Clr> \Jumbo Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> |DPS #40021 School Specialty ~ |$10.52/pkg
Staples $.491
CDNatschool No Bid
010175 ‘CORRECTION TAPE Arctic Office $1.894 Staples $1.76/ea
. . Lewis & Lewis $2.07 Tombo #68620
Size/Clr> ‘Whlte Pyramid School $2.69
Brand> ‘TOM68620 School Specialty $2.26
Staples $1.76
CDNatschool No Bid
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r*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
Frkkk Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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010225 |ENVELOPE, CLASP Arctic Office $8.32 Arctic Office $8.32/box
: o (A Lewis & Lewis $15.79 BSN #36662
Size/Clr>["x10 Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> |OP #37868 School Specialty  ($22.70
Staples $8.40
National Art No Bid
010227 ‘ENVELOPE, CLASP Arctic Office $8.355 Arctic Office $8.355/box
. o o Lewis & Lewis $12.83 BSN #36665
Size/Clr> ‘10 x13 Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> ‘OP #37897 School Specialty $23.05
Staples $11.12
National Art No Bid
010241 ‘ERASER, WHITE BOARD Arctic Office $1.82 National Art $1.28/ea
Size/Clr> ‘5,, Lewis & Lewis $2.11 Sanford
Pyramid School $1.42
Brand> \Sanford #81505 School Specialty $2.09
Staples $1.73
National Art $1.28
010242 |ERASER, ARROWHEAD PENCIL Arctic Office $.36 Arctic Office $.36/dozen
CAP Lewis & Lewis $5.96/box Pap #73015
Size/Clr> ‘R d Pyramid School $3.45
12eIA € School Specialty $1.70
Brand> \Faber Arrowhead #70569 Staples $.43
National Art No Bid
010245 ‘ERASER, RUBBER Arctic Office $.336/each Staples $2.91/dozen
Size/Clr> ‘Medium Lewis & Lewis $9.20/24/box Dixon #38900
Pyramid School $1.35%***x
Brand> |Sanford #70520 School Specialty  [$4.94
Staples $2.91
National Art No Bid
010267 ‘FOLDERS, PORTFOLIOS Arctic Office $9.338 Arctic Office $9.338/box
. Lewis & Lewis $12.04 Smead #87850
Size/Clr> \Asst. Colors Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> \Smead #SMD486A School Specialty $12.21
Staples $11.69
National Art No Bid
010358 ‘GLUE STIC Arctic Office $.383 Staples $.34/each
. Lewis & Lewis $.62 Staples #487135
Size/Clr> "25 0z Pyramid School $.14 Frrrx
Brand> ‘DiXOﬂ #15083 School Specialty $.48
Staples $.34
National Art No Bid

*Does Not Meet Specification
r*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
Frkkk Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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010360 |GLUE, WHITE (GLUE-ALL) Arctic Office $10.50 NO AWARD
. ) Lewis & Lewis $1.82*
Size/Clr> ‘1 pint Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> \Elmers #E1321 School Specialty $2.88*
Staples No Bid
National Art No Bid
010361 ‘GLUE STIC Arctic Office $1.354 Staples $.53/each
. Lewis & Lewis $1.30 OIC #50002
Size/Clr> ‘.75 oz. Pyramid School §. 4] e
Brand> |Dixon #15155 School Specialty ~ [$.85
Staples $.53
National Art No Bid
010363 ‘INDEX DIVIDERS Arctic Office $.419 Arctic Office $.419/set
. Lewis & Lewis $1.72 Avery #11466
Size/Clr> \Clear Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> \Averv #11466 School Specialty $.56
Staples $.47
National Art $.45
010373 ‘LABELS, FILE FOLDER Arctic Office $.97 Arctic Office $.97/box
) Lewis & Lewis $8.64 FFL6
Size/Clr> ‘Green Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> |Maco #MLLFF-L6 School Specialty  |$4.25
Staples No Bid
National Art No Bid
010376 ‘LABELS, FILE FOLDER Arctic Office $.97 Arctic Office $.97/box
. Lewis & Lewis $8.64 FFL2
Size/Clr> ‘Red Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> |Maco #MLLFF-L2 School Specialty  [$4.25
Staples No Bid
National Art No Bid
010387 ‘LAMlNATlNG FILM Arctic Office $39.95 Staples $19.55/roll
: " , Lewis & Lewis $91.26 GBC #3000024
Size/Clr> \25 x250’ gloss Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> ‘USI #0324 School Specialty No Bid
Staples $19.55
National Art No Bid
010410 ‘MARKER, SHARPIE ULTRA FINE Arctic Office $.695/each National Art $5.88/dozen
' Lewis & Lewis $9.11 Sanford #37001
Size/Clr> ‘Black Pyramid School $6.48
Brand> \Sanford #37001 School Specialty $.74/each
Staples $7.08
National Art $5.88

*Does Not Meet Specification
r*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
Frkkk Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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010412 ‘MARKER, SHARPIE ULTRA FINE Arctic Office $.695/each Staples $7.08/dozen
Size/CIr> |Green Lewis & Lewis $8.65 Sanford #37004
Pyramid School $6.48****x
Brand> \Sanford #37004 School Specialty No Bid
Staples $7.08
National Art No Bid
010415 ‘PEN, RUBBERIZED BALL Arctic Office $.778 Staples $.3225/ea
. . Lewis & Lewis $5.30/dozen Bic
Size/Clr> ‘Blue - Medium Pyramid School No Bid 4SGSM11BE
Brand> |Bic #SGSM11BE School Specialty ~ [$1.12
Staples $.3225
National Art No Bid
010420 ‘PEN, BALLPOINT Arctic Office $.091/each Staples $.88/dozen
. . . Lewis & Lewis $1.41 BICSGSM11BE
Size/Clr> \Flne Point/Black Pyramid School PA—
Brand> |PAP #338-11 School Specialty  |$1.74
Staples $.88
National Art No Bid
010426 ‘PEN, GEL Arctic Office $8.42 Staples $5.33/set
. ) ) Lewis & Lewis $10.41 Staples #11642
Size/Clr> \12 color set/ Medium tip Pyramid School No Bid
Brand> |Staples #11642 School Specialty  $9.89
Staples $5.33
National Art No Bid
010430 ‘MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER Arctic Office $.479 National Art $.36/ea
. Lewis & Lewis $4.82/box Sanford #25025
Size/Clr> ‘FI. Yellow Pyramid School $.38
Brand> |San #25025 School Specialty ~ [$.60
Staples $.3616
National Art $.36
010431 ‘MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER Arctic Office $.479 School Specialty |$.28/ea
Size/Clr> \Green Lewis & Lewis $5.04/box SS #1354269
Pyramid School $.38
Brand> \San #25026 School Specialty $.28
Staples $.465
National Art $.36
010433 ‘MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER Arctic Office $.479 School Specialty |$.28/ea
Size/CIr> ‘Pink Lewis & Lewis $5.04/box SS #1354266
Pyramid School $.38
Brand> ‘PAP #20701 School Specialty $.28
Staples $.465
National Art $.36

*Does Not Meet Specification
r*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
Frkkk Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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010435 ‘MARKER, PERMANENT Arctic Office $.527/ea Staples $5.58/dozen
. Lewis & Lewis $7.94 Staples
Size/Clr>  [Black Pyramid School $2.64* Duramark
Brand> \San #64171 School Specialty $7.45 #167056
Staples $5.58
National Art No Bid
010446 |MARKER, PERMANENT Arctic Office $.695/ea National Art $5.88/dozen
(SHARPIE®) Lewis & Lewis $6.43 Sanford #30001
Size/Cl ‘BI K Pyramid School $6.48
Izeltir> ac School Specialty $9.13
Brand> ‘Sanford #30001DZ Staples $7.08
National Art $5.88
010485 ‘PENClL, MECHANICAL Arctic Office $1.76 Staples $1.40/ea
Size/Clr> | 5mm Lewis & Lewis $3.47/dozen Pap #267828
’ Pyramid School $1.37HH*x
Brand> \Papermate Clear Point #267828 (56037) School Specialty $2.32
Staples $1.40
National Art No Bid
010490 ‘PENCIL, WRITING Arctic Office $2.252 Arctic Office #2.252/dozen
. . Lewis & Lewis $2.65 Dixon #13883
Size/Clr> ‘#3 Firm Lead Pyramid School §1.4QrrEe
Brand> |Dixon #13883 School Specialty ~ |$3.10
Staples $2.97
National Art No Bid
010502 ‘PlPE CLEANERS Arctic Office $1.629 School Specialty [$1.53/pkg
Size/CIr> |12 Lewis & Lewis $1.53%xx Chenille #7112
12T Pyramid School No Bid -1
Brand> |Chenille Kraft #7112-1 School Specialty  |$1.53
Staples No Bid
National Art No Bid
010612 ‘SClSSORS Arctic Office $6.83 Staples $1.03/ea
. . ' Lewis & Lewis $2.54 Fiskars #3452
Size/CIr> [8" (Office) Pyramid School 86,95
Brand> \Fiskar #FISK3452 School Specialty No Bid
Staples $1.03
National Art $5.17
010617 |SHARPENER, ELECTRIC (HEAVY Arctic Office $66.70 Staples $57.99/ea
DUTY) Lewis & Lewis $96.04 Bostitch
Size/Clr> |Gray. 5'Wx9"DX7-LI2'H Pyramid School $59.00 #EPS12HC
Ize/Lir>joray. X9TDX I ' School Specialty $72.36
Brand> |Bostitch #EPS12HC Staples $57.99
National Art No Bid

*Does Not Meet Specification
r*Draw
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010631 ‘STAPLER, DESK Arctic Office $11.41 National Art $8.40/ea
. Lewis & Lewis $14.31 Swingline
Size/Clr>  [Black Pyramid School  |$13.95 #74701
Brand> \Swin_qline #74701 School Specialty $14.69
Staples 9.72
National Art $8.40
010632 ‘STAPLER, DESK (DELUXE) Arctic Office $20.00 Staples $18.99/ea
Size/Clr> Lewis & Lewis $22.44 Paperpro #1110
Pyramid School $19.95
Brand> ‘Paperpro #1110 School Specialty $29.75
Staples $18.99
National Art No Bid
010653 |TABS, FOR HANGING FILE Arctic Office $1.58 Arctic Office $1.58/pkg
FOLDERS Lewis & Lewis $3.64 SMD #64615
Size/Cl ‘1/3 3-1/2 width Pyramid School No Bid
1ze/tir> cut, 3-1/2 widt School Specialty No Bid
Brand> \Pendaﬂex #ESS43-1/2 Staples $2.27
National Art No Bid
010678 ‘POST-|T TAPE FLAGS Arctic Office $3.535 Staples $1.01/ea
: ” Lewis & Lewis $24.14/12/pk 3m #680RD2
Size/Clr> |1/ Red Pyramid School $1.50
Brand> ‘SM 680-1 School Specialty $2.53
Staples $2.02/2/pk
National Art No Bid
010684 ‘TAPE, BOX SEALING Arctic Office $4.505 Pyramid $3.84/roll
. R Lewis & Lewis 20.77/4/pk 3M #3750
Size/Clr> ‘2 X60 yds. Pyramid School $3.84
Brand>  |3M #3750RDCL School Specialty  [$5.43
Staples $4.125
National Art $3.18*
010690 ‘TAPE, MENDING Arctic Office $2.336 National Art $1.37/roll
: . " Lewis & Lewis $2.59 3M #81034
Size/Clr> ‘3/4 x1296 Pyramid School $1.95
Brand> ‘3M Magic #81034 School Specialty $3.64
Staples $1.59
National Art $1.37

*Does Not Meet Specification
r*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
Frkkk Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna




