
BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Bush 6/#10

ALLEN #42217001 6/#10

No Preference 6/#10

FURMANO#13432

Country Foods - 

Pochantas 

#203817
42.99

ALLEN #42217001 * FSA #495026 44.97 42.57

SIG 5 STAR #13432 FSA #53716 37.33 35.01

BUSH #01619 FSA #388197 40.21 37.80

BUSH #01638 6/115oz 39.96 37.61

 

Stokly 6/#10

Bush 6/#10

No Preference 6/#10

 ALLEN#32213001 FSA #898375 *

33.78 31.43

POCHANTAS Country Foods 

#203825
34.42

BUSH #01886 6/108oz FSA #141419 31.05 28.76

BUSH #01885 6/108oz FSA #981244 30.52 28.23

No Preference

ROSARITA#4430010641 6/#10 Country Foods 

#203899
38.07

FSA #670421 38.66 36.32

ALLEN#35218 * 6/#10 FSA #210020 39.39 37.09

LA VICTORIA#07814 6/112oz FSA 42.78 40.41

RIO VIEJO#4149313536 6/#10 FSA #350982 40.76 38.41

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10

6/#10 Beans, Black                                                                     

11-1315

101 56 case

100 150 case

Beans,  Refried                                                                                         

11-1327

102 6/#10200 case
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Polar Glacier Water 16.9

Pure Life #11475051 24/16.9 oz

Pure Alaska #17 16.9

ARROWHEAD 35/16.9 oz Country Foods 

#214158
9.14

or Equal

PURE LIFE #12226711 35/16.9 oz FSA #294338 14.32 12.26

CLEARY ARCTIC #1010 24/16.9 oz FSA #858888 7.84 6.44

Kellogg's 38000-78787 96/.70 ozCountry Foods #214155 30.72

FSA #916621 24.73 24.26
104 case Cereal, Apple Jacks Whole Grain (Reduced Sugar) 

1 Bread Eq. Bowl Pack                                                                                                                          

10-1275

96/cs

Beverage: Water, Bottled in unbreakable container                                                                                              

10-1088

103 450 case 24/16.9z

50
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case General Mills 96/1 oz Country Foods 29.56

FSA #652817 26.87 26.36

General Mills 96/.94 oz Country Foods 29.55
or similar FSA #912227 26.85 26.34

Kelloggs 96/.67 oz Country Foods 29.48
or similar FSA #916660 24.73 24.26

GM TRIX #31922 96/CT FSA #912175 26.75 26.26

Kellogg's 96/1.0 oz Country Foods 28.22
or similar FSA #870919 26.87 26.36

KELLOGS FROSTED FLAKES 

MULTIGRAIN

96/CT FSA #571471

24.58 24.14

Kellogs 96/1.0  oz Country Foods 28.59

or similar FSA #224969 25.14 24.59

96/cs

108 100 case

107

105 Cereal, Cinnamon Toast Crunch, (REDUCED 

SUGAR) 1 Bread Eq. Bowl Pack                                                                                               

10-1278                                                                                               

96/cs

Cereal, Cocoa Puffs Whole Grain  (Reduced Sugar)   

Whole Grain        1 Bread Eq. Bowl Pack                                                                                                                  

10-1280

Cereal, Fruit Loops,Whole Grain  (Reduced Sugar)     

1 Bread  Eq. Bowl Pack                                                                                         

10-1277

case 96/cs

150 case

106 150

case

75 case 96/cs

Cereal, Frosted Flakes,Whole Grain  (Reduced 

Sugar) 1 Bread Eq. Bowl Pack                                                  

10-1281

96/cs

109 150 Cereal, Frosted Mini-Wheats Chocolate Little Bites 

Whole Grain. 1 Bread Eq. Bowl Pack                                                                                  

10-1276
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Malt O Meal Country Foods 40.86

Brookside

MALT O MEAL CINNAMON 

GRANOLA

4/50oz FSA #465303 41.10

40.42

Fieldstone

GM GRANOLA BULK 4/50oz FSA #265517 32.87 32.21

Real Fresh, Basic

Land O Lakes 

Trenton Farms  Country Foods 

#204035
43.07

FSA #316479 50.05 47.78

ORTEGA #7705151 4/107oz FSA #178519 39.93 38.50

LAND O LAKES #39940 6/106oz FSA #586564 76.38 74.24

Real Fresh Nacho Supreme mild

Land O Lakes  6/106oz FSA #915178 76.38 74.24

Trenton Farms  Country Foods 

#204036
44.16

FSA #657731 50.05 47.78

ORTEGA #706068 4/107oz FSA #112194 40.01 38.56

Tostitos 8/16 oz Country Foods No Bid

DON PANCHO 

TOSTITOS #18793 8/16oz FSA #905402 18.50 18.03

Bare Snack  48/.53oz Country Foods No Bid

(*) FSA #161725 24.50 24.40
case

Case

case

Cheese Sauce, Nacho-#10 can or Pouch                                                                                                                                                   

11-1020

Apple Chips, Smiply Cinnamon (smart snack)48/cs

Chips, Tortilla -  round, BKD WG  No Trans Fat 

(smart snack)

                                                                                                                                                                       

10-1390

8/16 oz

6/#10

case

10

114

112

113 75

50

case

110 35

Cheese Sauce, Aged Cheddar-#10 can or Pouch                                                                                                                             

11-1030

10 #

6/#10 111 20

Cereal, Bulk Granola                                                                         

10-1295
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Frito-Lay #30820 104/.875z Country Foods

No Bid

FSA #212997 34.20 33.80

Goody Man#9430 Country Foods No Bid

FSA #995206 30.37 30.09

Argo 25# sack

KATY'S KITCHEN #17026 1/25lb FSA #725937 22.15$                             20.84

Packer Country Foods 

#205365

22.42$                             

Sig 5 Star 

or similar

BAR VALLEY 54961 Country Foods #200461 41.40

SIG 3 STAR #02343 4/1GAL FSA #233212 41.16 39.21

Pepperidge Farm #14396 0.75 oz Country Foods  

#888888
55.34

FSA #856853 42.49 41.68

or Equal

PEPPERIDGE FARM #18105300/.75 oz FSA #542289 51.83 51.02

case

100/.8 

oz

104/cs

300 Pretzel,   Whole Grain   Goldfish                                                                                                                                                        

10-0325

Corn Starch

25# bag                                                                                                                                          

10-1575

case 4/1 gal

Bar Marshmallow  Brown Rice Krispy Treat                       

(smart snack)                                                                     

10-0850

25#

Relish Sweet Pickle                                                      

11-1110

case

Bag

119

2

118 10

115

116

100

100

Chips, Sunchips Harvest Cheddar                                        

10-0340

case

117

100
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case MJM # 512150 150 Country Foods 26.30

FSA  * 26.69 26.12

MJM #514150 150/1oz FSA #874896 *

29.55

MJM # 408001 300/1 oz Country Foods 41.65

FSA #257105 *

42.49 41.44

No Preference

SUGAR FOODS 74470 Country Foods 

#210087
18.17

FRESHGRMT #74470 250/.25 oz FSA #664411 17.32 17.07

MARZETTI #140015 250/.25 oz FSA #868950 23.15 22.83

Foothill Farms #00147 10# box Country Foods 55.77

Hidden Valley

FOOTHILL FARMS GLUTEN 

FREE #V402-60190

FSA #730238
48.05 47.50

Dole 6/#10

Festival 6/#10 Country Foods 

#202520
36.97

Delmonte 6/#10

10

112 5

113 10#

150/ 1 

oz

box

Croutons, Seasoned, Individually packaged                                                                                                                                       

10-1585

300/1 oz111 75 cs

250/.25 

oz

6/#10

Dressing Mix, Ranch, No MSG                                                                                                                                                 

10-1672

case

114 200 case

110 75

Fruit: Pineapple, chunks packed in unsweetened 

syrup or pineapple juice, USDA grade A, minimum 

score: 90+, minimum drained weight: 65 oz.                                                                                            

11-4400

case COOKIE VANILLA BITES SPORT                                                      

10-0389

WG  Maple Waffle GRAHAM 
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case FESTIVAL #740070 6/#10 FSA #602416 39.05 36.65

6/#10114 200 case Fruit: Pineapple, chunks packed in unsweetened 

syrup or pineapple juice, USDA grade A, minimum 

score: 90+, minimum drained weight: 65 oz.                                                                                            

11-4400

BID #132-15

Dry GOODS 7 of 19



BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case No Preference

FOOTHILL 074T-T0700 Country Foods 

#888888
28.70

SIG 5 STAR #01186 FSA #756578 29.39 28.89

DIAMOND CRYSTAL #57774 * 8/14 oz FSA  *

18.88 18.43

8/12 oz FSA #892922 32.53 32.18

No Preference

FOOTHILL 323T-T0701 Country Foods 

#888888
34.06

SIG 5 STAR #01189 FSA #756617 33.00 32.50

DIAMOND CRYSTAL #57773 * 8/15 oz FSA *

22.86 22.39

PANROAST #17409CPANZ 8/12 oz FSA #892896 37.85 37.50

Real Lemon 6/48 oz Country Foods 

#212670

 $                            52.76 

SUNTREE #75324 12/32 oz FSA #2404  $                            35.66 34.22

Red Gold REDY L9G 1000/cs FSA #758736 21.44 20.29

Heinz Country Foods 

#209808
18.89

(HEINZ #984800/78000108) FSA #760153 19.01 17.93

Hunts (2700038287) FSA #345865 22.06 20.94

Juice, Lemon, 48 oz. bottle, shelf stable                                                                                                

10-2651

20116

6/48

case

2000/cs Ketchup, Portion Control Packets                                 

Low Sodium/ 9 gm 

100% Natural Ketchup Made with sugar                                                                                                                                                               

11-1080

Gravy Mix: Beef Instant No MSG Added                      

Low Sodium                                                                                                        

10-2122

118 300 case

115 20

117

case 8/16 oz

8/16 oz

Gravy Mix: Chicken Instant no MSG added             

Low Sodium                                                                              

10-2125

5 case
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Red Gold  REDY57D 2/1.5 gal FSA #628037 *

23.03 21.48

Heinz 2/1.5 gal Country Foods 

#200073
22.15

(515500/78000075) FSA #299073 24.40 22.93

Hunts  (2700038333) 2/1.5 gal FSA #804151 27.83 26.33

119 case 2/1.5 gal Ketchup, Dispenser Pouch Pack. 33% Fancy 

Ketchup- Low Sodium                                                                                                                                                        

11-1010

150
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Best Foods #26575 200 ct Country Foods #209824 9.31

 

Heinz #5317 200 ct FSA #654213 13.40 13.10

Flavor Fresh #70812 FSA  * 12.04 11.75

KRAFT #2100066533 200/7/16 oz FSA #426989 9.66 9.34

Nalleys 501033 4/1 gal

Kraft 2100064301 4/1gal Country Foods #88888 45.62

FSA #144622 37.90 36.13

Nalleys 401031 30# bucket Country Foods No Bid

Sig-3 Star #58301

SIG 3 STAR #13831 30 lb carton FSA #58301 26.21$                             24.66

French Country Foods #209875 3.92$                               

FRENCH 41500085398 200/7 GR FSA 8.24$                               8.04

Flavor Fresh #70823 FSA  * 11.57$                             11.22

PPI #78000357 200/5.5 GM FSA #245912 3.68$                               3.53

HEINZ #78000701 200/1/5 oz FSA #86118  $                              4.84 4.69

Kellogg's 3/16 caseCountry Foods #203702 20.14$                             

Rasp # 35845 FSA #687812 19.55$                             19.27

  

4/1galcase

bucket

case

Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat 

1 gal.                                                                                                                                                                                              

11-1060

Mustard, pc yellow, prepared                                                                                                                

11-1095

Nutri Grain Bar, Assorted Flavors, 48/1.3 oz/cs  

*Flavor Raspberry                                                                                                                                                             

10-0754

case

3/16ct

30#

200/ctcase

200 Mayonnaise, PC, Reduced Fat ,   12 gm                                                                                       

11-1090

Mayonnaise,lite CTN NTF

Packaged in plastic bucket only!                                                                                                              

11-1045

121

123

124 200

100

100

120

50

50

122
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Kellogg's 3/16 caseCountry Foods #203703 20.14$                             

Strawberry #35945 FSA #687820 19.55$                             19.27

   

No Preference gal

KIRKLAND 2/3qt Country Foods #205975 11.35

CHEF PRIDE #58501CHP FSA #667641 10.09 9.68

Gold N Sweet 31467

*Vegalene

6/ case

PAM#6414407263 6/case FSA #787042 21.81$                             21.36

Vegalene 6/ case Country Foods #206457 35.36$                             

#22021 6/21.5 oz FSA #878685 30.62$                             30.12

#17021 6/21.5 oz FSA #50652 30.01$                             29.60

WHITE CAP #2097OWCP 6/20.5 oz FSA #248435 34.79$                             34.27

Festival 6/case Country Foods #202419 28.71

(#475100) FSA #602455 30.07 27.82

Packer 6/ case

or similar

Nalley 6/#10

Steinfield 6/#10

Heinz  #658200 6/5.75 pouchCountry Foods #200317 29.52

6/5.75 pouch FSA #486051 30.30 28.48

SIG 5 STAR #02412 1/5 gal FSA #230599 42.09 39.69

gal

case 3/16ct125

10 case

case 6/#10  Pickles, Banquet Dill-sliced, crinkle cut, 3/16"                                                                                                                                

11-1120

Pan Coating, 21.5 oz.                                                                                                                                                                        

10-4000

Nutri Grain Bar, Assorted Flavors, 48/1.3 oz/cs  

*Flavor Strawberry                                                                                                                                                            

10-0758

Oil, Canola                                                                                                                                            

10-3995

Orange  Mandarin Segments       LS                                                                                            

11-2013

200

129 50

6/cs

6/ #10

gal

128 200

126

127

20

case 
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Flavor Fresh#70807 Country Foods #888888 20.38

FSA #179756 * 12.59 12.24

House Blend #70807

or similar

Kellogg's 38000-36657 120/1.76Country Foods #203678 38.83

(#3800055130) FSA #545536 38.68 37.86

Excell, Potatoes Pearls 12/28 oz

Simplot 022770 12/26 ozCountry Foods #203085 38.65

FSA #976460 38.89 37.80

Idahoan, Real Mashed 

(#2970000365)

FSA #496006
51.03 49.84

Idaho Pacific #901

or similar

CBRD 10641 6/#10 Country Foods #204013 37.51

FSA No Bid No Bid

or similar

Rosarita #4430010688 4/1gal FSA #752460 49.52 47.27

LAJUNTA 344775 Country Foods 40.99

or similar

RED GOLD #REDSC99 6/#10 FSA #454214 36.22 33.97

cs

130 50 case

6/#10

100/1 oz Honey Mustard,PC  dipping sauce  

Ravioli  Cheese Mini WHL Grain CN Lable                             

11-5596

4/gal

case

Salsa, Nutritionally Enhanced Low Sodium

                                                                                                                                 

11-1125

Pop-Tarts one servings whole grain strawberry 

flavor                                                                               

10-0835

133

134

Potatoes, Instant,  Dehydrated                                                                                                                          

10-4800

100

90

131 case

12/28 oz

120

case

175

50

132
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Nalley's 4/1gal/case

BRANDING IRON Country Foods #203342 $                            38.51 

Cattleman Original FSA #86029  $                            47.97 45.75

Marzetti #83030

HEINZ #74000017 FSA #75149 39.87$                             37.77

HEINZ #74000015 FSA #719962 39.87$                             37.77

KRAFT #1957239057 FSA #733253 54.41$                             52.29

KC MASTERPIECE #05418 4/158 oz FSA #812846 51.97$                             49.77

Redpack RPKNA9E 6/#10 FSA #773686  $                            37.32 35.07

HEINZ 78004817 Country Foods #203478 $                            37.36 

    

or similar

ANGELA MIA #2700039125 6/104 oz FSA #439614 38.17$                             35.98

Wing Nien CO, Double Hi 500 ct Country Foods #209971 13.33$                             

or similar

YAMASA #18116 FSA 23.84$                             23.09

KIKKOMAN 500/15 mil FSA  $                            39.07 38.06

Wing Nien CO, Double Hi 500 ct Country Foods #210012 21.07

or similar

CHATSWORTH (HEINZ) 

#78000232

FSA #575542
9.91 9.56

DIAMOND CRYSTAL #76302 FSA * 10.25 9.90

*Rosarita 4/1 gal FSA #704784 46.23$                             44.31

LAJUNTA 7641580 Country Foods #203679 37.59$                             

Las Palmas 50055 4/1 gal

ORTEGA #780816 FSA #384258 37.94$                             36.09

Old El Paso 6/#10

case

case

case

Sauce: Sweet & Sour Sauce, Portion Pac                                                                                               

11-1145

Sauce: Soy Sauce, Portion Pac    , Low Sodium                                                                                              

11-1100

500

Sauce, Marinara Redpack Nutritionally Enhanced                                                                               

11-5590

136

4/1 gal Sauce: BBQ Sauce                                                                                                                          

11-1000

Sauce: Taco Sauce, Mild                                                                                                                                                                                      

11-1150

4/1galcase

20

139 20

25

135

137 500

6/#10case

40

138 75
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Manwich 44181 4/#10 Country Foods #204643 26.88$                             

FSA #224844 32.37$                             30.35

Redpack #RPK1A99 FSA 27.68$                             26.19

No Preference 4.5 oz Country Foods #218064 2.94$                               

CULINARY SECRET #10903 5.5 oz FSA #341111 5.94$                               5.91

No Preference Country Foods #218314 5.41

CULINARY SECRET #10920 18 oz FSA #341423 8.24 8.17

No Preference 16 oz Country Foods #218466 4.81$                               
CULINARY SECRET #10933 15 oz FSA #341813 10.26$                             10.20

  

All Brands acceptable 6.75 oz

OREGON SPICE 1/16 oz Country Foods #888888 5.41$                               

MRS. DASH #J016-AY900 FSA #269751 5.87$                               5.84

100

141 each5

10

Spice: Basil Leaves                                                                                                                             

10-6431

Spice:Mrs Dash                                                                                               

10-6462

Sloppy Joe Sauce                                                                                                       

11-5595

4/#10case

6.75 oz

6 16 oz Spice: Cumin Powder Ground                                                                               

10-6442

30

142

143

144

140

each

4.5 oz

each Spice: Chili Powder Mild                                                                     

10-6436

each

16 oz
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Culinary Secret #10955 1/28 oz FSA #338940 24.96$                             24.83

OREGON SPICE 1/32 oz Country Foods #218727 13.16$                             

All Brands acceptable 20 oz

OREGON SPICE 22 oz Country Foods #218662 7.69$                               

CULINARY SECRET #10944 28 oz FSA #341917 10.40$                             10.32

All Brands acceptable

OREGON SPICE 22 oz Country Foods 

#218907
5.69

CULINARY SECRET #10972 20 oz FSA #342268 6.71 6.64

All Brands acceptable 3#

MCCORMICK Country Foods 

#218870
16.88

CULINARY SECRET #10967 FSA #338992 17.23 17.05

No Preference

OREGON SPICE Country Foods #218980 4.89$                               

CULINARY SECRET #10980 FSA #342359 7.42$                               7.36

148

Seasoning Itlian Bulk                                                

10-6470

Spice: Onion Flakes                                                                                                                                                                       

10-6471

Spice: Garlic Powder                                                                                                                               

10-6453

10 each

15 case 1/28 oz

146

147 5

5

145

Spice, Paprika                                                                                       

10-6480

16 oz

20 oz

each

3#

each

each 20 oz

Spice: Onion Powder                                                                                                                                                     

10-6473

149 5
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case No Preference

OREGON SPICE 16 oz Country Foods #219055 11.52

CULINARY SECRET #10997 FSA #342489 14.39 14.32

No Preference 24/26 oz Country Foods #205593 23.85

MORTON #F110530001G FSA #170034 25.51 23.38

Butter Buds #49840 8/1 lb Country Foods #888888 52.69 *

(*) FSA #639516 44.64 44.19

No Preference

OREGON SPICE 7 oz Country Foods #219417 3.38

CULINARY SECRET #11031 6 oz FSA #343087 7.34 7.31

No Preference 25 lb Country Foods #205640 $                            22.23 

C & H #06221 FSA #469319  $                            26.14 24.84

8/1lb. Alfredo Buds, 

24/26 oz

150

154

151

Spices: Thyme Leaves                                                                                                              

10-6498

153

3

7 oz

Spice: Salt, iodized

26 oz.                                                                                                                                               

10-6494

10

case

Spice, Pepper Black                                                                            

10-6491

ea

ea

each

case

Sugar, light brown, packaged in poly-lined bag                                                                                                           

10-6500

25 #3

5

152 40

18 oz
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Log Cabin 1 oz Country Foods #210217 32.96$                             

or similar

LOG CABIN #78004824 100/1.5 oz FSA #767061 28.38$                             27.75

PPI #78000442 FSA #40592 10.60$                             10.20

CARY'S #78003234 FSA #688009 22.09$                             21.54

SMUCKER'S #51500022771 100/1.1 oz FSA #812862 15.67$                             15.27

DIAMOND CRYSTAL #70813 FSA #837256 * 11.07$                             10.72

Mission 200 Country Foods #204172 $                            12.74 

#(10105) FSA #26654  $                            10.70 10.39

Hunts 6/#10 FSA #47910 30.64$                             28.45

Redpack RPKHA99 6/#10

Heinz 6/#10 FSA #69914 29.62$                             27.37

S&W Tri Valley 6/#10 Country Foods #203166 25.84$                             

Del Monte 6/#10

SIG 5-STAR #13443 FSA #6580 28.93$                             26.63

RED GOLD #RPKHA99 FSA #912071 28.62$                             26.32

Hunts 6/#10

Heinz  6/#10

S&W Tri Valley 6/#10 Country Foods #203288 25.72$                             

Del Monte 6/#10

DELLA VITA #13469 FSA #788988 34.63$                             32.38

SIG 5-STAR #13450 FSA #6610 33.99$                             31.97

ANGELA MIA #2700037854 FSA #54798 32.12$                             29.92

Redpack RPKUA99 6/#10 cn

S&W Country Foods #203136 $                            38.12 

HUNTS #2700038835 FSA #54933  $                            43.00 39.35

RED GOLD #RPKUA99 FSA #614608 41.70$                             39.35

case

156 100 case

Tomato Paste                                                                                                                                       

11-6000

6/#10

56

157 56

100case  Syrup Cup, Light                                                                                                                                                                             

10-6541

159 56 case

158

155 150

case

6/#10

Taco Shells, Hard 5"                                                                                                   

10-6545

Tomato Sauce, extra thick                                                                                                                  

11-6010

Tomatoes, Diced in Juice                                                                                                                    

11-6125

6/#10

200
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case No Preference 4/1gallon

FOUR MONKS 2/1 gal Country Foods 

#201158

8.62$                               

SIG 5 STAR #27620 FSA #20737 19.57$                             17.72

Seapoint Farms (#D786) 200/.79 oz Country Foods No Bid

SEAPOINT #D787 200/1 oz FSA #236605 * 55.17$                             

54.52

Envy Foods #2039 24/8 oz Country Foods No Bid

FSA #898915 16.58$                             15.83

Envy Foods #2022 24/8 oz Country Foods No Bid

FSA #898889 16.58$                             15.83

Envy Foods #2008 24/8 oz Country Foods No Bid

FSA #898798 16.58$                             15.83

160 5 4 gallon Vinegar, White, 1 gal.                                                                                                                             

10-8551

Edamame Dry Roasted Lightly Salted  100 cal. 

Snack               10-0203                          

case

161 50 case 200/.79 oz

162 75 case 24/8 oz Beverage,  Envy Juice Acai Berry  8 oz  Sparkling                              

10-1070

163 50 case 24/ 8oz Beverage,  Envy Juice Strawberry Kiwi Sparkling                        

10-1071

164 50 case 24/8 oz Beverage,  Envy Juice Fujiapple  Sparkling                                     

10-1072
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BID SPECIFICATION SHEETS Re-Cap  (Re-Vised)

Award in Bold

* Minimum purchase requirement

IT
E

M
 #

EST. 

USAGE
UNIT

PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS CASE SIZE

DISTRIBUTOR 

PRODUCT #

PRICE PER CASE FOB  

SOLDOTNA

PRICE PER CASE FOB 

ANCHORAGE                          

Beans, Baked                                                                       

11-1310

6/#10100 150 case Apple & Eve #84529TPE Country Foods No Bid

FSA #230287 * 13.66$                             

12.76

165 200 case 36/6.75 Fruitables Plus Tropical Twist 100% Juice Aseptis 

Pack w/straw CN 1/2 C Veg.                                   

10-1084
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