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RECAP

Bid #104-16
Due Date: 8-07-2015

[ ltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

o1 [BENCH SHEAR AIH 1980.00 AIH 1980.00
Size - Grainger 2719.20
Brand |ROPER WHITNEY NO. 125 Midwest Technology  2418.00 ***
Bid - ' Paxton/Patterson 2132.00

#161493
02 [BOX AND PAN BRAKE AlH 4740.00 Paxton/Patterson  4600.00
Size - Grainger 6509.60
Midwest Technology = 4555.00 ***
orand ROPER WHITNEY PEXTO Paxton/Patterson 4600.00
Bid-  [MODEL PX24 '
#161498
03 IpusT EXTRACTOR AlH No Bid
size- |MUST RF UI Grainger No Bid
Midwest Technology = No Bid
srand FESTOOLS CT 26 £ Paxton/Patterson No Bid
Bid - 583492
#161495
04 BOOM ARM AlH No Bid
FOR DUST EXTRACTOR  Grainger No Bid
Size - Midwest Technology = No Bid
Brand [FESTOOLS CT M0114 Paxton/Patterson No Bid
Bid -
#161495

* Does Not Meet Specifications

*kkk D raW

** No Specificiations Provided

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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05 [PLANER AIH 10,281.00 AIH 10,281.00
Size - Grainger 10,779.20
Brand [POWERMATIC 201HH Midwest Technology  8905.13 ***
Bid - Lv1791268 Paxton/Patterson 10,435.00
#161496
06 IMITER BAND SAW AIH No Bid Grainger 3598.40
Size - Grainger 3598.40
Brand |DAYTON oL KU3 Midwest Technology = No Bid
Bid - Paxton/Patterson No Bid
#161505
07 [BENCH PLATE SHEAR ~ AIH No Bid Grainger 178.40
Size - Grainger 178.40
Brand |DAYTON 413WET1 Midwest Technology = No Bid
Bid - Paxton/Patterson No Bid
#161499
08 SANDER AlH 1800.00 AlH 1800.00
BELT/DISC Grainger 1383.20 Alt
Size - Midwest Technology  2214.00 ***
Brand [POWERMATIC Model 31A  Paxton/Patterson 2094.00
Bid - #1791291K
(Woodcraft Supply #823894)
#161506
08 |BAND SAW AIH 329.00 Grainger 325.40
PORTABLE Grainger 325.40
Size - Midwest Technology  436.67 ***
Brand |[DeWALT DWM120K Paxton/Patterson 431.00
Bid -

#161506
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10 ISAFETY GLASSES AIH 1.80 AIH 1.80
Size - |Clear, uncoated lens / Clear G.ralnger 2.00
Midwest Technology = 2.99 ***
srand [3M TEKK 11329 VIRTUA Paxton/Patterson No Bid
Bid - |(Northern Safety #110-30287)

#161506




