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021025 COVERSTOCK   (COSMIC
ORANGE)

No Bid
$37.84
$16.80

$16.80/ream
Neenah #22851

8.5”x11”/Cosmic OrangeSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Wausau #22851Brand>

021026 COVERSTOCK   (RE-ENTRY RED) No Bid
$37.84
$16.80

$16.80/ream
Neenah #22751

8.5”x11”/Re-entry RedSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Wausau #22751Brand>

021028 COVERSTOCK   (WHITE) No Bid
$30.12
$5.30

$5.30/ream
Domtar #81036

8.5”x11”/WhiteSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Domtar #81036Brand>

021035 TEXT PAPER  (LIFT-OFF LEMON) No Bid
$20.06
$8.40

$8.40/ream
Neenah #21011

8.5”x11”/Lift-Off LemonSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Wausau #22631Brand>

021040 TEXT PAPER  (SOLAR YELLOW) No Bid
$20.06
$8.40

$8.40/ream
Neenah #22531

8.5”x11”/Solar YellowSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Wausau #22531Brand>

021049 NEWSPRINT, SKIP-A-LINE (1/4”) $3.95
$8.34
$2.72******

$2.72/ream
Pacon #2639

11”x8.5”Size/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Pacon #2639Brand>

021066 EASEL PAD  1” (RULING) $9.95
$7.45
$8.33******

$8.33/each
Pacon #3386

1” RulingSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Pacon #3386Brand>

021067 EASEL PAD (POST-IT)  25”X30.5” $17.58
$25.77
$19.50

$17.58/each
3M #559

25”X30.5”Size/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

Pyramid School

3M Post-It #559Brand>

021075 TAPE, CALCULATOR  2-1/4”X125’ No Bid
$1.05
No Bid

$1.05/roll
SS #053859

2-1/4"x125’Size/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

Ampad #27-150Brand>
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021132 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(TURQUOISE)

$4.79
$5.97
$3.11******

$3.11/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103039

TurquoiseSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Peacock #P7712Brand>

021135 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(GRAY)

$4.19
$5.66
$2.77******

$2.77/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103059

GraySize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Riverside #03059Brand>

021136 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(RED)

$4.39
$4.52
$2.90******

$2.90/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103432

Festive RedSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Peacock (Holiday Red) #P9912Brand>

021137 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(SKY BLUE)

$4.09
$5.43
$2.74******

$2.74/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103048

Sky BlueSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

True-Ray #03048Brand>

021138 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(LILAC)

$4.09
$6.06
$2.74******

$2.74/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103050

LilacSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Wausau #S7118Brand>

021139 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(ORANGE)

$4.39
$5.64
$2.94******

$2.94/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103034

OrangeSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Tru-Ray #3034Brand>

021142 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(VIOLET)

$4.29
$5.74
$2.85******

$2.85/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103041

VioletSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Peacock #P7212Brand>

021143 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(WHITE)

$3.79
$4.93
$2.49******

$2.49/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103058

WhiteSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Tru-Ray #3058Brand>
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021144 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (12X18)
(YELLOW)

$4.29
$5.60
$2.85******

$2.85/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103036

YellowSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Tru-Ray #3036Brand>

021162 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (9x12)
(SKY BLUE)

$2.09
$3.15
$1.54******

$1.54/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103016

Sky BlueSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Tru-Ray #3016Brand>

021163 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (9x12)
(LILAC)

$2.09
$3.15
$1.54******

$1.54/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103018

LilacSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Peacock #P7109Brand>

021168 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER (9x12)
(WHITE)

$1.99
$2.67
$1.43******

$1.43/pkg
Tru-Ray
#103026

WhiteSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Tru-Ray #3026Brand>

021186 COPY PAPER  (BLUE) No Bid
$77.70
$52.90

$52.90/case
Xerox #3R11050

8.5”x11”/BlueSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Xerox #3R11050Brand>

021187 COPY PAPER  (GREEN) No Bid
$77.70
$52.90

$52.90/case
Xerox #3R11051

8.5”’x11”/GreenSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

WausauBrand>

021189 COPY PAPER  (YELLOW) No Bid
$77.70
$52.90

$52.90/case
Xerox #3R11053

8.5”x11”/YellowSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Xerox #3R11053Brand>

021196 COPY PAPER  8.5”X14” (WHITE) No Bid
$55.66
$52.90

$52.90/case
Xerox #3R2051

8.5”x14”,  WhiteSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Boise Cascade #X-9000Brand>

021198 COPY PAPER 11”X17” (WHITE) No Bid
$61.75
$43.12

$43.12/case
Xerox #3R3761

11”x17”,  WhiteSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

WCP Solutions

Cascade #EXP1117Brand>
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021325 NOTEBOOK FILLER PAPER $3.29*****
$3.70
No Bid

$3.70/pkg
SS #085289

8.5”x11”Size/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

APC #140P200Brand>

021326 NOTEBOOK, WIRE BOUND (3
SUBJECT)

No Bid
$5.06
No Bid

$5.06/each
SS #1438380

8-7/8”x11”/3 subjectSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

Avery #31-384Brand>

021350 PAD, STENOGRAPHER'S No Bid
$1.28
No Bid

$1.28/each
SS #085290

6”x9”Size/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

Staples #163485Brand>

021360 PAD, LEGAL 8.5”11” (CANARY) No Bid
$1.29
No Bid

$1.29/each
SS #027430

8.5”x11” CanarySize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

Tops #11429-PDBrand>

021365 PAD, LEGAL   8.5”X14” (YELLOW) No Bid
$2.00
No Bid

$2.00/each
SS #027427

8.5”x14” YellowSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

Ampad #20-263Brand>

021367 PAD, LEGAL    5”X8” (YELLOW) No Bid
$.55
No Bid

$.55/each
SS #027439

5”x8”, YellowSize/Clr>

Pyramid School
School Specialty
WCP Solutions

School Specialty

School Specialty #027439Brand>
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