PART I. PROPANE

Cooper Landing Elem
Homer High — Outside Kiln

Homer High School
Home Ec. & Inside Kiln

Hope Elementary
Kenai Elementary
Moose Pass Elementary

Nanwalek Elementary/High

August 31, 2015

BID RECAP

ITB #102-16 Fuel

CROWLEY HOME RUN

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Port Graham Elementary/High

PART I11. FUEL OIL

Fireweed Academy

Homer Flex School

McNeil Canyon Elementary
Nikolaevsk Elementary/High
Seward Elementary School
Seward High School

Seward Middle School

Voznesenka School

No Bid

OlIL
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

CROWLEY HOME RUN

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

OIL
2.02
2.02
2.02
2.02
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
2.02
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PETRO49 *

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

PETRO49 *

2.1375

1.9375

1.8175

2.2375

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

2.2375

SHORESIDE
PETROLEUM

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SHORESIDE
PETROLEUM

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1.8298

1.8298

1.8298

No Bid

SUBURBAN
PROPANE

1.0626

1.2976

1.2976

1.1626

No Bid

1.0626

1.9726

1.9726

SUBURBAN
PROPANE

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



PART III. DIESEL FUEL

CROWLEY HOME RUN  PETROA49 * SHORESIDE SUBURBAN

OlIL PETROLEUM PROPANE

Mountain View Elementary  No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
Nikiski Middle/High School  No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
Nikiski North Star Elementary No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
Redoubt Elementary No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
Skyview High School No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
Soldotna High School No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
Sterling Elementary School No Bid No Bid 3.92 No Bid No Bid
KPBSD Central Receiving/  No Bid No Bid 2.515 No Bid No Bid
Warehouse - #1 Diesel

KPBSD Central Receiving/  No Bid No Bid 2.465 No Bid No Bid

Warehouse - #2 Diesel

*dba Petro Marine Services in Homer, Alaska Oil Sales in Soldotna
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