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ltem # Item Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price
021019 ‘COVERSTOCK Arctic Office $10.64/pk (*) WCP Solutions $16.80/ream
. n . Pyramid School No Bid Neenah #21041
Size/Clr> \8.5 x11"/Pulsar Pink School Specialty $33.26
Brand> ‘Wausau #22821, Neenah #21041 Staples No Bid
Unisource $11.90/pk (*)
WCP Solutions $16.80
021020 ‘COVERSTOCK Arctic Office $10.64/pk (*) WCP Solutions $16.80/ream
. aay Pyramid School No Bid Neenah #22721
Size/Clr> ‘8.5 x11"/Lunar Blue School Specialty $33.26
Brand> |Wausau #22721 Staples No Bid
Unisource $11.90/pk (*)
WCP Solutions $16.80
021022 ‘COVERSTOCK Arctic Office $10.64/pk (*) WCP Solutions 16.80/ream
. A A Pyramid School No Bid Neenah #21021
Size/Clr> \8.5 x11"/Lift-off Lemon School Specialty $33.26
Brand> |Wausau #22831, Neenah #21021 Staples No Bid
Unisource $11.90/pk (*)
WCP Solutions $16.80
021025 ‘COVERSTOCK Arctic Office $10.64/pk (*) WCP Solutions $16.80/ream
: poa 2 . Pyramid School No Bid Neenah #22851
Size/Clr> \8.5 x11"/Cosmic Orange School Specialty $33.26
Brand> |Wausau #22851 Staples No Bid
Unisource $11.90/pk (*)
WCP Solutions $16.80
021104 ‘BUTCHER PAPER Arctic Office $70.74 School Specialty |$46.58/roll
. " , Pyramid School $64.99 Pacon #67301
Size/CIr>  [36"x1000/Black School Spedialty 846,58
Brand> |Riverside #764 Staples No Bid
Unisource $56.90
WCP Solutions $55.76
021105 ‘BUTCHER PAPER Arctic Office $70.74 School Specialty |$43.08/roll
: " , Pyramid School $60.19 BJ #67181
Size/CIr>  [36"x1000'/Dark Blue Sehool Specialty 843,08
Brand> \Riverside #759 Staples No Bid
Unisource $52.90
WCP Solutions $51.84
021107 ‘BUTCHER PAPER Arctic Office $91.54 School Specialty |$39.92/roll
: " , . Pyramid School $55.69 Pacon #67141
Size/Clr> \36 x1000'/Holiday Green School Specialty $39.02
Brand> \Wausau #K580 Staples No Bid
Unisource $49.90
WCP Solutions $48.30

*Does Not Meet Specification
r*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
Frkkk Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna

*xxekxx All or None
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021158 |CONSTRUCTION PAPER (9X12) Arctic Office $1.69 School Specialty |$1.28/pkg
(DK BROWN) Pyramid School $1.99 Tru-Ray
. o School Specialty ~ [$1.28 #103024
Size/CIr> |9"x12"/Dark Brown Staples No Bid
Brand> |Tru-Ray #103024 Unisource $1.40
WCP Solutions $1.72
021165 |CONSTRUCTION PAPER (9X12) Arctic Office $1.69 School Specialty [$1.32/pkg
(PINK) Pyramid School $1.99 Tru-Ray #3012
_ R School Specialty $1.32
Size/CIr>  |9"x12"/Pink Staples No Bid
Brand> ‘Peacock #P7009 Unisource $1.49
WCP Solutions $1.78
021172 |CONSTRUCTION PAPER (9X12) Avrctic Office $1.69 School Specialty  [$1.33/pkg
(SHOCK PINK) Pyramid School $1.99 Tru-Ray #3013
, o , School Specialty $1.33
Size/CIr>  |9"x12"/Shock Pink Staples No Bid
Brand> \Peacock (Hot Pink) #P9209 Unisource $1.49
WCP Solutions $1.79
021191 ‘COPY PAPER 8.5X11 (WHITE) Arctic Office $3.825/ream Staples $28.29/case
. o ) Pyramid School No Bid GP Spectrum
Size/CIr> [8.5"x11"/ White Sehool Specialty  [$29.08 4999705
Brand>  [Xerox #3R2047 Staples $28.29
Unisource $31.49
WCP Solutions $30.82

*Does Not Meet Specification

*»E*Draw

**No Specifications Provided
wrxkkk All or None

*xEx Minimum

*** Not FOB: Soldotna




