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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

      RECAP
 Bid #110-16

01 PIANO
    UPRIGHT
52” H  x  60-1/2” W  x  26

STEINWAY “BOSTON
PERFORMANCE EDITION”
UP-132E PE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

#163553

02 MARIMBA WITH PADAUK
BARS
      STANDARD
88.53” L  x  35.10” W

MAJESTIC Model M6543D
(Woodwind and Brasswind
#H6199)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

No Bid
2581.39
2883.00
3055.00
No Bid
2699.00
2990.00

Guitar Center 2581.39

#163706

03 CONCERT TOMS
     STANDARD
Black

LUDWIG LE-GT62-CC
(Woodwind and Brasswind
#463682 420)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

No Bid
960.25
1030.00
1395.00
No Bid
925.00
840.00

Woodwind/
Brasswind

840.00

#163706

04 SNARE DRUM WITH
STAND AND BAG
Piano Black

PEARL CONCERT SERIES
#CRP1455103-SSB
(Woodwind and Brasswind
#J13537 001 001)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

No Bid
385.90
No Bid
559.00
No Bid
505.00
490.00

Guitar Center 385.90

#163706

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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05 SAXOPHONE
     TENOR

BUNDY BTS-300 Model
#WWXBD52LN
(Woodwind and Brasswind
#462106)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

No Bid
540.02
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
898.00

Guitar Center 540.02

#163706

06 FRENCH HORN
         DOUBLE

YAMAHA YFR-567 Geyer
Series
(Woodwind and Brasswind
#461481)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

2281.00 ****
2589.66 Alt
2281.00
2340.00
No Bid
2475.00
2410.00

Alamo Music
Center

2281.00

#163705

07 BASSOON
    STANDARD

FOX Model IV
(Woodwind and Brasswind
#462106)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alamo Music Center
Guitar Center
The Music Man Inc
Nick Rail Music
Peripole-Bergerault Inc
Sam Ash
Woodwind/Brasswind

5199.00
4910.37
No Bid
4975.00
No Bid
5180.00
5150.00

Guitar Center 4910.37

#163705


