
Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669 

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  1  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15 

Item #

01 BALL STORAGE
STACKER

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$54.80
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$16.35
$185.00 Alt>>***
$23.34>>

Power Systems $16.35#

ClearSize -

Brand POWER SYSTEMS #81020

02 BALL, SLAM BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$123.29 Alt.
No Bid
$20.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
$75.00 Alt>>
$70.65 Alt
$47.96 Alt
$93.84 Alt>>***
$111.45 Alt

No Award#

30 lb. - 9”D - RedSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS ECHO
#IP0204 (ESB-30)

03 BALL, SLAM BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$99.65 Alt.
No Bid
$15.50 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
$61.00 Alt>>
$54.76 Alt
$34.36 Alt
$81.60 Alt>>***
$77.20 Alt

No Award#

20 lb. - 9”D - RedSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS ECHO
#IP0202 (ESB-20)

04 BARBELL, WOMEN’S BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$1521.25 Alt.
No Bid
$1250.00 Alt***
No Bid
$1095.00 Alt>>
$1315.00 Alt>>
No Bid
$930.93 Alt
$600.00 Alt>>***
No Bid

No Award#

15KG - 5/pkgSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS THE
BELLA 2.0 #RF0584

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  2  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15

Item #

05 BASKETBALL GOALS
     BREAKAWAY

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$448.00
$316.59***
$130.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$182.95 Alt *
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BSN Sports $448.00#

ORANGE RIM / WHITE
NET

Size -

Brand GARED MASTER #3500

06 BENCH, FLAT BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$757.00 Alt.
No Bid
$250.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$329.96
$175.00>>***
$827.73 Alt

Power Systems $329.96#

54" L x 48" W x 45" H -
Black frame & padding 

Size -

Brand PRO MAXIMA FW-115

07 COLLAR, SPRING
     OLYMPIC

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$16.00 Alt
No Bid
$9.50 Alt***
No Bid
$9.00 Alt>>
$45.00 Alt>>
$7.07 Alt
$8.23
$6.67 Alt>>***
$13.56>>

Power Systems $8.23#

Steel chrome finishSize -

Brand POWER SYSTEMS #50440

08 DUMBBELLS AND RACK
     HEX

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid
$1148.00 Alt***
$1211.36
$2030.00 Alt>>
$916.00 Alt>>
No Bid
$1450.81
$995.00 Alt>>***
No Bid

Gopher Sport $1211.36#

12 - Pair SetSize -

Brand GOPHER ULTRAFIT #68
-153 (DUMBELLS) #68-155
(RACK)

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue 
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  3  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15

Item #

09 GYM FLOOR COVER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$13674.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BSN Sports $13674.00#

Floor size: 96’W x 106’L -
Red

Size -

Brand GYMGUARD  (ANTHEM
SPORTS #A15-731)

10 MAT, LANDING BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$420.70 Alt*
No Bid
$263.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

4 - 4’ x 4’ mats per set -
Black

Size -

Brand MDUSA #MLMRC

11 MAT, TUMBLING BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid
$314.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$355.38 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Nasco $355.38#

4’ x 10’ x 2” - BlueSize -

Brand GIANTEX

12 MAT, TUMBLING BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$357.00 Alt.
No Bid
$298.00 Alt***
$300.06
No Bid
No Bid
$355.38 Alt*
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gopher Sports $300.06#

4’ x 10’ - Purple & BlackSize -

Brand GOPHER TUMBLEPRO #88
-050

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  4  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15

Item #

13 PITCHERS SCREEN BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$563.50 Alt. *
$493.99***
$352.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

7' length x 7' heightSize -

Brand JUGS SPORTS
PROTECTOR SERIES L
S6000

14 PLATE, BUMPER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$117.00 Alt.
No Bid
$53.00 Alt***
No Bid
$64.20 Alt>>
$72.00 Alt>>
$11.69 Alt*
$38.89 Alt
$40.00 Alt>>***
$96.10 Alt

No Award#

10 lb. - BlackSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS HI-TEMP
#HTRF10LB

15 PLATE, BUMPER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$136.40 Alt
No Bid
$70.25 Alt***
No Bid
$79.40 Alt>>
$88.50 Alt>>
No Bid
$58.33 Alt
$32.00 Alt>>***
No Bid

No Award#

15 lb. - BlackSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS HI-TEMP
#HTRF15LB

16 PLATE, BUMPER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$172.65 Alt
No Bid
$86.00 Alt***
No Bid
$105.90 Alt>>
$121.00 Alt>>
$29.23 Alt*
$97.22 Alt
$50.00 Alt>>***
$161.22 Alt

No Award#

25 lb. - BlackSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS HI-TEMP
#HTRF25LB

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  5  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15

Item #

17 PLATE, BUMPER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$315.00 Alt
No Bid
$156.00 Alt***
No Bid
$160.30 Alt>>
$187.50 Alt>>
$52.62 Alt*
$175.00 Alt
$90.00 Alt>>***
$350.78 Alt

No Award#

45 lb. - BlackSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS HI-TEMP
#HTRF45LB

18 PLATE, GRIP
     OLYMPIC

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$26.75 Alt
No Bid
$3.40 Alt***
No Bid
$7.50 Alt>>
$42.75 Alt>>
No Bid
$6.40
$2.50 Alt>>***
$9.92>>

Power Systems $6.40#

2.5 lbs. - BlackSize -

Brand POWER SYSTEMS ELITE
#60390

19 PLATE, GRIP
     OLYMPIC

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$38.00 Alt
No Bid
$6.70 Alt***
No Bid
$12.50 Alt>>
No Bid
No Bid
$12.17
$5.00 Alt>>***
$16.01>>

Power Systems $12.17#

5 lbs. - BlackSize -

Brand POWER SYSTEMS ELITE
#60392

20 PLATE, GRIP
     OLYMPIC

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$68.00 Alt
No Bid
$13.50 Alt***
No Bid
$25.00 Alt>>
$54.00 Alt>>
No Bid
$24.37
$10.00 Alt>>***
$27.92>>

Power Systems $24.37#

10 lbs. - BlackSize -

Brand POWER SYSTEMS ELITE
#60394

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  6  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15

Item #

21 RACK,

BELT/TUBING/JUMPROPE

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$63.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$68.00 Alt>>
No Bid
$35.73
$89.00>>***
$47.79>>

Power Systems $35.73#

26”W - BlackSize -

Brand POWER SYSTEMS #68160

22 RACK, DUMBBELL
     3-TIER

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid
$642.00 Alt***
No Bid
$775.00 Alt>>
$389.00 Alt>>*
$184.95 Alt*
$530.75
$399.00>>***
No Bid

Power Systems $530.75#

39"W x 107"L x 44"H - BlackSize -

Brand PROMAXIMA FW-58

23 RINGS, GYMNASTIC
WOOD

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid
$575.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
$90.00 Alt>>
No Bid
$288.07 Alt
$112.95 Alt>>***
No Bid

No Award#

Black straps - 5/sets per pkgSize -

Brand ROGUE FITNESS #RF0206
-5

24 RUBBER FLOOR MAT
     BORDER BEVEL

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid
$55.20 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$77.26
$59.50 Alt>>***
No Bid

Power Systems $77.26#

4’ x 4’ x 1/2” - BlackSize -

Brand HUMANE LOKTUFF
MAW9055

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  7  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15 

Item #

25 RUBBER FLOOR MAT
     CENTER

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid
$55.20 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$77.26
$59.50 Alt>>***
No Bid

Power Systems $77.26#

4’ x 4’ x 1/2” - BlackSize -

Brand HUMANE LOKTUFF
MAW9040

26 SOCCER NETS BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$182.30
$97.89***
$125.00 Alt***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Epic Sports $97.89#

 8'2"H x 24'7"W x 0D X
9'0"Base   - White

Size -

Brand FOLD-A-GOAL #NT

27 STORAGE RACK BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$4200.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BSN Sports $4200.00#

34” W x 14’2 ¼” L x 67”HSize -

Brand GYMSAFE PREMIUM
(ANTHEM SPORTS #A15
-917)

28 STORAGE RACK COVER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$374.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BSN Sports $374.00#

34"W x 12'-6"L x 60"H -
Black

Size -

Brand ANTHEM SPORTS A15-732

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  8  of  8

RECAP
Bid #112-16

Due Date: 12-11-15

Item #

29 STORAGE RACK COVER BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$374.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

34"W x 12'-6"L x 60"H -
Black

Size -

Brand ANTHEM SPORTS A15-732

30 STORAGE RACK POWER
WINDER

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$856.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BSN Sports $856.00#

20”LSize -

Brand POWER WINDER
(ANTHEM SPORTS #A15
-729)

31 VOLLEYBALL JUDGES
STAND

BSN Sports
Epic Sports
Gill Athletics
Gopher Sport
Intek Strength
MFAC
Nasco
Power Systems
ProMaxima
School Specialty

$1335.00
$681.28***
$496.00 Alt * ***
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Epic Sports $681.28#

80"H x 32"W x 44"D - Purple
Padding

Size -

Brand BLAZER #6015

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None


