Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #117-16, Science Equipment Re-Cap

Swift SM102 Microscope, LED Stereo

Swift M2250 Series #M2251C Microscope
Monocular Cordless LED

A & D HT-300 Scale, Compact

Wolfe #591815 Stereomicroscope, Student

Flinn AP8733 Table, Demonstration, Mobile

NPS #NPS-PSLT3060-36 Table, Science Lab

Carolina 7015131 Table, Student

* Does not meet specs

Arctic
Office

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$695.00 Alt

$335.00 Alt

B&H
Photo

$319.00

$245.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Carolina

$353.53

$278.21

No Bid

$215.98

No Bid

No Bid

$338.37

Fisher
Scientific

$282.03

$221.32

$134.63 Alt
$181.47 Alt
$1,151.60

$766.11

$304.88 Alt

Frey
Scientific

$315.05 Alt

$240.26

$155.88 Alt
$182.47 Alt
$1,157.66

$690.00

$308.22

Johnson
Scientific

$290.00 Alt

$195.00 Alt

$78.00 Alt

$178.00 Alt

$1,120.00
$789.00

$495.00

K-LOG

$355.25 Alt

$227.90 Alt

No Bid

$108.86 Alt

$1259.29 Alt

$622.60 Alt *

$404.61

Nasco
Modesto

No Bid

$319.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$549.29

Parco
Scientific

$250.00 Alt

$160.00 Alt

$90.00

$155.00 Alt

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Products
Unlimited

No Bid

No Bid

$105.00

$152.00 Alt

$932.00

$721.00 Alt

$403.00

Sargent
Welch

$289.26

$228.56

$70.05 Alt
$241.64 Alt
$1,576.28
$1139.00 Alt

$489.36



