
Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  1  of  5

RECAP
Bid #111-16

Due Date: 12-15-15

Item #

01 EXTRACTOR-SCRUBBER
    MULTI-SURFACE

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

No Bid
$3999.00 Alt*
No Bid
$9933.22 Alt*
$11964.77

WCP $11964.77#

56”L x 27”W w/o squeegee
x 43.5”H - Gray

Size -

Brand ADVANCE ADPHIBIAN
#56317011

02 EXTRACTOR, CARPET
     SELF-CONTAINED

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

No Bid
$1749.00 Alt
$1999.00 Alt
$1995.00 Alt
$1564.36 Alt *
$1970.73

WCP $1970.73#

27”L x 19”W x 28”H -
Blue/silver

Size -

Brand TENNANT E5

03 EXTRACTOR, CARPET
   SELF-CONTAINED

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$3263.45
$1749.00 Alt*
$2995.00
$2797.95 Alt*
$3274.37

Unisource $2995.00#

44.5” x 19.5” x 37” - BlueSize -

Brand CLARKE CLEAN TRACK 18
W&R #CLK-56266002

04 EXTRACTOR, CARPET
SPOT

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$366.59 Alt
$699.00 Alt
$669.00 Alt
$350.00 Alt
$691.00 Alt
$636.00

WCP $636.00#

21”L x 7.75”W - WhiteSize -

Brand NOBLES EX-SPOT-2
#9007629

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None
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RECAP
Bid #111-16

Due Date: 12-15-15

Item #

05 EXTRACTOR, CARPET
SPOT

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$391.63 Alt *
$699.00 Alt
$669.00 Alt
No Bid
$691.00
$499.62 Alt *

Waxie $691.00#

Size -

Brand ADVANCE AQUASPOT
#56220000

06 EXTRACTOR, HEATED Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

No Bid
$3049.00 Alt
$3495.00 Alt
$3471.65
$3692.68 Alt

Waxie $3471.65#

39”H x 25”W x 33”LSize -

Brand ADVANCE ET700
#56113181

07 SCRUBBER, FLOOR
     WALK-BEHIND
(BATTERY OPERATED)

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$14343.24 Alt
$4499.00 Alt
$3999.00 Alt
$6395.00 Alt
$3435.29 *
$4412.50

Oreck Floor Care $3999.00#

46.2”L x 22”W x 38.6”HSize -

Brand ADVANCE SC450
#56383129

08 SCRUBBER, FLOOR
     WALK-BEHIND
(BATTERY OPERATED)

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$3167.45 Alt *
$4499.00 Alt *
$4899.00 Alt 
$3295.00 Alt *
$3435.29 Alt *
$5554.37

WCP $5554.37#

54”L x 22”W x 43.10”HSize -

Brand TENNANT T300

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None
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RECAP
Bid #111-16

Due Date: 12-15-15

Item #

09 SCRUBBER, FLOOR &
CARPET

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

No Bid
$1799.00 Alt*
$2999.00 Alt
$2395.00 Alt
$2108.64
$3023.42

Waxie $2108.64#

Size -

Brand SQUARE SCRUB EBG
-20/C

10 SCRUBBER, TILE &
GROUT

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$329.29 Alt
$449.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

6” x 11” x 47” - BlackSize -

Brand HAWK ENTERPRISE
TALON F0036-115

11 TILT TRUCK
     STANDARD DUTY

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$828.17
No Bid
$800.00
$760.40
$877.18

Waxie $760.40#

60.5”L x 28”W x 38.6”H -
Black

Size -

Brand RUBBERMAID 1305
#FG130500 BLA

12 VACUUM, CANISTER Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$309.75 Alt
$399.00 Alt
$349.00 Alt
$485.00 Alt
$407.53 Alt
$344.21

WCP $344.21#

Blue/silverSize -

Brand TENNANT V6 1069908

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None



Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandDescription

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department 

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907) 714-8876     FAX (907) 262-7165

Page  4  of  5

RECAP
Bid #111-16

Due Date: 12-15-15

Item #

13 VACUUM, CANISTER Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$531.29
$299.00 Alt *
$485.00 Alt
$407.53
$430.88

Waxie $407.53#

Size -

Brand PROTEAM QUIETPRO CN
HEPA #107152 / KIT D
#107100

14 VACUUM, PORTABLE Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$235.63 Alt *
$399.00 Alt *
No Bid
$1678.84
No Bid

Waxie $1678.84#

32”H x 16.5”L x 12”WSize -

Brand NSS M-1 “PIG” &
CLEANING KIT #3093909

15 VACUUM, PORTABLE Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care
Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$235.63 Alt *
$399.00 Alt *
No Bid
$1486.07
No Bid

Waxie $1486.07#

32”H x 16.5”L x 12”WSize -

Brand NSS M-1 “PIG” &
CLEANING KIT #3093759

16 VACUUM, UPRIGHT
    COMMERCIAL

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$202.13 Alt
$369.00 Alt
$349.00 Alt
$330.00 Alt
$517.49 Alt
No Bid

No Award#

Torch/Safety RedSize -

Brand RICCAR #VIBCBP

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None
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RECAP
Bid #111-16

Due Date: 12-15-15

Item #

17 VACUUM, UPRIGHT
    COMMERCIAL

Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

No Bid
$769.00 Alt
$619.00 Alt
No Bid
$436.21 Alt
No Bid

Waxie $436.21#

19.5”W x 10”L x 47”HSize -

Brand ADVANCE CARPETWIN 18
#56 704 201

18 VACUUM, WET/DRY Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

No Bid
$539.00 Alt
$599.00 Alt
$499.00 Alt
$412.73 Alt
$699.53

WCP $699.53#

37.5”H x 29”L x 15.5”WSize -

Brand TENNANT #V-WD-15S

19 VACUUM, WET/DRY Global Equipment
Oreck Floor Care

Unisource
Waxie
WCP

$436.31
$415.00 Alt
$369.00 Alt
$250.00 Alt *
$302.89
$316.57

Waxie $302.89#

Size -

Brand PROTEAM PROGUARD 10
#107129

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None


