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                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

001 CLASSROOM DESK WITH
BOOK BOX
     RECTANGLE
20” D  x  26-1/8” W  x  22-32”

VIRCO ZUMA
#ZADJ2026BOXM

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

147.00
161.94
No Bid
132.61
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
79.55 Alt
175.00
128.43 Alt

School Specialty 79.55

#163673

002 CLASSROOM DESK

20”  x  26”  x  27”

KI “INTELLECT DESK”
#ELD27

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

166.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
141.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
139.81
No Bid
122.71

Think Office 122.71

#163896

003 STUDENT DESK
    LIFT LID
24” Wide  X  18” Deep  X  22

SCHOLAR CRAFT Model
2800

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

127.00 Alt
No Bid
277.92
135.20
No Bid
No Bid
147.00
129.26
140.00
154.50 Alt

School Specialty 129.26

#164058

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

004 STUDENT DESK
    OPEN FRONT
24” Wide  X  18” Deep  X  22

LEARNITURE
(School Outfitters #LNT-023-
SO)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

71.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
73.17
No Bid
No Bid
77.00
No Bid
No Bid
116.99 Alt

Arctic Office 71.00

#163628

005 CLASSROOM TABLE
      TRAPEZOIDAL
60  x  30  x  30

COMMUNITY CLASSMATE
SERIES 6030TRAP

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

675.00
No Bid
No Bid
333.33
No Bid
234.82 Alt *
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
335.71 Alt

Capital Office 333.33

#163620

006 ACTIVITY TABLE
            SQUARE TOP
36” W  x  36” L  x 19-30” H

NORWOOD COMMERCIAL
FURNITURE #RCE3636MC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
167.99
No Bid
199.42 Alt
195.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 167.99

#163628

007 TABLE
      RECTANGULAR
48” L  x  24” W  x  29” H

MAYLINE “FLIP-N-GO
#LF2448T
(Dallas Midwest # T10128)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

339.00
350.52
No Bid
355.68
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
350.00
794.13 Alt

Arctic Office 339.00

#163510
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

008 COMPUTER TABLE
         FIXED HEIGHT

72” L  x  30” W  x  29” H

SMITH CARREL 1500 Series
#01572

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

398.00
No Bid
688.80
349.19
No Bid
270.22 Alt *
580.00
577.44
329.00
422.82 Alt

Staples 329.00

#163510

009 COMPUTER TABLE
         ADJUSTABLE
HEIGHT

60” L  x  24” W  x  25-29” H

SMITH CARREL 1500 Series
#01575

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

498.00
No Bid
547.18
357.32
No Bid
234.82 Alt *
570.00
474.05
345.00
No Bid

Staples 345.00

#163510

010 FOLDING TABLE
            RECTANGLE
48” W  x  24” D  x  30” H

SMITH SYSTEMS UXL
NEST AND FOLD #FL2448

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

561.00
501.17
927.44
479.47
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
500.68
520.00
No Bid

School Specialty 500.68

#163510

011 FOLDING TABLE
            RECTANGLE
60” W  x  24” D  x  30” H

SMITH SYSTEMS UXL
NEST AND FOLD #NL2460

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

599.00
541.48
1057.34
506.13
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
503.11
565.00
No Bid

School Specialty 503.11

#163906
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

012 FOLDING TABLE
            RECTANGLE
72” W  x  24” D  x  30” H

SMITH SYSTEMS UXL
NEST AND FOLD #NL2472

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

627.00
565.64
1145.18
520.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
578.13
595.00
No Bid

BiNW of Alaska 565.64

#163628

013 TABLE
            RECTANGLE
60” W  x  24” D  x  22-32” H

SMITH SYSTEMS PLANNER
LAB STATION #24510
(ATD  American #411004)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

370.00
374.46
899.78
315.15
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
348.13
400.00
No Bid

School Specialty 348.13

#163867

014 TABLE
            RECTANGLE
60” W  x  30” D  x  22-32” H

SMITH SYSTEMS PLANNER
ACCESS STATION #11164
(Demco #WF13588670)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

524.00
528.11
1245.03
447.60
507.18
No Bid
No Bid
483.75
565.00
No Bid

School Specialty 483.75

#163600

015 LIBRARY TABLE
           SQUARE
60” W  x  60” D  x  29.5” H

SMITH SYSTEMS UXL
#XL6060
(Demco
#XL6060GOKIPLTFL)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

538.00
654.73
1178.34
553.80
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
576.80
720.00
No Bid

Arctic Office 538.00

#163600
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

016 FOLDING TABLE, MOBILE
     OCTAGONAL
60” x  60”  x  27” H

MIDWEST MOBILES SOT60

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

643.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
558.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 558.67

#164122

017 TABLE TOP
            ROUND
48” Diameter

HON 10500 Series
#TLD48GNNN

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

241.00
291.88
No Bid
244.92
No Bid
423.62 Alt
No Bid
549.65
215.00
No Bid

Staples 215.00

#163678

018 LIBRARY TABLE

29-1/2” H  x  36” D  x  72” W

COMMUNITY LINCOLN
MATTE
(Demco #12242630)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

549.00
No Bid
No Bid
355.16
588.76
435.42 Alt
No Bid
687.54
525.00
No Bid

Staples 525.00

#163556

019 FOLDING TABLE
          RECTANGLE
18” W  x  60” L  x  29-3/4” H

SOUTHERN ALUMINUM
LINENLESS SWIRL
#SA186P02L-SS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
329.05
No Bid
434.65
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
300.00
No Bid

Staples 300.00

#163569
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      RECAP
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020 TABLE BASE
    CYLINDER
48” Diameter

HON 10500 Series Cylinder
Base

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

316.00
394.99
No Bid
355.16
No Bid
423.62 Alt
No Bid
621.00
342.00
No Bid

Arctic Office 316.00

#163678

021 CONFERENCE TABLE
                   RACETRACK
29” H  x  96” W  x   48” D

OFM #T4896RT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

689.00 Alt
No Bid
1369.10
695.99
No Bid
No Bid
995.00
779.43
750.00
No Bid

Arctic Office 689.00

#163619

022 WORKSTATION, BOW
FRONT
     L-SHAPED
Black

BUSH INDUSTRIES SERIES
C #SRC007RSU 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

1039.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
652.93
No Bid
No Bid
1130.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 652.93

#163619

023 ACTIVITY TABLE
            RECTANGULAR
TOP
30” D  x  60” L  x 22-30” H

VIRCO 4000 Series  #483060

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

165.00
151.39
No Bid
116.72
No Bid
234.82 Alt
183.00
161.78 Alt
175.00
No Bid

Capital Office 116.72

#164022
#163569
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

024 ACTIVITY TABLE
    RECTANGULAR
30” D  x  48” W  x  15-24” H

JONTI-CRAFT BERRIES 
#6473JCE180
(Demco #P12230400)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

148.00 Alt
204.39
320.65
125.85
359.72
234.82 Alt
238.00
171.29
200.00
No Bid

Capital Office 125.85

#163596

025 ACTIVITY TABLE
  RECTANGLE WITH
WHITEBOARD TOP
30” D  x  60” W  x  22-30” H

LEARNITURE #RAL3060-
PK-SO
(School Outfitters #LNT-
RAL3060-PK-SO)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

214.00 Alt *
No Bid
No Bid
239.84
No Bid
No Bid
282.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 239.84

#163620

026 TABLE SET
   NESTING MOBILE
48” D  x  120” W  x  29.5” H

BALT #41499
(National Business Furniture
#41499)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

1663.00
No Bid
No Bid
1860.00
No Bid
No Bid
1440.00
1224.08
1040.00
No Bid

Staples 1040.00

#163510

027 LIBRARY TABLE

60” L  x  36” W  x  29” H

GEORGIA CHAIR 600 GP
Series
(School Specialty #6792373)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

529.00 Alt
No Bid
1142.22
647.99
No Bid
388.22 Alt
No Bid
490.15
385.00
No Bid

No Award

#163561



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 8  of  26

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand Item # Description

      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

028 LIBRARY TABLE

72” L  x  48” W  x  29” H

IRONWOOD
MANUFACTURING
“GLACIER LIBRARY
FURNITURE” #GLT487229

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

648.00 Alt
796.39
No Bid
713.17
No Bid
447.22 Alt
No Bid
434.39
650.00
No Bid

School Specialty 434.39

#163645

029 CLASSROOM TABLE
    WITH STORAGE
36” D  x  48” W  x  24-31” H

JONTI-CRAFT “KDZY”
#55234JC

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

484.00
463.35
667.47
361.87
No Bid
No Bid
472.00
408.85
535.00
No Bid

Capital Office 361.87

#164012

030 COMPUTER TABLE
        RECTANGULAR
48” Long  x  24” Deep  x  22

VIRCO 8700 Series #872448

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

182.00
512.87
No Bid
152.99
No Bid
211.22 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
204.00
No Bid

Capital Office 152.99

#163602

031 COMPUTER TABLE
        RECTANGULAR
72” Long  x  24” Deep  x  22

VIRCO 8700 Series #872472

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

255.00
643.98
No Bid
215.15
No Bid
270.22 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
285.00
No Bid

Capital Office 215.15

#164122
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

032 ACTIVITY TABLE
        RECTANGLE WITH
WHITEBOARD TOP 
8’ Long  x  31-1/4”” Deep  x

OFM Endure Series #9008-
WHT

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
3380.35
2359.99
No Bid
No Bid
2220.00
2102.16
1705.00
No Bid

Staples 1705.00

#164165

033 ACTIVITY TABLE
      RECTANGLE
24” W  x  48” L

SCHOLAR CRAFT 849
SERIES
(School Outfitters #SFT-
FS849RE2448-2140)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

127.00
No Bid
No Bid
87.20
No Bid
211.22 Alt
145.00
126.50 Alt
155.00
No Bid

Capital Office 87.20

#163607

034 ACTIVITY TABLE
      HORSESHOE
60”  x  66”  x  21-30" H

MAHAR CREATIVE 
COLORS #O6066HBK-SN

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

328.00 Alt
497.93
No Bid
293.51
No Bid
411.82 Alt
No Bid
494.85 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 293.51

#163635

035 ACTIVITY TABLE
      CLOVER SHAPE
48”  x  48”  x  22-30" H

VIRCO 4000 SERIES
“CLOVER”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters 
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

176.00
249.11
No Bid
144.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
177.44 Alt
195.00
No Bid

Capital Office 144.00

#163569
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

036 ACTIVITY TABLE
            KIDNEY
48  x  72 inch

VIRCO 4000 Series
#48KID72

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

303.00
623.76
No Bid
231.72
No Bid
411.82 Alt
No Bid
452.01 Alt
325.00
No Bid

Capital Office 231.72

#163636

037 ACTIVITY TABLE
         RECTANGLE
48” W  x  24” D  x  22-30” H

REGENCY SEATING
UTILITY #ACT4824

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

127.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
161.99
No Bid
187.62 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Award

#163636

038 CIRCULATION DESK UNIT

72” W  x  32” H

LIBRACRAFT
(Demco #WF13607100)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2040.00
2578.19
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 2040.00

#163582

039 CIRCULATION DESK END
PANEL
39” H

LIBRACRAFT
(Demco #WF13607080)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
360.00
497.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Demco 497.45

#163582
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

040 CIRCULATION DESK KNEE
SPACE UNIT
          with 2 DRAWERS
32” H

LIBRACRAFT
(Demco #WF13607010)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1560.00
1703.40
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Demco 1703.40

#163582

041 CIRCULATION DESK
BOOK RETURN UNIT
          with 2 DRAWERS
39” H

LIBRACRAFT
(Demco #WF13607130)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1800.00
1909.60
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Demco 1909.60

#163582

042 PEDESTAL DESK
        LEFT
29-1/2” H  x  30” D  x  66” W

HON 38000 Series
#38292LNS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

709.00
794.55
No Bid
701.48
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
778.38
670.00
No Bid

Staples 670.00

#163556

043 RETURN, FLUSH
      RIGHT
29-1/2” H x 24” D  x  48” W

HON 38000 Series
#38215RNS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

472.00
527.35
No Bid
460.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
599.66
440.00
No Bid

Staples 440.00

#163556
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

044 TEACHER DESK
    DOUBLE PEDESTAL
60” W  x  30” D  x  29-1/2” H

SCHOOL FIX #TDL6030

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

589.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
640.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
810.85 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Arctic Office 589.00

#163575

045 DESK SHELL

60” W  x  30” D  x  29”  H

OFFICE SOURCE PL Series 
#PL103
(Officefurniture2go.com #101-
KDA118)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

240.00
No Bid
No Bid
358.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Arctic Office 240.00

#163569

046 DESK
   BOW FRONT
29-1/2” H x  42” D  x  71” W

National Business Furniture
Signature Series 
Contemporary Collection
#15774

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

788.00
No Bid
No Bid
926.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Arctic Office 788.00

#163556

047 WORKSTATION
     CORNER
39” H

BUSH FURNITURE #6399CS
-03K

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

875.00
No Bid
No Bid
689.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1033.58
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 689.45

#164166
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

048 TEACHER DESK
      DOUBLE PEDESTAL
60” W  x  30” D  x  29-1/2” H

SANDUSKY LEE 700 Series
“Heavy Duty”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

615.00
No Bid
No Bid
609.32
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
789.20
720.00
No Bid

Capital Office 609.32

#164054

049 TEACHER DESK
      SINGLE PEDESTAL
48” W  x  30” D  x  30” H 

VIRCO 540 Series Model 543

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

485.00 Alt
788.33
No Bid
524.91
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
593.86 Alt
680.00
No Bid

Arctic Office 485.00

#163673

050 STUDENT CHAIRS

14 inch

LEARNITURE #114-CSW
(School Outfitters #LNT-114-
CSW)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

27.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
30.51
No Bid
41.29 Alt
30.00
No Bid
No Bid
68.67 Alt

Arctic Office 27.00

#164165

051 STUDENT CHAIRS

16 inch

LEARNITURE #116-CSW
(School Outfitters #LNT-116-
CSW)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

31.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
34.51
No Bid
47.19 Alt
39.00
No Bid
No Bid
69.30 Alt

Arctic Office 31.00

#164165
#163620
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

052 STUDENT CHAIRS

18 inch

LEARNITURE #118-CSW
(School Outfitters #LNT-118-
CSW)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

35.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
38.51
No Bid
58.99 Alt
63.00
No Bid
No Bid
72.48 Alt

Arctic Office 35.00

#164165

053 STUDENT CHAIRS
       STACKING
18 inch

ROYAL SEATING #1100
Series Model 18” A 4-leg
(School Specialty #136378)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

41.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
54.61
No Bid
58.99 Alt
No Bid
41.53
No Bid
69.30 Alt

Arctic Office 41.00

#163803

054 STUDENT CHAIR

16 inch (Large)

KI “INTELLECT” EC16

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

60.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
98.33
No Bid
47.19 Alt *
No Bid
99.09
No Bid
82.66

Think Office 82.66

#163896

055 CHAIR, STUDENT
    STACK
15”

VIRCO ZUMA SEATING
#ZU415SGLFR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

69.00
83.62
No Bid
70.80
No Bid
47.19 Alt *
No Bid
52.84 Alt
85.00
69.30 Alt

School Specialty 52.84

#163673
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

056 CHAIR, STUDENT
        ROCKING
18 inch

VIRCO ZUMA SEATING
ROCKS #ZROCK18

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

110.00
117.17
No Bid
80.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
112.19 Alt
130.00
No Bid

Arctic Office 110.00

#163699
#164122

057 CHAIR, STUDENT
    CANTILEVERED
15-1/2 inch

VIRCO ZUMA SEATING
#ZCANT15

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

75.00
79.87
No Bid
74.25
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
89.00
70.58 Alt

Think Office 70.58

#163680

058 CHAIR
     STACK
18” D  x  17.5” W  x  16” H

SMITH SYSTEM FLAVORS
STACK #11848

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

67.00
106.93
121.36
56.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
64.50
69.00
69.30 Alt

School Specialty 64.50

#163596

059 STOOL

Pewter

SAFCO DIESEL SERIES
#SAF-6665

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

103.00
120.57
No Bid
93.33
No Bid
No Bid
119.00
101.34
75.00
54.68 Alt

Staples 75.00

#163647
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      RECAP
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060 TASK CHAIR

Gulf Blue

SCHOLARCRAFT 110
SERIES

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

138.00 Alt
No Bid
233.93
126.40
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
177.03
129.00
122.08 Alt

Think Office 122.08

#163541

061 LIBRARY CHAIR
      UPHOLSTERED
18”

GEORGIA CHAIR 500 Series
(School Specialty #6769383)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

199.00
No Bid
530.47
312.64
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
187.55
215.00
No Bid

Arctic Office 199.00

#163561

062 GUEST CHAIR
   2-POSITION
18-1/2” H Seat

HOLSAG “CAMPUS”
(Demco #13694350)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
221.99
214.82
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Demco 214.82

#163556

063 STACK CHAIR
      UPHOLSTERED
17.5” seat height

KFI SEATING #1310FB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

117.00
119.58
161.34
113.49
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
112.74
120.00
216.18 Alt

School Specialty 112.74

#163600
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      RECAP
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064 MUSIC CHAIR

17.5 inch

National Public Seating 8200
Series “Melody”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
67.84
No Bid
No Bid
76.00
58.41
65.00
90.92 Alt

School Specialty 58.41

#163596

065 STACK CHAIR

19” W  x  21” D  x  33” H

National Public Seating 8600
Series

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

83.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
57.32
No Bid
No Bid
63.00
63.94
55.00
69.30 Alt

Staples 55.00

#163510

066 STACK CHAIR

18”

CLASSROOM SELECT 208
CONTEMPORARY SERIES
#1441243

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

98.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
120.21
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
65.44
No Bid
129.07 Alt

School Specialty 65.44

#163633

067 GUEST CHAIR
     NESTING
24” W  x  23.75” D  x  36.5” H

National Public Seating
#51326

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

320.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
233.33
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 233.33

#163510
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      RECAP
 Bid #116-16

068 CHAIR, STUDENT
    STACK
18 inch

VIRCO ZUMA SEATING
#50552

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

78.00
80.92
No Bid
77.71
No Bid
58.99 Alt *
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
69.30 Alt

Think Office 69.30

#163673

069 CHAIR
        LARGE
29.5” W  x  26” D  x  32.5” H

LESRO BELMONT
COLLECTION #G1651K4
(National Business Furniture
#53987)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

629.00
No Bid
No Bid
631.47
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
595.36
595.00
No Bid

Staples 595.00

#163599

070 COUCH
     LOVESEAT
48.5” W  x  26” D  x  32.5” H

LESRO BELMONT
COLLECTION #G1551K4
(National Business Furniture
#53982)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

760.00
No Bid
No Bid
760.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
648.64
690.00
No Bid

School Specialty 648.64

#163570
#163599

071 FOLDING CHAIR

18-1/4” W  x  20-1/4” D  x  29

National Public Seating 300
Series  #304

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

34.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
31.27
No Bid
No Bid
37.00
27.68
26.00
37.51 Alt

Staples 26.00

#163803
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      RECAP
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072 BALL CHAIR

ISOKINETICS FITNESS
BALL #FBC2

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
106.60
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 106.60

#163647

073 CUBBY STORAGE UNIT

28.5” D  x  24” W  x  41” H

WHITNEY BROTHERS
#WB0702

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

744.00 Alt
633.83
1451.70
535.51
No Bid
575.84
No Bid
No Bid
600.00
No Bid

Capital Office 535.51

#163620

074 STORAGE CABINET

48” W  x  13” D  x  36” H

ECR4KIDS #ELR-0421 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

469.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
254.99
No Bid
No Bid
298.00
263.64
270.00
No Bid

Capital Office 254.99

#163540

075 STORAGE CABINET

48” W  x  15” D  x  49” H

WOOD DESIGNS BIG 
CUBBY #WD50916

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
1030.17
527.84
No Bid
No Bid
820.00
745.55
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 527.84

#163540
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076 WALL CABINET
   GLASS DOUBLE DOORS
48” W  x  12” D  x  30” H

SHAIN SOLUTIONS
(School Specialty #142680)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

769.00
No Bid
No Bid
751.07
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
758.53
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 751.07

#163610

077 STORAGE TRAY CABINET

47-7/8” W  x  14-3/4” D  x  30

CLASSIC BIRCH ALL-
PURPOSE
(Lakeshore #JJ854)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

619.00 Alt
747.38
No Bid
638.67
No Bid
529.82
No Bid
524.86
No Bid
No Bid

School Specialty 524.86

#163678

078 STORAGE TRAY

11” x 14” x 3”

Lakeshore #LM124

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

144.00 Alt
207.43
No Bid
220.00
No Bid
194.70
No Bid
Included  #077
No Bid
No Bid

School Specialty

#163678

079 MULITMEDIA SPINNER
     MOBILE
20” W  x  20” D  x  73” H

PALADIN “ALL-IN-ONE”
(The Library Store #88-0329)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
975.93
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 975.93

#163600
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080 BOOKCASE
      2 SHELF
30” H  x  15.4” D  x  35.7” W

BUSH BUSINESS
FURNITURE #BK3036

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

225.00
No Bid
No Bid
110.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
96.59
129.00
No Bid

School Specialty 96.59

#163602

081 BOOKCASE
      3 SHELF
48” H  x  15.4” D  x  35.7” W

BUSH BUSINESS
FURNITURE #BK4836

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

204.00
No Bid
No Bid
166.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
144.89
195.00
No Bid

School Specialty 144.89

#163602

082 BOOKCASE
    STEEL
Light Gray

HON #S72ABCQ

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

239.00
274.04
No Bid
224.12
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
322.98
215.00
No Bid

Staples 215.00

#163575

083 BOOKCASE, LIBRARY
        5-SHELVES
72.3” H  x  14.1” D  x  36.0”

SAUDER #412177

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
219.93
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
310.00
No Bid

Capital Office 219.93

#163678
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084 BOOKCASE, LIBRARY
        5-SHELVES
69.8” H  x  13.2” D  x  35.3”

SAUDER #410367

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters 
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

415.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
195.23
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
225.00
No Bid

Capital Office 195.23

#163636

085 BOOKCASE

42” H  x  24” D  x  36” W

UNFINISHED FURNITURE

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
766.67
No Bid
234.82 Alt *
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 766.67

#163636

086 BOOKSHELF

27-1/4” H  x  12” D  x  30” W

WOOD DESIGNS
“CONTENDER” #C12930

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
304.71
180.00
No Bid
No Bid
195.00
236.36
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 180.00

#163593

087 SHELVING UNIT

72” H  x  18” D  x  36” W

EDSAL #UR185L-BLK

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

211.00
No Bid
No Bid
68.37
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 68.37

#163630
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088 CHAIR DOLLY
      STACKING
35 in. W x 22.75 in. D x 38 in.

National Public Seating 8200
Series #B00AWQ7VHW

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
183.99
No Bid
No Bid
185.00
205.20
170.00
No Bid

Staples 170.00

#163596

089 TABLE CART

31 in. W x  74 in. L

LAYFLAT TABLE MOVER
(School Fix #TT490)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

325.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
284.43
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
209.95
No Bid
No Bid

School Specialty 209.95

#163906

090 TABLE CART

31 in. W x  28 in. L x 48 in H

School Fix #TT481

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

259.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
251.93
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
460.80 Alt
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 251.93

#163906

091 CHAIR TRUCK
    HANGING
Black finish

CORRELL INC Model C84
(School Outfitter #COR-C84)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

536.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
323.99
No Bid
No Bid
710.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 323.99

#164078
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092 TABLE MOVER
          UPRIGHT
Black finish

Shiffler Equipment #URTC6

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

799.00
No Bid
No Bid
667.24
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
748.58
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 667.24

#163841

093 WIRE GARMENT RACK
         MOBILE
60” W  x  18” D  x  80” H

STOREMORESTORE #SMS
-69-UR1860C

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
412.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Capital Office 412.95

#163575

094 LECTERN
    FLOOR
Medium Oak

OKLAHOMA SOUND #800X

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

1229.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
755.59
No Bid
No Bid
720.00
850.76
No Bid
No Bid

School Outfitters 720.00

#163607

095 LECTERN
    FLOOR
22” W  x  46” H  x  17” D

OKLAHOMA SOUND
#111PLS “POWER PLUS
SOUND” (School Specialty
#1363819)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

979.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
780.59
No Bid
No Bid
545.00
630.68
460.00
No Bid

Staples 460.00

#163555
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096 END TABLE

22” W  x  22” D  x  21” H

HIGH POINT FURNITURE
NEXSTEP COLLECTION
#793MAH

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

337.00
No Bid
503.05
344.56
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
308.98
350.00
No Bid

School Specialty 308.98

#163599

097 FILE CABINET
     VERTICAL
28.5” D x 15” W x 29” H

HON 210 Series H212

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

330.00
363.82
No Bid
334.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
638.73
319.00
No Bid

Staples 319.00

#163897

098 DISPLAY CASE

36” W x 40” H x 14” D

WADDELL HERITAGE
SERIES 8949

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

885.00
957.88
3341.95
860.65
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
863.18
939.00
No Bid

Capital Office 860.65

#163645

099 BENCH TABLE
      CONVERTIBLE
8’ L

VIRCO  MTC8

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

731.00
901.73
No Bid
735.56
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
632.46 Alt
879.00
No Bid

School Specialty 632.46

#163575
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100 WHITEBOARD
     MAGNETIC
5’ W  x  3’ H

QUARTET #SM535B

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

145.00
223.77
No Bid
230.64
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
490.01
No Bid
No Bid

Arctic Office 145.00

#163634

101 WHITEBOARD
     MAGNETIC
6’ W  x  4’ H

QUARTET #SM537B

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska 
Brodart
Capital Office 
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

205.00
318.23
No Bid
339.49
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
412.91
No Bid
No Bid

Arctic Office 205.00

#163634

102 MARKERBOARD
      PORCELAIN
5’ W  x  4’ H

GHENT CENTURION
#14UPM45

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office Products
BiNW of Alaska
Brodart
Capital Office
Demco
Lakeshore
School Outfitters
School Specialty
Staples
Think Office

250.00
346.99
1143.75
323.99
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
480.18
No Bid
No Bid

Arctic Office 250.00

#163634


