KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue

Soldotna, Alaska 99669

(907)714-8876

bgillil

FAX (907)262-7165
and@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 1l of 6

RECAP
Bid #123-16

[ ltem # Description

Vendors & Price Quoted

Vendor Awarded & Price/Brand ]

01 2” X 6” X 12° HEM/FIR Builder’s Choice 7.38 Spenard Builders - 7.21
Size - Spenard Builders - Kenai
Kenai 7.21
Brand .
Bid - Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 7.52
#165206
02 27 X 6” X 10" HEM FIR Builder’'s Choice 6.15 Spenard Builders - 6.00
Size - Spenard Builders - Kenai
Kenai 6.00
Brand .
Bid - Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 6.48
#165206
03 2” X 6” X 16° HEM FIR Builder’s Choice 9.95 Spenard Builders - 10.52
Size - Spenard Builders - Kenai
Kenai 10.52
Brand .
Bid - Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 11.16
#165206
04 |2" X 4” X 12" SPRUCE-PIN-  Builder’'s Choice 4.92 Spenard Builders - 5.50
FIR Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size - Kenai 5.50
Brand [Home Depot #161-667 Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 5.76
#165297

* Does Not Meet Specifications

** No Specificiations Provided
****DraW

*** Not FOB: Soldotna
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05 2” X 4” X 16’ HEM FIR Builder’s Choice 6.63 Spenard Builders - 6.89
PRIME Spenard Builders - Kenai
_ Kenai 6.89
Size - Spenard Builders -
Brand Soldotna 8.32
Bid -
#165297
1” x 4”7 x 12° CEDAR Builder’s Choice 6.53 Spenard Builders - 6.16
TITEKNOT Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size - Kenai 6.16
Brand Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 6.39
#165206
07 1” x 6”7 x 12’ CEDAR Builder’'s Choice 10.81 Spenard Builders - 9.90
TITEKNOT Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size - Kenai 9.90
Brand Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 10.23
#165206
08 67 x 16’ PINE TITEKNOT  Builder’s Choice 13.12 Spenard Builders - 12.71
SIDING Spenard Builders - Kenai
TONGUE & GROOVE Kenai 12.71
Size - Spenard Builders -
gfgnd Soldotna 17.80
I -

#165302
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2” x 8” x 16" LOG CABIN Builder’s Choice 28.00 Spenard Builders - 25.41
S'DT'EEGUE & GROOVE Spenard Builders - Kenai

_ Kenai 25.41
Size - Spenard Builders -
Brand Soldotna 35.38
Bid -
#165302
10 6” X 6” x 20’ Builder’'s Choice 97.82 Spenard Builders - 83.00
TREATED Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size - Kenai 83.00
Brand |Brown Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 92.52
#165206
1 |CDX PLYWOOD Builder's Choice 59.95 Spenard Builders - 45.00
PRESSURE-TREATED  gpenard Builders - Kenai
Size - |3/4" x4 x 8 Kenai 45.00
Brand |H0me Depot #261688 Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 48.44
#165285
#165297
12 lPLYWOOD, CDX Builder’s Choice 26.35 Spenard Builders - 21.68
Size- 4 X 8 X 508 (19/32) Spengrd Builders - Kenai
Kenal 21.68
Brand .
Bid - Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 23.75
#165206
13 SMART SIDING, OSB Builder’s Choice 42.28 Spenard Builders - 41.33
Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size- |4 X 8 X 7/16” Kenai 41.33
Brand Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 45.13

#165206
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14 3/47 X 4' X 8 Builder’'s Choice 44.05 Spenard Builders - 30.27
UNDERLAYMENT Spenard Builders - Kenai
PLYWOOD Kenai 30.27
TONGUE AND enal _ :
GROOVE Spenard Builders -
Size - Soldotna 32.54
Brand
Bid -
#165206
15 ROOF PANEL Builder’'s Choice 34.50 Spenard Builders - 28.00
METAL Spenard Builders - Kenai
size- |3 x 10 Kenali 28.00
Brand [METAL SALES “PRO-PANEL Spenard Builders -
Bid- I #2594110 Soldotna 29.48
(Home Depot #1000043791)
#165292
16 RIDGE FLASHING Builder’'s Choice 33.25 Spenard Builders - 28.50
UNIVERSAL Spenard Builders - Kenai
size- [10'6” Kenai 28.50
Brand [METAL SALES #4203441 Spenard Builders -
Bid - [Home Depot #1000043690) Soldotna 30.79
#165292
17 |ROOF SHINGLES Builder's Choice 34.56 Spenard Builders - 38.00
3-TAB Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size - IAntique Brown Kenai 38.00
Brand |MALARKEY #204 Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 41.39

#165206
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18 [ROOFING FELT Builder’'s Choice 34.35 Alt Spenard Builders - 32.09
Size - Spenard Builders - Kenai
Brand |#D226 Kenai 32.09
Bid - Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 34.50
#165206
19 |ROOFING PANEL Builder's Choice 66.51 Spenard Builders - 29.84
POLYCARBONATE Spenard Builders - Kenai
Size- [26"X 12' Kenai 29.84
Brand |SUNTUF #101699 Spenard Builders -
Bid - Soldotna 37.39
#165292
#165297
20 Ir HINGE Builder’s Choice No Bid Spenard Builders - 3.69
Size - |6 Spenard Builders - Kenai
Kenai 3.69
Brand [NATIONAL MFG CO #N129 :
Bid- |171 Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 4.59
#165206
1 [BARREL BOLT Builder’s Choice No Bid Spenard Builders - 2.82
Size- 4" Spenard Builders - Kenai
Kenai 2.82
Brand [NATIONAL MFG CO #N151 :
Bid- |g5g Spenard Builders -
Soldotna 3.29
#165206
22 [HASP, SWIVEL Builder’s Choice No Bid Spenard Builders - 5.46
size - Ja-1/2 igﬁg;’;\rd Builders - 16 Kenai
Brand |NATIONAL MFG CO #V32 Spenard Builders '
Bid - -
Soldotna 6.69

#165206
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93 IpooR PULL Builder’'s Choice No Bid Spenard Builders - 2.92
Size - |6-3/4" Spen_ard Builders - Kenai
Kenai 2.92
Brand [NATIONAL MFG CO #N100 S 4 Build
Bid- |313 penard Builders -
Soldotna 3.35
#165206
24 [HURRICANE ANCHOR Builder’'s Choice .60 Spenard Builders - .51
Si Spenard Builders - Kenai
ize - .
Kenai 51
Brand ISIMPSON H.25AZ “Z-MAX" Spenard Builders -
Bid - [(SBS #SIMH25AZ) P
Soldotna .65
#165206
o5 DELIVERY CHARGE Builder’s Choice Free with Pkg
Size - Spengrd Builders -
Kenai Free
Brand .
Bid - Spenard Builders -

Soldotna Free




