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RECAP
Bid #124-16

Due Date: 3-4-16

Item #

01 CAMERA,  DIGITAL
(MIRRORLESS)

Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$448.00 Alt*
No Bid
No Bid
$549.90 Alt
$857.37 Alt
No Bid
$740.00
$609.95
$1196.95 Alt

Tri State Camera $609.95#

BlackSize -

Brand SAMSUNG #EV-
NX30ZZBGBUS

02 CAMERA, DIGITAL Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$446.95
No Bid
No Bid
$446.95
$407.15 Alt **
No Bid
$540.00
$430.00
$446.95

Tri State Camera $430.00#

BlackSize -

Brand NIKON D3300 DSLR #1532

03 CAMERA, INTERACTIVE
DOCUMENT

Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$679.00
No Bid
$630.00
$615.95
$673.37
$511.00 Alt
$735.00
$680.50
$616.00

Howard
Technology Sol

$511.00#

Size -

Brand ELMO TT-12ID #1349

04 HDTV, LED Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$316.00 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
$258.00 Alt
$343.99 Alt
No Bid
$325.00
$304.95
$239.00 Alt

B&H Photo $258.00#

32”Size -

Brand SHARP #LC-32LB370U

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None
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05 PRINTER, HP OFFICEJET 
PRO X451DN

Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$306.00
$337.80
No Bid
$299.00
No Bid
$327.00
$250.00
$359.40
No Bid

Marsh Creek LLC $250.00#

Size -

Brand HEWLETT PACKARD
#CN459A#B1H

06 PROJECTOR CEILING
MOUNT

Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$94.50
$73.90
$118.00
$75.00
$139.49 Alt
$98.00
$90.00
$102.00
$79.00

Arctic Office Pro. $73.90#

7.1" x 7.1" x 4.2" - SilverSize -

Brand EPSON #ELPMBPJF

07 PROJECTOR, LCD Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$1833.90
$1977.80
$1775.00
$1900.00
$2811.26 Alt
$1921.00 Alt
$2033.00
$2003.00
$1699.00

W.B. Hunt Co Inc. $1699.00#

20.8 x 8.2 x 14.2 inches -
White

Size -

Brand EPSON #EMP1985WU
POWERLITE

08 TABLET, DRAWING Adorama
Arctic Office Products
AVES
B&H Photo
Dell Marketing 
Howard Technology Sol.
Marsh Creek LLC
Tri State Camera
W.B. Hunt Co Inc.

$789.25
No Bid
No Bid
$739.90
$859.99
No Bid
$945.00
$815.00
$688.00

No Award#

13.3”Size -

Brand WACOM CINTIQ 13HD
#DTK1300

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations and/or Addendum Provided
*** Not FOB:  Soldotna     ****Draw    *****No Award-bid as all or none  >>All or None


