
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #125-16 Re-Cap

Award in Bold   

Computer Lewis Max Interactive Saitech Inc

Aprisa Tablet Solutions Dell GCSIT & Lewis

Dell Latitude E5550/5550 CTO Laptop 899.98$         924.25$       783.00$      732.00$     750.77$      No Bid 808.81$        

Dell Optiplex 5040 SFF Desktop Computer 628.00$         639.51$       555.00$      518.00$     602.91$      No Bid 548.81$        

Dell Professional Topload 14.1 (460-BBMO) 43.48$            44.75$         44.00$        40.50$        43.02$        25.95$        40.99$          

Dell USB Mouse (330-9456) 14.48$            No Bid  14.00$         13.25$        14.33$        No Bid 13.85$          

Dell PowerEdge T630 6,698.00$      7,076.60$   6,852.00$  5,721.00$  6,819.91$  No Bid 6,389.62$    

Dell Chromebook II 224.88$         227.92$       221.00$      212.00$      209.31$      No Bid 199.14$        

Dell Extrenal USB Slim DVD +/- RW Drive (429-AAUX) 41.98$            46.04$         43.19$        40.00$        43.02$        No Bid 40.99$          

Dell E-Port Plus Docking Station (331-6307) 118.00$         127.89$       167.00$      147.00$      121.29$      No Bid 118.95$        

Dell Flat Panel Monitor Stand for Docking Station (330-0874) 74.48$            76.73$         72.00$        68.00$        70.99$        No Bid 68.95$          

    

Microsoft Surface Pro 4 Tablet 949.88$         No Bid 949.05$      936.00$      953.80$      No Bid No Bid

    

Microsoft Surface Pro 4 Type Cover Included with Tablet No Bid 138.90$      134.00$      108.91$      29.25$        No Bid

    

Anthro Ergotron Yes Charging Cart #YESMORGMPW4 1,398.88$      1,435.69$   1,594.00$  1,420.00$  $1133.51 * No Bid $1249.00 Alt

Anthro Ergotron Yes36 Charging Cart #YESMJUGMPW4 1,288.00$      1,309.29$   1,398.24$  1,367.00$  1,133.51$  No Bid 1,179.00$    

    

ELO Touch Solutions TouchScreen Monitor, 15" (E144246) 388.00$         444.01$       440.31$      432.00$      398.68$      No Bid 411.00$        

* No longer available


