
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
Purchasing Department

139 E. Park Avenue
Soldotna, Alaska  99669

(907)714-8876      FAX (907)262-7165
bgilliland@kpbsd.k12.ak.us

Page 1  of  5

                                Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price/BrandItem # Description

      RECAP
 Bid #122-16

01 DRUM SANDER
     DOUBLE
64-1/4” W  x  49” D  x   43

WOODMASTER Model 5075-
x2-153

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna

9829.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
8559.65

W. W. Grainger 8559.65

#164974

02 BELT SANDER
     INDUSTRIAL

MUST BE UL
JET J-4300A #414600

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

1785.00
2298.40
2125.00
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
760.00 Alt *

Alaska Industrial
Hardware

1785.00

#165003

03 COMPOUND MITER SAW
     DOUBLE BEVEL
SLIDING

12 inch

DeWALT #DWS780

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

679.00
780.00
1020.00
No Bid

592.50

645.00
655.20

Spenard Builders -
Kenai

592.50

#164977

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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04 AIR COMPRESSOR

DeWALT #D55146

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

369.00
781.00
916.54
No Bid

340.00

365.00
463.76

Spenard Builders -
Kenai

340.00

#164977

05 ORBIT SANDER,
      RANDOM
5 inch

DEWALT #D26453K

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

59.97
112.60
150.00
No Bid

75.00

82.99 Alt
100.40

Alaska Industrial
Hardware

59.97

#164974

06 CIRCULAR SAW
      LIGHTWEIGHT

DeWALT #DWE575

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

99.95 Alt
210.70
220.00
No Bid

116.00

120.00
133.40

Spenard Builders -
Kenai

116.00

#164974

07 RECIPROCATING SAW
      CORDLESS

DeWALT #DC385-B  “TOOL
ONLY”

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

109.00
146.20
360.00
No Bid

94.00

99.99
119.08

Spenard Builders -
Kenai

94.00

#164974
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08 FRAMING NAILER

DeWALT #DW325PL

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

329.00 Alt
276.30
310.00
No Bid

215.00

226.00
313.79

Spenard Builders -
Kenai

215.00

#164973

09 IMPACT WRENCH
     CORDLESS

MILWAUKEE M18 FUEL
Model 2763-20 
(Home Depot #1000022615)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

219.00 Alt
260.97
280.00
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
218.00

W. W. Grainger 218.00

#164979

10 DRILL BIT

DeWALT #DW1361

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

69.95 Alt
49.38
49.50
No Bid

No Bid

29.99
35.56

Spenard Builders -
Soldotna

29.99

#164974

11 JOB BOX

47.75” W  x  24” H  x  25-1/2”

HUSKY #BMJB4824D
(Home Depot #128-961)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

549.99 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Award

#164979
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12 SANDING DISCS
          RANDOM ORBIT

DeWALT #DW4307

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

3.19 Alt
12.29
9.00
No Bid

2.60

3.19
5.07

Spenard Builders -
Kenai

2.60

#164974

13 DOZER HOLE SAW

MILWAUKEE “GENERAL
PURPOSE” Model #4-22
-4025

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

124.95 Alt
135.04
145.00
No Bid

No Bid

122.50 Alt
144.20

Spenard Builders -
Soldotna

122.50

#164974

14 WORKBENCH
    MOBILE
49.5 in. W  x  18.2 in. D  x  37

HUSKY #HOTC4609B1QBD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

539.99 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
1017.89

Alaska Industrial
Hardware

539.99

#164974

15 STEP LADDER

10 foot

WERNER Model #310

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

274.99 Alt
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
231.84

W. W. Grainger 231.84

#164979
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16 WORKSHOP TABLE AND
TOOL KIT

STRONGHAND TOOLS
BUILDPRO “MODULAR
FIXTURING FOR
EDUCATION”
#TMQA57838SK

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
7275.00

W. W. Grainger 7275.00

#164975

17 WORKSHOP TABLE AND
TOOL KIT

STRONGHAND TOOLS
BUILDPRO “MODULAR
FIXTURING FOR
EDUCATION”
#TMQA57838SK

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Alaska Industrial
Hardware
Midwest Technology
Paxton Patterson
School Specialty
Spenard Builders -
Kenai
Spenard Builders -
Soldotna
W. W. Grainger

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
Included in #16#164975


