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Item # Item Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price

021016 COVERSTOCK $10.55/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #22861

8.5”x11”Cellestial BlueSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22861Brand>

021018 COVERSTOCK $10.55/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #22841

8.5”x11”/Rocket RedSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22841Brand>

021021 COVERSTOCK $10.55/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #22731

8.5”x11”/Solar YellowSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22731Brand>

021023 COVERSTOCK $10.55/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #22741

8.5”x11”/Gamma GreenSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22741Brand>

021024 COVERSTOCK $10.55
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #21855

8.5”x11”/Blue (Terrestrial Teal)Size/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22109Brand>

021025 COVERSTOCK $10.55/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #22851

8.5”x11”/Cosmic OrangeSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22851Brand>

021026 COVERSTOCK $10.55/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #22751

8.5”x11”/Re-entry RedSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Wausau #22751Brand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                              ****Draw     ***** Minimum    ****** All or None
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021028 COVERSTOCK $6.09/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$5.39
No Bid
No Bid

$5.39/ream
Domtar #81036

8.5”x11”/WhiteSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

WCP Frontier

Domtar #81036Brand>

021102 BUTCHER PAPER $74.07
$57.59
$48.25******
$55.01
No Bid
$44.14

$48.25/roll
Pacon #67001

WhiteSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Riverside #750Brand>

021130 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $4.03
$2.95
$2.68
$2.89
No Bid
$3.49

$2.68/pkg
Tru Ray #3061

12”x18”/BlackSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #3061Brand>

021134 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $4.17
$3.99
$3.25
$3.62
No Bid
$3.84

$3.25/pkg
Tru Ray #3038

12”x18”/Festive GreenSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

 Peacock (Holiday Green) #P8012,Brand>

021137 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $4.12
$3.25
$2.70
$3.07
No Bid
$3.35

$2.70/pkg
Tru Ray #3048

12”x18”/Sky BlueSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

True-Ray #03048Brand>

021143 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $3.92
$2.98
$2.47
$2.84
No Bid
$2.95

$2.47/pkg
Tru Ray #3058

12”x18”/WhiteSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #3058Brand>

021144 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $3.89
$3.39
$2.83
$3.18
No Bid
$3.49

$2.83/pkg
Tru Ray #3036

12”x18”/YellowSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #3036Brand>
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021146 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $3.60
$3.69
$3.10
$3.44
No Bid
$3.49

$3.10/pkg
Tru Ray #3032

12”x18”/MagentaSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #3032Brand>

021155 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.95
$1.60
$1.36
$1.59
No Bid
$2.18

$1.36/pkg
Tru Ray #3029

9”x12”/BlackSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Peacock #P6309Brand>

021158 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.83
$1.79
$1.50
$1.72
No Bid
$2.11

$1.50/pkg
Tru Ray #3024

9”x12”/Dark BrownSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #103024Brand>

021162 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.85
$1.69
$1.53
$1.72
No Bid
$2.11

$1.53/pkg
Tru Ray #3016

9”x12”/Sky BlueSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #3016Brand>

021164 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.80
$1.83
$1.53
$1.76
No Bid
$2.21

$1.53/pkc
Tru Ray #3002

9”x12”/OrangeSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Peacock #P6609Brand>

021168 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.90
$1.56
$1.41
$1.56
No Bid
$1.90

$1.41/pkg
Tru Ray #3026

9”x12”/WhiteSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Tru-Ray #3026Brand>

021169 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.95
$1.79
$1.49
$1.72
No Bid
$2.18

$1.49/pkg
Tru Ray #3004

9”x12”/YellowSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

 Peacock #P8409Brand>
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021170 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.83
$1.98
$1.65
$1.69
No Bid
$2.21

$1.65/pkg
Tru Ray #3423

9”x12”/LimeSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Peacock (Hot Lime) #P9609Brand>

021173 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.91
$1.89
$1.57
$1.81
No Bid
$2.21

$1.57/pkg
Tru Ray #3017

9”x12”/Royal BlueSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

 Peacock (Dark Blue) #P7309Brand>

021174 CONSTRUCTION  PAPER $1.02
$.83
$.72
$.99
No Bid
$2.11

$.72/pkg
Sunworks
#81039”x12”/Light GreenSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Sunworks #8103Brand>

021181 COPY PAPER $45.80
No Bid
$50.35
$51.50
No Bid
No Bid

$45.80/case
Wll #8510010R

8.5”x11”/LilacSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Arctic Office

Xerox #3R11059Brand>

021186 COPY PAPER $47.10
No Bid
$50.35
$51.50
No Bid
No Bid

$47.10/case
Xerox #3R11050

8.5”x11”/BlueSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Arctic Office

Xerox #3R11050Brand>

021187 COPY PAPER $47.10
No Bid
$50.35
$51.50
No Bid
No Bid

$47.10/case
Xerox #3R11051

8.5”’x11”/GreenSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Arctic Office

WausauBrand>

021189 COPY PAPER $47.10
No Bid
$50.35
$51.50
No Bid
No Bid

$47.10/case
Xerox #3R11053

8.5”x11”/YellowSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Arctic Office

Xerox #3R11053Brand>
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021190 COPY PAPER $47.10
No Bid
$50.35
$51.50
No Bid
No Bid

$47.10/case
Xerox #3R11055

8.5”xx11”/GoldenrodSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Arctic Office

Xerox #3R11055Brand>

021191 COPY PAPER $33.66
No Bid
$30.50
$29.90
$31.25
No Bid

$29.90/case
GP NWC
#991346PA8.5"x11”/ WhiteSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

WCP Frontier

Xerox #3R2047Brand>

020960 COVERSTOCK $6.09/pkg
No Bid
$10.60
$11.52
No Bid
No Bid

$10.60/ream
Neenah #82331

8.5”x11”/Pastel YellowSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Domtar #81044Brand>

021197 COPY PAPER,  3 HOLE PUNCHED $65.90
No Bid
$37.46
$48.60
No Bid
No Bid

$37.46/case
Boise Comet 92

8.5”x11”/WhiteSize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Xerox #3R2641Brand>

021027 COVERSTOCK $10.65/pkg
No Bid
$16.55
$17.00
No Bid
$31.78

$16.55/ream
Neenah #21971

8.5”x11”/Gravity Grape(Dark Purple)Size/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Unisource

Neenah #21971Brand>

021180 COPY PAPER $47.10
No Bid
$50.35
$51.50
No Bid
No Bid

$47.10/case
Xerox #3R11060

8.5”x11”/CherrySize/Clr>

Arctic Office
Pyramid School
Unisource
WCP Frontier
Contract Paper
School Specialty

Arctic Office

Wausau & Colorsoucre #04E3811Brand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                              ****Draw     ***** Minimum    ****** All or None


