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FOB SOLDOTNA 

HandGard #FB37 RM Country Foods 57.25$                       

or equal FSA 42.41$                       

Form Plastic #5000-108500 Country Foods No Bid

FSA No Bid

Pactiv #0TH100220000 Country Foods 30.28$                       

or equal (500 per case) FSA 30.45$                       

CelluCap #RC100 Country Foods 74.14$                       

or equal FSA No Bid

Pactiv #YCI8-1160-0000 Country Foods 39.31$                       

FSA 40.38$                       

404 20 CASE 500/ea

Container, Plastic Sandwich, Hinged, Smartlock, 6"

402 15 CASE 504/ea

Bowls, Foam, 22 oz.

403 0 CASE 10/100ea

Caps, Paper, Sanitary, Disposable, White. No known QTY.

400 20 CASE 200/ea

Bags, Bun Pan, Plastic, 27"x 37", High Density Heat 

Resistant. 

401 0 CASE 2,400 ea

Portion Tray, 4.3 oz, Clear Plastic. No Known QTY.
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FOB SOLDOTNA 

Pactiv #YCI8-1048-0000 FSA 35.75$                       

Par-Pak #02090 Country Foods 35.01$                       

Solo #R9N-J8000 Country Foods 88.15$                       

or equal FSA 88.37$                       

Dixie #9PPATH FSA 92.69$                       

Dixie #P020XXTRANSL FSA 30.78$                       

Solo P200N 10/250 CT Country Foods 29.11$                       

Solo B200N-0100 FSA 29.64$                       

Solo #P550N Country Foods 57.81$                       

FSA 59.21$                       

Dixie #P055TRANSLUC

Solo #B

Solo #P400N Country Foods 45.01$                       

FSA 46.26$                       

408 30 CASE 10/250ea

Cups, 5.5 oz, Souffle, Plastic, Translucent

409 50 CASE 10/250ea

Cups, 4 oz, Souffle, Plastic, Translucent, Solo

406 10 CASE 20/100ea

Cups, 9 oz, Paper, Waxed 

407 10 CASE 12/200ea

Cups, 2 oz, Souffle, Plastic, Translucent, Dixie

405 5 CASE 250/ea

Container, Plastic, 7", Hinged Hoagie, Single 

Compartment, Lockable
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FOB SOLDOTNA  

ProPak #17638 Country Foods No Bid

FSA 22.33$                       

Essentials #69407

ProPak #16826

PrimeSource 18X1000 #7500210 Country Foods 62.01$                       

FSA No Bid

Primesource

or equal

Anchor #10800091 Country Foods 15.11$                       

FSA No Bid

PrimeSource #75007140 Country Foods 7.94$                         

or equal

FSA No Bid

PrimeSource #75007130 Country Foods 7.94$                         

or equal FSA 10.15$                       

414 10 CASE 10/100ea

Gloves, Size Medium, Sanitary, Embossed, Food Grade 

Plastic, Disposable.

412 0 CASE 18"x2000'

Film, 18"x2000', PVC Clear, Dispenser Box w/ Cutter 

Guard Edge. No known QTY.

413 0 CASE 10/100ea

Gloves, Size Large, Sanitary, Embossed, Food Grade 

Plastic, Disposable. No known QTY.

410 40 CASE 500/ea

Container, Foam, 8oz, Squat

411 0 CASE 18"x1000'

Foil, 18"x1000', Dispenser Box w/ Cutter Guard Edge. No 

known QTY.
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FOB SOLDOTNA 

PrimeSource #75007120 Country Foods 7.94$                         

or equal FSA No Bid

Best Value #803PG Country Foods 3.54$                         

FSA 2.60$                         

Grainger #11M710

or equal

Dixie #PL2C

Solo PL2n 25/100 Ct Country Foods 26.87$                       

FSA No Bid

Solo #PL4N Country Foods 40.98$                       

FSA No Bid

Pan Saver #402002 Country Foods 38.28$                       

FSA No Bid

418 0 CASE 20/125ea

Lids, 4oz Souffle, Clear Plastic, Solo. No known QTY.

419 0 BOX 10/box/cs

Pan Saver, Full Pan Deep, 6", Ovenable. No known QTY.

416 100 EA 1

Hot Pads, Pan Grippers, Pot Holders, Insulated w/ Elastic 

Wrist Band.

417 0 CASE 2,400 ea

Lids, 2oz Souffle, Clear Plastic, Dixie. No known QTY.

415 0 CASE 10/100ea

Gloves, Size Small, Sanitary, Embossed, Food Grade 

Plastic, Disposable. No known QTY.
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FOB SOLDOTNA 

San Jamar #800FG17 FSA 6.40$                         

or equal

Best Guard Country Foods 8.83$                         

Dixie #LO10

PrimeSource #75003991 Country Foods 32.59$                       

FSA 34.21$                       

3M #70070653863 Country Foods No Bid

FSA No Bid

Disco #D104 Country Foods 14.29$                       

ProPak #17807

ProPak #84IMA FSA 14.68$                       

Southern Champion #0413 FSA 19.73$                       

Primesource #FT100 Country Foods 18.79$                       

James River #KL100ST424 20 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Trays, 1#, Food Tray w/ Sides.

422 0 CASE 6/10ea/cs

Scouring Pads, Heavy Duty Pad

423 5 CASE 12 ea

Scouring Sponge, Stainless Steel

420 10 PR PAIR

Oven Mitts, 17", Heavy Duty, Heat Protection, BestGuard, 

Pair

421 64 CASE 1,000 ea

Pan Liners, Super Release, 16 3/8" x 24 3/8"
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FOB SOLDOTNA 

Southern Champion #0409 Country Foods 15.85$                       

FSA 16.28$                       

Dixie #RP50

Primesource #FT050

Southern Champion #0417 FSA 24.12$                       

Primesource #FT200 Country Foods 23.08$                       

James River #KL200ST

Pactiv TH1-0500 Country Foods 21.17$                       

FSA 21.93$                       

PCA #M60-8000

Genpak #10500

or equal

Primesource Country Foods 7.22$                         

Nutribon 

Jet

or equal

PrimeSource #75002491 FSA 7.25$                         

Primesource Country Foods 7.22$                         

Dixie #PSM21

Jet

or equal

PrimeSource #75002493 FSA 7.22$                         

428 40 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Utensils, Forks, Plastic, White, Medium Weight

429 30 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Utensils, Spoons, Soup, Plastic, White, Medium Weight

426 90 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Trays, 2#, Food Tray w/ Sides.

427 550 CASE 500 ct/cs

Trays, 5-Compartment, Lunch Tray, Foam, 9"x12"

425 200 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Trays, 1/2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. 
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FOB SOLDOTNA 

Jetware EDKIT

Dixie #MWSKPC

Prime Source #75002480 Country Foods 15.31$                       

FSA 16.06$                       

Nutri-bon 

Reynolds #7358

PaperCon Country Foods 34.92$                       

Zenith

or similar

FSA No Bid

Reynolds #7512 Country Foods No Bid

Pactiv #W62

FSA No Bid

No Preference

Dexter Russell Country Foods 4.82$                         

FSA No Bid

432 0 CASE 5/500 ct/cs

Wrapper, Foil Sheet, Red Line Imprint, Foil Laminated, 

12"x12". No known QTY.

433 20 EA EA

Knife, Small Paring, 3 1/3"

430 450 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight Plastic, 

Includes spork, napkin and straw in a cellophane wrap.

431 0 CASE 1,000 ct/cs

Wrapper, Foil Bag, Cheeseburger Imprint, Foil Laminated, 

6"x3/4"x6.5". No known QTY.
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