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RECAP
Bid #100-17

Due Date: 8-8-16

Item #

01 AMPLIFIER, POWER AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$1657.00 Alt 
$1499.00
$1200.00
$1434.97
No Bid
$1620.80

Guitar Center $1200.00#

19”W x 16.2”D x 3.5”H -
Black

Size -

Brand CROWN #XTI 6002

02 CABLE, ETHERCON AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
$530.36 Alt
$456.00
No Bid
$145.00 (bid pricing
not honored)

Pro Sound Inc. $456.00#

300’ - BlackSize -

Brand PRO CO #ETHERSHLD300

03 CABLE, ETHERCON AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
$379.43 Alt
$205.50
No Bid
$128.00 (bid pricing
not honored)

Pro Sound Inc. $205.50#

150’ - BlackSize -

Brand PRO CO #ETHERSHLD150

04 CABLE, MICROPHONE AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
$19.00
$11.00 Alt
$24.47
No Bid
$13.00

Guitar Center $11.00#

15’ - BlackSize -

Brand PRO CO XLR15 #EXMSS
-15
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05 CABLE, SPEAKER AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
$.70
1.11
No Bid
$.79

Guitar Center $.70#

BlackSize -

Brand PRO CO 12-2 #12GA.B

06 CAMERA, DOCUMENT AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$113.22
No Bid
$82.23
$76.67
$402.00 Alt
No Bid

Pro Sound Inc. $76.67#

3.8"L x 0.9"W x 1.1"H -
Silver camera, white stand

Size -

Brand IPEVO #CDVU-03IP

07 CHARGER, DROP-IN AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$99.57
No Bid
$999.00

Pro Sound Inc. $99.57#

9”W x 1.9”H x 5.3”D - BlackSize -

Brand FRONTROW TOGO #925C

08 CONSOLE, DIGITAL
MIXING

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
$3999.00
$3994.64
$3972.37
No Bid
$4025.55

Pro Sound Inc. $3972.37#

10.1”H x 23.9”D x 35.1”W -
Black

Size -

Brand MIDAS #M32
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09 EXPANSION CARD
     32-CHANNEL

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$407.85
$399.00
$390.00
$387.77
No Bid
$390.00

Pro Sound Inc. $387.77#

8.2 x 6.8 x 2.1" - BlackSize -

Brand BEHRINGER #X-DANTE

10 EYEBOLT KIT AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$49.50
$28.00
$27.00
$24.00
No Bid
$27.00

Pro Sound Inc. $24.00#

M10 x 1.4" / 35.0 mm   - 3
pkg - Black

Size -

Brand JBL M10 #229-00009-01

11 HEADPHONE, STEREO
     KIDS

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$9.37
$7.75 Alt
No Bid

Pro Sound Inc. $9.37#

WhiteSize -

Brand SCHOOL PHONICS #K-6

12 MICROPHONE,
HANDHELD

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$230.17
No Bid
$122.00 (bid pricing
not honored)

Pro Sound Inc $230.17#

 2.1”D. x 9.3”H - SilverSize -

Brand FRONTROW TOGO #925H
-216

    * Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
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13 PROJECTOR,
INTERACTIVE

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
$590.71
$665.37
$1805.00 Alt
No Bid

No Award#

11.3”W x 8.7”D x 3.6”H -
White

Size -

Brand DELL S320 #225-3956

14 PROJECTOR, NETWORK AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
No Bid
$814.85
$635.37
No Bid
No Bid

No Award#

11.7 in x 8 in x 3.5 in - BlackSize -

Brand DELL 1610HD #224-8089

15 RACK RAILS AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

No Bid
$22.00
$24.00
$38.97
No Bid
$20.35 (bid pricing
not honored)

B&H Photo $22.00#

1.53”D x 21”H x 0.68”W -
Black

Size -

Brand MIDDLE ATLANTIC
#RRF12

16 SNAKE, AUDIO
     DIGITAL

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$709.50
$750.00
$686.28
$692.97
No Bid
$690.00

Guitar Center $686.28#

19 x 8.9 x 3.5" - BlackSize -

Brand BEHRINGER #S16

    * Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
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17 SNAKE, AUDIO
     DIGITAL

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$1185.00
$1199.00
$1200.00
$1144.97
No Bid
$1155.00

Pro Sound Inc. $1144.97#

19 x 9.5 x 5.4” - BlackSize -

Brand BEHRINGER #S32

18 SPEAKERS, COLUMN AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$336.00
$350.00
$367.00
$289.47
No Bid
$336.00

Pro Sound Inc. $289.47#

20.8”H x 3.9”W x 6”D -
White

Size -

Brand JBL CBT #50LA-1-WH

19 SPEAKERS, COLUMN AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$783.00
$820.00
$878.00
$743.07
No Bid
$850.00

Pro Sound Inc. $743.07#

27.4”H x 6.7”W x 9.3”D -
White

Size -

Brand JBL CBT #70J-1-WH

20 SUBWOOFER SYSTEM
     18” DUAL SELF-
POWERED

AVES Audio Visual Sys.
B&H Photo
Guitar Center
Pro Sound Inc.
School Outfitters
Vintage King Audio

$1611.00
$1799.00
$1528.28
$1411.97
No Bid
$1500.00

Pro Sound Inc. $1411.97#

22.57”H x 47.42”W x 26.79”
D  - Black

Size -

Brand JBL #SRX828SP

    * Does Not Meet Specifications ** No Specificiations Provided *** Not FOB: Soldotna
****Draw


