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Item # Item Description Vendors & Price Quoted Vendor Awarded & Price

010320 INK CARTRIDGE $28.47
$30.00
$29.44
$30.99
$35.00
$28.78
No Bid
$39.69
$27.99***
$29.50

$28.47/each

BlackSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc. 
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CN053ANBrand>

010321 INK CARTRIDGE $14.27
$15.00
14.60
$15.99
$18.00
$14.45
No Bid
$24.69
$12.00***
$14.50

$14.27

CyanSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CN054ANBrand>

010322 INK CARTRIDGE $14.27
$15.00
$14.91
$15.99
$18.00
$14.45
No Bid
$24.69
$12.00***
$14.50

$14.27

MagentaSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc. 
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP# CN055ANBrand>

010323 INK CARTRIDGE $14.27
$15.00
$14.91
$15.99
$18.00
$14.45
No Bid
$24.69
$12.00***
$14.50

$14.27

YELLOWSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CN056ANBrand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                              ****Draw     ***** Minimum    ****** All or None
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010342 INK CARTRIDGE $33.93
$35.50
$35.65
$36.99
$43.00
$34.15
$39.49
$45.50
$28.00***
$35.30

$33.93

BLACK/HP96Size/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #C8767WN#140Brand>

010343 INK CARTRIDGE $38.22
$38.00
$39.73
$41.99
$49.00
$38.74
$49.00
$50.05
$32.00***
$39.80

$38.00

TRI-COLOR/HP97Size/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Redondo Tech

HP #C9363WN#140Brand>

010702 TONER $121.27
$140.00
$139.12
$142.05
$155.00
$123.96
$165.00
$186.86
$150.00***
$142.65

$121.27

BlackSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CE390A,Brand>

010703 TONER $70.50
$85.00
$82.88
$84.62
$94.00
$73.91
$99.00
$131.53
$87.00***
$148.80

$70.50

BlackSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CF280ABrand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                              ****Draw     ***** Minimum    ****** All or None
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010721 TONER $116.70
$140.00
$138.82
$142.99
$156.00
$122.65
$165.00
$186.91
$140.00***
$142.75

$116.70

BlackSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CC364ABrand>

010730 TONER $143.79
$115.00
$145.11
$148.17
$154.00
$149.78
$169.00
$195.77
$69.00***
$148.80

$115.00

BlackSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Redondo Tech

HPC8061XBrand>

010750 TONER $82.28
$85.00
$83.16
$84.99
$92.00
$85.23
$99.00
$131.81
$89.00***
$85.30

$82.28

BLACKSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CE410XBrand>

010751 TONER $81.71
$98.00
$98.08
$98.99
$107.00
$82.55
$115.00
$144.89
$102.00***
$98.90

$81.71

YELLOWSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc.
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CE412ABrand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                              ****Draw     ***** Minimum    ****** All or None
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010752 TONER $81.71
$98.00
$96.69
$98.99
$107.00
$82.55
$115.00
$144.89
$102.00***
$98.90

$81.71

MagentaSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc. 
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CE413ABrand>

010753 TONER $81.71
$98.00
$96.69
$98.99
$107.00
$82.55
$115.00
$144.89
$102.00***
$98.90

$81.71

CyanSize/Clr>

Lewis & Lewis
Redondo Tech
Zones, Inc.
Meredith Digital
Howard Tech
Alaska A/V
Adorama Inc. 
AAA Office Sup
LaserLink Int.
Insight Public Sec

Lewis & Lewis

HP #CE411ABrand>

                  *Does Not Meet Specification    **No Specifications Provided     *** Not FOB: Soldotna
                                                              ****Draw     ***** Minimum    ****** All or None


